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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT _
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINO}IS .
EASTERN DIVISION [ EoD SEp 0372002

Chapter 11
Case No. 01 B 24795
(Jointly Administered)

Inre

COMDISCO, INC., et af., Honorable Ronald Barliant

Hearing Date: September 24, 2002

Debtors.

Hearing Time:
UN!TEDES; ILE D
ATES BANKRUPT
FINAL APPLICATION OF NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ic{.‘l(.iggt}SRT

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP N
FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR - AUG 8 0 2002
SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED
Brown Rudnick Berlack Israels LLP (“BRBI"), counsel to the Official E@ripe of ety

Security Holders (the “Equity Committee”) appointed in the above-referenced chapter 11 cases
of Comdisco, Inc. et al. (the “Debtors’), submits this Final Application (the “Final Application™} for
Allowance of 'Compensation for Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred and respectfully

represents as follows:

INTRODUCTION

1. Pursuant to Sections 328, 330 and 331 of Title 11 of the United States Code (the
“Bankruptcy Code”), Rule 2016(a) of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the
“Bankruptcy Rules”), Rule 607 of the Local Rules of the Northern District of Illincis (the “Local
Rule™), this Court’s July 16, 2001 Administrative Order Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 105(a) and
331 Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of
Professionals (the “Fee Procedures Order”), this Court's Order dated July 31, 2002 confirming
the Plan (as defined below), and the United States Trustee Guidelines For Reviewing
Applications For Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330,
effective May 1, 1995 (the “UST GUidelines”), BRBI respectfully requests that: (a) final
allowance of compensation for the period September 5, 2001 through and including November

30, 2001 (the “First Period”) in the amount of $607,698.50 as set forth in BRBI's First Interim
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Fee Application For Allowance Of Compensation For Services Rendered And Expenses
Incurred filed with this Court, dated January 14, 2002 (the “First Application”), be allowed and
awarded; (b) reimbursement for the actual and necessary expenses incurred and recorded by
BRBI during the First Period in connection with the performance of such services, in the amount
of $87,845.23 as set forth in the First Application be allowed and awarded; (c) final allowance of
compensation for the period December 31, 2001 through.and including March 31, 2002 (the
“Second Period”) in the amount of $510,755.50 as set forth in BRBI's Second Interim Fee
Application For Allowance Of Compensation For Services Rendered And Expenses I[ncurred
filed with this Court, dated May 14, 2002 (the “Second Application”) be allowed and awarded;
(d) reimbursement for the actual and necessary expenses incurred and recorded by BRBI
during the Second Period in connection with the performance of such services, in the amount of
$66,138.17 as set forth in the Second Application be allowed and awarded; and (e) final
allowance of compensation and reimbursement of expenses for the period April 1, 2002 through
and including August 12, 2002 (the “Third Period”; and together with the First Period and the
Second Period, the “Compensation Period”) in the estimated amount of $754,320.62."

2. During the First Period, BRBI professionals spent a total of 1,893.3 hours
performing services for the Equity Committee. BRBI's blended hourly rate during the First
Period was $321.00.

3. During the Second Period, BRBI profess:ona[s spent a total of 1 5424 hours
performlng services for the Equity Commlttee BRBl s blended hour!y rate during the Second
Period was $331 .00. | | |

4, During the Third Period, the actual amount of time expended between April 1,
2002 through August 12, 2002 by professionals off BRBI was 1,759.9 hours. Additional time has

been, and will be, spent by BRBI professional§ rendering services and preparing this Final

I BRBI will advise the Court and necessary parties of the actual amount of fees and expenses incurred during the
Third Period at or before the September 24, 2002 hearing. BRBI has recorded fees in the amount of $658,060.50
from April 1, 2002 through and including August 12, 2002. BRBI estimates that an additional $25,000.00 will be
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Application during the period August 13, 2002 through the hearing scheduled for September 24,
2002.

5. Pursuant to the Local Rule, a cover sheet for professional compensation is
attached to this Final Application.

6. BRBI is not seeking enhancement of the fees customarily charged by BRB! and
accepted by its clients. BRBI has neither received a retainer from the Equity Committee, nor
subjected its fees or expenses to Ilimitations other than as required by the UST Guidelines and
applicable siatutes.

7. In accordance with the Fee Procedures Order, during the Final Period, BRBI
submitted a Professional Fee Statement (as defined in the Fee Procedures Order) (i) on June 5,
2002 for the period April 1, 2002 through April 30, 2002, (ii) on June 24, 2002 for the period May
1, 2002 through May 31, 2002, (iii} on July 23, 2002 for the period June 1, 2002 through June

30, 2002, and (iv) on August 28, 2002 for the period July 1, 2002 through July 31, 2002.

PRELIMINARY STATEMENT

8. During'the Compensation Period, BRBI actively pursued the ultimate goal of
confirming and efficiently implementing a consensual plan of reorganization. BRBI's
professionals diligently facilitated positive and productive negotiations among the Debtor, the
Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “Creditors’ Committee”), and other major
parties-in-interest and the professionals retained and employed in this case, thereby fostering
the plan process.

9. In light of the services provided by BRBI, and the results it achieved for the
Equity Committee and other parties-in-interest during the Compensation Period, BRBI
respectfully submits that the award of compensation requested is fair and equitable and should

be granted.

incurred for expenses and services rendered to its constituency and in preparation and presentation of this final fee
application.
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JURISDICTION AND VENUE

10. Pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§157 and 1334, this Court has jurisdiction over this
Application. This is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b). The venue of this
proceeding is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1409. The statutory predicates for the relief
requested herein are sections 330 and 331 of title 11, United States Code (the “Bankruptcy

Code™.

BACKGROUND

11. On July 16, 2001, the Debtors filed voluntary petitions in this Court for relief
under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. The Debtors continue to operate their businesses
and manage their properties as debtors-in-possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of
the Bankruptcy Code.

12. On July 24, 2001, the United States Trustee (the “Trustee”) appointed an Official
Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “Creditors’ Committee”} in these cases. On September

5, 2001, the Trustee appointed the Equity Committee.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED
DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD

13.  The following summary will highlight certain of the more significant matters
addressed by BRBI as counsel to the Equity Committee and give the Court a general
understanding of the complexity and abundance of legal work performed as well as the results
achieved during the Compensation Period.

14, BRBI's First and Second Fee Applications, dated January 14, 2005 and May 14,
2002, respectively, summarize the significant matters addressed by BRBI attorneys for the
period September 5, 2001 through March 31, 2002. The descriptions of those matters are
incorporated herein by reference. Accordingly, BRBI will only describe herein those significant
events and issues addressed by BRBI attorneys for the period April 1, 2002 through August 12,

2002.

# 8077320 v2 4
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15. On March 15, 2002, Debtors filed their Motion for An Order Pursuant to 11
U.S.C. § 105 and Fed. R. Bankr. P. 9012 Approving the Settlement Between the Debtors and
CIT Group, Inc. (“CIT"). In response, the Equity Committee prepared and filed an objection to
the proposed settlement based on the grounds that CIT had engaged in bad faith negotiations in
refusing to consummate the proposed asset purchase. Further, the Equity Committee
conducted discovery of Debtor's senior management and an evidentiary hearing was conducted
on said motion on May 8, 2002. Ultimately, the Court approved the Debtors’ settlement over the
Equity Committee’s objection.

16. On April 4, 2002, Debtors sought approval to sell Debtors’ Healthcare leasing
unit to General Electric Capital Corporation, and to sell other Australian and New Zealand
assets. The Equity Committee interposed an objection to the sale of all such assets on the
grounds that any such sales were a “creeping plan” of liquidation that ought to be accomplished
pursuant to a plan of reorganization. Ultimately, after an evidentiary hearing, the Court
overruled the Equity Committee’s objection.

17.  On April 14, 2002, Debtors’ former President and Chief Operating Officer,
Michael A. Fazio (“Fazio”), filed his Motion to Compel Debtors to Immediately Pay To Him
Certain Amounts Due and Owing to Him By the Debtors Under the Terms of His Post-Petition
Employment Agreement with Debtors and Pursuant to This Court's Order dated August 23,
- 2001. Given Fazio’s abrupt and unexplained departure from Comdisco in February, 2002, the

Equity Committee filed an objection to the F 0 fnotion on April 30, 2002 and served discovery

on Fazio, the Debtors, and certain officers of the Debtofé. Ultimately, however, Fazio never

pursued his motion.

18. On April 26, 2002, Debtors flled thelr Notice w:th Motion for Order Approving (I}

Disclosure Statement; (ll) Record Date, V Deadllne and Procedures for Temporary
Allowance of Certain Claims; (llI) Procedures 'for Filing Objecnons to Plan; {IV) Sohcnatlon

Procedures for Confirmation; and (V) A Hearing Date to Consider Confirmation of the Plan.
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19.  The Equity Committee, after extensive research, investigation and analysis,
objected to the proposed Disclosure Statement because, inter alia, it failed adequately to
describe certain classes of claimants and, further, it provided releases for non-debtor third
parties, namely certain officers and directors of the Debtors.

20. In connection with the Equity Commitiee objection, BRBI attorneys aiso
undertook an analysis of certain class action claims then pending against the Debtors’ officers
and directors, as well as insurance coverage for such claims. Counsel further researched and
analyzed whether the Equity Committee had standing to assert, either directly or indirectly,
claims against the Debtors’ officers and directors relating to both pre-petition and post-petition
conduct and, further, whether said officers or directors violated any statutory or common law
duties in connection with such activities.

21. After a hearing conducted on May 31, 2002, the Court approved Debtors’
Disclosure Statement with certain modifications.

22. Immediately following such approval, the Equity Committee served discovery on
the Debtors, their officers and directors, and the Debtors’ professional advisors in connection
with the Plan Confirmation hearing scheduled for July 30 and 31, 2002. This discovery included
Notices of Deposition and document requests. Debtors immediately filed a Motion for Protective
Order Limiting The Scope of the Equity Committee’s Document Requests, and other discovery.

23. At or around that time, BRBI attorneys had extensive discussions with the
Debtors and the Creditors’ Committee regarding a consensual plan of reorganization.

24. In connection with said discussions, BRBI attorneys investigated and/or
researched numerous issues including, but not limited to, Debtors’ SIP claimants, the tradability
of any warrant or other right issued to equity holders pursuant to a consensual plan of
reorganization; plan valuation; the extent and scope of third party releases; death trap voting
issues; the proposed employee retention program; the tax effect on equity holders; and the
extent and nature of claims against certain third pariies including the Debtors’ officers and

directors that would be released as part of any consensual plan.
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25.  After multiple, lengthy conferences, the Equity Committee, the Debtors and the
Creditors’ Committee announced in early July, 2002, an agreement in principle regarding a
consensual plan of reorganization.

26. Following this announcement, BRBI attorneys continued to work with the Debtors
and Creditors’ Committee to effectuate the proposed consensual plan. This included, but was
not limited to, structuring the warrant or other right that was to be issued to the Debtors’ equity
holders pursuant to the plan; addressing tax issues in connection with the issuance of any such
warrant or other right; extensive discussion with the SEC; preparing letters, baliots and other
solicitation materials that were to be sent to parties in interest; and responding to multiple
shareholder inquires.

27.  After a hearing on July 30, and 31, 2002, the Court approved the plan of

recrganization.

APPLICATION

28. On July 16, 2001, this Court entered an Administrative Order, which describes
the procedures through which specified professionals, including BRBI, may apply for
compensation. This Application is submitted in accordance with the Administrative Order.

29.  On January 24, 2002, the Court adopted the Debtors’ suggestion regarding the
appointment of a Fee Review Committee in these cases to regulate and maintain professional
fees incurred in these Chapter 11 cases.

30. This is BRBI's final application for approval and aflowance of compensation and
reimbursement of expenses. Pursuant to its First Application, BRBI was awarded $607,698.50
in fees and $87,845.23 in expenses. An order approving BRBI's Second Application has not yet
been entered.

31. By this Application, BRBI! also seeks (a) $683,060.50 for the reasonable value of
actual and necessary legal services rendered during the Third Period, and (b) $71,260.12 for
reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred in connection with rendering such

setrvices.

# 8077320 V2 7
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32.  Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a detailed statement of BRBI's time records for
the Third Pericd.

33.  Attached hereto as Exhibit B is BRBI's billing summary for the Third Period which
provides the name of each employee, each attorney’s year of bar admission, the aggregate
amount of hours billed, and the current billing rate of each professional. BRB! employees spent
a total of 1,759.9 hours in performing services for the Equity Committee during the Third Period
for the blended hourly rate of $374.00. The compensation sought by BRBI reflecis the
customary rates charged by BRBI to other clients.

34. During the Third Period, BRBI attorneys expended time in the following

categories:

Case Administration 7 376.2|  $104,337.50
Asset Disposition f/k/a Asset 46.4 18,328.00
Sale

Business Operations f/k/a BRBI 1.3 637.00
Fee Applications

Plan of Reorganization 1,031.4 406,081.00
Asset Analysis and Recovery 26.3 9,235.50
Shareholder Inquiries 23.0 8,008.50
Committee Meetings 34.3 15,765.00
Litigation/Relief from Stay 2171 93,203.00
Claims Administration 6.0 2,465.00
Total 1,762.0 $658,060.50

(a.) Case Administration. BRBI seeks $104,337.50 for professional services
rendered during the Third Period related to Case Administration. For example, during the Third
Period, BRBI attorneys’ activities included, but were hot limited to, the following:

(i Reviewed publicly filed documents by the Debtors;

(i) Reviewed pleadings ﬁledﬁwr the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases and

provided the Equity Committee with recommendations on how to proceed in
matters presented to the Court for consideration;

(i)  Attended Court hearings;

#8077320 v2 8
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Attended monthly meeting with Debtors;

Attended Fee Review Committee Meetings;

Researched and analyzed corporate governance issues;

Prepared BRBI| monthly fee statements, BRBl Second Interim Fee
Application, the Equity Committee members statement of reimbursement
and the Second Interim Fee Application of the Equity Committee members
for reimbursement of expenses; and

Attended to all administrative matters in these cases.

Asset Disposition (f/k/a Asset Sales). BRBI| seeks $18,328.00 for

professional services rendered during the Third Period related to Asset Disposition. This

category includes all tasks related to sale of the Debtors’ assets. Specifically, during the Third

Period, BRBI attorneys’ activities included, but were not limited to, the following:

(i)

(iil)

(c.)

Researched and analyzed bankruptcy law in connection with the Equity
Committee’s objection to the sale of the various Leasing business units;

Researched legal standard of valuation in context of sale of various
leasing units; and

Prepared response to HP's reply to the Equity Committee’s motion to
preclude HP’s termination fee.

Plan_of Reorganization. BRBI seeks $4086,081.00 for professional

services rendered during the Third Period related to Plan of Reorganization. Time spent in this

category includes all tasks relating to the Debtors’ proposed plan of reorganization. Specifically,

during the Third Period, BRBI's attorneys’ activities included, but were not limited to, the following:

(i
(if)
(iif}

(iv)

v)
(vi)

# 8077320 v2
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(vii)y  Participated in numerous plan negotiation conferences.

(d.) BRBI seeks $9,235.50 for professional services rendered during the Third
Period related to Asset Analysis and Recovery. For example, during the Third Period, BRBI
attorneys’ activities included, but were not limited to, the following:

(i) Analyzed the rights of shareholders to make direct claims under
Comdisco's policies of directors and officers liability insurance; and

(i)  Analyzed the prior reported decisions as to the rights of shareholders to
foresee directly when the insured company itself was concurrently making its own claims, the
competing rights of shareholders and creditors, and the right of the Equity Committee to make
such direct claims on behalf of shareholders in an insolvency proceeding.

(e.)  Shareholder Inquiries. BRBI seeks $8,008.50 for professional services

rendered during the Third Period related to Shareholder Inquiries. Time spent in this category
includes all communications with shareholders regarding the status of the Debtors’ cases.

(f.) Committee Meetings. BRB! seeks payment of $15,765.00 for professional

services performed during the Third Period in connection with Committee Meetings. Time spent in
this category includes ali preparation for and communications with the Equity Committee.

(g) Litigation/Relief from Stay. BRBI seeks payment of $93,203.00 for

professional services performed during the Third Period in connection with Litigation/Relief from
Stay. Time spent in this category includes tasks relating to the representation of the Equity
Committee concerning other litigation or contested matters in these cases. Specifically, during
the Third Period, BRB!'s attorneys’ activities included, but were not limited to, the following:

(i Prepared and filed objections to the proposed settlement with CIT;

(ii) Worked on class action analysis; and

(iii) Prepared the Equity Committee's objection to Citibank’s motion regarding
assignability of debts.

(h.) Ciaims Administration. BRBI seeks payment of $2,465.00 for professional
services performed during the Third Period in connection with Claims Administration. Time spent

in this category includes tasks relating to claims administration.

# 8077320 v2 1 O
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35. BRBI anticipates generating additional fees and incurring andfor recording
additional expenses in the estimated amount of $25,000.00. At or before the September 24,
2002 hearing, BRBI will advise the Court and necessary parties of its exact billing and will
provide additional documentation of the actual amount of these presently unrecorded fees and
expenses.

36. BRBI submits that the professional services rendered to the Equity Committee for
which it seeks final compensation have been necessary and appropriate to its representation of
the Equity Committee and have not been duplicative of the services performed by any other
counsel in this case.

37.  Time devoted, however, is only one of the many pertinent factors in assessing an
award of compensation. The number of hours expended must be considered in light of: (a) the
amounts involved and the results achieved, (b) the novelty and difficulty of the questions
presented, (c) the skill required to properly perform the legal services, (d) the preclusion of other
employment, (e) the customary fee to a private client for the services rendered, (f) awards in
similar cases, (g) time constraints required by the exigencies of the case, including the
frequency and amount of time required to be devoted other than during regular business hours,
(h) the experience, reputation and ability of the attorneys rendering services, and (i) the nature
and length of the professional relationship with the client. BRBI believes that application of the
foregoing criteria more than justifies the compensatlon requested

38. BRBI submits that its services were necessary, benefited the Equity Commlttee

the Debtor’s shareholders and the Debtor’s e \ave furthered the Debtor’s rehabllitatlve
goals. BRBI is seeking its customary time charges wﬂhout any bonus or multiplier. The fees
requested are calculated on an hourly basis e_n are _no more than BRB! would charge a private
client seeking identical services. ‘

39.  BRBI has extensive experienee.__1.[1___&_”@:"1 rﬁptcy matters and was wel'l.qualiﬁed to'.
represent the Equity Committee in this case. For example, BRBI has represented official

creditors’ or equity committees in the following significant Chapter 11 cases:

# 8077320 v2 11
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A.H. Robins Company, Incorporated (E.D. Va.)
Allis-Chalmers Corporation (S.D.N.Y.)

Anglo Energy Limited (S.D.N.Y.)

Budget Group, Inc. (D. Del.)

Continental Airlines, Inc. (S.D. Tex.)

David Schick and Venture Mortgage Corp. (S.D.N.Y.)
Days Inns of America, Inc. (D. Del.)

FRD Acquisition Co. (D. Del.)

Global Crossing Ltd. (S.D.N.Y.)

Gordon Jewelry Corporation (Zale Corporation) (N.D. Tex.)
Harnischfeger Industries, Inc. (D. Del.)

Insilco Corporation (W.D. Tex.)

Integrated Resources, Inc. (S.D.N.Y.)

Mercury Finance Company (N.D. lIl.)

R.H. Macy & Co,, Inc. (S.D.N.Y.)

Randall’s island Family Golf Centers, Inc. (S.D.N.Y.)
Texscan Corporation (D. Ariz.)

Thermadyne Holdings Corp. (E.D. Mo.)

Todd Shipyards Corporation (D.N.J.)

Tracor Holdings, Inc. (W.D. Tex.)

Trump Taj Mahal Associates (D.N.J.)

40. In addition, BRBI's bankruptcy and reorganization group also has an extensive
practice in the area of in and out-of-court restructurings and has represented unofficial
committees or individual creditors or equity security holders in connection with restructurings,
exchange offers and/or solicitations of consents involving a number of major corporations,
including the following: Arizona Charlie's, Inc., Granite Partners, L.P., Greate Bay Hotel &
Casino (The Sands), Harrah’s Jazz, Marvel Entertainment Group, Inc., MobileMedia
Communications, Inc., Stratosphere Corporation, Trans World Airlines, Inc., Viskase
Companies, Inc. and XO Communications, Inc. BRBI has also represented numerous debtors,
including The Washington Corparation, Keene Corporation, Triangle Wire & Cable, Inc., and
Equitable Bag Co., Inc. in both in-court and out-of-court restructurings.

41. Despite the multitude of complex issues presented in this case, BRBI, with the
active assistance of the Equity Committee’s financial advisors, successfully negotiated and
represented its constituency throughout the Plan process.

42. BRBI submits that its fees are eminently reasonable under all of the criteria

typically examined in reorganization cases. Based upon the factors to be considered in

# 8077320 v2 12
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accordance with Sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, the work that has been
performed to date more than substantiates the charges requested by BRBI.

43. BRBI respectfully requests that it be allowed final compensation in the amount of
$607,698.50 for the First Period, $510,755.50 for the Second Period, and the estimated amount
of $683,060.50 for the Third Period, for a total fee award of $1,801,514.50. BRBI submits that
this compensation is reasonable given both the size and complexity of this case and the amount
of time BRBI was required to incur in order to effectively represent the interests of the Equity
Committee in this proceeding. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is BRBI's billing summary for the
Compensation Period which provides the name of each professional, each attorney’s year of
bar admission, the aggregate amount of hours billed, and the current billing rate of each
professional. BRBI professionals spent a total of 5,195.6 hours in performing services for the
Equity Committee during the Compensation Period for the blended hourly rate of $342.00. The

compensation sought by BRBI reflects the customary rates charged by BRBI to other clients.

THE REQUESTED REIMBURSEMENT
OF QUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES

44. BRBI has disbursed the amounts set forth in Exhibit D annexed hereto in the
aggregate amount of $71,260.12 during the Third Period. Also attached hereto as Exhibit E is a
summary of the amounts disbursed by BRBI during the Compensation Period. Estimated, non-
recorded expenses will be more fully detailed at or before the Septembgr 24, 2002 hearing.

BRBI submits that such expenses were necessa ‘reasonable in scope and amount.

BRBV's regular practice is to charge its clientsifij'r"t'h it-of-pocket disbursements.

45, BRBI's usual client charge for p bfdbo;ﬁié;s'_ is twenty five cents per page for in-

house photocopying, which it believes approximates’ its per page copying cost. Outgoing

facsimile transmissions are billed at $1.25"?;f_) M'ore'over,'a!though some of BRBI's

professionals travel first class, BRBI is charging, or will only charge, these estates the coach

fare for these travels.

# 8077320 v2 13



. ] ) ) ® ] v @
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 14 of 153

46. BRBI made every effort to minimize expenses in the Debtors’ cases. The
expenses incurred in rendering professional services were necessary and reasonable to serve

the needs of the Debtors, their estates, and their equity holders.

CERTIFICATION OF BRBI

47, Pursuant to Rule 2016(a) of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure,
attached to this Application are (a) Exhibit A setting forth detailed statement of BRBI's time
records for the Third Period, (b) Exhibit B setting forth BRBI's billing summary for the Third
Period, which provides the name of each professional, each attorney’s year of bar admission,
the aggregate amount of hours billed, and the current billing rate of each professional, (c)
Exhibit D setting forth detailed expenses for the Third Period, (d) Exhibit C setting forth BRBI's
billing summary for the Compensation Period, which provides the name of each professional,
each attorney’s year of bar admission the aggregate amount of hours billed, and the current rate
of each professional, (e) Exhibit E sefting forth detailed expenses for the Compensation Period
and (f) Exhibit F is a chart setting forth all payments sought or received by BRBI in any capacity
whatsoever in connection with the Debtors’ cases. Such amounts are to be paid from the
Debtors’ estates pursuant to section 1103 of the Bankruptcy Code and the Court’s order
authorizing the retention of BRBI. None of the compensation sought or received by BRBI has
been shared with any other entity — nor does any BRBI attorney have any agreement for the
sharing of the compensation sought — other than agreements to share compensation as a

member or regular associate of BRBI.

# 8077320 v2 14
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WHEREFORE, BRBI respectfully requests fhat the Court enter an order: (i} allowing
compensation for professional services rendered as counsel to the Equity Committee during the
First Period in the amount of $607,698.50; (if) allowing reimbursement for BRBI's expenses during
the First Period in the amount of $87,845.23; (iii} allowing compensation for professional services
rendered as counsel to the Equity Committee during the Second Pericd in the amount of
$510,755.50; (iv) allowing reimbursement for BRBI's expenses during the Second Period in the
amount of $66,138.17; (v) allowing compensation for fees and reimbursement of expenses during
the Third Period in the amount of approximately $754,320.62 (o be more fully detailed and
documented at or before the September 24, 2002 hearing); (vi} authorizing and directing payment
to BRBI in the approximate amount of $247,200.69 on account of fees generated and expenses
incurred, which sum represents the total amounts sought herein, less the sum of $1,779,557.33
previously paid by the Debtor; and (viii) granting BRBI such other and further relief as is just and
proper.

Dated: New York, New York
August 29, 2002

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

By: (,/,waj 3@5@4‘““/ d;~\/ y—&‘/,m 5566

Edward S. Weisfelner, Esq., (%)
120 West 45™ Street

New’ York New York 10036

(212) 704- 0100

_Offit:fiél _Cbr'n'mittee of Equity Security Holders

# 8077320 v2 15



=

Case 01 24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc |

{

w» o - -

, Pleading Page 16 of 153
.

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

QONE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111

©617-866-8200

COMDISCO, INC.

MATTER
803215
803215
803215
803215
803215
803215
803215

NO.

.0000
L0001
.0002
.0004
.0005
.0006
L0007
803215.
803215.

0008
0009

Invoice Number **#%%*
Aug 29,
803215

DISBUR-
SEMENTS

2002

'S

TOTAL

71,209.33174,427.83
201.51 18,529.51

0.00 637.00
0.00401,958.50
0.00 9,235.50
0.00 8,008.50
0.00 15,128.00
0.00 93,203.00
0.00 2,318.00

Invoice Date
Client Number
COMDISCO, INC.
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM NXKKEXEXXXXXZX APRIL 1, 2002
THROUGH KERRRXXERYXERREXXXX JULY 31, 2002:
MATTER NAME HOURS FEES
CASE ADMINISTRATION 369.10 103,218.50
ASSET DISPOSITIONS 46.40  18,328.00
BUSINESS OPERATIONS 1.30 637.00
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION 1,022.60 401,958.50
ASSET ANALYSIS AND RECOVERY 26.30 9,235.50
SHAREHOLDER INQUIRIES 23.00 8,008.50
COMMITTEE MEETINGS 33.00  15,128.00
LITIGATION/RELIEF FROM STAY 217.10  93,203.00
CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION 5.70 2,318.00
TOTAL 1,744.50 652,035.00
TOTAL FEES

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

TOTAL FEES AND EXPENSES OF THISeINVOICE

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE

KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BiLL WITH YOUR CHECK TO OUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT"

PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-2108175

$

$

EXHIBIT A
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
ONE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111
817-856-8200

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number ##**x*%¥
Invoice Date Aug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Number 03215.0000

Re: CASE ADMINISTRATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM JUNE 5, 2002
THROUGH AUGUST 28, 2002

TIME SUMMARY:

Professional Hours Rate Value
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA 45.70 hours at 490.00 = 22,393.00
STEVEN POHL 0.20 hours at 425.00 = 85.00
WILLIAM M. DOLAN IIT 5.60 hours at 445.00 = 2,492.00
MARK S BALDWIN 2.30 hours at 425.00 = 977.50
DANIEL C. GUSENOFF 22.90 hours at 275.00 = 6,297 .50
REGINA C. CHEUNG 0.40 hours at 245.00 = g98.00
CATHERINE W. NG 1.40 hours at 13%0.00 = 266.00
EDWARD S. WEISFELNER 24 .00 hours at 525.00 = 12,600.00
SCOTT M. BERMAN 6.10 houxrs at 425.00 = 2,582.50
KENNETH S. GOODWIN 0.30 hours at 390.00 = 117.00
JOHN P. BIEDERMANN 0.50 hours at 365.00 = 182.50
DAPHNEE SURPRIS . 155.80 hours at 275.00 = 43,945.00
LESLIE H. SCHARF 4.10 = 1,353.00
SARINA LO CASCIO 20.40 = 2,856.00
CHRISTOPHER M. LAUKAMG 73.30 = 6,9263.50

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE
KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BiLL WITH YOUR CHECK TO OUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT”
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-31087175

L 3
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number #*#*%*
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 4
August 29, 2002

CURRENT FEES ‘ 103,218.50
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002
04/01/02 GUSENOFF
04/01/02 WEISFELNER
04/01/02 BERMAN
04/01/02 SURPRIS
04/01/02 LAUKAMG
04/02/02 BALDIGA
04/02/02 GUSENOFF
0s4/02/02 CHEUNG
04/02/02 SURPRIS
04/02/02 SURPRIS
04/03/02 GUSENOFF

Invoice Number

Page

- REVIEWED AND ANALYZED RECENT

PROXY STATEMENT, ARTICLES OF
ORGANIZATION, FORM 10-K (2.1)
; RESEARCHED AND ANALYZED
DELAWARE LAW RE: CORP.
GOVERNANCE {3.0) ; RESEARCHED
AND ANALYZED STRATEGIES TO
HOLD STOCKHOLDER MEETINGS
WITHOUT A FINDING OF "CLEAR
ABUSE" (3.0) ; DRAFTED MEMO
RE: BANKRUPTCY LAW AND CORP.
GOVERNANCE ISSUES (1.0)

- REVIEW INTERNAL RESEARCH
MEMO RE OPTIONS FOR EQUITY IN
LIGHT OF RECENT DEVELOPMENTS
{.70) ; ATTEMPTED CONTACT WITH
FORTGANG (.10)

- REVIEW MASTER PLAN RE CASE

STRATEGY (.8); 0OC, TCS W/DS RE

SAME(.2) ; REVIEW E-MAILS RE
SAME (.1)

REVIEW 3/25/02 HEARING
TRANSCRIPTS (2.3)

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
{.3); INDEX PLEADINGS {.5);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.2)

- ANALYZE RIGHTS TO
APPOINTMENT OF EXAMINER

- REVISED AND EDITED MEMO RE:
DELAWARE LAW AND BANKRUPTCY
ISSUES (4.0) ; CONFERENCES
WITH STEVE LONDON RE:

CORPORATE ‘GOVERNANCE MEMOS (.6)

OFESSIONAL

: BALDIGA RE CASE
ADMIN (.20); REVIEW INCOMING
pLEADINGé (170
- REVISED“&H “HD?TED BRBI
MEMOS RE: BANKRUPTCY LAW,
DELAWARE LAW AND CORPORATE
GOVERNANCE ISSUE

Akkkkk

420.

467

632

95

98

1,265

28

1,072

330

718

2,502.50

00

.50

.50

.00

.00

.00

.00

.50

.00

.00

L 3
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Pleading Page 20 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO,

INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION
BAugust 29, 2002

04/03/02

04/03/02

04/03/02

04/04/02

04/04/02

04/04/02

04/04/02

04/05/02

SURPRIS

SURPRIS

LO CASCIO

BALDIGA

GUSENQFF

WEISFELNER

SURPRIS

GUSENOFF

Invoice Number  ex¥%xx

Page

- E-MATL BALDIGA RE VENTURES
LIT ISSUE (.10); CONTINUE TO
LOCATE INFO RE VENTURES LIT
{.20)

- LEXIS SEARCH RE EXAMINER AND
RESEARCH NEWS ARTICLE PER
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE SAME
{3.60}); TEL. CONF. BALDIGA AND
LONDON RE EQUITY HOLDERS
{.20); REVIEW DEBTOR'S
SCHEDULES RE IDENTITY OF
EQUITY HOLDERS (1.0); E-MAIL
BALDIGA AND LONDON RE SAME
{.10)

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
{.3}; REVIEW SAME FOR CALENDAR
DATES (.2)

- REVIEW MATERIALS (.1); MEMO
TCO FEE REVIEW COMMITTEE;
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MS.
LONSTEIN REGARDING PROTOCOL,
4/9 MEETING, BUDGET
CATEGORIES, ETC (.3).

- RESEARCHED, ANALYZED AND
REVIEWED COMDISCO CORPORATE
DOCUMENTS, DELAWARE LAW/CASE
LAW RE: CORPORATE GOVERNANCE
ISSUES (2.0); CITE CHECKED
CASE LAW (1.0); CONFERENCES
WITH STEVEN LONDON RE:
RELATIONSHIP OF DELAWARE LAW
TO CORPORATE GOVERNANCE
DOCUMENT (.9); REVISED ‘AND
EDITED MEMO R

ERERE]

- T/CS PEDOWITZ;“BRAVERMAN

INCOMING PLEADINGS ( 50} ;
ADDITIONAL RESEARCH 'RE ARTICLE
RE EXAMINER (1.1)

- REVIEWED AND ANALYZED
CORPORATE GOVERNANCE DOCUMENTS
AND FORM 10-K RE: DIRECTORS
AND UPCOMING ELECTIONS

0.5 137.50
4.9 1,347.50
0.5 70.00
0.4 196.00
5.9 1,622.50
1.2 630.00
5.3 1,457.50
0.7 192.50
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002
04/05/02 WEISFELNER
04/05/02 SURPRIS
04/05/02 LO CASCIO
04/07/02 WEISFELNER
04/08/02 BALDIGA
04/08/02 GOODWIN
04/08/02 SURPRIS
04a/08/02 LAUKAMG
04/09/02 BALDIGA
04/098/02 SURPRIS
04/10/02 BERMAN
04/10/02 SURPRIS

Invoice Number

Page

T/C TUITE RE TRADING ISSUE AND
0/C DAPHNEE SURPRIS RE
SBEME (.20}
- REVISE MEMC RE EXAMINER PER
BILL BALDIGA'S COMMENTS (4.1);
REVIEW CASE RE SAME (1.2);
TEL. CONFS. MB RE SAME (.50);
REVIEW INCOMING PLEADINGS {1.3)
- RETRIEVE EQUITY COMMITTEE'S
TRADING ORDER
- REVIEW AND EDIT MEMO TO
COMMITTEE ON ALTERNATIVES AND
STRATEGIES (1.8).
- PREPARE FOR FRC MEETING;
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR.
BODENSTEIN; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH MR. PEDOWITZ
REGARDING SAME
-0/C WITH DAPHNEE SURPRIS RE
FILES (.3)
- REVIEW AND ANALYZE FIRST
INTERIM FEE APPLICATION RE FEE
REVIEW COMMITTEE (6.1); REVIEW
DOCKET PACKAGE TO EQUITY (2.3)
- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES;
{(.6); INDEX PLEADINGS (.9)
- REVIEW MATERIALS; CONFERENCE
WITH MR. PEDOWITZ TO PREPARE
FOR FEE REVIEW COMMITTEE
MEETING (.2); MEMO TO SKADDEN
REGARDING 4/12 MEETING ISSUES
(.1)
- ATTEND JOINT FEE REVIEW
COMMITTEE MEETING
(2.9) ;DISCUSS SAME WITH EDWARD
S. WEISFELNER( 40), CALCULATE
BREAKDOWN OF TIME ENTRY RE
"OTHER PROF. n CATEGORY(z 8);
DRAFT CHART:R “SAME( 30); TEL.
CONF. C. LONSTEIN RE JOINT FEE
“10), DRAFT

: f IgG MEETING
{(1.2); DISCUSS EXPENSE TRAVEL
WITH ACCOUNTING( J30)
- REVIEW VARIOUS COMDISCO
E-MATL bk
- OFF. CONF. EDWARD S.
WEISFELNER RE MEMO TO JOINT
FEE REVIEW COMMITTEE RE
BREAKDOWN OF "OTHER PROF
RETENTION" (.20); REVIEW

7

@

khkkkk*k

105.00

1,952.50

42.00

945.00

147.00

117.00

2,310.00

142 .50

147.00

2,200.00

127.50

1,622.50
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATICN
August 29, 2002

04/10/02 SURPRIS
04/10/02 LO CASCIC
04/10/02 LAUKAMG

04/11/02 BALDIGA .

04/11/02 BIEDERMANN
04/11/02 SURPRIS
04/11/02 SURPRIS

oa/1z/02 BALDIGA

04/12/02 SURPRIS

w w w
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

PLEADINGS, ORDER RESEARCH,
ANALYSIS RELATING TO OTHER
PROF. RETENTION(3.3); DRAFT
MEMO TO JOINT FEE REVIEW
COMMITTEE RE SAME (2.4)

- REVIEW INCCOMING PLEADINGS RE
4/18/02 HEARING(3.0); DRAFT
MEMO TO EQUITY COMMITTEE RE
SAME (2.0}

~ RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
(.3); RETRIEVE PLEADINGS
ON-LINE AND PREPARE CASE
CALENDAR (1.2}

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
{.8); INDEX PLEADINGS (2.0);
RETRIEVE DEBTORS' FIRST
OMIIBUS OBJECTICN TO CLAIMS
AND ARRANGE TO ORTAIN COPY OF
SAME PER LESLIE H. SCHARF
{.2); REVIEW CURRENT DOCKET
ON-LINE FOR PLEBDINGS AND
ARRANGE TO OBTAIN COPY OF SAME
PER DAPHNEE SURPRIS (.5)

- REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING
FEE REVIEW COMMITTEE PROTOCOL,
ETC.

- REVIEW OF DAPHNEE SURPRIS
FEE AUDIT MEMO; OFFICE
CONFERENCE WITH FS RE: SAME

- REVIEW PRE-BILL RE 3/02 FEES
(1.0}; ORGANIZE DOCS RE TRAVEL
EXPENSES '

- PREPARE FOR EQUITY COMMITTEE
MEETING(1.5); PARTICIPATE IN
MEETING WITH PROF. ADVISORS
(3.0}; TE. CONF. WITH WILLIAM
R. BALDIGA AND MARK BALDWIN RE

1,375.00

210.00

332.50

98.00
182.50
825.00

165.00

392.00

1,375.00
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION

August 29, 2002
04/12/02 SURPRIS
04/12/02 LAUKAMG
04/15/02 BALDIGA
04/15/02 BERMAN
04/15/02 SURPRIS
04/15/02 SURPRIS
04/15/02 LAUKAMG
04/16/02 SURPRIS
04/16/02 LO CASCIO
04/17/02 BERMAN

Invoice Number

Page

CASE STRATEGY (.50)

- OFF. CONF. WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA RE JOINT FEE REVIEW
COMMITTEE'S REQUEST(.50);
DRAFT BUDGET RE 4/02-7/02(.50)
- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
{.5); INDEX PLEADINGS (1.2);
RETRIEVE AND REVIEW CURRENT
DOCKET ON-LINE FOR ORDERS
APPROVING THE LEASING OF
ELECTRONICS LAR AND SCIENCES
AND IT CAP SERVICES AND
ARRANGE TO OBTAIN A COPY OF
SAME PER DAPHNEE SURPRIS (.8)
- PREPARE FOR 4/18 FEE HEARING
- TEL. CONFS. MARK S. BALDWIN
AND DANA S. MONTONE (.2) ;
REVIEW MOTION RE TYCO
SETTLEMENT AND OBJECTION BY
EQUITY COMMITTEE(.8)

- REVIEW INCOMING PLEADINGS
(1.0)

- TEL. CONFS. WITH WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA RE JOINT FEE REVIEW
COMMITTEE REQUEST(.30); E-MAIL
TO BELL BOYD RE BUDGET (.20)
- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(.3); INDEX PLERDINGS (.6);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.3);
RETRIEVE VARIOUS PRESENTATIONS
TO THE EQUITY COMMITTEE AND
ARRANGE TO OBTAIN A COPY OF
SAME PER DAPHNEE SURPRIS (.3)
- DREPARE STATUS RE BREI
OBLIGATIONS IN RESP. TO FEE
COMMITTEE'S REQUEST (2.3);
PREPARE RESPONSE RE TRAVEL
EXPENSES & PREPARE MEMO TO
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE

SAME (2.5); MEMO TO JOINT FEE
RE BREBKDOWN OF MATTERS FOR
THE MONTHS OF DECEMBER AND
MARCH (2.6)

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE S$SAME
{.3); RETRIEVE PLEADINGS
ON-LINE AND PREPARE CASE
CALENDAR (.8)

- TEL. CONFS. SUNGARD'S COUNSEL

9

| e ]

w @ ) -
-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

o W

.1

.3

L

khkkkkk

275.00

237.50

147.00

425.00

275.00

137.50

142.50

2,035.00

154.00

127.50
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002
ca/17/02 SURPRIS
04/18/02 SURPRIS
04/18/02 LO CASCIO
04/19/02 LAUKAMG
0a/24/02 BERMAN
0a/24/02 1.0 CASCIO
04/25/02 BALDIGA
04/25/02 BERMAN
04/26/02 BALDIGA
0a/26/02 BALDIGA
04/26/02 BERMAN

v

@
5 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

- REVISE TRAVEL EXPENSES MEMO;
TEL. CONF. WITH WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA RE SAME (1.2); PREPARE
DOCS FOR WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE
4/18 HEARING (.20); TEL.
CONFS. WITHE WILLIAM R. BALDIGA
RE 4/18/02 HEARING (1.2);
REVISE MONTHLY BILL ENTRIES
(.80); OFFICE CONF. WITH
EDWARD S. WEISFELNER RE
SAME(.10) ; REVIEW INCOMING
PLEADINGS (.50)

- PREPARE AND SERVE MONTHLY
FEE STATEMENT(5.3); TEL. CONF.
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE HEARING
(.20); REVIEW PLEADING RE
FAZIO AND EXHIBITS (2.5)

- REVIEW FILES FOR DEPOSITION
TRANSCRIFPTS FOR DAPHNEE SURPRIS
- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(.5); INDEX PLEADINGS (1L.5)

- 0/C DAPHNEE SURPRIS RE:
BREAKUP FEE DECISICN.

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
(.3); REVIEW PLEADINGS AND
UPDATE CALENDAR (.9); E-MAIL
DAPHNEE SURPRIS RE SAME (.1)

- REVIEW NEW FEE ORDER AND
OUTLINE ISSUES UNRESOLVED

- REVIEW BREAK UP FEE DECISION
AND DRAFT MEMO AND OFFICE
CONFERENCES WITH DAPHNEE
SURPRIS REGARDING SAME

- REVIEW MATERIALS FROM US
TRUSTEE AS TO QUESTIONS ON FEE
APPLICATIONS AND PREPARE
RESPONSES (.4); MEMOS TO
PEDOWITZ, OTHERS REGARDING
4/30 FRC MEETING AND ISSUES TO
ADDRESS (.2); PREPARE
MATERIALS FOR FRC (.2)

- REVIEW TRADING ORDER TO
REVIEW ISSUES AS TO ADDITION
OF PERMITTED STUFF

- REVIEW DAPHNEE SURPRIS
E-MAILS REGARDING BREZKUP FEE
QPINION

10

1,017.50

2,200.00

56.00

120.00

85.00

182.00

98.00

510.00

382.00

147.G60

85.00
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION

August 29,

04/26/02

04/26/02

0s/27/02

04/29/02

04/29/02

04/30/02

04/30/02

04/30/02

05/01/02

05/01/02

05/01/02

2002

LO CASCIO

LAUKAMG

BALDIGA

BALDIGA

BERMAN

BALDIGA

LO CASCIO

BALDIGA

WEISFELNER

WEISFELNER

Invoice Number

Page

- RETRIEVE EQUITY COMMITTEE'S
TRADING ORDER ON-LINE AND
E-MAIL SAME TO WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(.5); INDEX PLEADINGS (.8)

- REVIEW RECENT MOTIONS FOR
BRANDYWINE (PENNSYLVANIA
LANDLORD) AND CFS PLAN
PARTICIPANTS AND DECIDE
WHETHER TO TAKE POSITIONS

- REVIEW MATERIALS; CONFERENCE
WITH MR. PEDOWITZ TO PREPARE
FOR FRC MEETING OF 4/30

- OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH
EDWARD S. WEISFELNER RE BREAK
UP FEE; DRAFT AND REVISE MEMO
REGARDING BREAK UP FEE

- PARTICIPATE IN FEE REVIEW
COMMITTEE MEETING,
PARTICULARLY TO RESPOND TO
MANY BRBI FEE APPLICATTON
QUESTIONS

- ATTEND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
CALL OF FEE REVIEW COMMITTEE
{1.1); PREPARE MEMO TO BILL
BALDIGA REGARDING SAME (.3)

- RETRIEVE MEMORANDUM QPINION
RE BREAK-UP FEE ON-LINE AND
ARRANGE TO SEND TC COMMITTEE
PER SCOTT M. BERMAN

- MEMO TO ALL EQUITY PROPS
REGARDING 4/30 FRC MEEIING
GUIDELINGS GOING FORWARD“ ETC.

(. 40), FURTHER

RELATED T/cs BALDIGA AND
BALDWIN (1 1), BRIEF T/C
FORTGANG (. 1) S :
- (TIME ENTRY I8 FOR ABRIL 9,
2002) PREPARE FOR AND
PARTICIPATE IN FEE REVIEW
COMMITTEE (2.4)

11

»
Desc

% Kok ok ok ke

56.00

123.50

245.00

147.00

510.00

539.00

266.00

70.00

3982.00

840.00

1,260.00
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002

05/01/02 WEISFELNER
05/01/02 WEISFELNER
05/01/02 SURPRIS
05/01/02 SURPRIS
05/01/02 SURPRIS
05/01/02 SURPRIS

Invoice Number (F&*%¥*

Page

- {(TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 17,
2002) MULTIPLE T/CS PANAGAKIS,
T. CHEN, WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE
MATTERS SCHEDULE FOR HEARING
ON 4/18 WITH A VIEW TO
STREAMLINING EVIDENTIARY
PRESENTATION, INCLUDING REVIEW
OF PROPOSED STIP (2.2)

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 29,
2002} REVIEW DRAFT OF FAZIO
OBJECTION AND DISCUSS
DISCOVERY WITH WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA, MARK BALDWIN AND
LONSTEIN (1.0); BEGIN REVIEW
OF PLAN AND DISCLOSURE (1.4);
REVIEW BERMAN MEMO ON HP
BREAKUP FEES (.20)

- {(TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 25,
2002} OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH
EDWARD S. WEISFELNER RE FEE
ISSUES {.2); TELEPHONE TO M.
MURPHY RE SAME ({.1); TELEPHONE
TO WRB RE FEE COMMITTEE ISSUES
(.3); DRAFT 2ND INTERIM FEE
APPLICATION (2.0)

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 26,
2002) TELEPHONE TO WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA RE 4/30/02 FEE
COMMITTEE MEETING (.2);
PREPARE MEMO TO FEE COMMITTEE
RE 4/30/02 MEETING (1.2);
GATHER INFO RE SAME (2.5);
OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH EDWARD
S. WEISFELNER RE BREAKUP FEE

COMMITTEE RE SAME>%2 1)
- (TIME ENTRY IE FQR APRIL 19,

E
FAZIC'S EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT

RE CONFIDENTIALITY (2. 0); T/C

WILLIAM R. BALDIGh RE SAME
{.30) ; PREPARE' D £s TO WILLIAM

R. BALDIGA AND'MARK BALDWIN RE

PLEADINGS (1.2)°
- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 22,
2002) REVIEW INCOMING
PLEADINGS (1.5)

12

2.2 1,155.00
2.6 1,365.00
2.6 715.00
6.2 1,705.00
7.5 2,062.50
1.5 412.50
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002
05/01/02 SURPRIS
05/01/02 SURPRIS
05/01/02 SURPRIS
05/01/02 LO CASCIO
05/02/02 BALDIGA
05/03/02 BALDIGA
05/06/02 BALDIGA
05/06/02 WEISFELNER
05/07/02 BALDIGA
05/07/02 WEISFELNER

@ - -
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

L

Invoice Number *x*%%x

Page

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 23,
2002) T/C WILLIAM R. BALDIGA
RE WATER TOWERS DEP RE
CONFIDENTIALITY ISSUE(.20);
T/C LONSTEIN RE SAME (.3);
REVIEW PLEADINGS RE SAME
(1.3); PREPARE PACKAGE TO
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE
SAME(.50) DRAFT SECOND INTERIM
FEE APPLICATION(S.2)

- {TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 24,
2002) REVIEW INCOMING
PLEADINGS (3.2); T/C WILLIAM
R. BALDIGA RE SAME (.20); O/C
ACCOUNTING RE NEW PROTOCOLS IN
PREPARE OF SECOND INTERIM
FEES(1.2); ORGANIZE FILES(.50)
- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 25,
2002) CONTINUE TO GATHER INFO
RE 2ND INTERIM (3.5)

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
(.3); PREPARE CALENDAR AND
CIRCULATE SAME (.3)

- RANALYZE TRADING ORDER ISSUES
AS TC COMMITTEE MEMBER

- REVIEW BODENSTEIN'S CASE
GUIDELINES FOR FEES AND MEMO
TO EQUITY COMMITTEE TEAM
REGARDING SAME (.5); MEMO TO
FEE REVIEW COMMITTEE AND
CARMEN LONSTEIN REGARDING
FACTS TO RESPOND TO FEE REVIEW
COMMITTEE'S REQUIREMENTS (.5)
- PREPARE FOR'5/8 FEE HEARING;
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS.
PERLMAN REGARDING SAME

T/C B. WILLIAMS IN PREPARATION
FOR EQUITY COMMITTEE CALL
(.4); PREPARE FOR AND CONDUCT
TELEPHONIC COMMITTEE MEETING
(1.6) -

- PREPARE FOR 5/8 FEE HEARING;
MEMOS TO AND FROM U.S.
TRUSTEE, MR. HANSON

- T/C WILLIAM R. BALDIGA TO
FOLLOW UP ON TRADING WALL
ISSUE FOR GLENVIEW, DISCUSS
SETTLEMENT STATUS AND FOLLOW
UP REQUESTS FOR SKADDEN RE
PONTIKES TRADING ISSUES (.4);

13

7.5 2,062.50
5.1 1,402.50
3.5 962.50
0.6 84.00
0.3 147.00
1.0 490.00
0.2 98.00
2.0 1,050.00
0.4 196.00
1.6 840.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 28 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number HH%%%%
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 14
August 29, 2002

CORO FROM M. BALDWIN RE FAZTO
DEPO (.10); ATTENTION TO
EMAILS RE FEE HEARINGS FROM
FEE REVIEW COMMITTEE (.10);
REVIEW OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

(1.0)

0s/08/02 WEISFELNER COMMUNICATE WITH WILLIAM R. 0.2 105.00
BALDIGA RE HEARING AGENDA (.20)

05/08/02 SURPRIS - REVIEW INCOMING 7.8 2,145.00

PLEADINGS(3.5); CONTINUE TO
PREPARE SECOND FEE APP TO
COMPLY WITH JOINT FEE REVIEW
COMMITTEE'S REQUIREMENTS (3.7);
O/C WITH K. GRAUER AND D.
PEARSON-HEYWARD RE SAME (.6)
05/08/02 LO CASCIO - RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET 1.0 140.00
ON-LINE (.3); PREPARE AND
CIRCULATE CASE CALENDAR (.4);
REVIEW FILES FOR OFFICERS AND
DIRECTORS POLICIES PER DAPHNEE
SURPRIS (.3)
05/08/02 LAUKAMG - REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES 3.0 285.00
{.8); INDEX PLEADINGS (1.0);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (1.2)

05/09/02 BALDIGA - REVIEW MATERIALS FROM 0.1 49.00
GLENVIEW REGARDING TRADING WALL
05/09/02 SURPRIS - 0/C K. GRAUER RE TRAVEL 3.8 1,045.00

DISBURSEMENTS AND REVIEW
SAME (1.2} ; CONTINUE TC WORK ON
SECOND FEE APPLICATION(.2.6)
05/09/02 LO CASCIO - REVIEW FILES FOR PLAN AND 0.8 112.00
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FOR
DAPHNEE SURPRIS (.3); REVIEW
FILES FOR EXHIBITS TO MERCURY
FINANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
AND RETRIEVE SAMEfFROM STORAGE
PER EDWARD S. QFELNER (.5)
05/10/02 BALDIGA - REVISE SECOND'FEE' . 0.3 147.00
APPLICATION "MEMOS FROM '
UST, MR. HANS N EGARDING FEE

REVIEW COMMIT ISSUES (.1)
05/10/02 SURPRIS - 0/C WILLIAM R, BALDIGA RE 4.0 1,100.00
FEE APPLICATION AND CASE

E Rt ]

STATUS (. 2d)]“dg%1;s TO WILLIAM
R. BALDIGA RE EXHIBITS RE FEE
APPLICATION (.30)} CONTINUE TO
REVIEW RECEIPTS RE TRAVEL
DISRURSEMENTS IN PREPARATION

OF 2ND FEE APPLICATION(3.5}
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Case 01-24795

L W w w '
Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 29 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002
05/10/02 LAUKAMG
05/11/02 BALDIGA
05/13/02 BALDIGA
05/13/02 BALDWIN
05/13/02 SURPRIS
05/14/02 SURPRIS
05/14/02 LO CASCIO

Invoice Number
Page 15

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES 3.5
(1.0); INDEX PLEADINGS {(1.2);

UPDATE MASTER INDEX (.8);

PREPARE AND SENT OUT EXHIBITS

OF THE MERCURY FINANCE

COMPANY'S SECOND AMENDED

DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TO

WILLIAM BALDIGA AND PHILIP

FLINK IN BOSTON AND ARRANGE TO

OBTAIN A COPY OF SAME PER

EDWARD S. WEISFELNER (.5)

- REVIEW MATERIALS FROM WATER 0.1
TOWER REGARDING ITS FEES,

DOCUMENTS UNDER SEAL

- REVIEW MATERIALS; MEMO TO ED 0.1
WEISFELNER REGARDING WATER
TOWER DISPUTE

REVIEW OF WATER TOWER MOTION
{2.3)

- T/C W/MATTHEW BROWN RE STIP
MOTION (.20); T/C WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA RE FEE
APPLICATION(.10); T/C MATTHEW
BROWN E 0OSC'S EMPLOYMENT
AGREEMENT (.10); T/C M. MURPHY
RE EMPLOYEE RETENTION MEMO
{.20}; T/CS MATTHEW BROWN RE
SAME (.10); T/C CARMEN
LONSTEIN RE SECOND FEE
APPLICATION (.20); REVIEW
INCOMING PLEADINGS (1.2)

- T/C MATTHEW BROWN RE
ROTHSCHILD AND MCKINSEY'S
RETENTION{.20); T/CS YETNIKOFF
RE SECOND FEE APPS(.30);
COMPLETE AND PREPARE FILING OF
SECOND INTERIM FEE APP(4.6);
PREPARE COMMITTEE MEMEERS
SECOND APPS AND ARRANGE FILING
OF SAME(1.3); O/C KEN GRAUER
RE BILLS IN PREPARATION OF
SECOND INTERIM FEE APPS({1.3)

- RETRIEVE MCKINSEY AND 1.0
ROTHSCHILD RETENTION

APPLICATIONS (.4); RETRIEVE

COMMITTEE'S MONTHLY
REIMBURSEMENT REQUESTS
RETRIEVE AND E-MAIL
COMMITTEE'S SUPPLEMENTAL
OBJECTIONS TO CLIENT PER
DAPHNEE SURPRIS (.3)

(.3);

w

Rk kkk

332.50

49.00

4%9.00

977.50

577.50

2,117.50

140.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 30 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002
05/15/02 SURPRIS
05/15/02 10 CASCIO
05/16/02 BALDIGA
05/16/02 SURPRIS
05/17/02 DOLAN IIT
05/17/02 LAUKAMG
05/19/02 DOLAN IIT
05/20/02 LAUKAMG
05/21/02 DOLAN III
05/21/02 SURPRIS
05/22/02 LO CASCIO
0s/28/02 SURPRIS
05/28/02 LAUKAMG
05/29/02 WEISFELNER
05/29/02 SURPRIS
0s5/29/02 LO CASCIO

Invoice Number

Page

- T/C MATTHEW BROWN RE
COMPLAINTS (.20); REVIEW
INCOMING PLEADING (1.0)

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME

- REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING
FURTHER COMMENT/OBJECTION
EXPENSE ITEMS, ORDER (.1);
REVIEW MINUTES OF FEE R.C.
MEETING OF 4/30; FOLLOW UP
MEMOS (.1)

- PREPARE BREAKDOWN OF SECOND
INTERIM FEE APP

- CONFERENCE WITH E.
WEISFELNER, W. BALDIGA, AND M.
BALDWIN REGARDING ACTION
PLAN(1.0); OUTLINE ISSUES(.4)
PREPARE DISCOVERY AND
LITIGATION ACTION PLAN.

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(1.0); INDEX PLEADINGS {(2.0}; -
UPDATE MASTER INDEX (.2)

- READ COMPLAINT; RESEARCH
REGARDING ARSOLUTE PRIVILEGE
DOCTRINE; OUTLINE ISSUES.

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(1.0); INDEX PLEADINGS (1.2);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.8)

- TELEPHONE CALL WITH M.
BALDWIN AND J. STOLL REGARDING
STATUS.

- REVIEW TIME ENTRIES RE
MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT(1.0)

- RETRIEVE UPDATED’ DOCKET
ON-LINE (.3); PR PARE AND
CIRCULATE CASE’ ALENDAR (.6)

5 g g

PREPARATION OF

AND RELATEDugﬁgTERs (.40)
- DRAFT BREAKDOW
INTERIM FEE = 'ressdfiil:

- RETRIEVE PROTOCOL FOR FEE
REVIEW COMMITTEE AND ORDER
REGARDING JOINT FEE REVIEW

COMMITTEE FOR DAPHNEE SURPRIS

16

@
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330.00

42.00

98.00

357.50

623.00

304.00
1,112.50
285.00
445.00

275.00

126.00

1,045.00

47.50
210.00

412.50

70.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 31 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION

August 29, 2002
05/30/02 LO CASCIO
05/30/02 LAUKAMG
05/31/02 SURPRIS
06/01/02 BALDIGA
06/03/02 POHI,
06/03/02 DOLAN ITT
06/03/02 BERMAN
06/03/02 SURPRIS
06/03/02 LO CBSCIO
06/03/02 LAUKAMG
06/04/02 DOLAN III
06/04/02 LAUKAMG
06/05/02 BERMAN

Inveoice Number
Page

-~ RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
{.3); PREPARE AND CIRCULATE
CASE CALENDAR (.5); TELEPHONE
CALLS FROM REGINA CHEUNG AND
OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH
CHRISTOPER LAUKAMG RE PULLING
CASES CITED IN OBJECTION FOR
EDWARD S. WEISFELNER (.2});
OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH DAPHNEE
SURPRIS REGARDING SAME (.1)

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(.6); INDEX PLEADINGS (L1.7)

- REVIEW INCOMING
PLEADINGS{1.0); EMAIL TO
LONSTEIN RE HEARING (.30)

- REVIEW NEW LEASE REJECTION
MOTICN

- REVIEW LETTER TO
SHAREHOLDERS AND RELATED TAX
ISSUE

- CONFERENCE WITH M. BALDWIN
REGARDING STATUS OF DISCOVERY.
- OC W/STEVEN E. GREENBAUM

- REVISE MONTHLY STATEMENT PER
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA'S

COMMENTS (1.0} ; REVIEW INCOMING
PLEADINGS(.7)

- REVIEW FILES FOR REVISED
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.1);
RETRIEVE SAME ON-LINE AND
E-MAIL SAME TQ ATTORNEYS (.4)
- REVIEW FILES”
(3),Immx_f
UPDATE MAST
RETRIEVE MC'
COMDISCO fT

VENTURES PRESENT
ARRANGE TO OBTAI
PER DAPHNEE '
- REVIEW‘ﬁIs

S. GREENBAUM REG ”bI'Gf 7
PROPOSED DRAF" NT
- REVIEW AND’ORGAN&ZE FILES
{(1.8); INDEX PLEADINGS (2.0);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.7)

- REVIEW EDWARD S. WEISFELNER
MEMO

17

<

w

W

*kokkk ok

154.00

218.50

357.50

49.00

85.00

222.50

127.50
467.50

70.00

- 142.50

89.00

' 427.50

127.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 32 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002
06/05/02 SURPRIS
06/05/02 LO CASCIO
06/05/02 LAUKAMG
06/07/02 LAUKAMG
06/11/02 SURPRIS
06/12/02 BALDIGA
06/12/02 SURPRIS
06/12/02 LO CASCIO
06/13/02 LAUKAMG
06/14/02 BALDIGA
06/17/02 BALDIGA
06/17/02 WEISFELNER

Invoice Number

Page

- FINALIZE MONTHLY STATEMENT
AND SERVE(.50); REVIEW
PRE-BILL RE 5/02 MONTHLY
STATEMENT AND DISCUSS SAME
WITH ACCOUNTING{1l.5)

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
(.3); REVIEW DOCKET FOR
CALENDAR DATES (.2)

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(.3); INDEX PLEADINGS (.7);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.5)

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(.5); INDEX PLEADINGS (1.6);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.8);
RETRIEVE PLEADINGS FROM FILES
AND ARRANGE TO OBTAIN A COPY
OF SAME PER DAPHNEE SURPRIS
(.3); RETRIEVE OBJECTION OF
CREDITOR JAMES P. LABE TO
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT WITH
RESPECT TO THE JOINT PLAN OF
REORGANIZATION AND ARRANGE TO
FAX SAME TO MARK S. BALDWIN
(.3)

- REVIEW INCOMING PLEADINGS.

- REVIEW MATERIALS; MEMO FROM
U.S. TRUSTEE; MEMOS TO MR.
PEDOWITZ REGARDING FEE R.C.
ISSUES

- T/C BALDIGA RE 6/18 HEARING.
- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
(.3); PREPARE AND CIRCULATE
CALENDAR (.5) i
- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(1.0); INDEX P ADINGS(2 0);
UPDATE MASTER ‘ I
- REVIEW ALL PLEADINGS FOR
6/18 HEARING AND RECOMMEND
E.C.'S POSITIO o INVOLVEMENT
- REVIEW MATER s REGARDING
AGENDA ; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
WITH MS. LONST ' REGARDING
6/18 HEARING,
_ REVIEW AGENTA LETTER FOR
6/18 HEARING {.3) AND REVIEW
MOTION ON EMPLOYEE BENEFITS
{(1.4)

IMS RESOLUTION

18
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550.00

70.00

142.50

332.50

275.00
98.00

82.50
112.00

427.50

343.00

98.00

892.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 33 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002
06/19/02 LO CASCIO
06/20/02 WEISFELNER
06/20/02 LO CASCIO
06/21/02 BALDIGA
06/21/02 SURPRIS
06/24/02 WEISFELNER
06/24/02 LAUKAMG
06/25/02 LAUKAMG
06/26/02 BALDIGA
06/26/02 BALDIGA
06/26/02 LO CASCIO

Invoice Number

Page

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
{.3); PREPARE CALENDAR ({.1)

- REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING
NATURE QF SECURITY TO BE
ISSUED IN CONNECTION WITH
SETTLEMENT {.990) ; AND RELATED
DISCUSSIONS WITH WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA (.20)

- PREPARE CALENDAR AND
CIRCULATE SAME

- REVIEW MATERIALS FCR
PREPARATION FOR FEE REVIEW
COMMITTEE MEETING OF 6/27/02;
MEMO TO SUKLEY REGARDING SAME
- REVIEW AND REVISE TIME ENTRY
RE MAY MONTHLY FEES(1.5);
PREPARE AND FILE MONTHLY FEE
STATEMENT (1.2)

- T/C M. PERKEL RE STATUS OF
FAZIO MOTION (.30); ATTENTION
TO ISSUES RE WATERTOWER FEES
AND RELATED DISCUSSION WITH
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE SAME AND
SETTLEMENT STATUS(.70)

- RETRIEVE SECOND INTERIM FEE
APPLICATIONS OF VARIOUS
PROFESSIONALS AND ARRANGE TO
OBTAIN A COPY OF SAME PER
DAPENEE SURPRIS

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
{.5) ; INDEX PLEADINGS (1.0)

- LETTER FROM BUYER/OFFEREE OF
N.J. REAL ESTATE; MEMO TO MR.
PANAGAKIS REGARDING SAME

- REVIEW MATERIALS; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH MR. LAMIMAN
REGARDING WTC FEE ISSUES (.2);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR.
PANAGAKIS; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH MR. LAMIMAN
REGARDING WTC FEE SETTLEMENT
{.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
WITH AND MEMC FROM MR. LAMIMAN
(.1)

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
(.3} ; PREPARE AND CIRCULATE
CASE CALENDAR (.9)

19

L

ok k Rk

56.00

577.50

70.00

98.00

742.50

5E25.00

266.00

142.50

98.00

294 .00

168.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 34 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, IMC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002
06/26/02 LAUKAMG
06/27/02 BALDIGA
oe/27/02 LAUKAMG
07/03/02 WEISFELNER
07/03/02 LO CASCIO
07/03/02 LAUKAMG
07/08/02 SCHARF
07/08/02 LO CASCIO
07/08/02 LAUKAMG
07/10/02 BALDIGA

Invoice Number

Page 20
~ REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES 4,
(1L.5); INDEX PLEADINGS (2.0);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.7)
- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 4,

MR. PANAGAKIS, MR. LACKEY, MS.
PERLMAN REGARDING WTC FEES,
PONTIKES, ETC. (.6}; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH MR. LAMMAMIN
(WIC)} REGARDING WTC FEE
ISSUES; REVIEW MATERIALS
REGARDING INDEMNIFICATIONS
(.2); PRELIMINARY REVIEW ALL
FEE APPLICATIONS FOR FRC
MEETING (1.3); REVIEW
SKADDEN'S AGENDA, DRAFT FRC
REPORT (.3}; CONDUCT FEE
REVIEW MEETING (1.9); FOLLOW
UP TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
DAVID PEDOWITZ (.1)

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES 3.

{1.2}; INDEX PLEADINGS (1.7);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.6)

- O/C LESLIE H. SCHARF RE FEE 0.

APPLICATIONS {.20); REVIEW
MOTIONS FOR ALLOWANCE FOR
VOTING PURPOSES(.40) -

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET 0.

ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
(.3); PREPARE AND CIRCULATE
CALENDAR (.4}

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES 2.

(.8); INDEX PLEADINGS (1.5}

- REVIEW OF BILLING SUMMARY 1.

RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT TO
BE SERVED FOR JUNE 2002.

- RETRIEVE LAST MONTHLY 0.

INVOICE AND LAST FEE
APPLICATION SUBMITTED AND FEE
PROCEDURES ORDER FOR LESLIE H.

SCHARF

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES 3.

(.8)}; INDEX PLEADINGS (1.5} ;
UPDATE MASTER FILES (1.2}

- REVIEW MATERIAL OBJECTION TO 1.

WATER TOWER FEES AND EXHIBITS
{.5}; REVIEW VARICUS NEW
PLEADINGS, INCLUDING AS TO
CLAIM VOTING, ETC. (.5);
TELEPHONE FROM AND LETTER TO
MURPHY, TELEPHONE TO LAMMANTIN
RE: WIC FEE DISPUTE, DEPO,

@
Desc

kkkkkk

399.00

2,009.00

332.50

315.00

98.00

218.50

594.00

70.00

332.50

784.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

@ w w

Pleading Page 35 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK {SRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002
07/10/02 LO CASCIO
07/11/02 BALDIGA
07/11/02 LAUKAMG
07/12/02 BALDIGA
07/12/02 BALDIGA
07/12/02 SCHARF
07/12/02 LO CASCIO
07/14/02 BALDIGA

Invoice Number
Page 21

ETC. {.3); TELEPHONE TO

MURPHY, TELEPHONE TO LAMMANIN,

MEMC FROM LAMMANIN RE: WTC (.3)

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET 0.6
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME

(.3); PREPARE AND CIRCULATE

CASE CALENDAR (.3)

- REVIEW MATERIAL RE: FEE APPS 3.9
FOR TOMORROW'S FRC MEETING AND

VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE ON OBEN

POINTS (1.1); REVIEW MATERIAL

BRBI BILLING ISSUES AND POINTS

RAISED BY OTHERS {.3);

NUMEROUS TELEPHONE FROM AND

TELEPHONE TO AND MEMO FROM AND

MEMO TO MEMBERS OF EQ.

COMMITTEE, SKADDEN, LAMMENIN

AND OTHERS RE: WTC FEE TRIAL,

TESTIMONY, RELATED ISSUES

(2.3}; TELEPHONE FROM LAMMENIN

(.2)

-~ REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES 1.3
(.7); INDEX PLEADINGS (.4);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.2)

- REVIEW ALL PLEADINGS, ETC.
FILED IN LAST WEEK (.9);
REVIEW MATERIAL ALL FRC AND
RELATED CORRESPONDENCE,
REPORTS, ETC. FOR TODAY'S
MEETING (1.2); REVIEW MATERIAL
BRBI SECOND FEE APP AND NEW
QUESTIONS POSED/ISSUES TO BE
RESPONDED TO (.4); REVIEW
MATERIAL ADDITIONAL FEE APPS
FOR FRC DISCUSSION (.7); FRC
MEETING (1.8); MEMOS TO
CHANIN, EDWARD S. WEISFELNER
RE: FEE APP TO-DO'S (.2)

- DRAFT COMPREH IVE STATUS
REPORT TO COMMITTEE ON ALL
PLAN, PONTIKES"CLAIM, SIP AND
RELATED MATTERS‘!ﬂ‘T o
- REVIEW OF MEM’ qum BALDIGA ' 0.6
RE: STATUS OF c \SE.

- REVIEW INCOMING FILES

- TRAVEL BOSTON TO' CHICAGO FOR
7/15 HEARING AND MEETINGS, AND
DURING TRAVEL REVIEWED ALL
PLAN PROVISIONS AS TO CLAIMS
AND ALL PLEADINGS FOR 7/15
HEARING (5.9 TOTAL HOURS,

= O
~] W

*hkkkkk

84.00

1,911.00

123.50

2,548.00

1,421.00

198.00

1 42.00
2,303.00
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Pleading Page 36 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION
Dugust 29, 2002

07/15/02 BALDIGA

07/15/02 LAUKAMG

07/16/02 BALDIGA

07/16/02 LAUXKAMG

07/17/02 LO CASCIO

07/17/02 LAUKAMG

07/18/02 BALDIGA

07/19/02 SCHARF

07/22/02 BALDIGA

j @ (™ w
-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

BILLED AT 4.7 BECAUSE OF OTHER
WORK DONE EN ROUTE)
- PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND

" OMNIBUS HEARING (1.8);

CONFERENCE WITH LACKEY,
PERLMAN AND OTHERS AT SKADDEN
TO ANALYZE ALL CLATMS, CLASS
C-5-5 AND RELATED ISSUES AND
REVIEW MATERIALS DPROVIDED BY
THEM ({.9); RETURN TRAVEL
CHICAGO TOC BOSTON (5.4)

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(.2); INDEX PLEADINGS (.4);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.2)

- TELEPHONE FROM AND RETRIEVAL
INFO. FOR ESPINAL AS TO CHANIN
EXPENSES

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
{.3); INDEX PLEADINGS {.7);
UPDATE MASTER FILES(.8);
INTEGRATE ATTORNEY FILES INTO
MASTER FILES (1.2)

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
{.3); RETRIEVE PLEADINGS AND
PREPARE AND CIRCULATE CALENDAR
(1.0}

-~ REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
{.3); INDEX PLEADINGS (.4);
RETRIEVE PLEADINGS FROM FILES
AND ARRANGE TO OBTAIN A COPY
OF SAME PER LESLIE H.
SCHARF{.4)

- REVIEW MATERIAL FINAL WTC
FEE ORDER (.1); REVIEW
MATERIAL OTHER FEE ORDERS AND
BRBI FINAL SECOND INTERIM FEE
APPLICATICN ISSUES (.3);
DRAFTED REPORT TO COMMITTEE AS
TO ALL OPEN ISSUES (1.3).

-~ REVIEW OF COMMITTEE UPDATE
MEMO AND SUPPORTING
DOCUMENTATION REGARDING CLAIMS
ORJECTION PROCESS.

- REVIEW MATERIAL NEW WATER
TOWER ORDER FORM (.1)}; REVIEW
MATERIAL AND MEMO TO FRC RE:
CHANIN EXPENSES AND NEXT
MEETING (.2); TELEPHONE FROM
ESPINAL (.1)

22

8.1

v

kkkkkk

3,969.00

76.00
28.00

285.00

182.00

104.50

833.00

165.00

196.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884

L

Pleading Page 37 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO,

INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002

07/22/02

07/22/02

07/22/02

07/25/02

07/25/02

07/25/02

07/28/02
07/29/02

07/29/02

07/29/02

07/30/02

07/31/02

07/31/02

WEISFELNER

WEISFELNER

SCHARF

BALDIGA

SCHARF

LO CASCIO

BALDIGA

BALDIGA

SCHARF

LAUKAMG

LAUKAMG

BALDIGA

SCHARF

j @ W
-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02

-
00:00:00

Invoice Number

Page

- REVIEW STATUS REPORT TO
COMMITTEE ¢(.5)

- REVIEW CLAIMS OBJECTION
RESPONSES, FORTGANG WITHDRAWAL
AND FEE CCOMMITTEE MINUTES
(2.10)

- FURTHER REVIEW OF JUNE 2002
TIME LOGS FOR MONTHLY BILLING
TO DEBTOR.

~ REVIEW MATERIAL SEVERAL NEW
FEE APPS

- TELEPHONE CALL WITH B.
BALDIGA RE: ISSUES RELATING TO
FEE REVIEW COMMITTEE PROFPOSED
REDUCTIONS; E-MAIL TO EDWARD
5. WEISFELNER RE: SAME.

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
(.3); PREPARE AND CIRCULATE
CALENDAR (.6)

- REVIEW MATERIAL NEW 2002

TO-DATE FINANCIALS, NOTES, ETC.

- REVIEW MATERIAL FORTGANG
MOTION :

- OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH
EDWARD S. WEISFELNER RE:
ISSUES RELATING TO EXPENSES
AND REIMBURSEMENT AS PER FEE
REVIEW COMMITTEE GUIDELINES.
- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
{.5);: INDEX PLEADINGS (2.2);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.6)

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(.5); INDEX PLEADINGS (.4);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.8)

- DRAFTED FEE ESTIMATE FOR ALL
3 E.C. FIRMS [

- PREPARATION 'OF CHART RE:
TRAVEL REDUCTION EXPENSES FOR
HOTEL STAYS IN CHICAGO.

TOTAL HOURS

23

L
Desc

khkhkkk

262

1l,102.

99.

3%2.

99.

12s6.

98.

49.

66.

313

161.

196

132

.50

50

0o

00

00

00

0¢C

00

00

.50

50

.00

.00



& v ] @ w w -
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Des
Pleading Page 38 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
ONE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111
617-856-8200

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number #***x¥
Involce Date Aug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Number 03215.0001

FOR PROFESSICNAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM JUNE 5, 2002
THROUGH AUGUST 28, 2002

TIME SUMMARY:

Professiconal Houxrs Rate Value
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA 23.00 hours at 490.00 = 11,270.00
EDWARD S. WEISFELNER 1.70 hours at 525.00 = 892.50
SCOTT M. BERMAN 0.40 hours at 425.00 = 170.00
KENNETH S. GOODWIN 1.20 hours at 390.00 = 468.00
DAPHNEE SURPRIS 20.10 hours at 275.00 = 5,527.50
LESLIE H. SCHARF 0.00 hours at $0.00 = 0.00
46 .40

CURRENT FEES 18,328.00

INCLUDFS ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE
KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BILL WITH YOUR CHECK TO QUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT"
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-3108175
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 39 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
ASSET DISPOSITIONS
August 29, 2002
04/03/02 BERMAN
04/04/02 SURPRIS
04a/065/02 WEISFELNER
04/08/02 BALDIGA
04/09/02 GOODWIN
04/09/02 SURPRIS
04/10/02 BALDIGA
04a/10/02 GOODWIN
04/11/02 BALDIGA
04/11/02 SURPRIS

Invoice Number

Page

- OC W/DS RE CASE STRATEGY

- REVIEW MOTION RE SALE OF
HEALTHCARE TO GE AND
SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS (2.5);
TEL. CONF. BILL BALDIGA RE
SAME (.20)

T/C B WILLIAMS RE HEALTHCARE
SALE TO G.E. AND SETTLEMENT
ISSUES (.30)

- REVIEW PLEADINGS; P&S AS TO
SALE OF NEW JERSEY REAL ESTATE
(.3); REVIEW PLEADINGS, P&S AS
TO HEALTHCARE/LEASING SALE (.5)
- CONFERENCE WITH DAPHNEE
SURPRIS RE SALE OF HEALTHCARE
VERTICAL (.4); CALL TO WILLIAM
R. BALDIGA (.2); REVIEW E-MAIL
FROM WEISFELNER RE SAME (.1)

- TEL. CONF. WITH WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA RE HEALTHCARE(.10);
REVIEW DOCS RE OBJECTION TO
PROPOSED SALE OF HEALTHCARE
LEASING (2.0)

- DRAFT OBJECTION TO SALE OF
HEALTHCARE LEASING BUSINESS

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE HEALTH
CARE VERTICAL (.3); CONFERENCE
WITH DAPHNEE SURPRIS RE HEALTH
CARE VERTICAL ({.2)

- REVIEW MATERTALS REGARDING
SALE OF ASIA BUSINESSES,
POSSIBLE OBJECTION (.5);:
REVIEW PRIOR VALUATIONS OF
HEALTHCARE LEASING, ETC. FOR
OBJECTION; CONFERENCE WITH
BRENT WILLIAMéﬁiEGARDING SAME
(.7 L
- TEL. CONFS. .WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA RE OBJRCTION TO
HEALTHCARE LEﬁﬁ%N@'( 50) ; OFF.
CONF. WITH WILLTAM 'R BALDIGA
AND B. WILLIAMﬁﬁRE SAME (.30);
DRAFT OBJECTION To"
HEALTHCARE (2.0); CONTINUE TO
REVIEW DOCS RE HEALTH
OBJECTION (2.5)

52

N o
~1 W

@

* Kok ok ke ok

85.00
742 .50

157.50

392.00

273.00

577.50

196.00

185.00

588.00

1,457.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 40 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
ASSET DISPOSITIONS
August 29, 2002
04/12/02 BALDIGA
04/12/02 SURPRIS
04/15/02 BALDIGA
04/15/02 SURPRIS
04/17/02 BALDIGA
04/18/02 BALDIGA
04/30/02 BERMAN

Invoice Numbex

Page

- REVIEW MOTION, P&S TO ALL
AUSTRALIA/NEW ZEALAND
BUSINESSES (.4); REVIEW COURT
COMMENTS ON VALUE ETC. AT 3/26
HEARING (.4); CONFERENCE WITH
MR. CHANIN; DRAFT AND RESEARCH
OBJECTIONS TO PACIFIC RIM AND
HEALTHCARE LEASING BUSINESSES
(4.6}

- DRAFT AND REVISE OBJECTION
TO HEALTHCARE AND ANZ
SALE(6.0); NUMEROUS OFF.
CONFS. WITH WILLIAM R. BALDIGA
RE OBJECTION (1.0)

FURTHER REVISIONS TO AUSTRALIA
AND HEALTHCARE SALE MOTIONS
(.2)

- REVISE OBJECTIONS TO
HEALTHCARE ANZ(1.8); ARRANGE
FOR FILING OF SAME (.70); TEL.
CONFS. WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE
SAME (.50)

- PREPARE FOR 4/17 HEARINGS ON
SALES OF AUSTRALIA AND
HEALTHCARE (.5); SEVERAL
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH
TINA TCHEN AND OTHERS
REGARDING HEARRING (.2), DRAFT
SCRIPT AS TO RESERVATION OF
RIGHTS, ETC (.5)

- TRAVEL TO CHICAGO FOR
HEARING AND DURING TRAVEL
PREPARED FOR HEARING/TRIAL ON
OBJECTIONS TO SALES OF '
AUSTRALIA AND OF HEALTHCARE
LEASING (5.1)‘_NEGOTIAIE WITH

PREFERRED AFFI, VITS Y
CONDUCT HEARIN (1 8), RETURN
TRAVEL AND CONFERENCE WITH
EDWARD §. WEIS NER REGARDING
STRATEGY, ETC “AND DURING
TRAVEL REVISE PLEADINGS AS TO
COMMITTEE'S BUSINESS JUDGMENT
LAWSUIT {(5.5)

- TCS W/LOCASCIO RE SAME

53

13.1

@

*kkkkk

2,646.00

1,925.00

441.00

825.00

588.00

6,419.00

85.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 41 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *rxx**#*
ASSET DISPOSITIONS Page 54
August 29, 2002

WEISFELNER - (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 8, 1.4 735.00

2002) T/C WILLIAMS RE
SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND SALE OF
HEALTH CARE (.50); REVIEW
HEALTHCARE SALE MOTICN (.90}

05/01/02

TOTAL HOURS 46.4
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 42 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC, Tnvoice Number Fxxx*x%
ASSET DISPOSITIONS Page 55
August 29, 2002

FOR COSTS ADVANCED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:

03/12/02 MEALS - VENDOR:CRANBERRY 10.14
DELI
04/29/02 MEALS - VENDOR:CRANBERRY 12.82
DELIL
Subtotal: 011 22.96
05/31/02 COPIES - VENDOR:VILLAGE 178 .55
COPIER
Subtotal: 013 178.55

CURRENT EXPENSES 201.51




@ w ™ @ » - -
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 43 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
ONE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111
617-856-8200

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *%%k#¥
Invoice Date Aug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Number 03215.0002

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM JUNE 5, 2002
THROUGH AUGUST 28, 2002

TIME SUMMARY:

Professional Hours Rate Value
WILLITAM R. BALDIGA 1.30 hours at 490.00 = 637.00
1.30
CURRENT FEES 637.00

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TQ DATE
KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BILL WITH YOUR CHECK TO QUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT™
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-3108175
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 44 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number ***x*=x

BUSINESS OPERATIONS Page 57
August 29, 2002
05/13/02 BALDIGA - REVISE TESTIMONY OUTLINES 1.3

{.2); CONFERENCE WITH MR. BONZ
TO FPREPARE FOR CROSS-EXAM
{.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
WITH MR. BAYLOR REGARDING PLAN
CHANGE (.l1); PREPARE FINAL
DOCUMENTS AND CASE ANALYSIS
FOR TRIAL ¢{.8)

TOTAL HOURS 1.3

637.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 45 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
ONE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111
617:856-8200

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number ***%%%*
Invoice Date Aug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Number 03215.0004

FOR PROFESSICNAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM JUNE 5, 2002
THRCUGH AUGUST 28, 2002

TIME SUMMARY:

Professional Hours Rate Value
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA 168.20 hours at 490.00 = 82,418.00
DAVID H. MURPHREE 1.50 hours at 490.00 = 735.00
JAMES STOLL 38.80 hours at 470.00 = 18,236.00
PHILIP J FLINK 70.30 hours at 515.00 = 36,204.50
STEVEN R. LONDON 19.10 houxrs at 490.00 = 9,359.00
ELISE BUSNY 1.50 hours at 350.00 = 525,00
JOHN G. NOSSIFF JR. 2.70  hours at 445.00 = 1,201.50
ANGEL TAVERAS 18.00 hours at 295.00 = 5,310.00
WILLIAM M. DOLAN IIX 29.80 hours at 445.00 = 13,261.00
JAYNE M DONEGAN 8.60 hours at 425.00 = 3,655.00
MARK S BALDWIN 157.60 hours at 425.00 = 66,980.00
KARA L. BROOKS 49.80 -8 'at = 17,430.00
CARLENE M. MERCIER 1.20 = 162.00
REGINA C. CHEUNG 134.00 = 32,830.00
DANIXKA M. HAUEISEN 1.50 = 322.50
KENNETH R. GOLDBERG 31.00 = 13,175.00
CATHERINE W. NG 20.20 = 3,838.00
SANDRA K. DAVIS 0.30 = 82.50
DAPHNE E. SCHMITT 1.40 = 245.00

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE
KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BILL WITH YOUR CHECK TO QUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT™
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-3108175
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02

Pleading Page 46 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 25, 2002

ANDREA PAPARELLA 9.50 hours
MOLLY SELZER 17.320 hours
STEVEN E. GREENBAUM 3.30 hours
EDWARD S. WEISFELNER 103 .40 hours
SCOTT M. BERMAN 0.80 hours
KENNETH S. GOODWIN 0.50 hours
JOHN P. BIEDERMANN 0.80 hours
DAPHNEE SURPRIS 116.70 hours
LESLIE H. SCHARF 9.40 hours
SARINA LO CASCIO 4.90 hours
CHRISTOPHER M. LAUKAMG 0.50 hours

at

at
at
at
at
at
at
at
at
at

120.
120.
525.
525,
425,
390.
365,
275,
330.
140,
$95.

EE R R SRR R R R R RS R R

CURRENT FEES

00
00
00
00
00
00
00
00
00
00
00

L J

v

00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number
Page

59

1,140.
2,076.
1,732.
54,285.
340.
195,
292,
.50
.00
686.
47.

32,092
3,102

401,

ok dek ok k

00
00
50
00
00
00
00

00
50

958.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02

Pleading Page 47 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
04/01/02 BALDIGA
04/01/02 LONDON
04/01/02 BALDWIN
04/01/02 CHEUNG
04/02/02 LONDON
04/02/02 BALDWIN
04/02/02 BALDWIN
04/02/02 BROOKS
04/02/02 NG
04/02/02 LO CASCIO

»

00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

- ANALYZE APPEAL FROM
DISCOVERY DENIAL (.3);
CONFERENCE WITH MR. WEISFELNER
AND ANALYZE OTHER STRATEGY
OPTIONS {.5)

- CONTINUED ANALYSIS OF
CORPORATE GOVERNANCE ISSUES
(5.4); CONFERENCE WITH D.
GUSENOFF REGARDING INTERPLAY
OF BANKRUPTCY LAWS WITH DEL
GEN CORPORATE LAW (0.4);
CONFERENCE WITH B. BALIDGA
REGARDING SAME (0.3)

- REVIEW OF BELL BOYD MEMO ON
CONFIDENTIALITY (1.2); REVIEW
OF MEMO ON APPEAL OF 2004
ORDER AND EDIT SAME (.8)

- REVISE MEMQO RE: APPEAL OF
2004 EXAM DENIAL (0.2)

- DRAFT MEMORANDUM REGARDING
CORPORATE GOVERNANCE
STRATEGIES (3.0); REVIEW,
REVISE AND EDIT D. GUSENOFF
MEMORANDUM REGARDING
BANKRUPTCY LAWS (0.9);
CONFERENCE WITH B. BALDIGA
REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE
STRATEGIES (0.2)

EDIT MEMO ON APPEAL (1.2)

- REVIEW OF CORPORATE
GOVERNANCE RESEARCH (.9);
REVIEW OF SUBORDINATION
RESEARCH (1.5)

RESEARCH RE: NOTICE
REQUIREMENTS UNDER POLICIES
(2.1) '

- PREPARE MEMO ANALYZING
POTENTIAL PROFESSIONAL
RESPONSIBILITY ISSUES IN
CONDUCTING INFORMATION
DISCOVERY : ‘

- RETRIEVE PACER REPORT OF
CASES WHERE COMDISCO IS A
PARTY (.2}; PACER RESEARCH TO
RETRIEVE DOCKETS FOR ACTIONS
FILED IN NORTHERN DISTRICT OF
CALIFORNIA (.5); RESEARCH RE
OBTAINING STATE COURT
COMPLAINT INCLUDING TELEPHONE
CALLS TO COURT AND DOCUMENT

60

N
FEN

kk kR kR

382.

2,989.

850

49

2,009

510.
1,020.

735.

969.

le68.

00

00

.00

.00

.00

ey}
0o

00

00

00



9 L™ w ] ) w ;
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 48 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK iSRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
RARugust 29, 2002
04/03/02 BALDIGA
04/03/02 LONDON
04/03/02 BALDWIN
04a/03/02 NG
04/03/02 WEISFELNER
04/03/02 SURPRIS
04/03/02 LO CASCIO
04/04/02 BALDIGA
04/04/02 LONDON

Invoice Number

Page

RETRIEVAL SERVICE RE SAME (.5)
- ANALYZE STRATEGIES RE CORP.
GOVERNANCE ISSUES AND DRAFT
COMPREHENSIVE MEMO TO COMMITTEE
- CONFERENCE WITH M. BALDWIN
REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE
STRATEGIES (0.4); CONFERENCE
WITH B. BALDIGA REGARDING
CORPORATE GOVERNANCE AND
BANKRUPTCY LAWS (0.3); REVISE
AND EDIT COMBINED MEMORANDUM
(1.2) _

- RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF BELL
BOYD MEMO (.7); FINALIZE CORP.
GOVERNANCE MEMO {2.3);
FINALIZE APPEAL MEMO (1.7);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E.
WEISFELNER AND W. BALDIGA RE
SAME {1.) _

- REVIEW DRAFT MEMOS ON
PROFESSIONAL RESPONSIBILITY TO
PROVIDE A MORE COMPREHENSIVE
ROADMAP' PER REGINA CHEUNG'S
INSTRUCTION

- PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE
IN C/C WITH BILL BALDIGA AND
BILL BALDWIN TO REVIEW
OPTIONS, DISCUSS RESEARCH
RESULTS AND PLAN STRATEGY FOR
CONFIRMATION BATTLE AND
RELATED MATTERS, INCLUDING
POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT AGENDAS,
DISCUSS FEE REVIEW COMMITTEE
MATTERS (1.3) o

OFF. CONF. COMDISCO TEAM RE
PLAN (.30) o

- TELEPHONE TO DOCUMENT
RETRIEVAL SERVICE IN
CALIFORNIA RE OBTAINING
COMPLAINT FILED IN DISTRICT
COURT ACTION {.2); PREPARE
LETTER REQUEST AND FAX RE SAME
(.6) o

- DRAFT COMPREHENSIVE MEMO TO
COMMITTEE REGARDING STRATEGIES
AND REVISE ALL SUPPORTING MEMOS
- REVISE AND EDIT MEMORANDUM
ON RELATTONSHIP OF BANKRUPTCY
LAWS AND CORPORATE GOVERNANCE
AND STRATEGY

61

v

Rk kkkk

1,323.00

1,127.00

2,422.50

551.00

682.50

82.50

112.00

1,176.00

2,107.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 49 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
Rugust 29, 2002
04/04/02 BALDWIN
04/04/02 BROOKS
04/04/02 CHEUNG
04/04/02 LO CASCIO
04/05/02 BALDIGA
04/05/02 LONDON
04/05/02 BALDWIN
04/05/02 CHEUNG
04/05/02 NG

Invoice Number

Page

- FINALIZE CORP. GOVERWANCE
MEMO (1.2); MEMO TO EQUITY
COMMITTEE (2.2)

RE: EQUITY COMMITTEE'S ABILITY
TO ASSERT CLAIMS {2.1)

- DRAFT SUMMARY OF FAZIO'S
EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT (0.6),
REVIEW FAZIO'S EMPLOYMENT
AGREEMENT (0.8), ANALYSIS OF
RULE 4.2 IN MA BY SUPREME
JUDICIAL COURT (0.4)

- FOLLOW-UP TELEPHONE CALLS TO
DOCUMENT RETRIEVAIL SERVICE,
DAPHNEE SURPRIS RE OBTAINING
COMPLAINTS REGARDING ACTION IN
CALIFORNIA RE VENTURES

- DRAFT COMPREHENSIVE SET OF
MEMOS TO COMMITTEE AS TO ALL
STRATEGIC OPTIONS, PLAN
ISSUES, ETC.

- COMPLETE FOLLOWUP ANALYSIS
REGARDING INTERACTION BETWEEN
BANKRUPTCY LAWS AND CORPORATE
GOVERNANCE LAWS

FURTHER RESEARCH ON CORPORATE
GOVERNANCE {1.8)

- REVIEW FAZIO'S EMPLOYMENT
AGREEMENT (0.3), DRAFT SUMMARY
OF FAZIO'S EMPLOYMENT
AGREEMENT (0.3), ANALYSIS OF
NY LAW ON RULES OF
PROFESSIONAL RESPONSIBILITY OF
ATTORNEYS TO FORMER EMPLOY]
(0.7), ANALYSIS OF CT FA{ ON

ATTORNEYS ' ETHICAL co UCT TO

EMPLOYEES (0.7) .

oN COMMUNICATINGIWITH“FORMER
EMPLOYEES (C. 4)
- REVIEW DRAFT ME
PROFESSIONAL REASONABILITY
RULES IN MASSACHUSETTS,
CONNECTICUT, NEW YORK AND
ILLINOIS PER MARK BALDWIN'S
INSTRUCTIONS (1.2); FINALIZE

62

* kK okkk

1,445.00

735.00

441 .00

56.00

3,087.00
1,127.00

765.00

857.50

874.00



Pleading Page 50 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 295, 2002
04/05/02 WEISFELNER
04/08/02 BALDIGA
04/08/02 BALDWIN
04/08/02 CHEUNG
04/09/02 BALDIGA
04/09/02 BALDWIN
04/09/02 CHEUNG
0a/09/02 NG
04a/10/02 BALDWIN
04/11/02 BALDIGA
04/11/02 CHEUNG

@ @ v ) -
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

COMPREHENSIVE CASE LAW
RESEARCH ON PROFESSIONAL RULES
(3.4)

- ¢/C PANAGARKIS, F PERLMAN RE
SETTLEMENT, MEETING SCHEDULE
(.30)

- REVIEW VENTURES 80/20°
COMPLAINT, STENTO AGREEMENTS,
ETC. :

- LETTER TO F. PERLMAN WITH
DEPOSITION NOTICE AND DOCUMENT
REQUESTS (2.3)

- ANALYSIS OF MA CASE LAW RE:
PROFESSIONAL RESPONSIBILITY OF
ATTORNEYS TO COMMUNICATING
WITH EMPLOYEES (1.3), ANALYSIS
OF MA CASE LAW RE:
PROFESSIONAL RESPONSIBILITY OF
ATTORNEYS TO FORMER EMPLOYEES
{1.3)

- REVISE MEMO TO COMMITTEE
REGARDING STRATEGIC OPTIONS
{.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
WITH MR. RUSSO (COUNSEL FOR
FORMER VENTURE EXECS) (.2)

- PREPARATION OF DOCUMENT
REQUESTS AND OTHER DISCOVERY
{(3.5); EMAIL TO F. PERLMAN
(.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
WITH PERLMAN (.1)

- REVIEW NY CASES ON
COMMUNICATING WITH EMPLOYEES
{0.1)

- ANALYSIS AND ORGANIZATION CF
CASE LAW TO SUPPCRT MEMO ON
PROFESSIONAL RESPONSIBILITY

- TELEPHONE CONFER' CE WITH F.
PERLMAN AND G. PANAGAKIS {.3);
FURTHER DRAFTING OF DISCOVERY
(2.1); ATTENTION TO MOTION FOR
CONTINUANCE (1.5) %

PREPARE FOR 4/13 COMMITTEE
MEETING ON PLAN PRESENTATION
(.3) o

- ANALYSIS RE: NY CASELAW oN
PROFESSIONAL RESPONSIBILITY ON
COMMUNICATING WITH FORMER
EMPLOYEES (0.7), ANALYSIS RE:
NY CASELAW ON PROFESSIONAL
RESPONSIBILITY ON
COMMUNICATING WITH CURRENT

63

g kR kR

157.50

196.00

977.50

637.00

196.00

1,615.00

24.50

247.00

1,657.50

147.00

612.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 51 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
04/12/02 BALDIGA
04/12/02 BALDIGA
04/12/02 TAVERAS
04/12/02 TAVERAS
o4/12/02 DOLAN III
04/12/02 DOLAN III
04/12/02 DOLAN III
04/12/02 DOLAN III
04/12/02 BALDWIN
04/12/02 BALDWIN
04/12/02 BROOKS
04/12/02 BROOKS

Invoice Number

Page

EMPLOYEES (1.8}

- ANALYZE DEBTORS' PLAN AND
DISCLOSURE DELIVERED TODAY
(1.8)

REVIEW BLAKE AND FAZIO
CONTRACT SUMMARIES (.2)

- CONFERENCE WITH BILL DOLAN
REGARDING LITIGATION(.5);
REVIEWING PLEADINGS IN
CASE({.5); ANALYZING BANKRUPTCY
LAW REGARDING ALLOWANCE OF 3RD
PARTY CLAIMS IN BANKRUPTCY
CONTEXT (2.0) ; REVIEWED
DOCUMENTS REGARDING EQUITY
COMMITTEE MEETING(.2)
REVIEWING BANKRUPTCY DOCUMENTS
INCLUDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
AND PLAN OF REORGANIZATION(2.0)
- TELEPHONE CALL WITH M.
BALDWIN REGARDING STATUS;
REVIEW LAW REGARDING MOTION
FOR LEAVE TO APPROVE FILING OF
ADVERSARY PROCEEDING; REVIEW
DOCUMENTS REGARDING FILING.
CONFERENCE WITH ASSOCIATE
REGARDING MOTION FOR LEAVE TO
FILE (.5).

- RESEARCH REGARDING

SHAREHOLDER DERIVATIVE ACTIONS.

- REVIEW PLAN MATERIALS;
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5)
DRAFTING OF COMPLAINT (2.8);
RESEARCH RE: SAME {1.2)

- RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF
PROPOSED PLAN (2.5)

RESEARCH RE: CASES WHERE AN
EQUITY COMMITTEE HAS SUED
OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS (2.3)

- CONFERENCED ‘'WITH ATTY.
BALDWIN RE: ACTION AGAINST
OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS (.4);
REVIEWED APRIL 12, 2002 EQUITY
COMMITTEE MATERIALS AND
COMDISCO PLAN (1.1); REVIEWED
COMDISCO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
(.4); RESEARCH RE: BREACH OF
FIDUCIARY DUTY BY BOARD
MEMBERS (3.4)

@

kkkkkk

882.00

98.00

944 .00

580.00

133.50

222.50

445.00

222.50

1,700.00

1,062.50

805.00

1,855.00



Pleading Page 52 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 25, 2002
04/12/02 MERCIER
04/12/02 DAVIS
04/14/02 TAVERAS
04/14/02 BALDWIN
04/14/02 BROOKS
04/15/02 BALDIGA
04/15/02 TAVERAS
04/15/02 DOLAN III
04/15/02 DOLAN III
04/15/02 BALDWIN

w @ 9 -
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

- RETRIEVED DOCKETS FROM
ILLINOIS FEDERAL DISTRICT
COURT; ORDERED COPY OF
COMPLAINTS FOR SAME.

- REVIEW OF SAMPLE ADVERSARY
PROCEEDINGS

- RESEARCHING AND ANALYZING
LAW ON ABILITY TO SUE OW
BEHALF OF CORPORATION IN
BANKRUPTCY (2.0) ; ANALYZING
LAW REGARDING DOCTRINE OF
FUTILITY (2.0) ; ANALYZING LAW
REGARDING DERIVATIVE SUITS BY
SHAREHOLDERS (2.0) ; DRAFTING
MOTION FOR LEAVE OF COURT TO
COMMENCE AN ADVERSARY
PROCEEDING ON BEHALF OF
DEBTORS' ESTATE (2.5)

- RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF DRAFT
BUSINESS PLAN

- RESEARCH APPLICATION OF
BUSINESS JUDGMENT RULE (4.1);
RESEARCH RE: CIVIL CONSPIRACY
CLAIMS (3.2)

- ANALYZE STATUTORY AND COMMON
LAW DUTIES OF DIP AND OFFICERS
AND DIRECTORS TO PROVIDE
ACCURATE INFORMATION TO EQUITY
COMMITTEE {.5)

- REVISED MOTION FOR LEAVE TO
COMMENCE ADVERSARY PROCEEDING;
DRAFTED NOTICE (2.1): DRAFTED
ORDER (.5); ANALYZING DELAWARE
COURT RULES AND' CASELAW ON
DOCTRINE OF FUTILITY IN
SHAREHOLDER DERIVATIVE
ACTIONS (1.5)

- ATTENTION TO DETAIL
REGARDING MOTION FOR LEAVE TO
FILE ADVERSARY PROCEEDING
{(.3); TELEPHONE CALL WITH M.
BALDWIN (. 2) t

it

- REVIEW AND REVISE 'MOTION FOR

]
N

LEAVE T0' COMMENCE ADVERSARY
PROCEﬁDING ON BEHALF OF
DEBTCR '8  ESTATES.

- DRAFTING COMPLAINT (4.5);
REVIEW OF RESEARCH RE: SAME
(1.5); PREPARATION FOR LACKEY
DEPOSITION (2.6); PREPARATION

FOR CIT SETTLEMENT HEARING (.9)

162.00

82.50

2,507.50

722.50

2,555.00

245.00

1,2092.50

222.50

2,447.50

4,037.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 53 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
04/15/02 BROOKS
04/16/02 DOLAN III
04/16/02 BALDWIN
04/16/02 BROOKS
04/17/02 DOLAN III
04/17/02 BROOKS
04/17/02 SURPRIS
04/18/02 SURPRIS
04/19/02 DOLAN III
04/19/02 BALDWIN
04/22/02 BALDIGA
0a/22/02 TAVERAS
04/22/02 BALDWIN

Invoice Number
Page

- RESEARCH POTENTIAL CLAIMS
AGAINST OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS
UNDER DELAWARE LAW (4.8);
RESEARCH RE: CHOICE OF LAW
{2.9); CONFERENCED WITH ATTY.
BALDWIN RE: POTENTIAL CLAIMS
{.3); RESEARCH RE: VIABRILITY
OF BRINGING SEPARATE STATE
COURT ACTION (2.4)

- FURTHER EDITS AND REVISIONS
TO MOTION TC APPROVE FILING OF
SUIT.

- FURTHER DRAFTING OF
COMPLAINT (6.2); FACTUAL
RESEARCH RE: SAME (1.8)

- RESEARCH RE: AIDING AND
ABETTING PER ATTY. BALDWIN
{3.4); RESEARCH RE: CONSPIRACY
CLAIMS (2.7)

- FURTHER EDITS TO MOTION TO
APPROVE FILING OF SUIT.

- CONFERENCED WITH ATTY.
BALDWIN RE: CONSTRUCTIVE FRAUD
CASES (.2); RESEARCH RE:
CONSTRUCTIVE FRAUD CLAIMS
{2.9); RESEARCH RE: OMISSIONS
OF MATERIAL FACTS (2.5)

- REVIEW PLAN AND D/S

- OFF. CONF. EDWARD S.
WEISFELNER RE PLAN (.70)

- TELEPHONE CALLS WITH W.
BALDIGA AND M. BALDWIN
REGARDING MOTION FOR AUTHORITY
TO FILE LAWSUTT ™™

- FURTHER DRAFTING OF
COMPLAINT (2.7) ; RESEARCH RE:
SAME (1.3)] ,
- REVIEW FAZIO OMPLAINT AND
IMPACT ON I

TRANSCRIPT' !
FAZIO MOTION {.86); REVIEW OF
RIECKS DEPO {1.2); MEMO TO
EQUITY COMMITTEE RE SAME (1.5)

66

1a.

]

XXk EkF

3,640.00

222.50
3,400.00
2,135.00

89.00

1,960.00

1,127.50
192.50

89.00

1,700.00

147.00

59.00

5,167.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

® @
Pleading Page 54 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN QF REQRGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
04/22/02 BROOKS
04/23/02 BALDIGA
04/23/02 BALDWIN
04/24/02 BALDIGA
04/24/02 DOLAN III
04/24/02 BALDWIN
04/25/02 DOLAN III
04/25/02 BALDWIN
04/26/02 BALDIGA

Invoice Number

Page

- RESEARCHED FRAUDULENT
MISREPRESENTATION UNDER
ILLINOIS LAW PER ATTY. BALDWIN
(1.6); RESEARCHED REQUIREMENTS
TO MAKE OUT A CLAIM FOR
NEGLIGENT MISREPRESENTATICON
UNDER ILLINOIS LAW (1.1);
RESEARCH REASONABLE RELIANCE
BY OFFICERS AND DIRECTCORS
{1.9); RESEARCH POSSIBLE
IMMUNITY CLAIMS BY OFFICERS
AND DIRECTORS (1.6)

- READ WATER TOWER. DEPOCSITION
TRANSCRIPTS AND ANALYZE EFFECT
ON PLAN ISSUES

- FURTHER DRAFTING OF
COMPLAINT (3.5); RESEARCH RE:
SAME (1.8):; MEMO TO D. SURPRIS
RE SBME(.5)

- REVIEW CHANIN'S TERM SHEET
AND ANALYSES FOR PLAN
SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS (.3);
CONFERENCE WITH TEAM TQ REVISE
STRATEGY AND COMPLAINT FOR
PARALLEL PLAN
LITIGATION/SETTLEMENT STRATEGY
(.8)

- PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE
IN CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING
LITIGATION STRATEGY (1.0);
REVIEW DRAFT OF PROPOSED
PLEADING (.3).

- FURTHER DRAFTING ‘OF f
COMPLAINT (.8); ¥ELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WIT SEL (. 7),
DRAFTING OF FAZIO DOCUMENT
REQUEST (1. 1)

o
R =
(1.2) ; DRAFTING OF EPOSITION
NOTICES AND DO

(.8)

AGREEMENT; ANAEYZ :WATER TOWER
TESTIMONY AND COMPLIANCE WITH
AGREEMENT, NEXT STEPS

67

6.2

w vk ok ok ok

2,170.00

539.00

2,465.00

535.00

578.50

1,105.00

222.50

850.00

245.00
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Pleading Page 55 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
04/26/02 BALDIGA
04/26/02 BALDWIN
04/27/02 BALDIGA
04/29/02 BALDIGA
04/28/02 BALDWIN
o4a/30/02 BALDIGA
04/30/02 BAILDWIN
05/01/02 BALDIGA
05/01/02 WEISFELNER
05/01/02 WEISFELNER
05/01/02 WEISFELNER

@ [+ @
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

- REVIEW DEBTOR'S VALUATIONS
AND OTHER MATERIALS REGARDING
DECLINE IN EUROPE BUSINESS,
BASES FOR PRESENT RUN-OFF
DECISION

-~ REVISIONS TO COMPLAINT

- REVIEW H.P. BREAKUP FEE
DECISION; ANALYZE BENEFITS OF
APPEAL (.3); DRAFT OBJECTION
TO FAZIO COMPENSATION MOTION
(.7)

- REVISE FAZIO OBJECTION(.2);
MEMO TO TEAM REGARDING
LITIGATION STRATEGY (.2)

- REVISE FAZIO OBJECTION (.8);
PREPARATION OF DEPOSITION
NOTICE AND DOCUMENT REQUEST
{1.7) ; DEPOSITION NOTICE
DOCUMENT REQUEST FOR DEBTORS
{.8); SUPPLEMENTAL OBJECTION
TO MOTION (1.7)

- DRAFT FAZIO DISCOVERY,
REVISE OBJECTION

- REVISIONS TO DISCOVERY
{2.1) ; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
WITH J. BLAKE (.2); ATTENTION
TO SUPPLEMENTAL OBJECTION (1.2)
- OUTLINE MEMO TO COMMITTEE
REGARDING PLAN ATTACKS:
SETTLEMENT COMPARISONS, ETC.

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 10,
2002) CONTINUED WORK TO REVIEW
ESTATE VALUATIONS IN EFFORT TO
FORMULATE SETTLEMENT POSITIONS
{2.2); RESEARCH ON POTENTIAL
D&0 CLAIMS FOR FAILURE TO
MAXIMIZE 1 1) '

- (TIME ENTRY“IS FOR APRIL 11,
OR 4/12 MEETING
WITH COMPANY gN'pLAN, S
INCLUDING ARRKNGEMENTS WITH
MEMBERS RE PARTICIPATION {.70)

WITH DEBTOR TO REVIEW PLAN AND
DISCLCSURE STATEMENT DRAFT
(2.5); PARTICIPATE IN FOLLOW
UP MEETING WITH COMMITTEE RE
SAME AND STRATEGIES GOING
FORWARD, INCLUDING REVIEW AND

68

B
o -

L
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245.00

722.50
490.00

196.00

2,125.00

1%6.00

1,487.50

245.00

1,732.50

367.50

2,152.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 56 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. ' Invoice Number **+*%%*
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION Page 69
August 29, 2002

DELIBERATION OVER PENDING
ASSET SALES (.90); FOLLOW UP
DISCUSSIONS WITH W. BALDIGA
AND CHANIN RE SAME (.70)
05/01/02 WEISFELNER - (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 16, 3.6
2002) PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND
MEETING WITH R. LAMBERT TO
DISCUSS SETTLEMENT STRATEGY
(1.4); PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND
MEETING WITH FORTGANG AND
PANAGAKIS RE SAME{2.2)
05/01/02 WEISFELNER - {TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 18, 0.9
2002 T/C D. PEDOWITZ RE STATUS
OF SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS
(.40) ; CORRESPONDENCE TO G.
PANAGAKIS RE OPEN SETTLEMENT
ISSUES (.50)
05/01/02 WEISFELNER - {TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 19, 1.2
2002) MEET W/ CP REPS TO
REVIEW WARRANT STRUCTURE AND
OTHER SETTLEMENT PROSPECTS
(1.2)
05/01/02 WEISFELNER - (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 22, 0.4
2002)REVIEW MATERTALS FROM CP
RE POTENTTAL SETTLEMENT
05/01/02 WEISFELNER - (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 24, 1.8
2002) PREPARE FOR AND
PARTICIPATE IN TEAM MEETING TO
REVIEW COMPLAINT, MOTION,
SETTLEMENT STATUS (1.2); T/C
M. PERKIEL (FAZIOQ COUNSEL) RE
ADMIN CLAIM MOTION (.60)
05/01/02 WEISFELNER - (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 25, 2.1
2002) T/CS M. ESPINAL RE
WARRANT STRUCTURE ISSUES
RELATED TO POTENTIAL
SETTLEMENT {.40); STUDY WORK
PRODUCT (.90); T/CS (2X) G.
PAPADAKIS RE SETTLEMENT AND
HIS MEETING WITH FORTGANG (.80)

05/01/02 WEISFELNER - {TIME ENTRY IS ',APRIL 26, 0.5
2002) REVIEW DRAFT D&O
COMPLAINT i - :
05/01/02 WEISFELNER - (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 9, 1.4

2002) ATTENTIONlehSETTLEMENT
PROSPECTS BASED ON REVIEW OF
VALUES (1.4)

1,890.00

472.50

630.00

210.00

945.00

1,102.50

262.50

735.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 57 of 153

BROWN RUDN!CK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
05/01/02 WEISFELNER
05/01/02 WEISFELNER
05/0L/02 WEISFELNER
05/02/02 BAILDIGA
05/02/02 BALDWIN
05/02/02 BROOKS
05/02/02 SCHMITT
05/02/02 WEISFELNER
05/03/02 BALDWIN
05/04/02 BALDIGA

Invoice Number

Page

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 17,
2002) T/C BRAVERMAN RE
SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS AND
RELATED T/C LAMBERT({.70);
OUTLINE POTENTIAL COMPLAINT
AGAINST D&O'S (1.0)

- (TIME ENTRY FOR MAY 1, 2002)
PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND
PRE-MEETING WITH CHANIN TEAM
TO REVIEW STATUS OF
SETTLEMENTS AND VALUATION OF
WARRANTS BEING OFFERED (1.5)
T/C WILLIAMS RE EUROPE TRIP
AND DEVELOPMENT OF SETTLEMENT
COUNTER PROPOSAL ON WARRANT
STRUCTURE (.9); COMMUNICATE
WITH EQUITY HOLDERS RE
ANNOUNCED PLAN FILING AND
EQUITY RECOVERY (.70)

- ANALYZE PLAN PROVISIONS AS
TQ THIRD PARTY RELEASES (.6):
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR.
WILLIAMS REGARDING SIP ISSUES
(.1); ANALYZE FIDUCIARY DUTY
ISSUES FOR PLAN OBJECTION (.8)
- DRAFTING OF COMPLAINT (1.8);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
CHANIN ABOUT SBME {.5)

- CONFERENCED WITH ATTY.
BALDWIN RE: D&O POLICY
ANALYSIS (.3); RESEARCH RE:
CLATMS BROUGHT BY MEMBERS OF
EQUITY COMMITTEE (2.1)

- RETRIEVE AND SHEPARDIZE CASES

- REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT
COMPLAINT ‘AGATNET BOARD AND
THIRD PAR jTH RELATED
DISCUSSICNS WITH*WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA
- DRAFTIRG OF “REPLY BRIEF
(1.8); REVIS é‘To COMPLAINT
(1.3) . ,o-'i?%‘%ﬁ”'
- ANALYZE PLAN _Rovxsroms
REGARDING STP RECOVERIES AND
OPPORTUNT OBJECTION
(.6); ANATYZE“BTAN PROVISIONS

' AS TO THIRD PARTY RELEASES AND

RECENT 7TH CIRCUIT LAW AS TO
OBJECTION STRATEGIES (.8)

70

N
-

* kKK Kk Kk

3.1

892.50

787.50

840.00

.735.00

977.50

840.00

245.00
1,417.50

1,317.50

€£86.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 58 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO,
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION

INC.

August 29, 2002

05/05/02

05/06/02

05/06/02

05/07/02

05/08/02

CHEUNG

BALDIGA

WEISFELNER

BALDIGA

BALDIGA

Involice Number

Page 71

- ANALYSIS RE: REAL ESTATE
FORECLOSURE AUCTIONS AND
REVOCATION OF BID (0.8),
ANALYSIS RE: JUDICIAL SALE AND
AUCTIONS OF ASSETS OF
COMPANTES (1.3), ANALYSIS RE:
WITHDRAW OF BID IN GOVERNMENT
SALES (0.2), ANALYSIS RE:
WITHDRAWAL OF BID IN
CONSTRUCTION CONTEXT AND
AFFECT ON DEPOSIT (0.4),
ANALYSIS RE: CREATION OF
ENFORCEABLE CONTRACT BY
ACCEPTANCE OF A BID (0.6),
ANALYSIS OF CREATION OF
ENFORCEABLE CONTRACT IN A
JUDICIAL SALE (0.6), ANALYSIS
RE: GOOD FAITH AND DEPOSIT
(0.3), ANALYSIS RE: RETURN.OF
DEPOSIT (0.9), ANALYSIS RE:
CREATION OF OPTION CONTRACT IN
AN AUCTION CONTEXT (0.3),
ANALYSIS RE: MEASURE OF
DAMAGES (0.5), ANALYSIS RE: CT
APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT
AGREEMENTS (0.5), DRAFT BRIEF
RE: RESPONSE TO MOTION TO
APPROVE CIT SETTLEMENT (3.8),
REVISE BRIEF (1.5)

- ANALYZE SUBSTANTIVE
CONSOLIDATION ASPECTS OF PLAN,
ECONOMICS OF FAILURE TO
CONSOLIDATE, AND POSSIBLE
BENEFITS TO EQUITY IF WE
DEFEAT CONSOLIDATION

C/C WILLIAM R."BALDIGA AND M.
BALDWIN TO REVIEW DRAFT OF
COMPLAINT AND OTHER LITIGATION
MATTERS (1.1) =i
- TRAVEL TO CHICAGO FOR 5/8

ANALYZED ADDITIONAL':
AUTHORITIES A o STRATEGIES
FOR DEFEATING PLAN BY
ATTACKING THI PARTY RELEASES
- RETURN TRAVEL TO BOSTON AND
DURING TRAVEL REVIEW
ADDITIONAL PROVISIONS OF PLAN
AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND
OUTLINE OBJECTIONS

-

*k ok kkx

11.7 2,866.50
2.3 1,127.00
1.1 577.50
4.8 2,352.00
4.4 2,156.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 59 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC,

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
05/08/02 WEISFELNER
05/09/02 BALDIGA
05/09/02 FLINK
05/09/02 BALDWIN
05/09/02 WEISFELNER
05/09/02 SURPRIS
05/10/02 BALDIGA
05/10/02 FLINK
05/10/02 BALDWIN
05/10/02 WEISFELNER

Invoice Number

Page

- PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND
MEETING WITH CHANIN ON
SETTLEMENT STRATEGY, INCLUDING
REVIEW OF VALUATION ISSUES
(1.8); EXTENDED SETTLEMENT
DISCUSSIONS WITH PANAGAKIS
{.8); CONTINUES DISCOVERY
REVIEW {.8)

- ANALYZE WARRANT/SETTLEMENT
ISSUES

- REVIEW COMPANY'S ECONOMIC
PROPOSAL (0.7); CONFERENCE
WITH CHANIN REGARDING THE SAME
{0.5); CONSIDER ALTERNATIVE
STRUCTURES. (0.7);

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
FAZIO'S COUNSEL (1.3)

- T/CS CHANIN RE WARRANT
STRUCTURE FOR PURPOSES OF
SETTLEMENT (.4); T/C P. FLICK
RE SAME {1.1); T/C B. POST RE
STATUS (.2); T/C PEDOWITZ RE
SAME {.3); COMMUNICATE WITH M.
BALDWIN AND WILLIAM R. BALDIGA
RE PLAN LITIGATION ISSUES RE
CONFIRMATION AND MANAGEMENT
COMPENSATION, FAZIO DEPOSITION
SCHEDULE (.7)

- 0/C EDWARD S. WEISFELNER RE
PLAN AND D/S{.30); REVIEW PLAN
AND D/S{4.2); 0/C WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA RE SAME(.30)

- OUTLINE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
OBJECTION (.4); ANALYZE
WARRANT ISSUES AND INTERPLAY
WITH DISPUTED CLAIMS (.3)

- REVIEW SURE DOCUMENTS
FOR PLAN GF ORGANIZATION,

- TELEPHO CONFERENCE WITH
CLASS ACTION COUNSEL (.8);
DRAFTING MPLAINT (.8) ;

PREPARATI ISCOVERY (1 7)
TATED T/CS

. "BALDIGA, P. FLINK
(RE SECURITIES ISSUES) (1.7);
ADDITIONAL PASS ON DRAFT
COMPLAINT AGAINST D&0O (.7);
RELATED CALLS WITH CHANIN ON
VALUATION ISSUEBS (.3);

72

KRRk kk

1,785.00

245.00

278.50

552.50

1,417.50

1,320.00

343.00

1,802.50

1,700.00

1,417.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 60 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
05/10/02 SURPRIS
05/11/02 BALDIGA
05/13/02 BALDIGA
05/13/02 MURPHREE
05/13/02 STOLL
05/13/02 FLINK
05/13/02 BALDWIN
05/13/02 CHEUNG
05/13/02 HAUEISEN
05/13/02 WEISFELNER
05/13/02 SURPRIS
05/13/02 SURPRIS
05/14/02 FLINK
05/14/02 BALDWIN

Invoice Number

Page

- REVIEW PLAN AND D/S

- REVISE BRRI FEE APPLICATION
AND REVIEW EXPENSE ITEMS

- ANALYZE ORJECTIONS TO
EMPLOYEE RETENTION PROGRAM
{.4); CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL
TQ CLASS-ACTION PLAINTIFFS
{1.0)

- ATTENTION TO ISSUES OF
SECTION 1123, 1145 AND
PREFERRED STOCK.

- REVIEW MATERIALS; DISCLOSURE
STATEMENT, REVIEW BUSINESS PLAN
- CONSIDER ISSUES AND
SOLUTIONS REGARDING SETTLEMENT
PROPOSALS;

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
CLASS COUNSEL (.5); REVIEW OF
CLASS ACTION PLEADINGS (1.8);
REVIEW OF INSURANCE COVERAGE
ISSUES (1.1)

- RESEARCH SECTICN 1123 (A) (6)
IN SECONDARY SOURCES (0.5)

- MEETING WITH PHILIP J. FLINK
REGARDING TRACKING STOCK.

- T/C PANAGAKIS RE POTENTIAL
SETTLEMENT ISSUES (.6); REVIEW
DRAFT FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
OBJECTION (1.3); MEET WITH
CHANIN TO REVIEW WARRANT
STRUCTURE ON POTENTIAL
SETTLEMENT (1.5)

- RESEARCH RE 1125 OBJ TO
D/S(2.4); DRAFT D/S OBJECTION
(2.0) : P

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM SEC
RE D/S OBJECTION(1.0};

-~ REVIEW EQUITY HOLDERS
PROPOSAL (0.2); REVIEW PLAN OF
REORGANIZATION REGARDING
MANAGEMENT COMPENSATION (0.3);
TELEPHONE TO MIKE ESPINAL OF
CHANIN REGARDING PROPOSAL
(0.2) CONSIDER STRUCTURING
ISSUES (0.7);

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D.
PEDOWITZ RE COMPLAINT (1.2);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
CHANIN (.7); EDIT AND REVISE
COMPLAINT (2.6)

73

@
Desc
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962
196

686,

147.

705.

1,287,

1,445.

122
a3

1,785

1,210

275.

721.

1,912

.50
.00

00

00

00

50

00

.50

.00

.00

.00

60

00

.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 61 of 153

BROWN RUDN!CK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
05/14/02 EAUEISEN
05/15/02 BALDIGA
05/15/02 MURPHREE
0s5/15/02 STOLL
05/15/02 FLINK
05/15/02 BALDWIN
05/15/02 WEISFELNER
05/15/02 SURPRIS
05/16/02 BALDIGA

Invoice Number

Page

- RESEARCHING DEVELOPMENTS IN
TRACKING STOCK.

- ANALYZE OBJECTIONS TO PLAN
AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT ON
ACCOUNT OF THIRD PARTY
RELEASES (1.7); TELEPHONE
CONFERENCES WITH S.E.C.
REGARDING SAME {.1)

- RESEARCH SEC NO ACTION
LETTERS AND OTHER AUTHORITIES
ON LIQUIDATING TRUSTS, VOTING
TRUSTS AND OTHER STRUCTURES.

- REVIEW DEBTOR RUSINESS PLAN
(.5); TELEDPHONE CONFERENCE
WITH DEBTORS' COUNSEL
REGARDING SECURITIES ACT (.5);
CONFERENCE WITH BALDWIN
REGARDING SEC PAPERS (.5)

- TRAVEL TO AND FROM NEW YORK
CITY FOR MEETING WITH COMPANY
COUNSEL (4.00); REVIEW
STRUCTURE ISSUES AND PROPOSALS
{1.00) ; MEETING WITH EQUITY
COMMITTEE INVESTMENT BANKERS
{0.3); MEETING WITH COMPANY
COUNSEL (2.00); REVIEW MEETING
RESULTS (0.5);

- EMAILS TO/FROM CLASS COUNSEL
{.8); FURTHER DRAFTING OF
COMPLAINT (1.8); RECEIPT AND
REVIEW OF MEMO FROM B. WILLIAMS
- PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE
IN PRE SETTLEMENT MEETING WITH
CHANIN AND P. MFLICK AND

MR. PANAGAKTE MEMO TO TEAM
REGARDING SETTLEMENT AND OTHER
ISSUES (.5); ANALYSIS OF PLAN
RELEASE LITIGATION STRATEGY
{.6)

74

J
Desc

hkkkkk

279.50

882.00

490.00

705.00

4,017.00

1,317.50

1,680.00

1,925.00

539.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 62 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002

05/16/02 BALDIGA
05/16/02 BALDWIN
05/16/02 CHEUNG
05/16/02 WEISFELNER

05/16/02  SURERIS

05/17/02 BALDIGA

05/17/02 BALDIGA

05/17/02 STOLL

Invoice Number

Page

- REVIEW SEC'S OBJECTIONS TO
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND DRAFT
EQUITY COMMITTEE'S OBJECTION

- FURTHER DRAFTING OF
COMPLAINT (3.7);
CORRESPONDENCE TO DEBTCRS'
COUNSEL (.3); REVISIONS TO
DOCUMENT REQUESTS (1.8)

- REVIEW ISSUE OF RELEASE OF
THIRD PARTY/NON-DEBTORS IN
PLAN WITH BILL (0.3); DRAFT
MEMO RE: SUMMARY OF FIDUCIARY
DUTY RESEARCH (0.2); REVIEW
ARTICLES RE: SAME ISSUE AND
PULL CASES FROM THESE ARTICLES
(0.2)

- DISCUSSIONS WITH BALDIGA RE
DEPO OF FAZIO AND RELATED
MATTERS

- CONTINUE TO CONDUCT GENERAL
RESEARCH RE OBJECTION TO
D/S(2.4); DRAFT SAME (.7);
REVIEW CASES (2.1); T/C
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE
SAME({.30); T/C MARK BALDWIN RE
COMPLAINT (.20} ; :

- ANALYZE PLAN
PROVISIONS/STRATEGIES TO
DEFEAT CONFIRMATION AS TO
INSIDER AND OTHER THIRD PARTY
RELEASES (2.7); ANALYZE AND
DRAFT OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE
STATEMENT AS TO SIP CLAIMS,
THIRD PARTY RELEASES AND
INTERPLAY BETWEEN SHARES AND
DOLLAR CLAIMS FOR ACCEPTANCE
AND DISTRIBUTI
(5.3); ANALYZE SIP_CLAIMS As
COMPONENT OF PosA BLE
SETTLEMENT (.9) =

- REVIEW MATERIALS 'TELEPHONE
CONFERENCES ‘WITH MR. FAZIO'S
COUNSEL 5

- TELEPEoﬁE” ONFERENCE WITH E.
WEISFELNER, I, BALIDGA, MARK
BALDWIN AND "BILL DOLAN
REGARDING VARTIOUS PLAN RELATED
ISSUES; IMPACT ON EQUITY;
NECESSARY RESEARCH; CONFERENCE
WITH WILLIAM R. BALDIGA
REGARDING SIP ISSUES

539.00

2,465.00

171.50

157.50

1,567.50

4,459.00

45.00

1,410.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 63 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Involce Number re**x¥
PLAN OF REOCRGANIZATION Page 76
August 29, 2002

05/17/02 DOLAN IIX PREPARE DISCOVERY AND 1.0 445.00
LITIGATION ACTION PLAN.
05/17/02 BALDWIN ~ CONFERENCE CALL WITH COUNSEL 6.2 2,635.00

(1.8); EDIT AND CIRCULATE
DRAFT COMPLAINT (%.2); REVISE
DISCOVERY (2.6); TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH CLASS COUNSEL
{.6)

05/17/02 CHEUNG - ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE: 7.8 1,911.00
DISCOVERY; ORBJECTION TO PLAN;
SETTLEMENT WITH BILL, ED,
PHIL, MARK, JIM, BILL (1.5)};
ANALYSIS OF ISSUES RE:
DRAFTING OBJECTION TO PLAN
WITH BILL AND DAPHNE {0.8);
REVIEW FIDUCIARY DUTY RESEARCH
{0.5); DRAFT SUMMARY OF
FIDUCIARY DUTY RESEARCH (1.2);
RESEARCH SECONDARY SOURCES RE:
THIRD-PARTY NONDEBTCOR RELEASES
(0.5) ; RESEARCH CASES IN 7TH
CIR. RE: THIRD-PARTY NONDEBTOR
RELEASES (1.1), RESEARCH CASES
IN N.D. ILL RE: THIRD-PARTY
NONDEBTOR RELEASES {1.1);
RESEARCH OTHER CIRCUITS RE:
SAME (1.1)

05/17/02 WEISFELNER - PREPARE FOR AND CONDUCT 2.6 1,365.00
INTER-OFFICE MEMO TQ REVIEW
SETTLEMENT ISSUES, DRAFT
COMPLAINT AGAINST D&0OS,
OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION AND
DISCLOSURE (1.8}; REVIEW AND
REVISE DRAFT COMPLATINT (.80)

05/17/02 SURPRIS - WORK ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT 10.5 2,887.50
' OBJECTION
05/18/02 BALDIGA - REVISE MASTER COMPLAINT VS. 0.5 245,00
D&O Co
05/18/02 BALDICA - REVISE ANALYSIS OF : 0.7 343.00

SHAREHOLDER/SUB. CLAIMANTS FOR
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION
05/18/02 CHEUNG - RESEARCH CASES IN N.D. ILL 10.7 2,621.50

RE: THIRD-PARTY NONDEBTOR
RELEASES (1.5); RESEARCH 7TH
CIR. RE: THIRD-PARTY NONDEBTOR
RELEASES (1.5); RESEARCH OTHER
CIRCUITS RE: THIRD-PARTY
NONDEBTOR RELEASES (2.1)
RESEARCH SECONDARY SOURCES RE:
THIRD-PARTY NONDEBTOR RELEASES
(1.5) ; DRAFT SECTION OF
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Case 01-24795
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Pleading Page 64 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, 1INC,.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION

Bugust 29,

05/18/02
05/19/02

05/20/02

05/20/02

05/20/02

05/20/02

05/20/02

05/20/02

2002

SURPRIS
SURPRIS

BALDIGA

BALDIGA

STOLL

BUSNY

DOLAN III

DOLAN IIX

w o '
Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

OBJECTION TO PLAN RE:
THIRD~PARTY NONDEBTOR RELEASES
(4.1)

-~ WORK ON D/S OBJECTION

- WORK ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
OBJECTION

- REVISE MASTER COMPLAINT VS.
OFFICERS, DIRECTORS, ETC.
(.8); CONFERENCE WITH MR.
STOLL, MR. BALDWIN AND MR.
DOLAN TC IDENTIFY NEW FACTS,
NEW COUNTS FOR MASTER
COMPLAINT (1.0)

- REVISE OBJECTION TC
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND
ANALYZE POSSIBLE OBJECTION ON
BASIS OF SUBSTANTIVE
CONSOLIDATION (.8); DRAFT
REVISIONS TO DISCLOSURE
STATEMENT OBJECTION AS TO
THIRD PARTY RELEASES (.9);
ANALYZE EXTENT TO WHICH WE
NEED TO ADD RESERVATION OF
RIGHTS AS TO

. LEGAL/CONFIRMATICN OBJECTIONS

(.8); ANALYZE DEATH TRAP
VOTING ISSUE {.3); CONFERENCE
WITH MR. DANAGAKIS REGARDING
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
OBJECTIONS, SETTLEMENT, ETC.
{.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES
WITH MR. BRAVERMAN REGARDING
POTENTIAL PLAN/DISCLOSURE
STATEMENT WITNESS (.2)

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
BALDWIN, DOLAN, BALDIGA
REGARDING CLATMS AGAINST
VARIOUS PARTIES (2.0);
CONFERENCE WITH MARK BALDWIN
REGARDING SAME (1.0); REVIEW
PROPOSED COMPLAINT (.8);
ANALYZE POTENTIAL LEGAL CLAIMS
(2.5} ; ANALYZE SECURITIES
FRAUD SUITS (1.0)

- ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS BRY EQUITY
COMMITTEE (1.1l); OFFICE
CONFERENCE WITH JIM STOLL (.4)
- PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND
CONFERENCE CALL ON LITIGATION
STRATEGY.

- EDIT AND REVISE COMPLAINT.

77

]

E

1,760.00
1,155.00

§82.00

1,813.00

3,431.00

525.00

667.50

667.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 65 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
05/20/02 BALDWIN
05/20/02 CHEUNG
05/20/02 SURPRIS
05/21/02 BALDIGA
05/21/02 BALDIGA
05/21/02 BALDIGA
05/21/02 STOLL
05/21/02 DOLAN ITI

L

Invoice Number (r¥kkkx

Page

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B.
BALDIGA, STOLI, AND DOLAN RE:
COMPLAINT (2.1); REVISIONS TO
SAME (.8); DRAFTING OF FURTHER
DISCOVERY (3.2)

- REVISE OBJECTION TO PLAN
SECTION ON THIRD-PARTY
RELEASES (2.7); REVIEW STATUS
OF LAW ON THIRD-PARTY RELEASES
IN 7TH CIR. (2.7); REVIEW
SECONDARY SOURCES COMMENTARY
FOR ARGUMENTS AND ADDITIONAL
CASE LAW (0.8); REVIEW LEADING
CASES IN OTHER CIRCUITS {(1.8)

; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
SONIA CHAE AT SEC RE:
OBJECTION {(0.5)

- CONTINUE TO WORK ON
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
OBJECTION(9.4); T/CS WITH
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE SAME
{1.0); T/C WITH SKADDEN RE
SAME (.20); T/CS WITH EDWARD
5. WEISFELNER RE SAME (.30)

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
MR. BRAVERMAN REGARDING LARE
CALL {(.1); REVIEW LABE VENTURE
PROPOSAL (.2); CONFERENCE WITH
LABE; FOLLOW UP WITH BRAVERMAN
REGARDING LABE'S VENTURE
PROPOSAL (1.4)

- TRAVEL TO NEW YORK CITY TO
FINALIZE DISCLOSURE_STATEMENT

AND RELATED ISSUES AND TO

PARTIES (1.6}
(1.8)

INSURANCE COVERAGE
- ATTENTION TO ACTION ITEMS;
EDIT AND REVISE COMPLAINT.

6.5 2,762.50
8.5 2,082.50
10.9 2,997.50
1.7 833.00
5.1 2,499.00
0.1 0 49.00
4.0° 1,880.00
1.5 667.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 66 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number rex*x®
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION Page 79

August 29,

05/21/02

05/21/02

os/21/02

05/21/02

05/22/02

05/22/02

05/22/02
05/22/02

05/22/02

05/22/02

05/22/02

05/23/02

05/23/02

2002

CHEUNG

BIEDERMANN

SURPRIS

LO CASBCIO

BALDIGA

BALDIGA

STOLL
DOLAN TIIT

BALDWIN

CHEUNG

BERMAN

BALDIGA

BALDIGA

- REVIEW OBJECTION SECTION ON
THIRD PARTY RELEASES (0.3);
REVISE SAME (0.2)

- OFFICE CONFERENCE W/DAPHNEE
SURPRIS RE: DEATHTRAP ISSUES

- 0/C WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION
(.50); CONTINUE TO WORK CN
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION
(7.0) .

- CITE CHECK AND SHEPARDIZE
OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE
STATEMENT

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
MR. FAZIO'S ATTORNEY REGARDING
DEPO, ETC. :

- CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY
FENNING REGARDING VENTURES
{.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES
WITH MR. PANAGAKIS REGARDING
SETTLEMENT (.2); DRAFT
REVISIONS TC DISCLOSURE
STATEMENT OBJECTION (1.9)

- BEGIN REVIEW OF SIP PLEADINGS
- FURTHER EDITS AND REVISIONS
TO COMPLAINT.

- RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF
REVISION TO COMPLAINT (1.2);
EDIT SAME (1.1); RECEIPT AND
REVIEW OF SHAREHOLDERS
OBJECTION (1.0)

- RESEARCH CASELAW IN ALL
JURISDICTION RE: DEATHTRAP
PROVISIONS (0.7); RESEARCH 7TH
CIR., AND N.D. ILL CASES RE:
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
REQUIREMENTS FOR SECTION A OF
THE OBJECTICON (1.5)

- REVIEW WATER TOWER MOTION;
REVIEW OBJECTION TQ PLAN AND
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

- DRAFT UPDATE MEMO TO
COMMITTEE AND PROPOSALS AS TO
ALL RECENT EVENT, NEW
DEVELOPMENTS, DISCLOSURE
STATEMENT OBJECTION, ETC. (1.2)
- REVISE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
OBJECTION {1.3); CONFERENCE
WITH MR. WEISFELNER REGARDING
DISCOVERY PLAN (.3)

N
oo

122.5¢0

73.00

2,062.50

350.00

98.00

1,176.00

470.00

3,115.00

1,402.50

539.00

340.00

588.00

784.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 67 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number **xx¥¥
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION Page 80
August 29, 2002

05/23/02 BALDIGA - REVIEW MATERIALS; MEMO TO 0.1 45.00
SKADDEN REGARDING D&0O POLICIES
05/23/02 MURPHREE - ATTENTION TO SECURITIES LAW 0.2 98.00

ISSUES WITH PROPCSED PLAN AND
INTERESTS TO EQUITY HOLDERS.

05/23/02 STOLL : - AWNALYSIS OF SIP CLAIMS 3.5 1,645.00

05/23/02 DOLAN IIT - FURTHER EDITS TO COMPLAINT 4.0 1,780.00
AND MEMCRANDUM.

05/23/02 DOLAN III - FURTHER EDITS AND REVISIONS 0.3 133.50
TO COMPLAINT AND MEMORANDUM.

05/23/02 BALDWIN : - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 4.9 . 2,082.50

COUNSEL (1.2); REVISE
COMPLAINT AND FORWARD TO
COUNSEL (1.8); STRATEGY MEMO
{.8); ATTENTION TO DISCOVERY
(1.1)
05/23/02 CHEUNG - ATTENTION TO OBJECTION TO 4.8 1,176.00
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE:
LOWENSTEIN & MONARCH (0.5);
REVISE DEATH TRAP CITATION TO
DREXLER IN OBJECTION (0.3),
ATTENTION TC TRANSMITTING
OBJECTION TO LOCAL COUNSEL
{1.8); REVISE PARENTHETICALS
TO CITATIONS (2.2)
05/23/02 WEISFELNER - T/CS SKADDEN RE EFFORTS TO 0.6 315.00
CLOSE GAP WITH CREDITORS AND
ATTEMPTS TO REACH FORTGANG
05/24/02 BALDIGA - ANALYSIS OF SIP SUBROGATION 2.0 980.00
AND RELATED ISSUES (.2)}; PROOF
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT CBJIECTICN
AND HANDLE NEEDED
CORRECTION/ERRATA PAGE (.2);
CONFERENCE WITH MR. BALDWIN
AND REVISE DOCUMENTS FOR
DISCOVERY PLAN (.5); REVIEW
FLOHR, CLASS ACTION

PLAINTIFFS, SEC AND LABE

STATEMENT AND NOTED ADDITIONAL
ARGUMENTS FOR 5/31/ HEARING

E

05/24/02 STOLL ~ WORK VED ‘4.5 7 2,115.00
ANALYSIE “OF SIP CLAIMS AND o '
TREATMENT UNDER PLAN
05/24/02 BALDWIN - FINALIYE DEPOSITION NOTICES = 5.4 2,295.00
(2.6); FINALIZE DOCUMENT
REQUESTS (1.8); SERVICE OF
DISCOVERY (.5); LETTER FOR F.

PERLMAN (.5)



Case 01-24795

v

w L @
Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 0

Pleading Page 68 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
05/24/02 CHEUNG
05/24/02 NG
05/28/02 BALDIGA
05/28/02 STOLL
05/28/02 BALDWIN
05/28/02 CHEUNG
05/28/02 NG
05/28/02 WEISFELNER
05/28/02 SURPRIS
05/29/02 BALDIGA
05/29/02 BALDWIN
05/29/02 NG

w

Invoice Numbexr

Page

- ANALYSIS RE: COMDISCO
RESEARCH ON FIDUCIARY DUTY
WITH CATHERINE (2.3)

- PREPARE OUTLINE OF RESEARCH
DCNE OM FIDUCIARY DUTY ISSUES
AND CRAMDOWN OF REORGANIZATICN
PLAN

- CONFERENCE WITH EDWARD S.
WEISFELNER; REVIEW MATERIALS
REGARDING SETTLEMENT ISSUES
{.2); BANALYZE CLASS ACTION
CASES AS TO STRATEGY FOR THIRD
PARTY RELEASE LITIGATION {(.7)
-~ REVIEW SECURITIES CLASS
ACTION PLEADINGS AND ORDERS TO
EVALUATE CLAIM FOR EQUITY
HOLDERS

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M.
PERKAL (.8); REVISIONS TO
COMPLAINT (2.1); REVIEW OF
DISCLOSURE STATMENT OBJECTIONS
(2.7)

- REVISE OUTLINE OF FID. DUTY
RESEARCH

- FURTHER REVIEW OF FILES AND
NOTES TO FINALIZE OUTLINE OF
RESEARCH ON FIDUCIARY DUTY

- T/CS FORTGANG, WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA, G. DANAGAKIS, MEMO TO
COMMITTEE, ALL IN CONNECTION
WITH POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT
{1.8); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT
COMPLAINT AND RELATED T/C
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA (1.6)

- REVIEW OTHER PARTIES
OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE
STATEMENT

- REVIEW LENDERS' OBJECTION TO
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2);
ANALYZE CASES AS TO POSSIBLE
PLAN AMENDMENT TO MAKE
RELEASES OF "OPT-OUT" VARIETY
(.3)

REVIEW OF OBJECTICNS FOR 5/31
HEARING (1.7)

- FURTHER REVIEW TO DETERMINE
COMPLETENESS OF RESEARCH MEMO

81

0.8

0:00:00 Desc

*hkkkh*

563.50

228.00

441.00

2,820.00

2,380.00

245.00

152.00

1,785.00

605.00

245.00

722.50

152.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 69 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
05/29/02 WEISFELNER
05/29/02 SURPRIS
05/30/02 BALDIGA
05/30/02 BALDIGA
05/30/02 STOLL
0s5/30/02 DOLAN III
05/30/02 BALDWIN
05/30/02 CHEUNG

Invoice Numberx

Page

PREPARE FOR AND CONDUCT
TELEPHONIC MEETING OF
COMMITTEE TO REVIEW DISCOVERY
OBJECTIONS, STATUS OF
SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS,
CONFIRMATION OBJECTION STATUS
(1.3); RELATED O/C WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA RE SAME (.40); 0/C
STEVEN E. GREENBAUM RE
REVISIONS TO DRAFT D*O
COMPLAINT (.40); PULL TOGETHER
RESEARCH FILER ON PERMISSIBLE
SCOPE OF THIRD PARTY RELEASES
AND REVIEW SAME (2.2}

- 0/C EDWARD S. WEISFELNER RE
PLAN STRATEGY(.30); 0/C
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE PLAN
CONFIRMATION ISSUES({.20)

- REVIEW FAZIO FACTS FOR
DEPOSITION PREPARATION

- TRAVEL BOSTON TO CHICAGO FOR
5/31 HEARINGS AND DURING
TRAVEL READ ALI, CASES AND
PREPARE FOR HEARING ON
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND READ
NEW PLEADINGS AS TO CLERK
SALE, DEBTOR'S OBJECTION TO
PLAN/TRUST MOTION AND SECOND
OMNIBUS CLAIMS OBJECTION
(6.1) ; CONFERENCE WITH MR.
WEISFELNER TC PREPARE FOR 5/31
HEARING; MEMO FROM AND MEMO TO
LABE'S COUNSEL '(.4) =

- CONFERENCE WITH MARK BALDWIN
RE COMPLAINT =~

- TELEPHONE CALL WITH M.'

SCHEDULING PREPARE FOR FAZIO
DEPOSITION; TELEP NE
CONFERENCE WITH FAzIO‘S

COUNSEL; ATTENTION!FO COMPLAINT
Wil

- DRAFT MEMO REGARDING THE
STANCE OF EACH’ CIRdUIT ON 3RD
PARTY NONDERTOR RﬁﬁEAgES

(1.7); DRAFT MEMC ON OPT OUT
RELEASES (1.8); RESEARCH ALL
CIRCUITS FOR CONSENSUAL
RELEASES {(1.2); REVIEW CASES
ON OPT OUT RELEASES (2.5)

2,257.50

137.50

196.00

3,185.00

235.00

223 .50

2,337.50

1,764.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/3

Pleading Page 70 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
05/30/02 GREENBAUM
05/30/02 WEISFELNER
05/30/02 SURPRIS
05/30/02 SURPRIS
05/30/02 LAUKAMG
05/31/02 BALDIGA

. - -
0/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

- REVIEW, EDIT COMPLAINT (.9);
0/CS EDWARD S. WEISFELNER,
DAPHNEE SURPRIS RE SAME {(1.2);
COMMUNICATIONS W/MATTHEW
BROWN, JAMES STOLL, REGINA C.
CHEUNG RE VARIOUS RESEBARCH
ISSUES {.7); REVIEW RESEARCH

MEMOS (.5}

- CONTINUED PREPARATIONS FOR

DISCLOSURE HEARING,

INCLUDING

TRAVEL TC CHICAGO WITH EN
ROUTE REVIEW OF OBJECTIONS
FILED BY OTHERS (4.4); PREPARE
FOR AND MEET WITH WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA TO REVIEW STATUS AND
DISCUSS LATEST SETTLEMETN
PROPOSALS (.90); T/CS (2X)
DEBTORS COUNSEL RE POTENTIAL
SETTLEMENT (1.1); RELATED CORO
TO PANAGAKIS RE SAME
- 0/C EDWARD S. WEISFELNER RE
5/31/02 HEARING(.20); REVIEW
INCOMING PLEADINGS (1.2)};
PREPARE DOCS FOR EDWARD S.
WEISFELNER RE 5/31/02 HEARING

(1.8}

(.30)

- T/CS M. BALDWIN RE LIT
ISSUES (.20} ; ©/C STEVEN E.
GREENBAUM RE LITIGATION (.20);
PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR STEVEN
E. GREENBAUM RE LITIGATION
(2.5); T/C EDWARD S.
WEISFELNER RE LIT ISSUES (.20)
- PULL REPORTERS FOR CASES
CITED IN ORJECTION BY THE
OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF EQUITY
SECURITY HOLDERS TO DEBTORS
MOTICN FOR ORDER APPROVING
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND
ARRANGE TO OBTAIN COPY OF SAME
FOR EDWARD S. WEISFELNER (.5)
-~ TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
SEC REGARDING HEARING

STRATEGY, ETC.

(.2);

CONFERENCE WITH LISA FENNING
REGARDING OVERALL LABE
INTENTIONS, COORDINATION FOR
CONDUCT ALL-DAY

HEARING (1.0);

HEARING ON DISCLOSURE

STATEMENT AND MISCELLANEQUS

OTHER MATTERS

(6.7);

RETURN

83

14.

o

*kok R kR

1,732.50

3,517.50

880.00

852.50

47.50

6,909.00
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Pleading Page 71 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
Rugust 29, 2002
05/31/02 STOLL
05/31/02 DOLAN III
05/31/02 WEISFELNER
05/31/02 SURPRIS
05/31/02 SURPRIS
06/01/02 BALDIGA
06/03/02 BALDIGA
06/03/02 GOLDBERG
06/03/02 WEISFELNER

Invoice Number

Page

TRAVEL CHICAGC TO BOSTON {6.2)
- CONFERENCE WITH BALDWIN AND
DOLAN REGARDING POTENTIAL
CLAIMS AGAINST CREDITORS
AND/OR DEBTOR

- CONFERENCE WITH M. BALDWIN
REGARDING STATUS OF COMPLAINT.
- ATTEND BREAKFAST MEETING
WITH WILLIAM R. BALDIGA AND
JUDGE FLENNING TO DISCUSS LABE
ISSUES {1.1); PREPARE FCR AND
ATTEND ALL DAY HEARING ON
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (7.2);
TRAVEL BACK TO NEW YORK (2.1)
- REVIEW C. LONSTEIN MEMO RE
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.50} ;
REVIEW ADDITIONAL DISCLOSURE
STATEMENT OBJECTIONS (1.0)

- 0/C STEVEN E. GREENBAUM RE
LIT(.20); CONTINUE TO PREPARE
DOCUMENTS RE LIT(1.5); T/CS M.
BALDWIN RE LITIGATION {.40);
EMAIL C. LONSTEIN RE SAME (.20)
- OUTLINE AND DRAFT
SOLICITATION PACKAGE LETTER TO
SHAREHOLDERS

- DEVELOP PLAN LITIGATION PLAN
AND PRIOR COURT RESTRICTIONS,
COMMENTS (.4); DRAFT PLAN
SOLICITATION LETTER AND
SUMMARY OF POSSIBLE
SHAREHOLDER CLAIMS VS. THIRD
PARTIES (5.1); ANALYZE TAX
EFFECT ON SHAREHOLDERS WHO |
ACCEPT VS. WHO REJECT ;

AND DEBTOR'S TAX WRITE P IN
DISCLOSURE STATEME] ]
- CONFERENCE WITH WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA (.2); RESEARCH TAX
ISSUES AND REVIEW LEGAL _
AUTHORITIES (.8); DRAFT TAX
INSERT TO LETTER (.5)

- OUTLINE SOLICITATION LETTER
(.7); FOCUS ON DISCOVERY AND
CONFIRMATION ISSUES, INCLUDING
CONTINUED RESEARCH ON
CONFIDENTIALITY OBJECTIONS
(1.4) ; REVIEW REVISED
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.1);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH
ROTHSCHILD REGARDING PCTENTIAL

84

o

* kK ok ok ok

470.00

445.00

5,460.00

412.50

632.50

1,078.00

3,234.00

637.50

1,242.50
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COMDISCO, INC.
PLAN OF RECORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
06/03/02 SURPRIS
06/04/02 BALDIGA
06/04/02 STOLL
06/04/02 DOLAN III
0s/04/02 CHEUNG
06/04/02 GOLDBERG
06/04/02 WEISFELNER

® ® - o
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

SETTLEMENT (.4); ATTEMPTED
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CHAIM
FORTAGANG REGARDING SAME (.1)
- REVIEW AMENDED D/S(2.3); T/C
MARK S. BALDWIN RE COMPLAINT
(.30); REVIEW AND PREPARE
DOCUMENTS FOR STEVEN E.
GREENBAUM RE COMPLAINT (1.0)

- DRAFT SOLICITATION LETTER TO
SHAREHOLDERS (4.3); ANALYZE
PRIOR COMPENSATION PLANS FOR
ACCURACY OF SHAREHOLDER
SOLICITATION (.6); TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH MS. PERLMAN
REGARDING SOLICITATION LETTER
{.1); CONFERENCE WITH MR.
WEISFELNER AND REVISE LETTER
AND MEMO TO COMMITTEE
REGARDING LETTER (.9)

- REVIEW SOLICITATION LETTER
(.8); CONFERENCE WITH WILLIAM
R. BALDIGA REGARDING CLAIMS
AND STRATEGY {.2)

- FURTHER REVIEW PROPOSED
DISCOVERY PLAN ON OBJECTION TO
PLAN.

- REVIEW WEALTH MAXIMIZATION
CASES (0.9); REVIEW DUTY TO
SHAREHOLDERS IN INSCLVENCY
CASES (1.5); DRAFT MEMO TO
GREENBAUM RE: DUTY TO
SHAREHOLDERS AND WEALTH
MAXIMIZATION (0.8)

- CONFERENCE WITH WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA {(.2); DRAFT INSERT TO
LETTER AND REVISE AND EDIT
{.8): ‘ '
REVIEW LEG%L AUTHORITIES (.7)

SOLICITATION LETTER WITH
RELATED TELEﬁﬁOﬁ% SNFERENCE
WITH WILLIAM R BALDIGA
REGARDING SAME (1.9} ;
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE wITH
WILLIAM R. BA ;
DISCOVERY AND RELATED
CONFIRMATION ISSUES AND
RELATED E-MAIL WITH MARK S.
BALDWIN REGARDING FAZIO
DEPOSITION (.8); MORE
DISCUSSIONS WITH ROTHSCHILD

4.7

990.00

2,842.00

470.00

222 .50

784 .00

637.50

'2,467.50



] w () ] o - ) w
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 73 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *x%%¥%
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION Page 86
August 29, 2002

AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
CHAIM FORTAGANG REGARDING
SETTLEMENT (.5); TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH DAVID PEDOWITZ
REGARDING UPDATE SETTLEMENT
ISSUES (.4); REVIEW DISCLOSURE
STATEMENT ON SECURITIES CLAIMS
ISGUES AND SIP SETTLEMENT
PROPOSALS (1.1)

06/04/02 SURPRIS - T/¢S WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE 6.7 1,842.50
IMMUNITY ISSUE(.30); REVIEW
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING
TRANSCRIPT (3.2); LEXIS SEARCH
RE IMMUNITY ISSUE (1.2);

REVIEW CASE LAW RE SAME {1.5);
REVIEW DRAFT LETTER TO
SHAREHOLDERS (.50)

06/05/02 BALDIGA - REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING 2.7 1,323.00
NEW SETTLEMENT ISSUES (.2);
REVIEW MATERIALS AND
CONFERENCE WITH MS. LONSTEIN
REGARDING SOLICITATICON LETTER;
PREPARE FOR 6/10 HEARTING (.4);
CONFERENCE WITH MR. STOLL TO
PREPARE LITIGATION STRATEGY
{.5); ANALYZE 1129(A) (.3)
STANDARD AND PROOF FOR
PURPOSES OF DISCOVERY BREADTH
ARGUMENT AT 6/10 HEARING (.7);
ANALYZE DEBTOR/COMMITTEE
IMMUNITY AND LEGALITY OF SCOPE
OF PLAN EXCULPATION CLAUSE
{.5); ANALYZE 5/31 TRANSCRIPT _
FOR STRATEGY"AS”TO s

SOLICITATION L1 ﬁﬁ‘“ETc (.4) e

06/05/02 BALDIGA

06/05/02 STOLL

(.5); REVIEW
STAYING BONUS 'APPROVAL (.5) ;
RESEARCH COLLUE BANKRUPTCY'
ISSUES (1.0) ° e
06/05/02 CHEUNG - RESEARCH STANDING OF EQUITY 8.3 2,033.50
COMMITTEE TO CLAIM BREACH OF
FIDUCIARY DUTY (1.8); REVISE
MEMO TO GREENBAUM (1.5);
RESEARCH GOOD FAITH
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REQUIREMENT UNDER SECTION
1129 (A) (3) {(0.2); RESEARCH
BANKR. LAW REQUIREMENTS OF
DISCOVERY FOR BREADTH (2.5);
RESEARCH 7TH CIR. FOR BREADTH
AND SCOPE OF DISCOVERY (1.6};
DRAFT EMAIL SUMMARIES OF SCOPE
OF DISCOVERY RESEARCH {(0.5);
TELEPHONE TO MARK BALDWIN RE:
SCOPE OF DISCOVERY CASES (0.2)

06/05/02 NG - PREPARE DRAFT MEMO ON 3.2 608.00
FIDUCIARY DUTY (1.3); FURTHER
RESEARCH OF ALL POSSIBLE CASE
LAW DISCUSSING CASES THAT
DISCUSS 1129(A) (4) (1.9)

06/05/02 SELZER - TELEPHONE FROM WILLIAM 0.8 96.00
BALDIGA RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT FOR
COMDISCO LITIGATION.

06/05/02 SELZER - MEMORANDUM TO WILLIAM 0.5 60.00
BALDIGA, WITH COPIES TO JAMES
W. STOLL AND STEPHANIE M.
TAVERNA SIDEN RE: RESEARCH
ASSIGNMENT FOR COMDISCO
LITIGATION. _ :

06/05/02 WEISFELNER - EXTENDED (ALL DAY} WORK ON 8.8 4,620.00
SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL WITH
RELATED DISCUSSIONS CCMMITTEE
CHAIR AND FINANCIAL ADVISOR,
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH
GEORGE PANAGAKIS AND TODD
SNYDER RE SAME, REVIEW
RELEVANT PROVISIONS OF PLAN
AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
(7.7); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT
OF SOLICITATION LETTER (1.1)

06/05/02 SURPRIS - DRAFT MEMO TO WILLIAM R. 6.1 1,677.50
BALDIGA RE IMMUNITY
ISSUE(3.5); CONTINUE LEXIS
RESEARCH RE SAME (2.3); EMAIL
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE SAME(.30)

06/06/02 BALDIGA - REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING 2.1 1,029.00
DISCOVERY DISPUTES FOR
POSSIBLE 6/10 HEARING {.4);
REVISE SOLICITATION LETTER
FROM COMMITTEE COMMENTS AND
MS. LONSTEIN COMMENTS; ANALYZE
IMMUNITY AND OTHER LAW
APPLICABRLE TO LETTER (1.4);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS,
PERLMAN REGARDING LETTER, ETC.
(.1); CONFERENCE WITH MS.
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COMDISCO, INC.
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
06/06/02 STOLL
06/06/02 CHEUNG
06/06/02 GOLDBERG
06/06/02 NG

06/06/02 WEISFELNER
06/06/02 SURPRIS

Invoice Number

Page

LONSTEIN REGARDING LETTER,
6/10 HEARING (.2)

-~ CONFERENCE WITH BALDWIN
REGARDING DISCOVERY RESPONSE
FRCM SKADDEN (.5); ANALYZE
OBJECTION TO RESPONSE (.3);
ANALYZE DERIVATIVE CLAIMS (.7)
- RESEARCH GOOD FAITH
REQUIREMENT UNDER SECTION
1129(A) {3) (2.4), REVIEW
MINORITY APPRAISAL CASES TO
ADD TO OUTLINE (0.8}, REVIEW
DERIVATIVE ACTION CASES IN
SALE OF ASSETS TO ADD TOQ
OUTLINE (0.8); REVIEW SOLVENT
SELF-DEALING CASES TO ADD TO
OUTLINE (0.7), REVIEW SOLVENT
BUSINESS JUDGMENT RULE CASES
TO ADD TO OUTLINE (0.7);
REVIEW TAKEOVER/TENDER OFFER
CASES TO ADD TO OUTLINE (0.8);
REVIEW RISE OF FIDUCIARY DUTY
TO CREDITORS CASES TO ADD TO
QUTLINE (0.8); REVIEW
SECONDARY MATERIALS TO ADD TO
OUTLINE (0.7); DRAFT MEMO TO
OUTLINE RE: SAME (0.1}

- RESEARCH TAX ISSUES AND
REVIEW LEGAL AUTHORITIES

- REVISE DRAFT MEMO REGARDING
FIDUCIARY DUTY AND STANDING
ISSUES - - o
- MEET WITH CHANIN AND DAVID
PEDOWITZ IN ADV%NCE,OF

FORTGANG, " CTT1E
TEAM AND 'BAVID PEDOWTTZ (3.2)
K IN RE
DISCOVERY 1sSUES(.20); T/cC
WILLIAM K. BALD i i
RESEARCH (.20) " FOLLOW UP 0/C
WITH EDWARD S. WETSFELNER AND
STEVEN E. GREENBAUM (.30); 0/C
EDWARD S. WEISFELNER RE
SOLICITATION LETTER (.30);
DRAFT DEPS, SUBPOENAS FOR

i

.&TH DEBTOR

88

5.3

7.9

L

*kkkkhkk

705.00

1,935.50

425.00

57.00

' 2,782.50

2,172.50
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PLAN OF REORGANIZATION Page 89
August 29, 2002

ROTHSCHILD, GOLDMAN AND
MCKINSEY AND SUPPORTING
DOCUMENTS (3.0); T/CS MARK S.
BALDWIN RE SAME (.50); T/CS C.
LONSTEIN RE SAME (.20); LEXIS
SEARCH RE IMMUNITY AND
RELEASES (3.2)
06/07/02 BALDIGA - REVIEW MATERTIALS; CONFERENCE 0.5 245.00
WITH MR. PEDOWITZ; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH MR. GOLDBERG
REGARDING TAX/SETTLEMENT ISSUES
08/07/02 STOLL - DISCOVERY CONFERENCE 0.5 235.00
REGARDING STADDER OBJECTIVES
{.5)
06/07/02 CHEUNG - DRAFT MEMC OF CASE SUMMARIES 4.0 980.00
RE: GOOD FAITH REQUIREMENT
UNDER 1129(A) (3) {(0.4);
RESEARCH GOOD FAITH
REQUIREMENT UNDER 1129 (2) (3)
{0.8); REVIEW VALUATION CASES
TO ADD TO OUTLINE (0.8);
REVIEW CRAMDOWN CASES TO ADD
TO OUTLINE (0.8);: REVIEW
BREACH OF DUTY OF LOYALTY
CASES TO ADD TO OUTLINE {0.8);
REVIEW BREACH BY
CREDITORS/PROFESSICNALS OF
DUTY OF LOYALTY TO ADD TO
OUTLINE {0.4)
06/07/02 GOLDBERG - CONFERENCES WITH ED 4.0 1,700.00
WEISFELNER, BILL BALDIGA,
DAVID PEDOWITZ AND OTHERS
(.5); REVIEW PLAN AND
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5);
RESEARCH TAX ISSUES AND REVIEW
LEGAL AUTHOR B: TAX
TREATMENT o““ﬁQUITY HOLDERS IN
REORGANIZAT ECTION 453,

06/07/02  WEISFELNER 0.9  472.50

DISCUSSIONS ON DOCUMENTING

SETTLEMENT AND RELATED MATTERS
{.6)
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06/07/02 SURPRIS - T/CS KENNETH R. GOLDBERG RE 4.3 1,182.50
SETTLEMENT {.20); T/CS AND
EMAILS WITH EDWARD S.
WEISFELNER RE SETTLEMENT
{.30); REVIEW BYLAWS({.20); T/C
G. PANAGAKIS RE SETTLEMENT
{.20); T/CS MARK S. BALDWIN
AND WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE
SETTLEMENT {.30); C/C TEAM RE
SETTLEMENT (1.0); FINALIZE
SUBPOENA AND ARRANGE SERVICE
OF SAME {1.5); DRAFT LETTER TO
INTERESTED PARTIES RE SAME

_ {.20)

06/08/02 WEISFELNER - REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT 2.1 1,102.50
COMPLAINT AGAINST D&O'S
REGARDING POST-PETITION
FIDUCIARY DUTY RREACHES AND
RELATED MOTION

06/09/02 BALDIGA - TRAVEL TO CHICAGQ FOR 6/10 4.2 2,058.00
HEARING/NEGOTIATIONS AND
DURING TRAVEL REVIEW 5/31
HEARING TRANSCRIPT AND OTHER
MATERIALS FOR 6/10 HEARING IN
THE EVENT SETTLEMENT FALLS
THROUGH (3.9); REVIEW
MATERIALS; CONFERENCE WITH
MARK §. BALDWIN REGARDING
FRIDAY'S SETTLEMENT, 6/10
HEARING (.3}

06/10/02 FLINK - REVIEW SETTLEMENT 3.2 1,648.00
STRUCTURING ISSUES (1.8);

06/10/02 NOSSIFF JR. 1.3 578.50

06/10/02 CHEUNG S 13.2 - 3,234.00

SETTLEMENT CA
OUTLINE {0.8)
EQUITABLE SUB
TO ADD TO OUTLINE (0.8)
REVIEW VALUAT ONTEXT OF
SALE OF ASSETS 'CASES TO ADD TO
OUTLINE (0.8); DRAFT MEMO
PORTION OF OUTLINE (0.4);
REVIEW SCHEDULE 13DS FOR
NICHOLAS PONTIKES (2.5);
ANALYSIS OF PONTIKES SHARE



@ w ] W o o
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 78 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
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PLAN OF REORGANIZATION Page 91
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HOLDINGS THRU TRUSTS FROM 2000
- 1/02 (2.0); DRAFT CHART
SUMMARY OF PONTIKES' HOLDINGS
(3.8); REVIEW PROXY STATEMENTS
FOR SHARE HOLDINGS BY PONTIKES
AND FAMILY TRUSTS (0.8);
REVIEW ANNUAL REPORTS ON FORM
10-K FOR SHARE HOLDINGS BY
PONTIKES AND FAMILY TRUSTS
{0.5}

06/10/02 GOLDBERG -~ CONFERENCES WITH PHILIP J. 2.

FLINK AND REGINA C. CHEUNG
(.3); REVIEW MATERIALS RE:
VALUATION, PLAN OF
REORGANIZATION, SETTLEMENT,
ETC. (.7); ADDITIONAL RESEARCH
AND REVIEW LEGAL AUTHORITIES
RE: TAX ISSUES (1.0)

06/10/02 WEISFELNER - INTER-QFFICE COMMUNICATION 1.

ON: PENDING DISCOVERY ISSUES
{.3); DOCUMENTATICN OF
SETTLEMENT (.9); PENDING
MOTION PRACTICE (.2);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WILLIAM
R. BALDIGA RE OUTCOME OF
TODAY 'S HEARING (.3)

06/10/02 SURPRIS - T/B MATTHEW BROWN RE DEPS 1.5

SCHEDULE{.20) ; PREPARE DRAFT
RE DEP SCHEDULE{1.3)}

06/11/02 BALDIGA - CONFERENCE WITH EDWARD S. 2.9

WEISFELNER, SETTLEMENT TEAM
REGARDING SETTLEMENT ISSUES
AND ALL SETTLEMENT ACTION
ITEMS (1.6); DRAFT SETTLEMENT
TERM SHEET AND MEMO TO TEAM
REGARDING TERMS, NEEDS (.8);
REVIEW CHANIN TLEMENT
ANALYSIS (.1);'T LEPHONE
CONFERENCES' WITH (SEC)
(.1); REVIEW FIRST DAY MOTION
REGARDING ORD ‘COURSE B
RE-INVESTMENT (.3)
06/11/02 FLINK - REVIEW ST

RIGHTS STRUCTURE %1;2);
FOLLOW-UP ON TAX ISSUES
REGARDING RIGHTS STRUCTURING
(0.7); CONSIDER TRADING ISSUES
REGARDING THE SAME (0.7) ;
DRAFT PROPOSED STRUCTURE FOR

-4
Desc

hkkkHwk

850.00

892.50

412 .50

1,421.00

2,369.00
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INTERNAL REVIEW (1.6);
06/11/02 CHEUNG - CONFERENCE CALL RE: ANALYSIS 4.9 1,200.50
OF SETTLEMENT (1.8); REVISE
CHART OF PONTIKES HOLDINGS TO
MORE CLEARLY REFLECT CURRENT
HOLDINGS (1.9); REVIEW
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FOR
REQUIREMENTS TO GROW CORP IF
NOT LIQUIDATING IN FUTURE (1.2)
06/11/02 GOLDBERG - CONFERENCES WITH BILL 6.0 2,550.00
BALDIGA, PHIL FLINK, MARK
BALDWIN AND REGINA CHEUNG
(1.4); RESEARCH TAX ISSUES AND
REVIEW LEGAL AUTHORITIES RE:
TAX CONSEQUENCES AND ISSUES IN
CONNECTION WITH STRUCTURING
i ALTERNATIVES (3.2); REVIEW
PLAN, DISCLOSURE STATEMENT,
. TERMS OF SETTLEMENT, ETC. (1.4)
06/11/02 SELZER - ANALYZE BACKGROUND 3.0 360.00
DOCUMENTS, GRUPO MEXICANO, AND
NOTE FOR MEMORANDUM TO BILL
BALDIGA.
06/11/02 WEISFELNER - ATTENTION TO DISCOVERY 0.9 472.50
ISSUES WITH RELATED
COMMUNICATION WITH MARK S.
BALDWIN (.2); TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA RE SETTLEMENT
DOCUMENTATION ISSUES AND
REVIEW MEMO RE OPEN POINTS (.7)
06/11/02 BIEDERMANN - O0/C W/ DAPHNEE SURPRIS RE 0.6 219.00
SHAREHOLDER SOLICITATION
LETTER ISSUES (.3); T/C W/
MILBANK RE GOLDMAN SACHS
DISCOVERY ISSUES (.3)
06/11/02 SURPRIS - T/CS BALDIGA”RE'BONUS 0.6 7 165.00°
" MOTION(.30); REVIEW BALDIGA'S o
MEMO RE PLAN SETTLEMENT(.30)
06/12/02 BALDIGA - MEMOS TO TEAM“ S 1O PLAN 7.8 3,822.00
ISSUES FOR TODAY 'S RESOLUTION '
(.2) ; REVIEW Apr%IONAL
MATERIALS FROM
SIP CLAIMS, |

v|l iF ki

NEW DRAFTS OF PLAN AND
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.6) ;

ANALYZE TAX STRUCTURE ISSUES
(.2); CONFERENCE WITH MR.
WEISFELNER; REVIEW MATERIALS
REGARDING SETTLEMENT
NEGOTIATION ISSUES (.4);
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06/12/02 BALDIGA
06/12/02 FLINK
06/12/02 CHEUNG
06/12/02 GOLDBERG
06/12/02 SELZER

Invoice Number
Page 93

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR.
ESPINAL; LETTER TO COMMITTEE
REGARDING NEW PLAN DRAFTS,
ETC. (.2); BNALYZE SUBSTANTIVE
CONSOLIDATION ISSUE (1.1);
CONFERENCES WITH SKADDEN,
CHANIN, TAX PEOPLE, SECURITIES
PEOPLE, ETC. REGARDING NEW
PLAN/SETTLEMENT ISSUES (1.9);
CONFERENCE WITH MS. LONSTEIN;
REVIEW NEW TERM SHEET TO
PREPARE FOR 6/13 HEARING {.5);
DRAFT AND CIRCULATE NEW
(ACCEPTANCE) SOLICITATION

LETTER (.8)
- REVIEW COURT'S DECISION 1.
(.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE

WITH MR. RIZZO REGARDING SAME
AND ANALYZE NEW PLAN
ALTERNATIVES (1.3)

- STRUCTURE REVIEW PROPOSED 3.

RIGHTS STRUCTURE WITH TAX
ADVISORS (0.4); REVIEW
PROPOSAL WITH CHANIN {(0.2);
CONFERENCE CALL WITH SKADDEN
REGARDING RIGHTS TERMS AND
OTHER OUTSTANDING ISSUES

(1.2); DRAFT RIGHTS TERM SHEET
(1.5);
- REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT 0.

FOR REQUIREMENTS TO STOP
LIQUIDATING AND GROW COMPANY

STRUCTURING

SitiEEH

TAX ISSUES

ADbIETéNAL
Uodiged: 1o

REV LEW LEG%L

RESEARCH ;
AUTHORIT@

A

CONNECTION WITH

Lakisid : \

?ﬁ#ﬁCTURING
3 |k F B

ALTERNATTVES ““BIluts o
ACQUIRE STOCK AND SECTIONS

305, 317, 354, ETC. (2.4)

- ANALYZE SUBSTANTIVE 1.

CONSOLIDATICN ISSUE WITH BILL
BALDIGA.

de ok ke e ok

784.00

1,699.50

122.50

1,912.50

132.00
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06/12/02 SELZER - MEMORANDUM TO BILL BALDIGA 2.4 288.00
RE: SUBSTANTIVE CONSOLIDATION
RESEARCH PLAN.

06/12/02 WEISFELNER - CONFER WITH WILLIAM R. 0.6 315.00
BALDIGA ON STATUS OF SETTLEMENT
0e/12/02 SURPRIS - REVIEW REVISED PLAN & 2.2 605.00

D/S(1.5); T/C T. MORENO RE
GOLDMAN DEP(.20); T/C M.
BALDWIN RE SAME(.20); REVIEW
LTR FROM STROOCK RE MCKINSEY
DEP(.20); T/C M. BALDWIN RE
SAME{.10)

06/13/02 BALDIGA - REVIEW NEW PLAN AND 4.6 2,254.00
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT CHBNGES
AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
AND MEMO TO MS. PERLMAN
REGARDING ISSUES {1.8);
SEVERAL TELEPHONE CONFERENCES
AND MEMO TO AND MEMO FROM MS.
PERLMAN, MR. PANAGAKIS, MS.
LONSTEIN, MR. WEISFELNER,
COMMITTEE, ETC. REGARDING
SOLICITATION LETTER, PLAN
CHANGES; ETC. (1.9); TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH MS. CHAE (SEC)
{.1); CONFERENCE WITH MS.
LONSTEIN REGARDING HEARING;
MEMO TO COMMITTEE REGARDING

ALL NEW PLAN EVENTS, ETC. (.8)
06/13/02 FLINK - REVIEW EQUITY TERM SHEET; 0.5 257.50
06/13/02 PAPARELLA - ANALYZED CASE LAW RE: 6.7 804.00
CONFIRMATION ISSUES
06/14/02 BALDIGA - REVIEW ALL PENDING 0.9 441.00
INFORMATION AND OTHER REQUESTS
AND MEMO TO MS. PE}
HANSON REGARDING
ACTION ITEMS f“?3
06/14/02 GOLDBERG 1.0 " 425.00
06/14/02 PAPARELLA 1.9 228.00

e

TO DISCUSS FINDINGE (.7);

ANALYZED CASE LAaW {1.2)
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06/14/02 SELZER
06/16/02 PAPARELLA
06/16/02 SELZER
06/18/02 BALDIGA
06/18/02 CHEUNG
06/19/02 BALDIGA
06/19/02 FLINK
06/19/02 GOLDBERG
06/20/02 BALDIGA
06/24/02 BAILDIGA
06/24/02 BALDIGA

Inveice Number

Page

- ANALYZE BANKRUPTCY
TREATISES, CONSULTATIONS WITH
FREE LEXIS CUSTOMER SERVICE
AND ANALYZE REMEDIES TREATIES
IN CONNECTION WITH THE
ISSUANCE OF SUBSTANTIVE
CONSOLIDATION.

- ANALYZED CASE LAW RE:
CONFIRMATION ISSUES

- MEMCOCRANDUM TO WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA REGARDING TYPE OF
RELIEF INVOLVED IN
REORGANIZATICN UNDER CHAPTER
11. ;

- REVIEW MATERIALS (.3);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MR.
PANAGAKIS REGARDING SEVERENCE
PLAN, CLAIM AND OTHER ISSUES
{.4)

-~ PREPARE BACKUP FOR NICK
PONTIKES STOCK HOLDINGS MEMO

- MEMO TO TEAM REGARDING PLAN

SECURITIES (.2); TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH MS. FENNING
(LABE'S ATTORNEY) REGARDING
POSSIBLE ALTERNATIVE PLAN FOR
VENTURES (.3)

- REVIEW STATUS E-MAIL
REGARDING RIGHTS STRUCTURING;
- REVIEW MEMO AND TERM SHEET
RE: CORPORATE ISSUES INVOLVED
IN PLAN

- CONFERENCE WITH MR.
WEISFELNER REGARDING ALL OPEN
PLAN ISSOES ~

- REVISE ij?iNANCING"'
PROPOSAL AND MEMO TO MR. RIZZO
REGARDING'SAME

- ANALYZE''PONTIKES FAMILY
STOCK TRANSACTIONS AND
STRATEGTES "FOR SUBORDINATION
OR OTHER RESOLUTION (1.2);
CONFERENCE‘WITH MR. PANAGAKIS
AND MEMO TG COMMITTEE
REGARDING PLAN ISSUES,
INCLUDING 'CLAIMS, PONTIKES
FAMILY, SECURITIES ISSUES,
£TC. AND CONFERENCE WITH MR.
FLINK REGARDING SAME (.7);
ANALYZE RESOLUTIONS OF SIP AND
OTHER SECURITIES CLAIMS (.6)

95

2.6

v

%ok kR kR

720.00

108.00

420.00

343.00

45.00

245.00

154 .50

212.50

98.00

196.00

1,274.00
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Pleading Page 83 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
06/24/02 GOLDBERG
06/25/02 BALDIGA
06/25/02 BALDIGA
06/25/02 FLINK
06/26/02 BALDIGA
06/26/02 FLINK
06/26/02 GOLDBERG
06/27/02 BALDIGA
06/27/02 FLINK
06/27/02 GOLDBERG

w

@ w
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

- REVIEW MEMORANDUM;
CONFERENCES WITH PHILIP J.
FLINK AND WILLIAM R. BALDIGA

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
COMMITTEE MEMBERS AND MEMO TO
MR. WEISFELNER REGARDING PLAN
VOTING ISSUE

- CONFERENCE WITH MR.
WEISFELNER REGARDING PONTIKES
ISSUES (.3); ‘TELEPHONE
CONFERENCES WITH MR.
PANAGAKIS; REVIEW MATERIALS;
CONFERENCE WITH MR. FLINK
REGARDING RIGHTS OFFERING (.2)
- CONSIDER ISSUES REGARDING
RIGHTS STRUCTURE;

- CONFERENCE WITH MR. FLINK
REGARDING WARRANT/RIGHT ISSUES
- PREPARE MEMO REGARDING
RIGHTS STRUCTURING ISSUES;

- CONFERENCE WITH PHILIP J.
FLINK; REVIEW MEMORANDUM;
DRAFT INSERT TO MEMORANDUM

- REVIEW MATERIALS (.4);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS.
LONSTEIN REGARDING PLAN
EXHIBIT ISSUES (.4);
CONFERENCE WITH MR. FLINK TO
PREPARE FOR PLAN SECURITY
NEGOTIATIONS (.6); CONFERENCE
WITH COMPANY AND CREDITORS'
COMMITTEE TEAMS REGARDING SAME
(1.3) )
- FOLLOW UP E: MA
(0.3); PREPARE FOR’CONFERENCE
CALL ON RIGHTS (0 ;

DISTRIBUTION REGARDING TERM
SHEET (0.2); E- , TO EQUITY
COMMITTEE REGAkD el CONFERENCE
CALL (0.7);
- CONFERENCES WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA, PHILIP J. FLINK,
REGINZ C. CHEUNG, GEORGE
PANTIGAKIS, BYRON VANCE, RON
HANSEN, RON MICHLER AND BOB
LACKEY (.4); REVIEW MEMORANDUM
AND TERM SHEET (.7):;

96

L

hkkkkk

212.50

245.00

245.00

927.00

98.00

2,420.50

212.50

1,323.00

2,317.50

1,275.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 84 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
06/27/02 GOODWIN
07/01/02 FLINK
07/02/02 FLINK
07/03/02 FLINK
07/03/02 SCHARF
07/07/02 SCHARF
07/08/02 FLINK
07/08/02 GOLDBERG
07/09/02 BALDIGA

Invoice Number
Page

ADDITIONAL RESEARCH AND REVIEW
LEGAL AUTHORITIES RE: TAX
ISSUES (1.9)

- CONFERENCE WITH KENNETH R.
GOLDBERG RE OTC BULLETIN BOARD
(.3); RESEARCH RE OTC BULLETIN
BOARD (.2)

- E-MAIL TO LOCAL COUNSEL
REGARDING STATUS (.20); E-MAIN
TO CHANIN (.10);

- TELEPHONE FROM STOCKHOLDER
REGARDING PLAN (.10); FOLLOW
UP E-MAIL REGARDING THE SAME
(.10) ; E-MAIL TO SKADDEN
REGARDING TIMING (.10);

- REVIEW CREDITORS COMMITTEE
TERM SHEET (.50); E-MAIL TO
WORKING GROUP REGARDING THE
SAME (.2);

- REVIEW OF PLAN AND
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT TO BE
ABLE TO RESPOND TO SHAREHOLDER
INQUIRIES.

- COMPLETED REVIEW OF PLAN,
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND
EXHIBITS TO SOLICITATION
PACKAGE .

- CONFERENCE WITH CHANIN
REGARDING TERM SHEET (.20);
SECOND CONFERENCE WITH CHANIN
REGARDING TERM SHEET (.30} ;
REVIEW PLAN OF REORGANTIZATION
REGARDING TERM SHEET (.80);
ALL HANDS CONFERENCE CALL
REGARDING TERM SHEET (.70);
CONSIDER CONFERENCE CALL
ISSUES (1.00); CONFERENCE WITH
CHANIN RECGARDING CONFERENCE
CALL (.30); s

- REVIEW TERM SHEET AND MEMO

- WORK DONE 7/8: REVIEW MOST
RECENT DEAL SHEETS DONE BY
CREDITORS COMMITTEE AND MR.
FLINK AND CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING SAME (.9);
CONFERENCE WITH MR. FLINK TO
PREPARE FOR NEGOTIATION;
CONFERENCE WITH CREDITORS'
COMMITTEE AND DEBTOR
REPRESENTATIVES TO NEGOTIATE
PLAN ISSUES AND SEVERAL FOLLOW

97

w O

S|

Kk kkkk

1¢5.00

154 .50

154.50

360.50

1.,254.00

1,485.00

1,6959.50

212.50
1,568.00



w

L L ] ) ™) )
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 85 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number h¥xxkikx
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION Page 98
August 29, 2002

UP TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH
MR. CHANIN, MR. FLINK, EDWARD
S. WEISFELNER, MS. PERLMAN AND
MR. PANAGAKTS REGARDING PLAN
AND RELATED ISSUES (2.3)
07/09/02 BALDIGA - REVIEW BALLOTS AND OTHER 0.8 392.00
MATERIALS IN FINAL
SOLICITATION PACKAGE (.2) ;-
REVIEW PLAN APPENDICES AND
CONFERENCE WITH MR. CHANING
REGARDING NEGOTIATION OF RIGHT
TO BE ISSUED {.6)
07/09/02 FLINK - CONFERENCE WITH CHANIN 2.3 1,184.50
REGARDING TERM SHEET (.20} ;
REVISE EQUITY TERM SHEET
(1.50); TELEPHONE TO R. HANSON
REGARDING THE SAME (.20);
CONSIDER STRATEGY ISSUES
REGARDING TERM SHEET (0.4);
07/09/02 BALDWIN - REVIEW OF TERM SHEET AND 1.2 510.00
DOCUMENTATION TO PREPARE IF
DEAI. NOT CONCLUDED AND
COMMITTEE NEEDS TO CHALLENGE

CONFIRMATION
07/09/02 GOLDBERG - REVIEW TERM SHEET AND MEMO 0.5 212.50
07/10/02 BALDIGA - REVISED TERM SHEET FOR C-5 0.5 245.00
TREATMENT, CW CHANIN RE: SAME
07/10/02 FLINK - FURTHER REVISIONS TO TERM 2.2 1,1332.00

SHEET (1.20); CONFERENCE WITH
CHANIN REGARDING THE SAME
(.20); E-MAIL TO WORKING GROUP
REGARDING TERM SHEET (.30);
E-MAIL TO EQUITY COMMITTEE
REGARDING \
FOLLOW UP ¥
CREDITORS
REGARDf““

NG'TER

07/10/02 BALDWIN 3.2 1,360.00
07/10/02 GOLDBERG - REVIEW "TERM SHEETS AND LEGAL 1.0 425.00
07/11/02 BALDIGA 1.6 7 784.00

4 G

HANSO'“Aﬁﬁ’OTHERs“AS TO RIGHTS
OFFERING (1.4); DRAFT
ADDITIONAL LANGUAGE FOR TERM
SHEET {.2)




L
Pleading Page 86 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
07/11/02 FLINK
07/11/02 BALDWIN
07/12/02 BALDIGA
07/12/02 FLINK
07/12/02 GOLDRBRERG
07/15/02 FLINK
07/15/02 NOSSIFF JR.
07/15/02 BALDWIN
07/15/02 CHEUNG
07/16/02 CHEUNG
07/17/02 FLINK
07/17/02 DONEGAN

Invoice Number
Page

- CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING
CONTINGENT EQUITY TERM SHEET
(2.0); REVISE TERM SHEET
(0.7); COMMENT ON FURTHER -
REVISED TERM SHEET {1.2);
E-MAILS TO WORKING GROUP
REGARDING THE SAME (0.3);
E-MAIL TO EQUITY COMMITTEE
REGARDING THE SAME (0.10);

- FURTHER REVIEW OF TERMSHEETS
AND DOCUMENTATION TO PREPARE
IF DEAL NOT CONCLUDED AND
COMMITTEE NEEDS TO CHALLENGE
CONFIRMATION (3.7); EMAILS RE:
SAME (.3) '

- REVIEW MATERIAL; CONFERENCE
WITH PHILIP J. FLINK RE: FINAL
CHANGES RE: EXCULPATION, ETC.
(.2)

- CHECK WITH CHANIN REGARDING
BLENDED RATE PRESENT VALUE
RATE (0.2); FINALIZE RIGHTS
TERM SHEET (1.4);

- REVIEW TERM SHEETS

- COORDINATE REGARDING NASDAQ
LISTING (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH
LATHAM REGARDING LIST OF
RIGHTS (0.3); CONSIDER FORM OF
RIGHTS INSTRUMENT (0.2} ;

- WORKING ON ISSUES RELATED TO
OTCBB LISTING OF SECURITIES

- BEMATLS TO/FROM COUNSEL TO
PREPARE IF DEAL NOT CONCLUDED
AND COMMITTEE NEEDS TO
CHALLENGE CONFIRMATION = =

- REVIEW TERMS OF RIGHTS TO
EQUITY HOLDERS

- DRAFT SUMMARY OF FIDUCIARY
DUTY CORPORATE TREATISE
RESEARCH (1.5) . ;.
- REVIEW WITH JAYNE DONEGAN
PREPARATION OF RI HTS
INSTRUMENT; ~ -

- CONVERSATION WITH P FLINK '

REGARDING RIGHTS‘ i
AGREEMENT (.2) ; RsvaWED TERM
SHEET (.4) ; DRAFTED RIGHTS
AGENT AGREEMENT (3.7)

99

< O

~l !
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

.3
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2,214.

1,700.

98.

824

212
360

400

297

73

367
566

1,827

50

00

.00

.50
.50

.50

.50

.50

.50

.50

.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

w

Pleading Page 87 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29,

07/17/02

07/18/02

07/18/02

07/19/02

07/22/02
07/22/02
07/22/02

07/22/02

07/22/02

07/23/02
07/23/02

2002

CHEUNG

DONEGAN

CHEUNG

CHEUNG

BALDIGA
FLINK
NOSSIFF JR.

CHEUNG

SCHARF

FLINK
CHEUNG

Invoice Number
Page

- DRAFT MEMO SUMMARTIZING
SOLVENT CO. FIDUCIARY DUTY
RESEARCHE (2.1), REVIEW SOLVENT
CO. FIDUCIARY DUTY CASES
(1.0), REVIEW SOLVENT CO.
FIDUCIARY DUTY TREATISE (1.5),
REVISE MEMO (0.5)

- DRAFTED RIGHTS AGENT
AGREEMENT

- DRAFT MEMO SUMMARIZING
INSOLVENT CO. FIDUCIARY DUTY
RESEARCH (1.5), REVIEW
VICINITY OF INSOLVENCY
FIDUCIARY DUTY TREATISES AND
ARTICLES (1.2}, REVIEW
INSOLVENT CO. CASES FOR
FIDUCIARY DUTY ANALYSIS (1.0),
REVIEW HOSTILE TAKEOVER CASES
(1.5), REVIEW SHAREHOLDER
SUITS (1.5), REVIEW STANDING
OF EQUITY COMMITTEE ISSUE
(0.2), REVIEW AUCTION CASES
FOR HIGHER STANDARD OF
FIDUCIARY DUTY (0.5), REVISE
MEMO {0.5)

- REVISE MEMO (0.2), REVIEW
FIDUCIARY DUTY OF CLEARLY
INSOLVENT CO. TREATISES AND
ARTICLES (1.0)

- TELEPHONE TO PERLMAN RE:
PLAN OBJECTIONS, ETC.

- REVISE RIGHTS AGREEMENT.

- WORK ON ISSUES REGARDING
CUSIP NO. FOR PUBLICLY TRADED
SECURITY =~ :

- DRAFT MEMO ‘SU
SETTLEMENT CASES :BREAK UP FEE

COUNSEL RE: LATE FILED BALLOTS
{(.2).

- REVISE RIGHTS AGREEMENT.

- REVISE MEMO (0.7)

o
~3 -3

1,249.50

1,615.00

1,935.50

284.00

49.00

2,678.00
222.50

1,592.50

66.00

875.50
171.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 88 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
07/24/02 FLINK
07/25/02 BALDIGA
07/25/02 FLINK
07/25/02 WEISFELNER
07/26/02 BALDIGA
07/26/02 FLINK
07/26/02 GOLDBERG
07/28/02 BALDIGA
07/29/02 BALDIGA
07/29/02 FLINK
07/29/02 DONEGAN

@

Invoice Number kkx*x**

Page

~ COVER E-MAIL TO WORKING
GROUP ATTACHING DRAFT RIGHTS
AGREEMENT (.7); REVIEW
RESPONSE FROM L&W (.1); REPLY
TO RESPONSE {.2); CONSIDER
STRUCTURING ISSUES (.3);
TELEPHONE CALL TC L&W RE: THE
SAME (.4).

- REVIEW DRAFT RIGHT (.3);
REVIEW MATERIAL LETTER TO
ZIEGLER REGARDING CLATIMS IN
C-5, DUPLICATION RISK {.2)

- REVIEW RIGHTS AGREEMENT
(.7); FOLLOW-UP ON STATUS OF
HEARINGS (.2); E-MAIL TO
WORKING GROUP RE: RIGHTS
AGREEMENT ISSUES (.9).

- REVIEW INTERNAL E-MAILS
REGARDING RIGHTS OFFERING
DOCUMENTATION AND COMMENT ON
SAME (.6); REVIEW CLAIMS'
OBJECTION RESPONSES (.2)

- REVIEW RIGHTS AGREEMENT AND

OPEN ISSUES AS TO TRADING, ETC.

- E-MAIL TO EQUITY COMMITTEE
RE: RIGHTS AGREEMENT (.4);
E-MAIL TO WORKING GROUP
(CREDITORS AND COMPANY
COUNSEL) RE: RIGHTS AGREEMENT
ISSUES (.6); VOICEMAIL FROM
LATHAM RE: RIGHTS AGREEMENT
(.1); LEAVE

RE: THE SAME (. 1)
- REVIEWfﬁI

RIGHTS, BTC
- REVIEW OF SEVERA
OBJECTIoﬁS ey
FROM PANHGAKAS TG

sl

SIGNIFIbAﬁT ﬁATfERs“FOR CONF.

HEARING ( 5); Al 15 OF
PONTIKAS YqTING ;

TELEPHONE TO LO( N 'TO

PREPARE FOR HEARIﬁG {.4)

- FOLLOW-UP WITH LATHAM RE:

RIGHTS AGREEMENT.

- REVIEWED E-MATILS REGARDING
DRAFTS/ISSUES IN CONNECTION

WITH RIGHTS AGREEMENT

1.7 875.50
0.5 245.00
1.8 927.00
0.8 420.00
0.6 294.00
1.2 618.00
0.5 212.50
0.5 '245.00

1.6 784.00
0.2 103.00
0.5 212.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 0

Pleading Page 89 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002

07/29/02 GOLDRERG
07/29/02 SCHARF
07/30/02 BALDIGA

07/30/02 FLINK

07/31/02 BALDIGA
07/31/02 FLINK
07/31/02 GOLDBERG
07/31/02 SCHARF

w
0:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

- REVIEW RIGHTS AGREEMENT
- OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH
EDWARD S. WEISFELNER RE:
VOTING RESULTS RECEIVED BY
DEBTOR ON THE PLAN (.2);
REVIEW OF VOTE TABULATION
DOCUMENTATION RECEIVED FROM
THE DEBTOR (.5).

- TRAVEL TO CHICAGO FOR PLAN
CONFIRMATION HEARING AND
DURING TRAVEL READ ALL PLAN
OBJECTIONS AND NUMEROUS OTHER
RECENT PLEADINGS, INFO FROM
DEBTOR, ETC. (4.3); CONDUCT
CONFIRMATION HEARING AND
POST-HEARING CONFERENCES WITH
CHANIN; LONSTEIN; DEBTOR'S
COUNSEL, ETC. (2.9); RETURN
TRAVEL TO BOSTON AND DURING
TRAVEL REVIEW ALL DECLARATIONS
AND OTHER MATERIALS
DISTRIBUTED DURING HEARING
(4.8)

- REVIEW REVISED RIGHTS
AGREEMENT .

- REVIEW MATERIAL NEW CHANGES
TO SECURITIES AGREEMENTS

- FOLLOW-UP RE: COMMENTS TO
RIGHTS AGREEMENT.

- REVIEW REVISED RIGHTS
AGREEMENT AND PREPARE FOR
CONFERENCE CALL. REVIEW LEGAL
AUTHORITIES. I

- REVIEW OF MEMO FROM B.
BALDIGA RE: OUTCOME OF
CONFIRMATION HEARING.

TOTAL HOURS

(=2 ]
-~ O

12.0

k& kok ok k

425.00
231.00

5,880.00

B15.00
98.00
360.50

425.00

66.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00: OO 00 Desc
Pleading Page 90 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
ONE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111
617-856.8200

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *%%%x%*
Invoice Date Aug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Number 03215.0005

Re: ASSET ANALYSIS AND RECOVERY -

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABCVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM JUNE 5, 2002
THROUGH AUGUST 28, 2002

TIME SUMMARY :

Professional Hours : : Rate Value
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA G.70 hours at 490.00 = 343.00
MARK S BALDWIN 3.10 hours at 425.00 = 1,317.50
KARA L. BROQKS 18.50 hours at 350.00 = 6,475.00
DAPHNEE SURPRIS 4.00 hours at 275.00 = 1,100.00
26.30
CURRENT FEES : 9,235.50

INCLUBES QONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE
KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BILL WITH YOUR CHECK TO QUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT”
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-3108175
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-

Pleading Page 91 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO,
ASSET ANALYSIS BAND RECOVERY
August 29,

oa/01/02
04/01/02

0s4/02/02

04/03/02

04/04/02
04/04/02

od4/05/02
04/09/02

04/15/02

INC.

2002

BALDWIN

SURPRIS

BROOKS

BROOKS

BALDWIN
BROOKS

BALDWIN
BROOKS

BALDIGA

A e A

® W -
1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

REVIEW QF D&0O ISSUES (.5)

- DISCUSS D&D INSURANCE ISSUE
WITH SMB(.20); E-MAIL MB RE
SAME (.10); CONTINUE TO
DECIPHER D&0O INSURANCE (3.7)
- CONFERENCED WITH ATTY.
BALDWIN RE: POTENTIAL EQUITY
FROM D&0O POLICIES (.4);
RESEARCH RE: EQUITY COMMITTEE
SEEKING ASSETS FROM D&O
POLICIES (3.4)

- REVIEWED AND ANALYZED D&O
POLICIES FROM 1597 FORWARD
{(4.3); CREATED A CHART SETTING
FORTH TERMS OF VARIOUS
POLICIES, INSUREDS, EXCLUSIONS
AND POLICY LIMITS {(2.7)
REVIEW OF D&0C ANALYSIS (1.7)
- ADDITICNAL REVIEW OF D&OC
POLICIES (3.3); CONFERENCED
WITH ATTY. BALDWIN RE: D&O
POLICY REVIEW (.3}

- REVIEW OF D&0 MATRIX {.9)

- CONFERENCED WITH ATTY.
BALDWIN RE: CLAIMS AGAINST D&O
POLICIES (.4); RESEARCH RE:
CLAIMS AGATNST D& POLICIES
(1.8); RESEARCH RE: CLAIMS
MADE POLICIES (1.9)

ANALYSIS OF DIRECT RIGHTS VS.
D&0 (.7) '

TOTAL HOURS

Page

104

L

W Rk ok kR

212
1,100

1,330.

2,450

722,
1,260.

382
1,435

343

.50
.00

00

.00

50
00

.50
.00

.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 92 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
ONE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111
617-856-8200

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *#**#%%%
Invoice Date hug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Number 03215.0006

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM JUNE 5, 2002
THROUGH AUGUST 28, 2002

TIME SUMMARY:

Professional Hours Rate Value

WILLIAM R. BALDIGA 3.30 hours at 490.00 = 1,617.00

SARAH HEASLIP 4.40 hours at 215.00 = 946 .00

EDWARD S. WEISFELNER 3.50 hours at 525.00 = 1,837.50

DAPHNEE SURPRIS 5.20 hours at 275.00 = 1,430.00

LESLIE H. SCHARF 6.60 hours at 330.00 = 2,178.00
23.00

CURRENT FEES 8,008.50

.o |
;.
I
!
B

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE
KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BILL WITH YOUR CHECK TO QUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT"
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-3108175
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 93 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
SHAREHOLDER INQUIRIES
August 29, 2002
04/04/02 SURPRIS
04/16/02 SURPRIS
04/17/02 SURPRIS
04/18/02 SURPRIS
04/22/02 BALDIGA
04/26/02 BALDIGA
04/27/02 BALDIGA
04/30/02 BALDIGA
05/01/02 SURPRIS
05/01/02 SURPRIS
05/01/02 SURPRIS
05/06/02 WEISFELNER
p5/07/02 BALDIGA
05/08/02 WEISFELNER
05/10/02 SURPRIS

Invoice Number

Page

TEL. CONF. BILL BALDIGA RE
SHAREHOLDERS' QUERIES(.10)

- TEL. CONF. WITH SHAREHOLDERS
RE CASE STATUS

- TEL. CONF. SHAREHOLDERS RE
STATUS

- EMAIL TO SHAREHOLDERS RE
STATUS (.30)

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
SHAREHOLDER REGARDING POSSIBLE
PREPETITION FACTS, PLAN
PROSPECTS, ETC. (.3); SECOND
CALL FROM SHAREHOLDER AS TO
VOSICKE ISSUES (.2}

- EMAIL TO AND FRCM
SHAREHOLDER REGARDING
HEALTHCARE SALE

- MEMO TO AND FROM SHAREHOLDER
REGARDING ASSET SALES

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
SHAREHOLDER REGARDING PLAN
ISSUES

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 19,
2002) T/C SHAREHOLDERS RE CASE
STATUS (.20)

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 23,
2002) T/C SHAREHOLDERS RE
STATUS OF CASES (.20)

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 24,
2002) T/C SHAREHOLDERS RE
STATUS

- PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND
MEETING WITH SHARE LDER (BOB
POSTMA} (.9); CORRE ,oND‘To
SHAREHOLDER (S. TENENBAUM)
(.3); PREPARE FOR AND
PARTICIPATE IN C/C WI
ROBBINS (.9) ALL iN CONNECTION
WITH INQUIRI

PLAN PROCESS - :
RESPOND TO SHAREH LDER
INQUIRIES (.4)

- T/C SHAREHOLDERS RE CASE
STATUS

106

v
Desc

* % ok Kk k ok

27

55.

82

82.

245,

49.

49,

98.

55,

55.

82

1,312

98.

210

137

.50

00

.50

50

00

00

00

00

00

00

.50

.50

00

.00

.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 94 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
SHAREHOLDER INQUIRIES
August 29, 2002
05/13/02 SURPRIS
05/14/02 SURPRIS
05/15/02 SURPRIS
05/16/02 SURPRIS
05/23/02 BALDIGA
05/28/02 BALDIGA
06/03/02 BALDIGA
06/04/02 BALDIGA
06/04/02 SURPRIS
06/06/02 HEASLIP
06/14/02 BALDIGA
07/03/02 WEISFELNER
07/08/02 SCHARF
07/08/02 SCHARF
07/09/02 BALDIGA
07/09/02 SCHARF
07/11/02 BALDIGA

Invoice Number

Page

- T/CS SHAREHOLDER RE CASE
STATUS (.40); T/C EDWARD S.
WEISFELNER RE SHAREHOLDERS
INQUIRIES (.20)

- T/C SHAREHOLDERS RE CASE
STATUS

- T/C SHAREHOLDERS RE CASE
STATUS

- T/C SHAREHOLDERS RE CASE
STATUS

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
SHAREHOLDER (DOWNS)

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
SHAREHOLDER (DOWNS) REGARDING
PLAN PROCESS, ETC.

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
SHAREHOLDER RECGARDING PLAN
PROCESS

- LETTER FROM SHAREHOLDER

- RESPOND TO SHAREHOLDER
INQUIRIES

- TELEPHONE FROM JIM STOLL,
RE: RESEARCH ON DERIVATIVE
SUITS (.3); ANALYSIS OF
DERIVATIVE SUITS (2.1); DRAFT
MEMO, RE: SAME (2.0)

- RETURN ALL SHAREHOLDER
CALLS/LETTER INQUIRIES
RECEIVED DURING PLAN
NEGOTIATION PERIOD
-RESPONSES TC SHAREHOLDER
INQUIRIES RE VOTING ISSUES
{.80)

- TELEPHONE CALLS WITH
SHAREHOLDERS RE QUESTIONS
CONCERNING‘V TING AND
UNDER THE PLAN.
“TLSMWITH '

ic

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
SHAREHOLDER (POSTMA) REGARDING
VOTING AND RELATED PLAN ISSUES

STOCKHOLDERS ‘RE:  ANSWERING
QUESTIONS PERTAINING TO
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND
POTENTIAL DISTRIBUTIONS.

- TWO TELEPHONE FROM
SHAREHOLDERS

NE CALLS WITH

107

o O
n P

kkkikk

165.00

137.50
110.00
302.50

49.00

147.00
98.00

49.00
137.50

946 .00

392.00

315.00

264.00

198.00

98.00

'231.00

147.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 95 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number
SHAREHQLDER INQUIRIES Page 108
August 29, 2002

07/15/02 SCHARF - TELEPHONE CALLS WITH 0.

STOCKHOLDERS RE: INADEQUACIES
CONCERNING DISTRIBUTIONS AND
VOTING ON THE DEBTOR'S PLAN OF
REORGANTIZATION.

07/16/02 SCHARF - TELEPHONE CALLS WITH VARIOUS 0.

EQUITY HOLDERS RE: TERMS AND
PROVISIONS OF PLAN AND
DISTRIBUTION TO STOCKHOLDERS
(.4); REVIEW OF CONTINGENT
EQUITY DISTRIBUTION AGREEMENT
RECEIVED FROM DEBTOR'S COUNSEL
AS A SUPPLEMENT TO THE
DEBTOR'S PLAN (.4).

07/17/02 BALDIGA - TELEPHONE FROM SHAREHOLDER 0.

RE: PLAN ISSUES

07/17/02 SCHARF - TELEPHONE CALLS WITH EQUITY 0.

HOLDERS RE: TERMS OF PLAN AND
DISTRIBUTIONS TO STOCKHOLDERS.

07/18/02 SCHARF ~ TELEPHONE CALLS WITH EQUITY 0.

HOLDERS RE: TERMS AND
PROVISIONS OF PLAN.

07/19/02 SCHARF - VARIOUS TELEPHONE CALLS WITH 0.

STOCKHOLDERS RE: TERMS AND
PROVISIONS OF DEBTOR'S PLAN
AND POSSIBLE DISTRIBUTIONS.

07/22/02 BALDIGA - CALL FROM SHAREHOLDERS 0.
07/22/02 SCHARF - VARIOUS TELEPHONE CALLS WITH 0.

STOCKHOLDERS RE: PROVISIONS OF
PLAN AND FILING BALLOTS (.4).

07/23/02 SCHARF - TELEPHONE CALLS WITH VARIOUS 0.

SHAREHOLDERS RE: TERMS AND
PROVISIONS OF ND
ADEQUACIES RE: POSSIBLE
DISTRIBUTIONS TO EQUITY
HOLDERS .

TOTAL HOURS 23.

Desc

&k de kR ok

231.

264.

49.

231.

165.

1908.

49.
132.

264

00

00

00

00

00

00

00
00

.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 96 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
ONE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111
617-856-8200

COMDISCO, INC. . Involice Number *** k&%
Invoice Date Aug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Number 03215.0007

Re: COMMITTEE MEETINGS

FOR PROFESSICNAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM JUNE 5, 2002
THROUGH AUGUST 28, 2002 :

TIME SUMMARY:

Professicnal Hours Rate Value

WILLIAM R. BALDIGA 14.20 hours at 490.00 = 6,958.00

MARK S BALDWIN 5.00 hours at 425.00 = 2,125.00

EDWARD S. WEISFELNER 9.00 hours at 525.00 = 4,725.00

DAPHNEE SURPRIS 4.80 hours at 275.00 = 1,320.00
33.00

CURRENT FEES :'L!' ' 15,128.00

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE
KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BiLL WITH YOUR CHECK TO QUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT”
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-37108175
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

v
Pleading Page 97 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
COMMITTEE MEETINGS
August 29, 2002
o4/12/02 BALDIGA
04/22/02 BALDIGA
05/01/02 BALDIGA
05/01/02 WEISFELNER
05/03/02 BALDWIN
05/06/02 BALDIGA
05/23/02 BALDIGA
0s5/28/02 BALDIGA
05/29/02 BALDIGA
05/29/02 BALDWIN

-

Invoice Number

Page

- PREPARE FOR AND TRAVEL TO
NYC FOR MEETING OF EQUITY
COMMITTEE/TIME CHARGED AT 1/2
TIME BECAUSE WORK OTHER THAN
MEETING PREPARATION DONE
DURING SOME TRAVEL (2);
CONDUCT PORTION OF
COMMITTEE/DEBTOR CONFERENCE
{1.8); RETURN TRAVEL (TIME
CHARGED NET OF TIME SPENT
ANALYZING PLAN AND DISCLOSURE
STATEMENT DELIVERED TODAY
{(2.1);

- DRAFT MEMO TO COMMITTEE
REPORTING AS TO ALL EVENTS OF
LAST WEEK, INCLUDING 4/18
HEARINGS

- COMMITTEE MEETING REGARDING
EUROPE, PLAN STRATEGY,
SETTLEMENT, ETC.

- (TIME ENTRY FOR MAY 1, 2002)
PREPARE FOR AND CONDUCT
LENGTHY EQUITY COMMITTEE
MEETING (1.8); T/C WILLIAM R.
BAILDIGA RE FOLLOW-UP ISSUES
{.4)

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
EQUITY COMMITTEE (.8)

- COMMITTEE MEETING REGARDING
SETTLEMENT, ETC. {.5); SECOND
COMMITTEE CALL REGARDING PLAN
STRATEGY (.3)
CONFERENCE WITH' PEDOWITZ
AND MR. WEISFELNER&REGARDING

(.4) ﬁ
- DREPARE

COMMITTEE '

- CONFERENEEH
WETSFELNER AND
COMMITTEE 'MBET
CONDUCT COMMTT
REGARDING'§/51‘_

LTI

SETTLEMENT
----- el i

MR. BALDWIN, “MR-“WETSFELNER
(.2)

- EQUITY COMMITTEE CONFERENCE
CALL 1.2)

110

5.9

w

* % K ok kok

2,891.00

294.00

735.00

1,155.00
340.00
392.00

1196.00

98.00

833.00

510.00



Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30

w

w @

Pleading Page 98 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
COMMITTEE MEETINGS
August 29, 2002
05/29/02 SURPRIS
06/06/02 BALDIGA
06/06/02 BALDWIN
06/06/02 WEISFELNER
06/06/02 SURPRIS
06/07/02 BAIDIGA
06/07/02 WEISFELNER
06/07/02 SURPRIS
07/29/02 BALDIGA
07/31/02 BALDIGA

W -
/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

- ATTEND COMMITTEE MEETING
(1.1); DRAFT MINUTES RE SAME
(.50)

- PREPARE FOR AND COMMITTEE
MEETING REGARDING
SOLICITATICN, PLAN ACCEPTANCE,
ETC.

- EQUITY COMMITTEE MEETING

- PREPARE FOR AND CONDUCT
LENGTHY CONFERENCE CALL WITH
COMMITTEE TO REVIEW DRAFT OF
SOLICITATION LETTER,
SETTLEMENT PROPOSALS AND
LITIGATION ALTERNATIVES

- ATTEND EQUITY COMMITTEE
CONFERENCE CALL

- PARTICIPATE IN PORTION OF
CONFERENCES AS TO SETTLEMENT

WITH COMMITTEE, PANAGAKIS, ETC.

- PREPARE FOR BND CONDUCT
LENGTHY CONFERENCE CALL TO
CONSIDER PROPOSED SETTLEMENT

- PARTICIPATE IN EQUITY
COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL
{1.7); PREPARE FOR EQUITY
COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL (1.0)
- MEMC TO COMMITTEE REGARDING
UPDATE, &/1 MEETING

- CONFERENCE WITH WEISFELNER,
PREPARE REPORT TO COMMITTEE AS
TG CONFIRMATION HEARING AND
RELATED MATTERS

TOTAL HOURS

111

LYV P
N O

-

*kkhkkk

440.00

343.00

1,275.00
1,890.00

137.50

4471 .00

1,680.00

742 .50

98.00

637.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 99 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
ONE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111
617-856-8200

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *x*x%*k
Invoice Date Aug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Number 03215.0008

Re: LITIGATION/RELIEF FROM STAY

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE AROVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM JUNE 5, 2002
THROUGH AUGUST 28, 2002

TIME SUMMARY :

Professional Hours i Rate Value
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA 15.50 hours at 4920.00 = 7,595.00
JAMES STOLL 0.50° hours at 470.00 = 235.00
MARK S BALDWIN 145.90 hours at 425.00 = 62,007.50
KARA L. BROOKS 4.30 hours at 350.00 = 1,505.00
REGINA C. CHEUNG 7.00 hours at 245.00 = 1,715.00
STEVEN E. GREENBAUM 29.00 hoursg at 525.00 = 15,225.00
EDWARD S. WEISFELNER 2.50 hours at 525.00 = 1,312.50
SCOTT M. BERMAN 1.10 hours at 425.00 = 467.50
DAPHNEE SURPRIS 10.70 hours at 275.00 = 2,942.50
MANDREA R. FISCHER ) 0.60 hours at 330.00 = _ 158.00
217.10
CURRENT FEES 93,203.00

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE
KiNDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BILL WITH YOUR CHECK TQ QUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT"
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-3108175



® @ W

-

o

Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 100 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

Invoice Number

LITIGATION/RELIEF FROM STAY Page
August 29, 2002
04/11/02 BALDWIN - DRAFTING OF CORRESPONDENCE

04/15/02

04/15/02

04/16/02

04/16/02

04/17/02

04/17/02

04/18/02

05/01/02

SURPRIS

FISCHER

BALDWIN

SURPRIS

BALDWIN

SURPRIS

BALDWIN

BALDWIN

TO F. PERLMAN RE TYCO
SETTLEMENT (.8) ; DOCUMENT
REQUEST RE: TYCO SETTLEMENT
{2.5)

- TEL. CONFS MARK S. BALDWIN
RE VARIOUS DEBTORS
PRESENTATION TO COMMITTEE
{.40) ; PREPARE PACKAGE TO
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA RE SAME
{(1.0); TEL. CONF. WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA RE MOTION TO CONTINUE
CIT MOTION (.20}); DRAFT MOTION
TO CONTINUE CIT MOTION {(2.3);
PREPARE PACKAGE FOR SCOTT M.
BERMAN (.20)

- REVIEW AND REVISE MOTICN TO
CONTINUE (.6).

DPREPARATION FOR CIT SETTLEMENT
HEARING (.8); PREPARATION FOR
LACKEY DEPOSITION (1.7)

- PREPARE FILING OF MOTICN TO
CONTINUE CIT MOTION({.60); TEL.
CONFS. WITH BALDWIN RE SAME
{.30); TEL. CONFS. WITH
YETNIKOFF RE SBME(.20)

WORKING TRAVEL TO CHICAGO
{3.5); PREPARATION FOR LACKEY
DEPOSITION (1.7); DEPOSITION
OF R. LACKEY (2.8); MULTIPLE
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
COMDISCO COUNSEL RE:
CONTINUANCE AND CORRESPONDENCE
RE: SAME (1.7) '
- TEL. CONF. SKADDEN RE cIT

MOTTON ADJOUREﬁﬁyg_( 20)

- PREPARATION FOR'“ELE 'HEARING
(1.7); OMNTRUS HEARING (2.3);
SUPPLEMENTAL OBbEdTION TO CIT
(3.5); FURTHER DRhFTING op
COMPLAINT (1.7}

LiziiHs

- RECEIPT ANDegﬁyiEW OF TYCO
BRIEF (1.5); THLEBHONE
CONFERENCE WITH & BERMAN RE:
SAME {.5); TEIEBHONE
CONFERENCE WITH COMMITTEE
(.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE

WITH CHANNIN RE SAME(.8)

113

%k ok ok ok

1,487.50

1,127.50

198.00

1,062.50

302.50

4,122.50

55.00

3,910.00

1,530.00
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Pleading Page 101 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO,
LITIGATION/RELIEF FROM STAY
August 29,

gs/01/02

05/01/02

05/01/02

05/01/02

05/01/02

05/01/02

05/01/02

05/01/02

05/02/02

05/02/02

0s/02/02

05/02/02

INC.

2002

WEISFELNER

WEISFELNER

WEISFELNER

WEISFELNER

BERMAN

SURPRIS

SURPRIS

SURPRIS

BALDIGA

BALDWIN

CHEUNG

BERMAN

-

o w
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00

Invoice Number

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 17,
2002) COMMUNICATE WITH M.
BALDWIN RE DEPO ON CIT
SETTLEMENT AND STATUS (.5)

- (TIME. ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 18,
2002) COMMUNICATE WITH MARK S.
BALDWIN AND WILLIAM R. BALDIGA
RE STATUS AND OUTCOME OF
HEARINGS AND CIT DEPO (.90)

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 25,
2002) REVIEW DECISION ON HP
FEES AND RELATED O/C DAPHNEE
SURPRIS RE SAME (.40) REVIEW
MEMO RE DEPOSITION RE CIT
SETTLEMENT (.20)

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 26,
2002) 0/C DAPENEE SURPRIS RE
HP FEE DECISION

- TCS KASNER RE: BREAK UP FEE
ORDER

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 22,
2002) LEXIS SEARCH RE
OBJECTICON TO CIT DEPOSIT

- (TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 25,
2002) TELEPHONE TO C. LONSTEIN
RE BREAK-UP FEE ORDER [.2);
OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH SCOTT
M. BERMAN RE BREAKUP FEE ORDER
{.2)

- {TIME ENTRY IS FOR APRIL 24,
2002) REVIEW LACKEY'S
TRANSCRIPT RE CIT ISSUE(1.2);
REVIEW ORDER RE 'HP BREAK- UP
FEE(.60) :

(3.0); CORRESP ND
STEINLE RE SAM_

TRANSCRIPT (0
PLEADINGS RELA$£§ O
TO APPROVE SETTLE
(2.5)
- REVIEW DRAFT
BREAK-UP FEE MOTTON; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCES WITH BALDIGA,

LONSTEIN, KASNER REGARDING SAME

Page

114

o
Desc

*hkkxx

262.50

472.50

315.00

262.50

85.00

825.00

110.00

495.00
98.00
1,487.50

759.50

182.50



Pleading Page 102 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO,
LITIGATICON/RELIEF FROM STAY
August 29,

05/03/02

05/06/02

05/06/02

05/06/02

05/07/02

0s/08/02

05/08/02

05/09/02

05/10/02

05/29/02

05/29/02
05/31/02

05/31/02

06/03/02

INC.

2002

CHEUNG

BALDIGA

BALDWIN

BROOKS

BALDWIN

BALDIGA

BALDWIN

BALDWIN

STOLL

BALDWIN

SURFRIS
BALDWIN

GREENBAUM

BALDIGA

» ® @ ™) -
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00

Invoice Number

- DRAFT FACTS IN RESPONSE TO
CIT SETTLEMENT (2.4}, REVIEW
DEPCSITION OF LACKEY
TRANSCRIPT (1.5)

- REVISE CIT SETTLEMENT
OBJECTION

-~ TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M.
PERCELL (.5); REVISIONS TC
REPLY BRIEF (2.2); PREPARATION
FOR EVIDENTIARY HEARING (1.4);
CONFERENCE CALL WITH COMMITTEE
(.5)

- REVIEW OF CCMPLATNT PER
ATTY. BALDWIN {(.7); RESEARCH
RE: PLEADING REQUIREMENTS OF
CAUSES OF ACTION (3.6)

- PREPARATION FOR CIT HEARING
(2.2); TRAVEL TO CHICAGO
(4.5); FINALIZE AND FILE BRIEF
(1.6)

- PREPARE FOR AND CONDUCT
HEARING ON FEES, CLAIMS STATUS
AND ASSISTED IN TRTIAL OF CIT
DEPOSIT LITIGATION (4.5);

- PREPARATION FOR HEARING
{1.5); EVIDENTIARY HEARING
{2.5); TRAVEL TO HARTFORD (4.5)
- PREPARATION FOR TYCO HEARING
{2.6); TRAVEL TO CHICAGO (5.5)
- CONFERENCE WITH BALDIGA AND
BALDWIN REGARDING RETENTION
BONUS LITIGATION ISSUES
CORRESPONDENCE TO M. PERCELL
(.5}

- T/C M. BALDWIN RE LIT ISSUES

- CONFERENCE CALL'WITH STOLL
AND DOLANT; PREPARATION FOR
FAZIO DEPOSITION REVIEW OF
EMPLOYMENT ﬁb%”fm"

- REVIEW DOC TS RE
LITIGATION ANALYSIS (5.4);
COMMUNICATIONS W/MATTHEW
BROWN, ASSOCIATES RE SAME (.7)
- REVIEW MATERTALS; CONFERENCE
WITH MR. BALDWIN REGARDING
FAZIO LITIGATION AND

DEPOSITION ISSUES

Page

115

BELRLE e

o

L
Desc

* kK kkk

955

o8

1,955

1,505.

3,527.

2,205.

3,612

3,017.

235.

212

27.
.00

2,040

13,202

147.

.50

.00

.00

00

50

00

.50

50

co

.50

50

.50

6o

€
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 103 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK {SRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
LITIGATION/RELIEF FROM STAY
August 29, 2002
06/03/02 BALDWIN
06/03/02 GREENBAUM
06/04/02 BALDWIN
06/04/02 GREENBAUM
06/05/02 BALDWIN
06/05/02 GREENBAUM
06/06/02 BALDWIN
06/06/02 GREENBAUM
06/07/02 BALDIGA
06/07/02 BALDWIN

Invoice Number

- WORK PERFORMED ON 5/21/02:
CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLASS
COUNSEL (.5); EMAILS TO/FROM
SKADDEN (.5); REVIEW OF CLASS
DOCKET AND RELATED PLEADINGS
(2.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH W.
DOLAN AND W. STOLL (1.2);
REVISIONS TO COMPLAINT (2.7)
- CONTINUE REVIEW, OUTLINE OF
DISCLOSURE DOCUMENTS,
PLERDINGS (3.1); T/CS M.
BALDWIN RE FACT, LEGAL ISSUES
AND THEORIES (1.1);
COMMUNICATIONS W/ASSOCIATES RE
SAME {.6)
- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M.
PERKEL (.5); CONFERENCE CALL
WITH M. KIPP (1.2); RECEIPT
AND REVIEW OF OBJECTIONS (.7);
DRAFTING OF MOTION TO COMPEL
(4.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH
SHAREHOLDERS (1.2)
- 0/C EDWARD S$. WEISFELNER RE
COMPLAINT (.7); COMMUNICATIONS
W/SEVERAL ASSOCIATES RE
RESEARCH PROJECTS (.6); REVIEW
ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS (1.8);
EDIT COMPLAINT (1.1)
- DRAFTING OF NOTICE TO COMPEL
- WORK ON COMPLAINT (5.1);
COMMUNICATIONS W/TEAM RE
RESEARCH ISSUES (.6)
- RE-NOTICE DEPOSITIONS AND
SUBPOENAS (2.8) ; CONFERENCES
WITH SKADDEN (.8); DRAFTING
MOTION TO COMPEL (2.5);
RESEARCH RE: SAME (1.1)
- ATTEND COMMITTEE MEETING
(.8); 0O/CS EDWARD"S. %' -
WEISFELNER RE SAME (.3); EDIT
COMPLAINT AND MOTION (5.7);
"Eﬁ?o

NEW

o4

COMMUNICATIONS RE
WTEAM" (.4); REVI
RESEARCH MEMOS (.6)
- OUTLINE/DRAFT OBJECTION TO
EMPLOYEE BONUS MOTION

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M.
KIPP (1.4); TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH G. PANAGAKIS
(.6); EQUITY COMMITTEE CALL
(2.2); DRAFTING OF MOTION TO

Page

1le

Tk hkh kK

3,230.00

2,520.00

3,527.50

2,205.00

510.00
2,992.50

3,060.00

4,095.00

539.00

4,080.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 288

L @ w )
4-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 104 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO,
LITIGATION/RELIEF FROM STAY
August 29,

06/08/02

06/08/02

os/10/02

06/10/02

06/10/02

06/11/02

0e/11/02

06/12/02

INC.

2002

BALDWIN

BALDWIN

BALDIGA

BALDWIN

GREENBAUM

BALDIGA

BALDWIN

BALDWIN

Invoice NMumber

COMPEL (4.2); DRAFTING OF
AFFIDAVIT (1.2) _

- RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF MEMO
ON "GOOD FAITH" REQUIREMENT
AND REVIEW OF ATTACHED CASES
(2.6)

- CONFERENCE CALL WITH W.
BALDIGA RE: COURT HEARING ON
6.10.02

- REVIEW ANALYSIS TO DATE OF
GOOD FAITH RESEARCH (.3);
PREPARE FOR TODAY'S HEARING,
INCLUDING CONFERENCES BY PHONE
AND/CR PERSON WITH MS.
PERLMAN, MR. PANAGAKIS, MR.
BALDWIN, MS. LONSTEIN AND MR.
LEAVITT AS TO SETTLEMENT, SIP
AND RELATED ISSUES AND CONDUCT
HEARING AND DICTATE REPORT OF
HEARING TO COMMITTEE (2.2);
RETURN TRAVEL TO O'HARE/BOSTON
(5.8) _

- RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF MOTION
FOR PROTECTIVE ORDER (1.1);
MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES
WITH M.. KIPP (.8); DRAFTING
OF OBJECTION (3.8); ATTENTION
TO SERVICE OF SUBPOENAS (.8)

- O/C EDWARD S. WEISFELNER RE
SETTLEMENT

- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
MR. PANAGAKIS (.2); LETTER TO
MR. PANAGAKIS (.2); MEMO TO
COMMITTEE AND OTHERS REGARDING
EMPLOYEE BONUS MOTION AND
GROUNDS FOR OBJECTION (.5)

- CONFERENCE CALL WITH
PROFESSIONALS (2.1);
CONFERENCE CALL WITH G.
PANAGANUS (.7); OBJECTION TO
MOTION FOR PROTECTIVE ORDER
(3.7); RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF
REVISED PLAN (.7) E
- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G.
PANAGAUS (.5); CONFERENCE CALL
WITH PROFESSIONALS (1.2); '
CONFERENCE CALL WITH SKADDEN
(1.5); REVIEW OF SOLICITATION
MATERIALS (2.1);
CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM
GOLDMAN'S COUNSEL (.8);

T g

Page

117

kkhkkkkk

1,105.00

340.00

4,067.00

2,762.50

210.00

441 .00

3,060.00

3,655.00
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Pleading Page 105 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK !SRAELS LLF

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number
LITIGATION/RELIEF FROM STAY Page 118
August 29, 2002

OBJECTION TO MOTION (2.5)

06/13/02 BALDWIN - REVIEW OF TERM SHEET (1L.7); 6.

REVIEW OF SOLICITATICN
MATERIALS (.8); RECEIPT AND
REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FRCM
MCKINSEY'S COUNSEL (.8);
ORJECTION TC MOTION (3.8)

06/14/02 BALDWIN " - CORRESPONDENCE TO 5.

PROFESSIONAL COUNSEL (.8);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
SKADDEN (7.); REVIEW OF
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (2.6);
CONFERENCE CALL WITH BALDIGA
RE: SAME (.5); ATTENTION TO
SHAREHOLDER SUITS (1.2)

06/17/02 BATDWIN - RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF EMAIL 2.

FRCM C. LONSTEIN RE: HEARING
AGENDA (.3); ATTENTION TO SAME
(.8); FURTHER REVIEW OF
DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.7)

06/25/02 BALDWIN - TELEPEONE CONFERENCE WITH B. 2.

BALDIGA RE: SUBORDINATION
LITIGATION (.5); REVIEW OF
PLAN RE: SAME (1.7)

06/27/02 BALDWIN - RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF TERM 2.

SHEET

TOTAL HOURS 217.

Desc

khkkkkk

2,932

2,465,

1,180

935

1,190

.50

00

.00

.00

.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 106 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
QNE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111
617-856-8200

COMDISCO, INC. Involice Number ***%%*
Invoice Date Aug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Number 03215.0009

Re: CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM JUNE 5, 2002
THRQUGH AUGUST 28, 2002

TIME SUMMARY:

Professional Houzrs Rate Value

WILLIAM R. BALDIGA 2.20 hours at 490.00 = 1,078.00

PHILIP J FLINK 2.00 hours at. 515.00 = 1,030.00

SARINA LO CASCIO 1.50 hours at 140.00 = 210.00
5.70

CURRENT FEES 2,318.00

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE
KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BILL WITH YOUR CHECK TO QUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT"
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION £ 04-3108175
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002
04/02/02 L.O CASCIO
04/03/02 BALDIGA
05/02/02 BALDIGA
05/17/02 FLINK
05/29/02 BALDIGA
06/14/02 BALDIGA
07/18/02 BALDIGA
07/28/02 BALDIGA

o L) ) ) v
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number

Page

- RESEARCH TO LOCATE PRECEDENT
BRIEFS REGARDING SUBORDINATION
OF CLAIMS AND E-MAIL SAME TO
S. BERMAN AND M. BALDWIN

- REVIEW MATERIALS; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH MR. MURPHY

~ REVIEW MATERIALS; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCES WITH MS. PERLMAN
REGARDING COMPENSATION PLAN
TRUST MOTION/CLAIMS

- REVIEW CASE STATUS AND
STRATEGY ISSUES;

- REVIEW NEW INFORMATION ON
SIP CLAIMS

- MEMO TC MS. PERLMAN AND MR.
PANAGAKIS REGARDING RESOLUTION
PROCESS FOR CLAIMS

- REVIEW MATERIAL FROM DEBTOR
AS TO CLAIMS RESOLUTION,
REPORTS, ORDERS, ETC.

- REVIEW PACKAGE FROM COMPANY
AS TO SIP CLAIM AND PONTIKAS
FAMILY CLAIMS, OBJECTIONS,
ETC. AND LETTER FROM ZIEGLER
REGARDING SAME

TOTAL HOURS

120
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210.00

45.00

98.00

1,030.00

49,00

49.00

539.00

294.00



» - w @ -l -
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Pleading Page 108 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

CNE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111 -

817-866-8200

@

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *#®#x%*
invoice Date
Client Number

Re: COMDISCC, INC.

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM JAMNUARY—3——3-900 f%q
THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002 :

MATTER NO.

803215.0000
803215.0004
803215.06007
803215.0009

MATTER NAME HOURS
CASE ADMINISTRATION 7.10
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION 8.80
COMMITTEE MEETINGS 1.30
CLAIMS ADMINLSTRATION 0.30

TOTAL 17.50

TOTAL FEES
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

TOTAL FEES AND EXPENSES QF THIS INVOICE

AN EE
PR L

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE

FEES
1,119.00
4,122.50

637.00
147.00

6,025.50

KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BILL WITH YOUR CHECK TO OUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT”

PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-37108175

Aug 29, 2002
803215

qust I, 2002

DISBUR-

SEMENTS
50.79
0.00
0.00
0.00
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Pleading Page 109 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number ****%%%
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 2
August 29, 2002

Professional Hours Rate Value
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA 4.30 hours at 490.00 = 2,107.00
PHILIP J FLINK 2.20 hours at 515.00 1,133.00
JOHN G. NOSSIFF JR. 3.70 hours at 445.00 = 1,646.50
JAYNE M DONEGAN 1.20 hours at 425.00 = 510.00
SARINA LO CASCIO 1.10 hours at 140.00 154.00
CHRISTOPHER M. LAUKAMG 5.00 hours at $95.00 = 475.00
17.50

CURRENT FEES 6,025.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 110 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
ONE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111
617-856-8200

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number #***#%%
Inveice Date Aug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Number 03215.0000

Re: CASE ADMINISTRATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTICONED MATTER FROM JANUARY 1, 1500
THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

TIME SUMMARY:

Professional Hours Rate Value
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA 1.00 hours at 490.00 = 490.00
SARINA LC CASCIO 1.10 hours at 140.00 = 154.00
CHRISTOPHER M. LAUKAMG 5.00 hours at $95.00 = 475.00
7.10
CURRENT FEES o 1,119.00

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE
KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BILL WITH YOUR CHECK TQ QUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT”
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-3708175
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 111 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002
08/01/02 BALDIGA
08/01/02 LO CASCIC
08/01/02 LAUKBMG
08/06/02 BALDIGA
08/06/02 LAUKAMG
08/07/02 LO CASCIO
08/07/02 LAUKAMG
08/12/02 LAUKAMG

Invoice Number

Page

- TELEPHONE FROM CHANIN RE:
FEE ESTIMATE (.1); REVISE FEE
ESTIMATE PLEADING (.1)

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
(.3); PREPARE AND CIRCULATE
CALENDAR (.4)

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(.3); INDEX PLEADINGS (.5);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.2)

- REVIEW MATERIAL, MEMO TO FEE
REVISION COMMITTEE RE: BRBI
SECOND FEE APPLICATION ISSUES
(.3); REVIEW FEE APPLICATIONS
OF OTHER PROFESSIONALS ({.5)

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
(.3); INDEX PLEADINGS(.5)

- RETRIEVE UPDATED DOCKET
ON-LINE AND CIRCULATE SAME
{.3); REVIEW SAME FOR CALENDAR
DATES (.1)

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
{.8); INDEX PLEADINGS (1.0);
UPDATE MASTER FILES (.7)

- REVIEW AND ORGANIZE FILES
{.3); INDEX PLEADINGS (.4)

TOTAL HOURS

4

@
Desc

hkkkdk

8.

98

95.

392.

76 .

56.

237

66.

.00

00

00

00

00

.50

50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 112 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
ONE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111
§17-866-8200

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number ***%+%
Invoice Date Aug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Number 03215.0004

Re: PLAN OF RECRGANIZATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM JANUARY 1, 1900
THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002 :

TIME SUMMARY :

Professional Hourxs Rate Value
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA 1.70 hours at 4950.00 = 833.00
PHILIP J FLINK 2.20 hours at 515.00 = 1,133.00
JOHN G. NOSSIFF JR. 3.70 hours at 445.00 = 1,646.50
JAYNE M DONEGAN 1.20 hours at 425.00 = 510.00
8.80
CURRENT FEES 4,122.50

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE
KINDLY RETURN A COPY QF THIS BILL WATH YOUR CHECK TO OUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT"
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-3108175
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 113 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
PLAN OF REORGANIZATION
August 29, 2002
0s8/01/02 FLINK
08/05/02 NOSSIFF JR.
08/06/02 BRALDIGA
0g/06/02 FLINK
08/06/02 NOSSIFF JR.
08/07/02 BALDIGA
og/08/02 NOSSIFF JR.
08/09/02 FLINK
08/12/02 DONEGEN

Invoice Number

Page

- COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT OF
RIGHTS AGREEMENT (.3); EQUITY
COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL
(rL.2).

- WORK ON ISSUES REGARDING
LISTING OF SECURITIES ON
NATIONAL EXCHANGE AND
AUTOMATED QUOTATION SYSTEM

- REVIEW MATERIAL, TELEPHONE
FROM ZIEGLER RE: SHAREHOLDER
INFO, ETC. (.2); REVIEW
MATERIAL, DRAFT LETTER TO
PANAGAKIS AND LACKEY RE:
PONTIKES SHARES (.9)

- REVIEW REVISED RIGHTS
AGREEMENT;

- WORKING ON OTC LISTING FOR
RIGHTS/COMMON STOCK

- REVISE REQUEST RE: PONTIKES
STOCK SALES; TELEPHONE TO
LEVITT RE: SAME; MEMO TO
COMMITTEE

- WORK ON OTC LISTING ISSUES
- REVIEW RIGHTS AGREEMENT;

- REVIEWED FORM 8-A TO
REGISTER RIGHTS, CONFERENCE
WITH M. SCHEFFER REGARDING
LISTING; REVIEWED RIGHTS
AGREEMENT; CONFERENCE WITH M.
BASSEWITZ REGARDING SAME.

TOTAL HOURS

7

<
[1=9

®
Desc

"Rk ok ek

772

445

539.

154.

667.

294

534
208
510

.50

.00

00

50

50

.00

.00
.00
.00
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Pleading Page 114 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK [SRAELS LLP
ONE FINANCIAL CENTER, BOSTON, MA 02111
617-856-8200

COMDISCO, IWC. Invoice Number #****%x*
Invoice Date Aug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Number 03215.0007

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTIONED MATTER FROM JANUARY 1, 1200
THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

TIME SUMMARY:

Professional Hours Rate Value
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA 1.30 hours at 490.00 = 637.00
1.30
CURRENT FEES 637.00

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TO DATE
KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BILL WITH YQUR CHECK TO OUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT”
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-3108775
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Pleading Page 115 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

Invoice Number ,¥*%+%

COMDISCO, INC.
Page S

COMMITTEE MEETINGS
August 29, 2002

08/01/02 BALDIGA - PREPARE FOR AND CONDUCT 1.3 637.00

COMMITTEE MEETING (1.3)

TOTAL HOURS 1.3
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Pleading Page 116 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
ONE FINANCIAL CENTER, 80STON, MA 02111
617-856-8200

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number ***%%%
Invoice Date Aug 29, 2002
Client Number 803215
Matter Nuwmbexr 03215.0009

Re: CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH
THE ABOVE CAPTIONED MATTER FRCM JANUARY 1, 1900
THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

TIME SUMMARY :

Professional Hours Rate Value
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA 0.30 hours at 490.00 = 147.00
0.30
CURRENT FEES 147.00

INCLUDES ONLY DISBURSEMENTS POSTED TQ DATE
KINDLY RETURN A COPY OF THIS BILL WITH YOUR CHECK TO OUR "BILLING DEPARTMENT"
PAYABLE WITHIN 30 DAYS

TAX IDENTIFICATION # 04-3108175
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Pleading Page 117 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Involice Number rxxxkk

CLATMS ADMINISTRATION Page 11
August 29, 2002

08/07/02 BALDIGA - REVIEW MATERIAL ESTIMATION 0.3 147.00
MOTION AND SCHEDULE

TOTAL HOURS 0.3
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Pleading Page 118 of 153 '

ExHIBIT B

Edward S. islne ner | 1‘ 5 i 1441 $75,652.50
Steven E. Greenbaum | Partner 1983 $525 323 $16,957.50
Phillip J. Flink Partner 1981 - $515 74.5 $38,367.50
William R. Baldiga Partner 1983 $490 278.4 $136,416.00
David H. Murphree Partner 1974 $490 1.5 $735.00
Steven R. London Partner 1980 $490 19.1 $9,359.00
James Stoll Partner 1985 $470 393 $18,471.00
William M. Dolan, 11l Partner 1985 $445 35.4 $15,753.00
John G. Nossiff, Jr. Partner 1989 $445 6.4 $2,848.00
Jayne M. Donegan Partner 1989 $425 9.8 $4,165.00
Mark Baldwin Partner 1984 $425 313.9 $133,407.50
Kenneth R. Goldberg Partner 1990 $425 31.0 $13,175.00
Steven Pohl Partner 1989 $425 2 $85.00
Scott M. Berman Partner 1083 $425 8.4 $3,570.00
Kenneth S. Goodwin Partner 1975 $390 2.0 $780.00
John P. Biederman Counsel 1989 $365 1.3 $474.50
Elise Busny - Partner 1994 $350 1.5 $525.00
Kara L. Brooks Associate 1994 $350 72.6 $25,410.00
Leslie H. Scharf Associate 1994 $330 20.1 $6,633.00
Andrea R. Fischer Associate 1991 $330 6 $198.00
Angel Taveras Associate 1996 $295 18.0 $5,310.00
Sandra K. Davis Associate 1998 $275 3 82.50

#8077509 1

EXHIRTR
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Pleading Page 119 of 153

w
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$88,357.50

Daphnée Surpris Associate $275 321.3

Daniel C. Gusenoff Associate 1999 $275 22.9 $6,297.50

Regina N. Cheung Associate 1999 $245 141.4 $34,643.00

Danika M. Haueisen Associate 2001 $215 1.5 $322.50

Sarah Heaslip Associate 2001 $215 4.4 $946.00

Catherine W. Ng Associate 2002 $190 216 $4,104.00

Daphne E. Schmitt Legal N/A $175 1.40 $245.00
Assistant

Sarina LoCascio Legal N/A $140 27.9 $3,906.00
Assistant

Carlene M. Mercier Legal N/A $135 1.2 $162.00
Assistant

Andrea Paparella Summer N/A $120 9.5 $1,140.00
Associate

Molly Selzer Summer N/A $120 17.3 $2,076.00
Associate

Christopher Laukamg Legal N/A $95 78.8 $7,486.00
Assistant

Grand Total 1,759.9 $658,060.50

Blended Hourly Rate $373.92

for Professionals

* Reflects Rate Change

#8077509 v1
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00:00:00 Desc

EXHIBIT C
R
BILLINS ASI‘;JEMMARY POSITION AD\I:JIIEI{?'II?ED HOD lNLc\; TOTAL TOTAL
BILLED | COMPENSATION
TO RATE e
PRACTICE
EDWARD S. WEISFELNER | PARTNER 1983 $490/525% 309.4/ $151,608.00/
258.6 $135,765.00
STEVEN E. GREENBAUM PARTNER 1983 $475/$525 16.2/32.3 $7,695.00/
$16,957.50
PHILLIP J. FLINK PARTNER 1981 $515 745 $38,367.50
WILLIAM R. BALDIGA PARTNER 1963 $490 387.6 $189,024.00
DAVID H. MURPHREE PARTNER 1974 $490 15 $735.00
STEVEN R. LONDON PARTNER 1980 $490 19.1 $9,359.00
JAMES STOLL PARTNER 1685 $470 39.3 $18,471.00
WILLIAM M. DOLAN, 11 PARTNER 1985 5445 35.4 $15,753.00
MARK BALDWIN PARTNER 1984 $425 4415 $167,637.50
JOHN G. NOSSIFF, JR. PARTNER 1989 $445 6.4 $2,848.00
JAYNE M. DONEGAN PARTNER 1989 $425 98 $4,165.00
SCOTT M. BERMAN PARTNER 1983 $375/ 344/154.9 $129,000.00/
425" $65,832.50
KENNETH R GOLDBERG PARTNER 1990 $425 31.0 $13,175.00
STEVEN POHL PARTNER 1989 $425 2 $85.00
EMILIO GALVAN PARTNER 1593 $390 38.5 $15,015.00
ERICA M. RYLAND PARTNER 1902 $375 88.3 $33,112.50
KENNETH S. GOODWIN PARTNER 1975 $350/ 145.8/115.1 $51,030.00/
390" $44,889.00
ELISE BUSNY PARTNER 1994 $350 15 "$525.00
KARA L. BROOKS ASSOCIATE 1964 $350 726 $25,410.00
JOHN P. BIEDERMANN COUNSEL 1989 $320/ 313.1/38.7 $160,192.00/
365° $14,125.50
ANDREA R. FISCHER ASSOCIATE 1991 $3007 56.6/10.6 $17,040.00/
330" $3,498.00
LESLIE H. SCHARF ASSOCIATE 1904 $300/330 26.2/20.1 $7,860.00/
$6,633.00

#8077532v1 -

EXHIBITC
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ANNE M. CUNNINGHAM ASSOCIATE 1981 $260/285* 252.011.0 $65,520.00/

$285.00

ANGEL TAVERAS ASSQCIATE 1996 $295 18.0 $5,310.00

RACHEL F. MAYERSON ASSOCIATE 1996 $285 11.5 $3,277.50

DANA MONTONE ASSOCIATE 1997 $280 76.4 $21,392.00

SANDRA K. DAVIS ASSOCIATE 1998 $275 3 $82.50

DAPHNEE SURPRIS ASSOCIATE 1998 $245/275* 345.2/512 .4 $84,574.00/

$140,910.00

LINDA B. GOEBEL ASSOCIATE 1998 $230 26.8 $6,164.00

DANIEL C. GUSENOFF ASSOCIATE 1999 $275 457 $12,567.50

REGINA N. CHEUNG ASSOCIATE 1999 $245 213.8 $52,381.00

DANIKA M. HAUEISEN ASSOCIATE 2001 $215 1.5 $322.50

SARAH HEASLIP ASSOCIATE 2001 $215 4.4 $946.00

CATHERINE W. NG ASSOCIATE 2002 $190 145.2 $27,588.00

DAPHNE E. SCHMITT LEGAL N/A $175 1.4 $245.00

ASSISTANT :

SARINA LOCASCIO LEGAL N/A $120/140* 97.6/63.8 $11,712.00/

ASSISTANT $8,932.00

CARLENE M.MERCIER LEGAL $135 1.2 $162.00
ASSISTANT

ANDREA PAPARELLA SUMMER $120 9.5 $1,140.00
ASSQCIATE

MOLLY SELZER SUMMER $120 17.3 $2,076.00
ASSOCIATE

GINA B. MICHALSKI LEGAL $110 18.9 $2,079.00

ASSISTANT

#8077532Vv1 -




. @ ] ) w -
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 122 of 153

Desc

CHRISTOPHER LAUKAMG LEGAL N/A $85/95* 91.4/151.3 $7,769.00/

ASSISTANT $14,373.50
GRAND TOTAL 5,195.6 $1,776,514.50
BLENDED HOURLY RATE $341.93

FOR PROFESSIONALS

* Reflects Rate Change

#8077532v1 -
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EXPENSE SUMMARY FOR THIRD PERIOD
EXPENSE CATEGORY AMOUNT
TELEPHONE $5,941.99
TRAVEL 18,240.44
MEALS 1,302.82
COPIES 412.70
COURT REPORTING 538.00
MESSENGER SERVICES 476.63
FEDERAL EXPRESS 1,211.22
RESEARCH 22,432.01
AIRFARE 6,489.00
TAXI 675.08
HOTEL 2,221.32
TELEPHONE IN-HOUSE 566.18
PHOTOCOPY IN-HOUSE 6,337.80
FACSIMILE 3,029.25
POSTAGE IN-HOUSE 4.00
SECRETARY OVERTIME 940.00
PARALEGAL OVERTIME 30.00
DOCUMENT BINDING 42.18
CORPORATE SERVICES 143.00
STORAGE FEES 24.00
MISCELLANEQOUS HARD COSTS 25.00
SERVICE OF PROCESS 177.50
TOTAL $71,260.12

#BOTT516 v1 0 LOCASCS 0 B03215/0000

EXHIBIT D
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number kkxxki¥
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 24
August 25, 2002

FOR COSTS ADVANCED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:

02/11/02 TELEPHONE - VENDOR:NY CASH 20.22

02/22/02 TELEPHONE - VENDOR:NY CASH 18.00

02/22/02 TELEPHONE - VENDOR:NY CASH 8.00

02/22/02 TELEPHONE - VENDOR:NY CASH 44 .00

03/05/02 TELEPHONE - 23.18
VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, INC

03/05/02 TELEPHONE - ' 305.14
VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, INC

03/05/02 TELEPHONE - 578.35
VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, INC

03/07/02 TELEPHCONE - VENDOR:NY CASH 15.00

03/07/02 TELEPHONE - VENDOR:NY CASH 32.00

03/07/02 Reversal from Veoid Check -32.00

Number: 1472 Bank ID: NYOl
Voucher ID: 1092224 Vendor:
NY CASH
03/07/02 Reversal from Void Check : -15.00
Number: 1472 Bank ID: NYO0l
Voucher ID: 1092224 Vendor:

NY CASH
03/07/02 TELEPHONE - VENDCR:NY CASH 32.00
03/07/02 TELEPHONE - VENDOR:NY CASH 15.00
03/19/02 TELEPHONE - VENDCR:NY- CASH 42.00
03/20/02 TELEPHONE - 322.91
VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, INC
03/20/02 TELEPHONE - 343.76
VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, INC
03/27/02 TELEPHONE - 473.80

VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, INC

04/12/02 TELEPHONE - - + 97.85
VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, IN -
04/24/02 TELEPHONE - o 155.00
VENDOR : CONFERENCE o
PRODUCTIONS LLC SR
05/01/02 TELEPHONE - : 624.18
VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, INC :
05/06/02 TELEPHONE - 111199.31
VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, INC _
05/06/02 TELEPHONE - - 535.34
VENDOR : DERAVENTURES,  IN o
05/08/02 TELEPHONE - VENDOR:SCOT 8.00
BERMAN * '
05/09/02 TELEPHONE - 46.35
VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, INC
05/29/02 TELEPHONE - 451.91

VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, INC
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 125 of 153

COMDISCO,

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002

06/06/02
06/07/02

06/27/02

02/15/02
02/15/02

02/15/02

02/28/02

04/01/02

o4a/01/02

04/01/02

04/03/02
04/03/02
04/03/02
04/23/02
04/23/02
05/28/02
05/30/02
05/31/02
06/10/02
06/10/02
06/10/02

06/10/02

TELEPHONE -
VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, INC
TELEPHONE -
VENDOR : DERAVENTURES, INC
TELEPHONE - VENDOR:AT&T
TELECONFERENCE SERVICES

Subtotal: 003

D. PEDOWITZ - VENDOR:FIRST
IN SERVICE TRAVEL

ESW - VENDOR:FIRST IN
SERVICE TRAVEL

S. BRAVERMAN -
VENDOR : FIRST IN SERVICE
TRAVEL

TRAVEL TO CT FOR CASE -
VENDOR :NY CASH

TRAVEL - VENDOR : INDEPENDENT
TAXI OPERATORS 381644
3/7/2002 :
TRAVEL - VENDOR:INDEPENDENT
TAXI OPERATORS 376842
3/21/2002

TRAVEL - VENDOR:INDEPENDENT
TAXT OPERATORS 372695
2/25/2002

TRAVEL - VENDOR:MARK S.
BALDWIN

TRAVEL - VENDOR:MARK S.
BALDWIN

TRAVEL - VENDOR:WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA

TRAVEL - VENDOR:WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA

CHICAGO TRAVEL 4/18 -
VENDOR : WILLIAM R. BALDIGA

TRAVEL - VENDOR:WILLIAM R.

BALDIGA
TRAVEL - VENDOR:FIRST IN
SERVICE TRAVEL o
TRAVEL - VENDOR:FIRST IN
SERVICE TRAVEL '
TRAVEL - VENDOR:WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA-TAXIS .
TRAVEL - VENDOR:WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA-HOTEL

TRAVEL - VENDOR:WILLIAM R.
BALDIGA-AIRFARE

TRAVEL - VENDOR :INDEPENDENT
TAXI OPERATORS 388552

Invoice Number

Page

247.20
1036.95

166.22

5794 .67
1116.50
2214.50

2222 .50

50.00

17.50
17.00
24.00

1750.88
1697.75
1050.50

192.00
1790.80

452.20

223%.50

' 202.50

82.75
612.85
1702.00

12.25

25

kR R Rk
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 126 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number ***%*%
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 26
August 29, 2002

06/12/02 TRAVEL - VENDOR:EDWARD S. 550.14
WEISFELNER
Subtotal: 004 17998.12
oe/r4a/02 SERVICES OF PROCESS - 177.50

VENDOR : KEATING & WALKER .

Subtotal: 006 177.50
05/14/02 PARKING AND TQLLS - 26.00
VENDOR :MARK S. BALDWIN
07/19/02 PHIL FLINK PARKING AND 35.00

TOLLS - VENDOR:BROWN
RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

Subtotal: 008 61.00

01/11/02 MEALS - VENDOR:NY CASH 6.00

01/25/02 MEALS - VENDOR:NY CASH 6.00

03/01/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA CAFE 9.04

©3/05/02 MEALS - VENDOR:CRANBERRY 7.11
DELI

03/06/02 MEALS - VENDOR:CRANBERRY 10.14
DELI

03/11/02 MEALS - VENDOR:KITCHEN 4.78
PROVANCE

03/14/02 MEALS - VENDOR:CRANBERRY 14.37
DELI

03/15/02 MEALS - VENDOR:CRANBERRY 10.14
DELI

03/19/02 MEALS - VENDOR:CRANBERRY = 10.50
DELY o

03/19/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA ‘CAFE~“ " #®smii " g g3

03/20/02 MEALS - VENDOR:PIATTI PRONTI = 13.36

03/20/02 MEALS - VENDOR:CRANBERRY. ' 6.25
DELI o

03/25/02 MEALS - VENDOR:PIATTI BRONTI 13.36

03/25/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA CAFE 13.96

03/26/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA CAFE™ 12.61

pa/o01/02 MEALS - VENDOR:CRANBERR 6.79
DELI _

04/08/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA CAFE " 11.50

04/10/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA 10.42

04/10/02 1/11 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA 138.36
CAFE S

c4/10/02 1/16 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA 9.09
CAFE

04/10/02 1/17 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROQPA 10.39

CAFE
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 127 of 153
BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION
August 29, 2002

04/10/02 1/31 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA
CAFE

04/10/02 2/15 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA
CAFE :

04/10/02 2/25 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA
CAFE

04/10/02 2/7 MEALS - VENDOR:OLLIE'S
NOODLE SHOP

04/11/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA CAFE

04/12/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA CAFE

04/12/02 MEALS - ESW, MEETING,
VENDCR : EUROPA CAFE

p4/12/02 MEALS - VENDOR:BERKELEY
CATERERS INC

04/12/02 MEALS - M. RONGONGO,
VENDCR :NY CASH

04/15/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EURQPA CAFE

04/18/02 MEALS - VENDOR:PIATTI PRONTI

04/30/02 2/11 MEALS - VENDOR:CITY
MARKET

04/30/02 2/8 MEALS -
VENDOR : CRANBERRY DELT

04/30/02 2/11 MEALS -
VENDOR : CRANBERRY DELI

04/30/02 2/11 MEALS -
VENDOR : CRANBERRY DELI

05/06/02 MEALS - VENDOR:PIATTI PRONTI

05/14/02 5/7 MEALS - VENDOR:WILLIAM
R. BALDIGA

05/15/02 MEALS - VENDOR:CRANBERRY
DELI

05/16/02 MEALS - VENDOR:CRANBERRY
DELT

05/21/02 MEALS -~ VENDOR:NY CASH

05/29/02 MEALS - VENDOR:PIATTI PRONTT

05/31/02 MEALS - VENDOR:JOHN'S
SHANGHAT

06/03/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA

06/04/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA

06/05/02 MEALS - VENDOR:OLLIE'S

NOCDLE SHOP

06/06/02 MEALS - VENDOR:QLLIE'S
NCODLE SHOP

06/06/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA

06/06/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA
06/06/02 MEALS - VENDOR:NY CASH
06/17/02 MEALS - VENDOR:REGINA CHUING
07/03/02 MEALS - VENDOR:OLLIE'S

NCODLE SHOP
07/19/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA CAFE

Invoice Number | rrxkxx
Page 27

14.92

10.18
21.40

10.76
12.50
67.79

378.65

9.71
13.36
8.85

12.81

12.82

13.36
181.863

6.00
13.386
13.10

11.45
10.42
14.72

17.47

11.51
10.95
6.00
8.92
15.76

11.79
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 128 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number sr#x¥%
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 28
August 29, 2002

07/19/02 MEALS - VENDOR:EUROPA CAFE 10.42

5/17- D.S.

Subtotal: 011 1302.82
05/08/02 COPIES - VENDOR:IKON 21.71
05/08/02 COPIES - VENDOR:IKON 58.29
05/14/02 COPIES - VENDOR:IKON 65.61
05/14/02 COPIES - VENDOR:IKON 16.45
05/29/02 COPIES - VENDOR:IKON 34.85
06/11/02 COPIES - VENDOR:IKON 215.79

Subtotal: 013 412.70
04/17/02 UCC EXPENSES - VENDOR:CSC 143.00

THE UNITED STATES CORP
Subtotal: 0lé 143.00

04/17/02 MISC. EXPENSES - 25.00
VENDOR : CHASE BUSINESS
CREDIT CARD

05/09/02 MISC. EXPENSES - VENDOR:THE 24.00
ROBERT LEWIS GROUP LLC

Subtotal: 019 49.00

04/10/02 CELLULAR TELEPHONE - 21.52
VENDOR : CINGULAR

05/23/02 CELLULAR TELEPHONE - 21.16
VENDOR : CINGULAR WIRELESS

06/05/02 CELLULAR TELEPHONE - o ] 10.65

..VENDCR : CINGULAR WIRELESS _
07/03/02 "CELLULZR TELEPHONE - v 93.99

VENDOR : EDWARD S. WEISFELNER

Subtotal: 024 147.32
04/29/02 TRANSCRIPTS - 538.00

VENDOR : ESQUIRE DEPCSITICN

SERVICES

Subtotal: 028 538.00
03/22/02 MESSENGER SERVICES - 9.00

VENDOR:TIME FOR A QUICK

ONE, INC.
04/09/02 MESSENGER SERVICES - 7.00

VENDOR : TIME FOR A QUICK
ONE, INC.



Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entere
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Pleading Page 129 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO,

INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION

August 29,

04/11/02

04/30/02

04/30/02

05/09/02

05/09/02

05/09/02

05/29/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

2002

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR:TIME FOR A QUICK
ONE, INC.

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR:TIME FOR A QUICK
ONE, INC.

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR:TIME FOR A QUICK
ONE, INC.

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR:TIME FOR A QUICK
ONE, INC.

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR:TIME FOR A QUICK
ONE, INC.

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR: TIME FOR A QUICK
ONE, INC.

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR :TIME FOR A QUICK
ONE, INC.

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO ROBERT
LACKEY 6/24

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO RONALD
HANSON 6/5

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO EDWARD
WEISFELNER 6/7
MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS

CORPORATION TO MARK BALDWINid

&/7
MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS

CORPORATION TO MARK BALDWIN .

6/10

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO RONALD
HANSON 6/24

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO DAVID
PEDOWITZ 6/24

i

d 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number k**%%%

Page 29

7.00

13.50

10.25

20.98

20.98

28.88

14.06

15.22

20.98

14.06
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 130 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK iSRAELS LLP

COMDISCO,

INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION

Rhugust 29,

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

07/15/02

o7/15/02

07/15/02

2002

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO JOHN BUTLER
6/24

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDCR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO CHAIM
FORTGANG 6/24

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO ROMAN SUKLEY
6/24

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO RICHARD
CHESLEY 6&/24

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS

. CORPORATICN TO KEN CORNICK

6/4

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO DAVID
PEDOWITZ 6/4

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO FRANCES
TUITE 6/4

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDCR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO STEVEN
BRAVERMAN 6/4
MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS

CORPORATION TO ROMAN SUKLEY [

€/5 Y
MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO CHATM
FORTGANG 6/5

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO ROBERT
LACKEY 6/5

MESSENGER SERVICES -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO JCHN BUTLER
6/5

Invoice Number

Page

20.98

11.28

20.98

20.98

16.61

16.61

26.06

17.96

20.98

11.28

20.98

20.98

30

kA dF kK



® @ ) ® - w @
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 131 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *kok ok ok k
CASE ADMINISTRATICN Page 31
August 29, 2002

07/15/02 MESSENGER SERVICES - 14 .06
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO MARK BALDWIN
6/6

07/15/02 MESSENGER SERVICES - 20.98
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION TO RICHARD
CHESLEY 6/5

Subtotal: 040 476.63

03/11/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 39.35
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/19/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 11.06
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/18/02 FEDERAI, EXPRESS - 12.41
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/19/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 11.06
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/19/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 13.09
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/19/02 FEDERAIL EXPRESS - 19.67
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/20/02 FEDERAIL, EXPRESS - 13.79
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/22/02 FEDERAL BXPRESS -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/26/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/28/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/28/02 FEDERAIL EXPRESS -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/28/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/28/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 13.09
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

.58.54
55.78
13.09
11.06

13.09
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 132 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Numbexr hkkkx%
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 32
Rugust 29, 2002

03/28/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 13.09
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/28/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 13.09
VENDOR : FEDERAL, EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/28/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 13.09
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

03/28/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 11.08
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

04/01/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 15.00
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

04/11/02 FEDERAL BXPRESS - 14.63
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

04/15/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 18.18
VENDOCR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

04/18/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 13.86
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORFPORATION

p4/18/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 13.15
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

04/18/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 13.15
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

04/18/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 13.15
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATICN

04/18/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - . 11.11
VENDOR : FEDERAL, EXPRESS y :
CORPORATION

04/18/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS -
VENDOCR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

04/18/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

04/18/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

04/18/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

04/18/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS - 13.15
VENDCR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

12.15
11.11

"13.15

13.15
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Pleading Page 133 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO,

INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION

August 29,

04/19/02

05/09/02

05/13/02

05/30/02

03/31/02
03/31/02
04/03/02
04/23/02
04/23/02

04/30/02

06/06/02

06/30/02

07/18/02

04/30/02
07/25/02
07/25/02
07/25/02
07/25/02

07/25/02

2002

FEDERAL EXPRESS -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

FEDERAL EXPRESS -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

FEDERAL EXPRESS -
VENDCR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

FEDERAL EXPRESS -
VENDOR : FEDERAL EXPRESS
CORPORATION

Subtotal: 045

SEARCHES - VENDOR:PACER

SERVICE CENTER

SEARCHES - VENDOR:PACER

SERVICE CENTER

SEARCHES - VENDOR:PACIFIC
INC

RESEARCH & RETRIEVAL,
SEARCHES ~

VENDOR : COURTEXPRESS . COM

SEARCHES -

VENDOR : COURTEXPRESS . COM

ON LINE SEARCHES -

VENDOR : GLOBAL SECURITIES

INFO INC
ON LINE SEARCHES -

VENDOR : GLOBAL SECURITIES

INFO INC

SEARCHES - VENDOR:PACER

SERVICE CENTER

SEARCHES - VENDOR :GLORAL -

SECURITIES INFO INC
Subtotal: 070

PACER ~ VENDOR:PACER
SERVICE CENTER

PACER - VENDOR:PACER
SERVICE CENTER 6/11
PACER - VENDOR:PACER
SERVICE CENTER

PACER - VENDOR:PACER
SERVICE CENTER

PACER - VENDOR:PACER
SERVICE CENTER

PACER - VENDOR:PACER
SERVICE CENTER

§

13.

16

54

15.

611.

152

73

146

141.

3z

36

234

35,

s,

Invoice Number

Page
86
.52
.32

15

22
.26
.18
.10
.25
00

.50
.50

.42
00
21

.19

.14

.57
.29
.78

.68

@ [ -
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

33

L

dkkkkk
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 134 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Inveoice Number cxx*x*x*
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 34
August 29, 2002

07/25/02 PACER - VENDOR:PACER 7.28
SERVICE CENTER

07/25/02 PACER - VENDOR:PACER 5.04
SERVICE CENTER

07/25/02 PACER - VENDOR:PACER 1.26

SERVICE CENTER

Subtotal: 076 34.23

05/13/02 CHICAGO AIRFARE - 1633.00
VENDOR:MARK S§. BALDWIN

05/14/02 4/7 AIRFARE - VENDCR:MARK 1573.00
S. BALDWIN

05/14/02 5/7 AIRFARE - 1702.00
VENDOR : WILLIAM R. BALDIGA

05/23/02 TRAINFARE - VENDOR:PHILIP 422.00
J. FLINK

06/14/02 AIRFARE - VENDOR:WILLIAM R. 296.00
BALDIGA

07/15/02 ED WEISFELNER AIRFARE - 863.00
VENDCR : FIRST IN SERVICE
TRAVEL
Subtotal: 080 6489.00

05/13/02 MILEAGE - VENDOR:MARK S. 26.00
BALDWIN
Subtotal: 081 26.00

01/23/02 TAXI - VENDOR:UTOG 2 WAY 63,75
RADIO INC. B 1 e ~

02/07/02 TAXI - VENDOR:UTOG 2 WAY 47.94
RADIO INC - D. MANCUSSO

02/11/02 TAXI - VENDOR:UTOG 2 WAY AR 87.21
RADIO INC :

02/14/02 TAXI - VENDOR:UTOG 2 WAY 99.96

~ RADIO INC - S. BERMAN

03/28/02 TAXI - VENDOR:UTOG 2 WAY 87.72
RADIO INC - &. BERMAN _

05/13/02 4 TAXI'S - VENDOR:MARK S. 92.00
BALDWIN _ _

05/14/02 2 TAXI'S - VENDOR:MARK S. 78.00
BALDWIN b S

05/14/02 3 TAXI'S - VENDOR:WILLIAM 70.00
R. BALDIGA

06/14/02 TAXI - VENDOR:WILLIAM R. 30.00
BALDIGR

Subtotal: 082 656.58
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 135 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

b A

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 35
August 28, 2002

05/13/02 HOTEL - VENDOR:MARK S. 543.83
BALDWIN
05/14/02 5/7 HOTEL - VENDOR:WILLIAM 430.88
_ R. BALDIGA
05/14/02 4/7 HOTEL - VENDOR:MARK S. 430.88
BALDWIN
06/14/02 HOTEL - VENDOR:WILLIAM R. 215.73
BALDIGA
07/03/02 HOTEL - VENDOR:EDWARD S. 600.00
WEISFELNER
Subtotal: 084 2221.32
03/25/02 CAR RENTAL - VENDOR:UTOG 2 51.00
WAY RADIO INC
04/15/02 CAR RENTAL - VENDOR:UTOG 2 31.62
WAY RADIO INC
06/14/02 CAR RENTAL - VENDOR:WILLIAM 48.70
R. BALDIGA
Subtotal: 088 131.32
02/22/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .59
03/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
03/19/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
03/19/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
03/20/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
03/20/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .59
03/20/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
03/21/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
03/21/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
03/22/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
03/22/02 TELEPHCONE-IN HOUSE .29
03/22/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
03/25/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.74
03/25/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
03/25/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
03/25/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .89
03/27/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 5.51
03/28/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
04/02/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
04/05/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .89
04/08/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .59
04/08/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
04/08/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
04/08/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
04/08/02 TELEPHONE-TIN HOUSE .29
04/09/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .58
04/09/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 30
04/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 30
04/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *x*x*xx
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 36
August 29, 2002

04/12/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .87
04/15/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .58
0a/15/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 3.48
04/15/02 TELEPHONE - IN HOUSE .29
04/15/02 TELEPHONE - IN HCUSE .58
0a/15/02 TELEPHONE - IN HOUSE 1.45
04/15/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 3.48
04/15/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
0a/16/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 3.77
04/16/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
04/17/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
04/17/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
04/17/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
0a/22/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .24
04/24/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.48
04/30/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 14.59
04/30/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 2.28
04/30/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 67.89
0s/01/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/02/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .58
05/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .58
05/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 2.03
05/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/06/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .15
05/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 7.83
05/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.20
05/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 4.64
05/09/02 TELEPHONE-IN HQUSE .15
05/09/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .87
05/09/02 TELEPHCNE-IN HOUSE .29
05/09/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .58
05/09/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/09/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/09/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 9.74
05/10/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 5.80
05/13/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .15
05/13/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/13/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/13/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .58
05/13/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 13.92
05/14/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.77
05/15/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 9.86
05/15/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/15/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .87
05/15/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .56
05/15/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/15/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/16/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/20/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 6.20
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COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number **x*x%x%
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 37
August 29, 2002

05/21/02 TELEPHCONE-IN HOUSE .30
05/21/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE : .30
05/21/02 TELEPHCONE-IN HOUSE .59
05/21/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/21/02 TELEPHONE~IN HOUSE ‘ .29
05/21/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/21/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/21/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/22/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/22/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/22/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/22/02 TELEPHONE-~IN HOUSE .29
05/22/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/22/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 8.70
05/23/02 TELEPHONE-TIN HOUSE 5.51
05/23/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.18
05/23/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .59
05/23/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
05/24/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
05/24/062 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
05/24/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/28/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/28/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/28/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE ' ' .30
05/28/02 TELEPHONE~IN HOUSE .30
05/29/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
05/29/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/30/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.45
05/31/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 11.60
05/31/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .58
05/31/02 TELEDPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
05/31/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.05
05/31/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 25.38
05/31/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 6.75
06/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
06/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
06/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
06/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HCUSE .58
06/03/02 TELEDPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
06/03/02 TELEPHCNE-IN HOUSE 2.61
06/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HQUSE .29
0s/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 3.48
06/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HCOUSE .58
06/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 11.02
06/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 2.90
06/04/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 7.83
06/04/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 6.79
06/04/02 TELEPHONE~IN HOUSE .30
06/04/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
06/04/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 2.07

06/04/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .89
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *x*%%
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 38
August 29, 2002

06/04/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
06/04/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 2.07
06/04/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.48
06/04/02 TELEPHONE~IN HOUSE .89
06/06/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 3.54
06/06/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .15
06/06/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.16
06/06/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
06/06/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.74
06/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .34
06/07/02 TELEPHONE-~IN HOUSE .29
06/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
06/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 12.18
06/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
06/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
06/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE - .29
06/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
06/07/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
06/10/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .59
06/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 2.66
06/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
06/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 4,06
06/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 3.77
06/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE . 2.64
06/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
06/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .59
06/12/02 - TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
06/13/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .29
06/13/02 TELEPHONE-IN HQUSE .30
06/13/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
06/14/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 12.85
06/14/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE : .30
06/14/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE . 1.48
06/14/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 4.43
06/14/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE ' .29
06/14/02 TELEPHONE - IN HCUSE 5 .58
06/17/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE : e .24
06/17/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE aE .24
0&/17/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE ' SR .30
06/17/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.77
06/17/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
06/18/02 TELEPHCNE-IN HOUSE 3.54
06/18/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
06/18/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .58
06/21/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE CEk .59
06/21/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE v .58
06/24/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 5.61
06/25/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .89
06/26/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
06/26/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30

06/26/02 TELEPHONE-IN HQUSE -30
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number #**%%%
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 39
Bugust 29, 2002

06/26/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
06/26/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
06/27/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
06/27/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .59
06/27/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.77
06/30/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 18.04
06/30/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 2.16
07/01/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE AT&T 54.19
CALLING CARD 6/10/2002
07/01/02 TELEPHONE - IN HOUSE .30
07/02/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/02/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/03/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/08/02 TELEPHONE - IN HOUSE .30
07/08/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.48
07/08/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .59
07/08/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/08/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.77
07/08/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .34
07/08/02 TELEPHONE-IN HCUSE . 1.77
07/08/02 TELEPHCNE-IN HOUSE .59
07/08/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.77
07/08/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/09/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/09/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 2.07
07/10/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/10/02 TELEDPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
a7/10/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.48
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE o .89
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE ' .30
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .59
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE . .59
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 28.91
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 29.50
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .23
07/11/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .45
07/12/02 TELEPHONE-IN HCUSE .30
07/12/02 TELEPHONE-IN HCOUSE 1.18
07/16/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .34
07/16/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 1.48
07/22/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/24/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 4.72
07/26/02 TELEPHONE -IN BOUSE .30

07/29/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .59
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number x#xxx

CASE ADMINISTRATION . Page 40
August 29, 2002

07/29/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/29/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 2.07
07/29/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .59
07/29/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .89
07/31/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .30
07/31/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 2.95
07/31/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE .43
07/31/02 TELEPHONE-IN HOUSE 3.90
Subtotal: 101 557.59
04/02/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 194.50
o04/02/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE .80
04/03/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 22.40
04/03/02 PHOTOCOPY-~IN HOUSE .50
04/03/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 12.00
o4a/04/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 36.00
04/04/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 28.40
04/04/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 7.80
04/05/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 14.00
04/05/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 51.50
04/05/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HCUSE 43.60
04/08/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 34.50
04/08/02 PHOTQCOPY-IN HOUSE 3.50
04/09/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 14.20
04/10/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 46.00
04/10/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 15.50
04/11/02 PHOTOCOPY - IN HOUSE 86.50
04/12/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 3.75
04/12/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 21.20
04/12/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 691.00
04/15/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 78.60
04/15/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 4.50
04/15/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 101.25
04/16/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 21.75
04/16/02 PHOTCCOPY-IN HOUSE 1.75
04/16/02 DPHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 54.00
04/17/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE .50
04/17/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE .20
o4/18/02 PHOTCOCOPY-IN HOUSE . 182.25
04/19/02 PHOTCOCOPY-IN HOUSE 151.50
04/23/02 PHOTCCOPY-IN HOUSE T .60
04/23/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 1.75
o4a/24/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 12."127.50
04/30/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE '1.00
05/01/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 2.25
05/02/02 PHOTQCOPY-IN HOUSE $7.80
05/07/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 2.40
05/09/02 PHOTCCOPY-IN HOUSE 844.00
05/09/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 60.40
05/09/02 PHOTOCOPY-IN HOUSE 46.00
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COMDISCO,

INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION

August 29,

05/10/02
05/10/02
05/10/02
05/10/02
05/13/02
05/13/02
05/14/02
05/15/02
05/15/02
05/16/02
05/16/02
05/17/02
05/20/02
05/21/02
05/21/02
05/21/02
05/22/02
05/22/02
05/23/02
05/23/02
05/24/02
05/28/02
05/28/02
05/29/02
05/29/02
05/29/02
05/30/02
05/30/02
05/30/02
05/30/02
05/31/02
05/31/02
06/03/02
06/03/02
06/04/02
06/04/02
06/05/02
06/06/02
06/06/02
06/06/02
06/06/02
06/07/02
06/07/02
06/07/02
06/07/02
p6/10/02
06/12/02
06/12/02
06/14/02
06/14/02
06/17/02

2002

PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY ~-IN
PHOTOCOPY -IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY -IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY~IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY -IN
PHOTCCOPY-IN
PHOTOCCOPY -IN
PHOTCCOPY ~IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCCPY -IN
PHOTOCOPY -IN
PHCTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOFY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY ~1IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY -IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY -IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY -IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE

Invoice Number

Page 41

15.60
130.50
161.25

45 .40

15.75
.80
.75
.75
.80
.60
-40
.80
.00
.40
.50
.50

bo
O W N WBE W

s

20.75
207.60
.75

14.00
63.00
63.50

67.00
66.25
101.00
24.60

.80
.60

Q

.20
101.20
296.20

95.80
©.80
91.60
$.40
1.40
184.20
63.40
15.00

4.80
1.20
.80

.20
.40
66 .80

* ok kkkk



Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Enter

COMDISCO,

INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATICN

August 29,

06/17/02
06/18/02
06/20/02
06/20/02
06/21/02
06/24/02
06/24/02
06/26/02
06/27/02
07/01/02
07/01/02
07/02/02
07/08/02
07/08/02
07/09/02
07/09/02
07/10/02
07/12/02
07/12/02
07/16/02
07/16/02
07/16/02
07/17/02
07/18/02
07/18/02
07/18/02
07/19/02
07/19/02
07/22/02
07/23/02
07/25/02
07/26/02
07/29/02
07/29/02

04/02/02
04/02/02
04/03/02
04/03/02
04/03/02
04/04/02
04/04/02
04/04/02
04/04/02
04/04/02
04/04/02
04/05/02
04/05/02
04/08/02

2002

PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN
PHOTOCOPY - IN
PHOTOCOPY-IN

Subtotal: 102

FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE
FACSIMILE

W
ed 09/03/02 O
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HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HQUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE
HOUSE

Invoice

w ®
0:00:00 Desc

Number

Page 42

.80
14.00
.60

.40
84.80

19.00
3.20
19.40

178.40
181.20

48.60

198.40
10.00

13.80

89.60
27.40
44.20
16.60
19.40
85.80
12.60

.40
32.80

6305.60

33.00
34.00
6.00
8.00
3.75
35.00
142.50
37.00
129.00
33.00
33.00
78.75
78.75
8.75

* ok ok koK
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BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number Hxkkxx
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 43
August 29, 2002
04/08/02 FACSIMILE 8.75
04/08/02 FACSIMILE 14.00
04/08/02 FACSIMILE 6.00
04/08/02 FACSIMILE 57.00
04/10/02 FACSIMILE 84,00
04/10/02 FACSIMILE 91.00
04/10/02 FACSIMILE 4.00
04/10/02 FACSIMILE 24.00
04/10/02 FACSIMILE 51.00
04/10/02 FACSIMILE 3 RECIPIENTS 1 3.75
PG EACH 041802
04/10/02 FACSIMILE 106 .25
04/10/02 FACSIMILE 78.75
04/11/02 FACSIMILE D. PEDOWITZ 11.25
040902
04/11/02 FACSIMILE C. LONSTEIN 7.50
040902
04/11/02 FACSIMILE 4 RECIPIENTS 6 30.00
PGS EACH 040902
04/12/02 FACSIMILE 30.900
04/15/02 FACSIMILE 41.00
04/15/02 FACSIMILE 4.00
04/15/02 FACSIMILE 4.00
04/16/02 FACSIMILE 26.00
04/16/02 FACSIMILE 38.75
04/16/02 FACSIMILE S. ARPS SLATE 7.50
041202
04/17/02 FACSIMILE J. BURK 041502 6.25
04/17/02 FACSIMILE M. MURPHY 041502 1.25
04/17/02 FACSIMILE 8.00
04/17/02 FACSIMILE 2.00
04/17/02 FACSIMILE 14.00
04/17/02 FACSIMILE 25.00
04/18/02 FACSIMILE 12.50
0a/18/02 FACSIMILE 88.75
04/18/02 FACSIMILE 90.00
0a/18/02 FACSIMILE 2 RECIPIENTS 1 1.25
PAGE EACH 041702
04/18/02 FACSIMILE 2 RECIPIENTS 1 2.50
PG EACH i,
04a/18/02 FACSIMILE 2 RECIPIENTS 1 PG . 2.50
EACH 041702
04/19/02 FACSIMILE © 90.00
0a/19/02 FACSIMILE 108.75
04/19/02 FACSIMILE 6.25
04/22/02 FACSIMILE W. BALDIGA 041802 23.75
04/23/02 FACSIMILE 39.00
04/23/02 FACSIMILE 40.00
04/24/02 FACSIMILE 28.00
04/24/02 FACSIMILE 28.00
04/29/02 FACSIMILE 5.00
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 144 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP
COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number **%%%%

CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 44
August 29, 2002

04/29/02 FACSIMILE 6.00
0a/29/02 FACSIMILE 3.00
p4/29/02 FACSIMILE 3.00
04/29/02 FACSIMILE 3.00
05/01/02 FACSIMILE 2.50
05/02/02 FACSIMILE 2.50
05/02/02 FACSIMILE TO CARMEN LONSTEIN 10.00
05/07/02 FACSIMILE TO CARMEN LONSTEIN 7.50
05/09/02 FACSIMILE 60.00
05/10/02 FACSIMILES TO MITCHEL 3.75

PERKIEL, FELCIA GERBER

PERLMAN AND CARMEN LONSTEIN

{1 PAGE EACH)
05/10/02 FACSIMILE 14.00
05/13/02 FACSIMILE 2 RECIPIENTS 8 20.00

PGS EACH 050102
05/13/02 FACSIMILE 26.00
05/13/02 FACSIMILE F. G. PERLMAN 10.00

050102
05/13/02 FACSIMILE 15.00
05/14/02 FACSIMILE 7.50
05/14/02 FACSIMILE 21.00
05/14/02 FACSIMILE 23.00
05/24/02 FACSIMILE TO FELCIA GERBER 43.75

PERLMAN
05/28/02 FACSIMILE 3.75
05/28/02 FACSIMILE 2.50
05/29/02 FACSIMILE 8.75
05/29/02 FACSIMILE €2.50
05/29/02 FACSIMILE 62.50
0s/29/02 FACSIMILE 35,00
05/29/02 FACSIMILE TO MITCHEL H. 3.75

PERKIEL; FELCIA GERBER

PERLMAN; CARMEN LONSTEIN, 1 .

PAGE EACH. e :
05/29/02 FACSIMILE 25.00
05/29/02 FACSIMILE 21.00
05/29/02 FACSIMILE 35.00
05/29/02 FACSIMILE 189.00
05/29/02 FACSIMILE 66.00
05/30/02 FACSIMILE 27.50
05/31/02 FACSIMILE W. BALDIGA 05300 13.75
05/31/02 FACSIMILE 2 RECIPIETNS 1 2.50

PGS EACH 052002 _
05/31/02 FACSIMILE C. LONSTEIN 20.00

052302 '
06/03/02 FACSIMILE 2.50
06/05/02 FACSIMILE 1.25
0&/06/02 FACSIMILE 6.25
06/06/02 FACSIMILE 23.75
06/07/02 FACSIMILE 7.50
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Enter
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Pleading Page 145 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION

August 29, 2002

06/07/02 FACSIMILE

06/07/02 FACSIMILE

06/07/02 FACSIMILE

06/07/02 FACSIMILE

06/11/02 FACSIMILE

06/11/02 FACSIMILE

06/11/02 FACSIMILE

06/11/02 FACSIMILE

06/11/02 FACSIMILE TO MATTHEW KIPP;
GEROGE PANAGKIS; WILLIAM
BALDIGA; 1 PAGE EACH

06/11/02 FACSIMILE 3 RECIPIENTS 7
PGS EACH 060602

06/12/02 FACSIMILE

06/12/02 FACSIMILE

06/14/02 FACSIMILE TO DAPHNE
SURPRIS; GEORGE PANAGRKIS;
WILLIAM BALDIGA; 1 PAGE EACH

06/14/02 FACSIMILE TO THOMAS ARENA

06/17/02 FACSIMILE G. PANAGAKIS
061402

06/17/02 FACSIMILE B. COGAN 061402

06/17/02 FACSIMILE T. ARENA 061402

06/17/02 FACSIMILE 4 RECIPIENTS 1
PG EACH 061402

06/17/02 FACSIMILE 2 RECIPIENTS 2
PGS EACH 061102

06/17/02 FACSIMILE D. PEDOWITZ 060702

06/20/02 FACSIMILE

06/29/02 FACSIMILE 2 RECIPIENTS 2
PGS EACH 062602

06/30/02 FACSIMILE

06/30/02 FACSIMILE

06/30/02 FACSIMILE

07/09/02 FACSIMILE

07/18/02 FACSIMILE

07/19/02 FACSIMILE

07/23/02 FACSIMILE ‘

07/24/02 FACSIMILE F. ZIEGLER 0718

07/25/02 FACSIMILE TO FRANK ZIEGLER:;‘
Subtotal: 103

04/02/02 BINDING-IN HOUSE

06/24/02 BINDING-IN HOUSE

06/24/02 BINDING-IN HOUSE

06/07/02

Subtotal: 104

POSTAGE-IN HOUSE

~ 1

1

b

W W www

26

(¥

ed 09/03/02 O

Invoice Number

Page

.50
.50
.50
.50
.75
.75
.75
.75
.75

.25

.75
.75
.75

.25
-25

.25
.25
.25

.00

.75
.75
.00

.50
.50
.50
.00
.50
.75
.75
.50
.25

.00
.18
.00
.18

.00

L4

45

0:00:00 Desc

khkkkkk
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 146 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *%%x%x%
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 46
August 29, 2002

Subtotal: 105 4.00

04/01/02 SECRETARY OVERTIME L. 60.00
CHABRRON 3/19/2002

04/02/02 SECRETARY OVERTIME B. 90.00
MCCORKLE

04/04/02 SECRETARY OVERTIME S. SAN 45.00
ANDRES

04/05/02 SECRETARY OVERTIME T. JANSEN 90.00

04/05/02 SECRETARY OVERTIME L. 30.00
CHARRCN

05/01/02 SECRETARY OVERTIME P. 30.00
LEMONIER-CHAMPAIGN 4/12/2002

06/01/02 SECRETARY OVERTIME L. 75.00
CHARRON 5/20/2002

06/01/02 SECRETARY OVERTIME L. 30.00
CHARRON 5/23/2002

06/01/02 SECRETARY QVERTIME M. 277.50
RANGONGO 3/5/2002

06/11/02 SECRETARY OVERTIME L. 30.00
CHARRON

06/14/02 . SECRETARY OVERTIME L. 30.00
CHARRON 5/28/02

06/14/02 SECRETARY OVERTIME L. 105.00
CHARRON 6/3/02

07/12/02 SECRETARY OVERTIME S. SAN 37.50
ANDRES
Subtotal: 106 930.00

04/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 264.25
4/2-4/5/2002

04/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 909.00
3/19, 3/25/2002 o

04/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH 156.00
3/20/2002 '

04/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH 315.25
3/22-3/28/2002 g

04/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH 4.99
3/25/2002 T

o4/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH 4.25
3/21/2002 LT

04/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH 568,00
3/22-3/28/2002 S

04/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH '127.50
3/30/2002

04/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 246.25
3/29/2002

04/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 405.75

3/31-4/4/2002
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 147 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *x*x%*
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 47
August 29, 2002

04/09/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH WESTLAW 86.83
4/5/2002

04/09/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 191%.75
4/2-4/5/2002

04/22/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH WESTLAW 71.53
4/15-4/16/2002

04/29/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 918.00
4/22/2002

05/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH WESTLAW 1786.14
4/15-4/17/2002

05/08/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH WESTLAW 39.94
5/5/2002

05/08/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 200.75
5/2/2002

05/08/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 15.00
5/2/2002

05/08/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 769.50
5/2-5/6/2002

05/22/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH WESTLAW 76.67
5/21/2002

06/05/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 1101.00
5/16-5/30/2002

06/05/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH WESTLAW 79.34
5/28/2002

06/05/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 5§357.50
5/13-5/30/2002

06/05/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 166.75
5/21/2002

06/05/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 10.00
5/28/2002

06/24/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 28.50
6/6/2002

06/24/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH WESTLAW 508.41
6/5/2002

06/24/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 3482.50

7 6/4-6/13/2002

06/24/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 10.00
6/6/2002

06/24/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH LEXIS 742.25
6/5-6/13/2002

07/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH WESTLAW 37.23
4/22/2002

07/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH WESTLAW 525.23
6/5/2002

07/01/02 COMPUTER RESEARCH WESTLAW 611.51
6/5/2002
Subtotal: 108 21545.57

04/02/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7903 6572 15.00

4639 TO CARMEN LONSTEIN
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 148 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number <¥%%&x
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 48
August 29, 2002

04/05/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7927 1770 15.00
8060 TO EDWARD WEISFELNER
04/05/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7920 1246 15.00

1945 TO MARK BALDWIN
(SIMSBURY, CT}

04/05/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7918 1046 15.00
3447 TO CARMEN LONSTEIN

04/09/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7903 7471 15.00
9461 TO FRANCES TUITE )

04/09/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7903 7472 15.00
4287 TO KEN CORNICK

04/09/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7918 1194 15.00
9270 TO DAVID PEDOWITZ

04/09/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7911 8440 15.00
4278 TO BRENT WILLIAMS

04/09/02  FEDERAL EXPRESS 7903 7472 15.00
1060 TO STEVEN BRAVERMAN

04/09/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7903 7494 15.00

: 0646 TO RANDALL LAMBERT

04/12/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7903 8052 15.00
8227 TO MARK BALDWIN

04/23/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 15.00
790393921407 TO DAPHNE
SURPRIS

05/03/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 79505 1849 15.00
2288 TO CARMEN LONSTEIN

05/23/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7927 2788 15.00
1160 TO FRANCE TUITE

05/23/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7904 2834 15.00
9320 TO DAVID PEDOWITZ

05/23/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7904 2835 15.00

3757 TO STEVEN BRAVERMAN

05/23/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7918 4543 15.00
5338 TO KEN CORNICK

05/23/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7904 2837 15.00
2373 TO CARMEN LONSTEIN T

05/24/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7904 2964 15.00
2592 TO ED WEISFELNER | || .

05/24/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7904 2963 15.00
7078 TO CARMEN LONSTEIN

05/28/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7905 3309 15.00
5757 TO DAVID PEDOWITZ o

05/28/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7920 4129 15.00
2382 TO ED WEISFELNER -

05/28/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7905 3311 15.00
6163 TO DAPHNE SURPRIS

05/28/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7920 4128 15.00
2175 TO FRANCES TUITE

05/28/02 FEDERAL EXPRESS 7904 3129 15.00

1247 TO KEN CORNICK
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page-149 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO,

INC.

CASE ADMINISTRATION

August 29,

05/28/02

06/07/02

07/12/02
07/12/02
07/12/02
07/12/02
07/12/02
07/12/02
07/17/02
07/18/02
07/18/02
07/18/02
07/18/02
07/18/02

07/18/02

04/01/02

06/14/02

06/01/02

05/16/02

2002

FEDERAL EXPRESS 7504 3128
5171 TO STEVEN BRAVERMAN
FEDERAL EXPRESS 7920 4832
2948 TO MARK BALDWIN
(SIMSBURY, CT)

FEDERAL EXPRESS TO STEVEN
BRAVERMAN 7918 8250 6924
FEDERAL EXPRESS TO DAVID
PEDOWITZ 7927 3602 7566
FEDERAL EXPRESS TO FRANCES
TUITE 7905 6255 4838

FEDERAL EXPRESS TO RANDALL

LAMBERT 7904 8349 4834
FEDERAL EXPRESS TO KEN
CORNICK 7918 8248 8667
FEDERAL EXPRESS TC CARMEN
LONSTEIN 7927 3602 6353
FEDERAL EXPRESS TQO JAYNE
DONEGAN 8300 5767 1492
FEDERAL EXPRESS TO KENNETH
CORNICK 7927 3700 1470
FEDERAL EXPRESS TC CARMEN
LONSTEIN 7904 9066 7481

FEDERAL EXPRESS TO FRANCES

TUITE 7920 7208 5318
FEDERAL EXPRESS TO STEVEN
BRAVERMAN 7918 8697 9937
FEDERAL EXPRESS TOC DAVID
PEDOWITZ 7920 7207 5188
FEDERAL EXPRESS TO RANDALL
LAMBERT 7904 9067 4829

Subtotal: 110

TRAVEL INDEPENDENT TAXT
381846 3/6/2002

Subtotal: 113

SECRETARIAL COVERTIME L.
GENTILE 5/22/02

Subtotal: 126

PARALEGAL OVERTIME S.
LOCASCIO 5/21/2002

Subtotal; 154

TRAVEL-PARKING AND
CAB-PETTY CASH -

15

15

i5

15

15

15

15

15.
15.
15.
15.
15.
15.
15.

15.

600.

10

30

30

24

Invoice Number

Page

.00

.00

.00

.00

.00

.00

.00

00

0o

¢o

Qo

00

o0

00

0o

Qo0

.00

.00

.00

.00

49
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 150 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC. Invoice Number *hkkkk
CASE ADMINISTRATION Page 50
August 295, 2002

VENDOR : BROWN RUDNICK
BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

Subtotal: 201 24.00

CURRENT EXPENSES 71,209.33
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Case 01-247

w L L)

Pleading Page 151 of 153

BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS LLP

COMDISCO, INC.
CASE ADMINISTRATION

Rugust 29,

2002

FOR COSTS ADVANCED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:

08/01/02
08/0L/02
08/01/02
08/01/02
08/01/02
08/06/02
08/06/02
08/06/02
08/07/02
08/07/02

08/01/02
08/02/02
08/05/02
08/08/02
08/09/02

08/01/02

TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE
TELEPHONE

Subtotal:
PHOTOCOPY
PHOTOCOPY
PHOTOCOPY
PHOTOQCOPY
PHOTOCCPY
Subtotal:

FACSIMILE

Subtotal:

~-IN HOUSE
-IN HOUSE
-IN HOUSE
-IN HOUSE
-IN HOUSE
-IN HOUSE
-IN HOUSE
~-IN HOUSE
-IN HOUSE
-IN HOUSE

101

-IN HOUSE
-IN HOUSE
-IN HOUSE
-IN HOUSE
-IN HOUSE

102

103

CURRENT EXPENSES

11

14.

32

10.

16.

L

95 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc

Invoice Number  hkkdkk

Page

.30
.30
.30
.30
.59
.59
.84
.30
.18
.89

.5S
.20
.80
.20
60
.40
.20
00

00

5



$87,845.23
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Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleadin%xﬁ@ﬁ_ 31:52 of 153
EXPENSE SUMMARY FOR COMPENSATION PERIOD
15T PERIOD | 2“° PERIOD | 3%° PERIOD TOTAL
EXPENSE CATEGORY EXPENSES | EXPENSES | EXPENSES | EXPENSES
TELEPHONE $4,663.26 $4,573.08 $5,941.99 |  $15,178.33
TRAVEL 21,739.61 15,052.82 18,240.44 55,032.87
MEALS 1,238.67 1,825.15 1,302.82 4,366.64
COPIES 178.48 3,813.57 412.70 4,404.75
COURT REPORTING 7,609.95 547.40 538.00 8,695.35
MESSENGER SERVICES 102.50 67.35 476.63 646.48
FEDERAL EXPRESS 1,259.90 820.21 1,211.22 3,291.33
RESEARCH 32,631.44 22,974.49 22,432.01 78,037.94
AIRFARE 10,096.00 6,489.00 16,585
TAXI 103.00 675.08 778.08
HOTEL 466.46 2,221.32 2,687.78
TELEPHONE IN-HOUSE 630.24 392.92 566.18 1589.34
PHOTOCOPY IN-HOUSE 6,975.75 3,274.80 6,337.80 16,588.35
FACSIMILE - 2,072.25 1,139.25 3,029.25 6,240.75
POSTAGE IN-HOUSE 1.60 4.00 5.60
SECRETARY OVERTIME 3,431.25 902.00 940.00 5,273.25
PARALEGAL OVERTIME 877.25 30.00 907.25
OFFICE SERVICES OVERTIME 473.00 473.00
LOCAL TRAVEL 3,288.68 3,288.68
DOCUMENT BINDING 33.00 42.18 75.18
MEALS - PETTY CASH 13.07 13.07
FILING FEE 75.00 75.00
CORPORATE SERVICES 550.00 143.00 693.00
STORAGE FEES 20.00 24.00 44.00
MISCELLANEOUS HARD COSTS 70.00 25.00 95.00
SERVICE OF PROCESS gl 177.50 177.50
TOTAL | $66,138.17 | $71,260.12 | $225,243.52

# 8077482 v1 0 LOCASCS 0 803215/0000

EXHIBITE




Partial Payments Made
Per July 16, 2001 Administrative Order:

v w ) o -
Case 01-24795 Doc 2884-1 Filed 08/30/02 Entered 09/03/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 153 of 153

EXHIBITF

@ L

Desc

4/1/02
$155,583.00% | $19,346.05 | $16,704.00
E{}g%t;gg $172,287.00 | $19,346.05 (90%) (100%) (10%) $0
5/01/02
$224 547.75 $27,976.73 | $24,949.75
g;;c?#gg $249,497.50 | $27,976.73 (90%) (100%) (10%) $0
6/01/02
$144,031.95 $18,993.44 | $16,003.55
g;rsool;gg $160,035.50 | $18,903.44 (90%) (100%) (10%) $0
7/01/02
through $70,215.00 $5,004.62 $0 $0 n/a n/a
7/31/02
Total: $652,035.00 i $71,410.84 $524,162.70 $66,316.22 | $57,657.30 $0

The aggregate amount of fees and expenses paid to the applicant to date for services rendered
and expenses incurred herein is $590,478.92.

The total amount of fees nof yet paid to the applicant to date for services rendered and

expenses incurred herein is $132,966.92.

The total amount of fees withheld from BR_BI is $57,657.30.

Adjustments/deductions:

*  Overpayment of $524.70; this was applled fowa

#38077481 1

m_:f_

‘\H

ithheld and $7£> 309 62 for fees and
1, through Juiy 31 2002.

EXHIBIT F



