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PoEo,
P
IN THE, UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT e

FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS RO
EASTERN DIVISION ,

.

In re: Case No. 01-24795 f{ W T

COMDISCO, INC. (Jointly Administered)  “vi. . ¢
et al,, Chapter 11 SR
Debtors. Hon. Bruce W. Black b

THIRD INTERIM APPLICATION FOR THE PERIOD FROM APRIL 1, 2002
THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002 AND FINAL APPLICATION FOR THE PERIOD FROM
JULY 27,2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002 FOR ALLOWANCE OF
COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF
EXPENSES OF ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
AS RESTRUCTURING AND ACCOUNTING ADVISORS TO THE OFFICIAL
COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF COMDISCO, INC. ET.AL.

Pursuant to sections 330, 331 and 503(b)(1)}(A) of the Bankrupicy Code, 11
U.5.C. §§ 101-1330 (the “Bankruptcy Code™), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy
Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules™) and Rule 607 of the local Rules of the United States
Bankruptcy Court for the Northern District of Tllinois (the “Local Rules™), Emst & Young
Corporate Finance LLC (“EYCF”), restructuring and accounting advisor to the Official
Commitiee ol Unsecured Creditors of Comdisco, Inc. (the “Creditors” Committee™) in the above-
captioned chapter 11 case (the “Case”), makes this interim application (the “Application”) for
allowance of $192,900 for compensation and $2,973 as reimbursement for expenscs for the
period from April 1, 2002 through Aungust 12, 2002 (the “Third Interim Application Period”) and
this final application (the “Final Application™) for approval of compensation for fees in the
amount of $1,096,931 ! together with $25,673 as reimbursement for expenses for the period from

July 27, 2001 through Augusl 12, 2002 (the “Final Application Pcriod™).

! Included in this figure is a $37,987 for compensation duc to an understatement of fees for the
period December 31, 2001 through March 31, 2002, which was billed by the Apphcant on
Aungust 29, 2002 (see Exhibit E attached), and which the interim allowance for is also being
sought herein.

Ui i 6 2002 -

DGkl
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BACKGROUND

1. On July 16, 2001, Comdisco, Inc. (“Comdisco™ or the “Debtor”) and certain of its
affiliated companies filed voluntary petitions in this Court for reorganization relief under chapter
11 of title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.8.C. §§ 101-1330, as amended (the “Bankruptcy
Codc™).

2 On July 25, 2001, the United States Trustee appointed the Official Committee of
Unsecured Creditors of Comdisco, Inc. (the “Creditors® Committee”).

3 On Scptember 19, 2001, the Committee filed its Application for an Order
Authorizing them, nune pro tune, to Retain and Employ, as Restructuring and Accounting
Advisors, E&Y Capital Advisors LLC (“EYCA™) for the Period July 27, 2001 through August
31, 2001 and Ernst & Young Corporate Finance LLC, Effective September 1, 2001 by Virtue of
the Assignment of such rctention from E&Y Capital Advisers LLC to Emst & Young Corporate
Finance LLC (the “Retention Application™), by which the Committee sought authonty to retain
and employ EYCA as its restructuring and accounting advisor in this Chapter 11 case nunc pro
tunc (o July 27, 2001 and EYCF, Effective September 1, 2001, The Court, having determined
that legal and factnal bascs set forth in the Retention Application established just causc for the
rclict, approved the Retention Application on October 23, 2001.

4. On April 3, 2002, EYCF filed its First Interim Fee Application for the penod July
27, 2001 to November 30, 2001. EYCF requested a total of $593,661 in fees and cxpcnses,
which amounts have been allowed in full as requested.

5. On June 21, 2002, EYCF filed its Second Tnterim Fce Application for the period
December 1, 2001 to March 31, 2002. EYCF requested a total of $295,784 in fees and expenses.

No ruling has been issued with respeet to the Second Interim Fee Application.
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6. On July 31, 2002, this Court entered an Order (the “Plan Confirmation Order™)
confirming the First Amended Joint Plan of Reorganization of Comdisco, Inc. and Tts Affiliated

Debtors and Diebtors in Posscssion and Exhibits (the “Plan’).

SERVICES PROVIDED DURING THE
THIRD INTERIM APPLICATION PERIOD

7. The Creditors’ Committee required the assistance and advice of EYCF in order to
investigate the financial affairs of the Debtor and to perform its other duties under section

1103(c) of the Bankruptcy Code.

8. Professionals from EYCF participated in the Comdisco matter during the Third
Interim Application Period, billing a total of 475 hours and $192,200 in {ecs (as voluntarily

reduced). A summary of participating professionals appears below:

Standard
Professional Hours  Hourly
Billed Rate Total
Robert Mason 2.0 $770 $1,540.00
Stuart Gleichcnhans 7.0 $650 $4.550.00
Nicholas Falzone 3.3 $650 $£2,145.00
Michael Williams 81.0 $605 $49,005.00
Donald Kallen 57.2 $589 $33.690.80
Robert Fahrenbach 14 $584 $817.60
Robert Wingles 0.5 $582 $291.00
David Miller 35.9 §575 £20,643.00
John Grivetti 2.1 $475 $997.50
Luis Franco 141.0 $340 $47,940.00
Kimberly Boggs 65.6 $286 $18,761.00
Jaclyn Lcas 25.1 $275 $6,902.50
Richard Sherman 58.0 $275 $15,950.00
Beatrice Ingles 27.5 $140 $3,850.00
GROSS TOTAL HOURS AND FEES: 507.6 $207,083.50
Reduction of Non Working Travel (1.0) (375.00)

Time (50% of time incurred)
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Less Voluntary Reduetion 31.6 (14,308.30)
NET TOTAL HOURS AND FEES: 475.0 $192,20(.00

9. As described in the attached Exhibits A and B, EYCF professionals and chent
service associates billed their time to distinct subject matter categorics. During the Third Intenm
Application Period, EYCF professionals and client service associates billed their time to distinct
subject matter categorics. Below is a summary of the significant activities that were performed
by EYCI professionals during the Compcnsation Period, orgamized by project code description

(“PCD"):
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(Third Interim Pecriod)

Fee Category Total Hours Total Fees
PCD 13 - Analysis and Reconciliation 36.4 $11,938
of Filed Claims
PCD 18 - Analysis of Tax Related 63.2 $31,013
Mallers
PCD 25 - Preparation and Participation 65.4 $27.683

in Mectings and Conference Calls with
Debtors and Debtors Professionals

PCD 26 - Prepare Information for and 38.4 $18,142
Participation in Meegtings with
Unsecured Creditors Committce

PCD 30 - Analyze Employee 75.7 $33,222
Severance, Pension, Retention and
Bonus Program

PCDD 46 - Preparation of Fce/Expense 32.7 $9.198
Applications

PCD 48 - Preparation of Monthly 38.8 $15,504
Invoice and Support Schedules

TOTAL UNADJUSTED HOURS 307.6 $207,084

AND FEES

PCD 13 - Analysis of Reconciliation of Filed Claims

EYCF aided the Committee’s reorganization plan assessment by analyzing the Debtor’s
estimates for Liabilities Subjcct to and Not Subject to Compromise and Off Balance Sheet
Claims. The focus of the analysis involved determining the range of potential ¢laims and the
recovery priotity of those claims as presented by the Company. These analyscs included
comparisons of current versus prior estimates of claims, rcconciliation between the Company’s
consolidated halance sheet and estimate of claims, and a breakdown of the claims into the

Company’s balance sheets by business unit. A summary of the supporting schedules for the
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Debtor’s estimates was prepared for the Commuttee.

PCD 18 — Analysis of Tax Related Matter

EYCF and EYLLP expended significant effort and professional time conducting duc diligence
with respect to the Debtor’s tax position. This included mectings with the Debtor’s tax
management and external tax advisots and rcviewing the Debtor’s tax data room rccords
regarding it current and historical tax situation. This due diligence was directed toward
analyzing, for reorganization purposes, the Debtor’s existing tax altributes, such as its domestic
and international net operating losses, tax credits, tax basis in assets and liabilities, and tax
refund opportunities. The duc diligence aided in the review and response to proposed asset sales
and the Debtor’s reorganization plan. Thesc tax services were performed with a view to

maximizing the value of the Debtor’s assets available for distribution or reorganization.

An executive summary of the Dcbtor’s current tax situation and potential reorganization issues
was prepared for the Committee. Given the possibility of significant diminution of the Debtor’s
eslale becansc of potential tax payments, the Committee had a strong interest in ensuring that the
Debtor was taking advantage of potential and significant tax minimization and planming

strategies, both domestically and intcrnationally.

PCD 25 - Preparation and Participation in Meetings and Conference Calls with Debiors and

Debtors Professionals

EYCF and EYLLP participated in various meetings and confcrence calls with Debtor’s
management and counsel regarding strategic, financial, and operational 1ssues in order to (i)
obtain the necessary financial information, and (i) ensure effective communication and
coordination. EYCF provided the Commitiee with valuablc insights relating to reorganization

plan alternatives, and provided input with respect to various tax issues, claims and bonus
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program analyses provided to the Commitlee from the Debtor and its representatives.

PCD 26 - Prepare Information for and Participation in Meetings with Unsecured Creditors

Commuilee

EYCF and EYLLP participated in regularly scheduled (as well as ad-hoc) calls with the
Committec in order to advise and assist the Committec in effectively addressing potential issucs,
discuss strategic matlers, and communicate the results of our work. EYCF played a significant
role advising and providing assistance to the Committee in effectively addressing plan related
issues, identifying rcorganization plan structuring opportunitics, and communicating the results
of various analysis and due diligence to support the Committee’s efforts to ncgotiate the
reorganization plan.

PCD 30 - Analyzc Emplovee Severance, Pension, Retention and Bonus Program

EYCF and EYLLP assisted the Committee in analyzing the Debtors’ emergence compensation
plan to assess whether the plan was within market parameters and was stimulating the

appropriate employee behaviors. This analysis included:

» Reviews of the plan and each of the programs for individual business units;

» Tnierviews with cach of the leaders of the business units;

» (Consnltations with Debtor management, thc Dcbtors® tax advisors, EYCF and
EYLLP colleagues, the Commitiee and its other advisors on plan specifics, affects of
the plan on other analyses, participant data, etc. and

»  (Consideration and evaluation of program aliernative structures.
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PCD 46 - Preparation of Fee/Expense Applications

The Applicant incurred time compiling and preparing fec and expense applications and invoices
for the second fee application covering the December 2001 through March 2002 period. This
included compiling, reconciling and summanzing the time and expense detail of EYCF

professionals.

PCD 48 - Preparation of Monthly Invoice and Support Schedules

The Applicant incurred lime preparing detailed monthly invoicc and support schedules to be
submitted to thc Committee. Where possible the Applicant used client service associates or

more junior staff at lower hourly charge out rates to perform these tasks.

Charges and Disbursements. In addition to its request for $192,200 in fees, EYCF also seeks
compensation for $2,973 in expenses arising out of its representation of the Creditors

Committee during the Interim Application Period. A summary of these charges is presented

below:

Expense Type Amount

Coach Airfare $2,646.00
Meals $0.00
Lodging $185.00
Tax1/Car Rental $123.00
Telephone $0.00
Other $19.00

TOTAL EXPENSES: $2,973.00
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SERVICES PROVIDED DURING THE
FINAL APPLICATION PERIOD

10.  The Creditors’ Commttee required the assistance and advice of EYCF m order to
investigate the financial affairs of the Debtor and to perform its other duties under section
1103(c) of the Bankrupicy Code.

11. Professionals from EYCF participated in the Comdisco matter during the Interim
Application Period, billing a total of 2,611.5 hours and $1,096,931 in fees (as voluntarily

reduced). A summary of participating profcssionals appears below:

Standard
Professional Hours Hourly
Billed Rate Total
Mason, Robert 2.0 $770 $1,540.00
Dunn, James 20.5 $650 $13,325.00
Falzone, Nicholas 54.2 $650 $35,230.00
Gleichenhaus, Stuart 263.6 8650 $171,340.00
Kalslad, Charles 16.9 $650 $10,985.00
Voortman, Anna 5.0 5650 $3.250.00
White, Ken 2.3 $650 $1,495.00
Williams, Michacl 1743 $605 $105,451.50
Kalfen, Donald 145.6 £589 $85,756.90
Fahrenbach, Robhert 1.9 $584 $1,109.60
Wingles, Robert 0.5 $582 $291.00
Thompson, Sean Q.5 3380 $5,510.00
Miller, David 146.9 $575 $84,467.50
Pacini, Dorothca 46.0 £550 $25.300.00
Cook, Martha 3.8 $538 $2,044.40
Stoeckel, Gregory 1.9 5512 $972.80
Grivetti, John 418.8 $474 $198,928.80
Ruppert, Lori 2.3 $385 $885.50
Ryan, Frances 54.7 $375 $20,512.50
Franco, Luis 355.8 $340 $120,972.00
Campbell, Keith 33.5 $320 $10,720.00
Van Vuren, Enk 407. £320 $130,528.00
Boggs, Kimberly 145.0 $286 $41,470.00
Morrow, Cory 10.0 $286 $2,860.00
Mostello, Audrey 16.5 $286 $4,719.00
Choquette, Audrey 218.%8 $275 $60,156.25
Krop, Andrew 56.9 $275 $15,647.50
Leas, Jaclyn 437 $275 $12,017.50
Malczyk, Bill 23.4 $275 $6,435.00

Sherman, Richard 155.3 $275 $42.707.50
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Ein, Susan 1.0 $215 $215.00
Mills, Elizabeth 1.6 $175 $280.00
Ingles, Beatrice 99.6 $140 $13,944.00
Cardenas, Olivia 12.3 $121 $1,488.30
Koepke, Kathy 2.5 $44 $110.00
GROSS TOTAL HOURS AND FEES: 2,954.5 $1,232,666
Reduction of Non Working Travel Time (23.3) (13,337)
(50% of time incurred)

Less Voluntary Reduction 319.7 {122,398)
NET TOTAL HOURS AND FEES: 2,611.5 $1.096.931

12, As described in the details attached to the Interim Applications previously filed
and included hercin for the Final Application Period, EYCF professionals and client service
associates billed their time to distinct subject matter categories. Below is a summary of the
significant activities (generally greater than 35 hours) that were performed by EYCF
professionals during the Final Application Period, organized by project code description

(i‘PCD!!)'
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Fee Category Total Hours Total Fees
PCD 1 - Planning, Supervision, 92.5 $33,082.50
Admimstration and Review
PCD 3 - Review Newly Received 97.0 $38,595.30
Documents
PCD 4 - General Communtcations 477 $19,758.50
with Unsecured Creditors
PCD 5 - Preparation and Review of 129.2 $48,851.70
Information Requests and Related
Maiters
PCD 6 - Valuation and Related 47.6 $28,722.00
Malters
PCD 7 - Liquidation Analysis and 51.1 $17,340.00
Related Matters
PCD 9 - Analysis of Long-Term 511 $26,559.50

Business Plan and Rclated Matters

PCD 10 - Analysis of Current 69.4 $29,953.00
Operating Results and Related Matters

PCD 12 - Analysis of Bankruptcy 61.6 $25,677.50
Schedules, Court Documents and other
Legal Documents

PCD 13 - Analysis of Tax Related 304.7 $149,684.60
Matters

PCD 18 - Analysis and Reconciliation 37.0 $12.165.00
of Filed Claims

PCD 25 - Preparation and Participation 182.2 $88,324.40

in Meetings and Conference Calls with
Debtors and Dcbtors Professionals

PCD 26 - Prepare Information for and 183.7 $100,465.10
Participation in Mcctings with
Unsecured Creditors Committee

PCD 30 - Analyze Employcc 257.1 $118,112.80
Severance, Pension, Retention and
Bonus Program

PCD 31 - Analyze Employment 36.5 $11,581.60
Benefit Matters
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PCD 35 - Review/Analyze Valuc of 64.2 $20,353.50
PCD 45 - Firm Retention 107.7 $38,008.80
PCD 46 - Preparation of Fee/Expense 169.3 $46,639.00
Applications

PCD 48 - Preparation of Monthly 66.6 $24,937.40
Invoice and Support Schedules

PCD 55 - Preparation of 315.0 $105,256.75
Misccllancous Financial Analysis

PCD 58 - Strategic and Operalional 129.1 $44,540.00
Assessment Matters

PCD 71 — Preparation of Financial 52.9 $19,587.50
Models

PCD 73 — Analysis of Tax Attributes 54.0 $25,039.50
PCD 74 — Meetings with prolessional 66.8 $33,186.50
to discuss case status and develop

strategy.

PCD 76 Short-term Cash Flow 36.9 $14,104.50
Projections

PCD CODES WITH >
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PCD 1 — Planning, Supervision, Admimistration and Roview.

The Applicant incurred time coordinating its tasks and responsibilities with the representatives of
the Committee and the EYCF and EYLLP teams, to ensure maximum benefit was provided to
the Committee while minimizing costs. Senior EYCF and EYLLP personnel also incurred time
reviewing and analyzing the work completed. For the most part, the Applicant identified these

activities in specific PCDs, or otherwise included such time herein.

PCD 3 - Review Newly Received Documents

The Applicant incurred time reviewing and analyzing newly received documentation from the
Debtors, as well as documents received from other parties in interest in the case. In most
instances, the Applicant identified these activities in specific PCDs, or otherwise included such

time herein.

PCD 4 - General Communications with Unsecured Credilors

Throughout the case EYCF responded to Unsccured Creditors’ inquiries into progress of the

case.

PCD 5 - Preparation and Review of Information Reguests and Related Matters

EYCF assisted the Committee with the gathcring of a significant amount of financial
information. As part of this, EYCF spent a subslantial amount of time meeting with the Dcbtor’s
management and financial advisors to discuss the detailed components of our requests and the
timetable for the Debtor’s responsc to provide supporting documentation. In addition, EYCF

coordinated such activities with Lazard Frercs, the Committee’s financial advisor.
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PCD 6 - Valuation and Related Matters

Early on in the case, EYCF updatcd a number of indications of value and related analytics that
had been preparcd pre-petition. These analyses were used to assist the Committee and its
financial advisor in determining an initial value range of various business units. The Committee
was able to better understand the sive and diffcrences of the various business units in the
timeframe in which the analyscs were completed, in order to determine the strategy for value

realization.

PCD 7 - Liguidation Analysis and Related Matlers

Early on in the case, EYCF updated a liquidation analysis prepared pre-petition with numbcrs for
the quarter-ended 6/30/01 in order to allow us to better advise the Committee as to the range of
potential values.

PCD 9 - Analysis of Long-Tcrm Business Plan and Relatcd Matters

EYCF has analyzed a number of analyscs, plans and reports produced by the Debtor’s
professionals that have addressed the operating and viabilily of the Icasing businesses. EYCF
discussed related issucs with the Commitiee’s {inancial advisors in order to coordinate such
activities.

PCD 10 - Analysis of Current Opcrating Results and Related Matters

The Applicant incurred time analyzing thc Debtors’ operating results to understand the business
trends and financial issues. These efforts included the analysis of monthly cash {low rcports,

monthly linancial statements, and other primarily financial related repotts.
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PCD 12 - Analysis of Bankruptcy Schedules, Court Documents and other Legal Documents

The Applicant incurred lime analyzing various bankruptcy schedules, court documents and other
lega! documents related to its efforts to advise the Committee during the case.

PCD 13 - Analysis of Tax Related Matters

EYCF and EYLLP expended significant cffort and professional time conducting duc diligence
with respect to the Debtor’s tax position. This included meetings with the Debtor’s tax
management and external tax advisors and reading the Debtor’s tax data room records regarding
its current and historical tax situation.

This due diligence was dirceted toward analyzing the Deblor’s existing tax attributes, such as its
domestic and international net operating losscs, tax credits, tax basis in assels and liabilitics, and
tax refund opportunitics. The due diligence aided in the review and response to proposed assel
sales and the Debtor’s reorganization plan. These lax services were performed with a view to
maximizing the value of the Debtor’s assets available for distribution or rcorganization

An executive summary of the Debtor’s currcnt tax situation and potential reorganization issues
was preparcd for the Committee. Given the possibility of significant diminution of the Debtor’s
estale becanse of potential tax payments, the Commiltee had a strong interest in ensuring that the
Debtor was taking advantage of potential and significant tax minimization and planning

stratcgies, both domestically and internationally.
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PCD 18 - Analysis and Reconciliation of Filed Claims

EYCF aided the commitlee in analyzing the Company’s estimates for Liabilities Subjcct to and
Not Subject to Compromise and Off Balance Sheet Claims. The focus of the analysis mvolved
determining the range of potential claims and the recovery priority of those claims as presented
by the Company. These analyses included comparisons of current versus prior eshimates of
claims, reconciliation between the Company’s consolidated balance shect and estimate of claims,

and a breakdown of the ¢laims into the Company’s balance sheets by business unit.

PCD 25 - Preparation and Participation in Meetings and Conference Calls with Debtors and

Debtors Professionals

EYCF and EYLLP participated in various meetings and conference calls with Debtor’s
management and counsel regarding strategic, financial, and operational issues in order to (i)
obtain thc nccessary financial information, and (1) ensurc cffective communication and
coordination. EYCF provided the Committee with valuable insights rclating to possible strategic
reorganization altematives, and responscs to information provided to the Committee from the

Debtor and its representatives.

PCD 26 - Prepare Information for and Participation in Meetings with Unsecured Creditors

Committee

EYCF and EYLLP participated in regularly scheduled (as well as ad-hoc) calls with the
Committee in order to advise and assist the Committee in effectively addressing potential issucs,
discuss stratcgic matters, and communicate the results of onr work. LYCF played a significant
role advising and providing assistance to thc Committee in effectively addressing issues,
identiflying opportunities, and communicating action plans to obtain support and negotiate

accordingly.
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PCD 30 - Anatyzc Emplovee Severance, Pension, Retention and Bonus Program

EYCF and EYLLP assisted the Committee in analyzing the Debtors’ emergence compensation
plan to assess whether thce plan was within market paramcters and was stimulating the

appropriate cmployee behaviors. This analysis included:

» Reviews ol the plan and each of the programs for individual business units;

» Interviews with each of the leaders of the business units;

* Consultations with Debtor management, the Debtors’ lax advisors, EYCF and
EYLLP colleagues, the Committce and its other advisors on plan specifics, affects of
the plan on other analyses, participant data, etc, and,

» (Consideration and evaluation of program alternative structures.

EYCF also provided expert witness teslimony regarding certain executive employment contracts

that the Commilles {elt were not appropriate, given the results of these analyses.

PCD 31 - Analyze Employment Benefit Matters

EYCF and EYLLP assisted the Committee in evaluating the level of certain proposed employee
benefits. The Applicant accumulated research on the market levels for benefits for certain levels
of employees to better undersiand the how the proposed costs compared to similar situations in
other cascs and companies.

PCD 35 - Review/Analyzc Value of 1.ease Portfolios

At the request of the Committee, the Applicant has uscd information from the Debtor to
independently analyze each of the lease portfolios in order to confirm certain assertions made by

the Debtor and to understand issucs that might anse in the bidding process.
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PCD 45 - Firm Retention

The Applicant incurred time conducting the required initial and ongoing connections checks (io
disclose connections with the various parties in intcrest in the case), preparing affidavits of
disinteresledness and other required court documents related to the retention of the Applicant.
Where possible the Applicant used client service associates or more junior staff at lower hourly
charge out rates to perform these tasks.

PCD 46 - Preparation of Fee/Expensc Applications

The Applicant incurred time compiling and preparing fec and expense applications and invoices
for the initial and sccond fee applications covening the July through December 2001 and
December 2001 through March 2002 periods.

This included compiling, reconciling and summarizing the time and expense detail of EYCF
professionals.

PCD 48 - Preparation of Monthly Invoice and Support Schedules

The Applicant incurred time preparing detailed monthly invoice and support schedules to be
submitted to the Committee. Where possible the Applicant used clienl service associates or
more junior staff at lower hourly charge oul rates to perform these tasks.

PCD 55 - Preparation of Miscellaneous Ninancial Avalysis

EYCF provided valuable assistance to the Commitiee in developing a balance sheet analysis that
helped track changes to the leascd assets both on a geographic and business unit basis. EYCF
also prepared analyses on the characteristics of each lcasing portfolio, assessing timing of
expected lease receipts, residual risk, ratings classification and ranges of value from a net present
value basis to assist the Committee in understanding the cash flows and risks attendant to each of

the business units.
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EYCF provided valuable assistance to the Committce in developing various analyses, including

analyses on:

* The balance sheet that helped track changes to the leased assets both on a geographic

and business unit basis.

» The characteristics of each leasing portfolio, assessed timing of expected leasc
receipts, residual risk, ratings classification and ranges of value from a nct present
valuc basis to assist the Committec in understanding the cash flows and risks

attendant to each of the business units.

» The amount and nature of debt at the foreign entitics.
* Components of aclual and estimations of projected consolidating cash flows.
* Details of runofl plans and comparison between current and previous versions of the

plan.

» Charactenistics of each lcasing portfolio.

PCD 58 - Stralegic and Opcrational Assessment Matiers,

Due to conflicting reports from biddcrs for certain of the leasing business units regarding the
quality of the underlying lease file detail kept by the Debtor, the Commiitee requested that EYCF
perform an independent asscssment of the Debtor’s underlying Icase files. This assessment
included reviewing a sample of the lcasc files detail on the Debior’s premises and preparing a
summary of our findings for the Committee so that they could understand the feedback from the
bidders.

PCD 71 — Preparalion of Financial Models.

Early in the casc, the Applicant created a consolidating balance sheet model that reconciled to
the financial statements filed with the SEC and that indicaied the book value of assets by both
busincss line geography. This model was used by the Committee as the first indication of the

size of assels in each busincss line and geographic location. The model incorporated work
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performed by the Applicant pre-petition and compared levels of assets to previous quarters. The
resulting output was also sharcd with Lazard Freres and was used in part in their early analysis of
the Debtors reorgamization allernatives.

PCD 74 — Meetines with professionals to discuss case status and develop strategy.

The Applicant has had a number of meetings and conference calls with the individual members
of the Commiitee, thc Committee’s other legal and financial prolcssionals, and internally to
discuss and develop a strategy to rcalize the greatest value for the creditors.

PCD 76 Short-term Cash Flow Projeciions.

EYCF monitored and analyzed the Debtor’s monthly cash flow, consolidating recently provided
monthly data with prior months on an ongoing basis. The monthly cash flows were used to
gstimate future cash balances, which were provided to the Committee. EYCF also compared

these cash balance estimates to the actal results.

13. Charges and Disburscments, In addition to its request for $1,096,931 in fees,

EYCF also seeks compensation for $25,673 in cxpenses arising out of ils representation of the
Creditors’ Committee during the Final Application Period. A summary of these charges is

presenied below:

Expense Type Amount

Coach Airfare $20,377.00
Meals $500.00
Lodgmg $2,462.00
Tax1/Car Rental $1,878.00
Tclephone $163.00
Other $295.00

TOTAL EXPENSES: $25,673.00
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REASONABLENESS OF FEES, CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS

14.  The professional scrvices rendered by EYCF during the Final Application Period
required a high degree of professional competence and expertise so thal the numerous issues
requiring evaluation and response by the Committee could be addressed with skill and dispatch.
The provision of such services, thereforc, has required the expendilure of substantial time and
effort. EYCF submits that the services rendered to the Committee were performed efficiently,
cffectively, and economically and that the results obtained thus far have provided a significant

benefil to the Committee.

CONCLUSION

The nature of EYCF’s fee arrangement, by which payment for services rendered
is sought in this Application, is consistent with the curreni practices of EYCF for
restructuring and accounting advisory scrvices provided to creditor committees in other
bankruptcy matters, and has already been approved by this Court.

Those expenses for which reimbursement is sought in this Application satisfy the
standards set forth in the Bankruptey Codc, the Guidelines, and the Local Rules.

No agreement or understanding cxists between EYCF or any third person for the
sharing of compensation, except as allowed by section 504(b) of the Bankruptecy Codc
and Bankrupicy Rule 2016 with respect to sharing of compensation between and among
partners of EYCF.

All the services for which compensation is requested hereunder were rendcred at
the request of and solely on behalf of the Committee, and not on behalf of any other

entity.
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WHEREFORE, EYCF respectfully requests that the Court enter an Order in the form
attached to this Application as Exhibit A (i) allowing $1,096,931 as final compensation for
professional services rendered, and the sum of $25,673 for final reimburscment of actual and
necessary costs and expenses incurred by it in these cases from July 12, 2001 through and
including August 12, 2002, (ii) authorizing the Debtors and directing them forthwith to pay
EYCEF the outstanding balance of $319,835 as compensation for services rendcred and
reimbursement of cxpenses incurred during these chapter 11 cases, (i11) authorizing and directing
the Debtors to pay EYCF for any fees and expenses that EYCF incurs after August 12, 2002 for
such scrvices in connection with the consummation of the Debtors reorganization plan (which
occurred on or about October 1, 2002), and in connection with the filing of its Final Fee
Application, together with any expenses incurred on or prior to the Effective Date of the Plan but
booked to EYCF’s recotds after July 31, 2002," without the need for further court approvai or the

filing of any further fee applications.

Becausc of delays in receiving invoices from vendors and processing therm internally, expenses incurred may
not appear on billing sheets related to this matter for up to 60 days. EYCF has incteded an estitnate of such
expenses based on average monthly cost in this Application,
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Dated: October 14, 2002 M ‘\\\“\Qﬂw

<= LR

Sworn to and subscribed beforc
me this Kéfday of Jclottr. , 2002.

Notary Public ‘

My Commiission Expires: 167 S ‘_',4&

Notary Public, Clayton County Georgia
My Comnmission Expires Qct. 29, 2002
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COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATF. FINANCE LLC
SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY PROFESSIONAL
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27,2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

PROFESSIONAL POSITION RATE HOURS FEES

Restructuring Advisory Services

White, Ken Senior Managing Director $650 2.3 1,495.00
Gleichenhaus, Stuart ~ Managing Director 650 263.6 171,340.00
Miller, David Managing Pirector 575 146.9 84,467.50
Grivetti, John Dircctor 475 418.8 198,928.80
Ryan, Frances Vice President XI5 54.7 20,512.50
Franco, Luis Associate 340 355.8 120,972.00
Van Vuren, lirik Associate 320 4079 130,528.00
Campbell, Keith Associale 320 335 10,720.00
Choquette, Andrew Amnalyst 275 2188 60,156.25
Krop, Andrew Analyst 275 56.9 15,647.50
Malczyk, Bill Analyst 275 234 6,435.00
I.eas, faclyn Analyst 275 43.7 12,017.50
Ingles, Beatrice Client Serving Associate 140 09.6 13,944.00

Sublotal 21259 347,164.05

Ernst & Young LLP
Tax Consulting Service

Mason, Robert Partner $£770 2.0 1,540.00
Falzone, Nicholas Partner 650 34.2 35,230.00
Kolstad, Charles Partner 650 16.9 10,985.00
Voortman, Anna Partner 650 5.0 3,250.00
Williams, Michael Principal 605 174.3 105,451.50
Fahrenbach, Robert 584 1.9 1,109.60
Wingles, Robert 582 (.5 291.00
Thompson, Sean Senior Manager 580 9.5 5,510.00
Pacini, Dorothea Senior Manager 550 46.0 25,300.00
Sherman, Richard Senior 275 155.3 42.707.50
Millg, Elizabeth Financial Management Advisor 175 1.6 280.00
Koepke, Kathy Staff 44 2.5 110.00

Subtotal 469.7 231,764.60
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ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY PROFESSIONAL

FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002
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PROFESSIONAL POSITION RATE HOURS FEES
Human Resource Services
Dunn, James Partner 5650 20.5 13.325.00
Kalfen, Donald Partncr 589 145.6 85,756.90
Cook, Martha Semor Manager 538 3.8 2,044 .40
Stoeckel, Gregory 512 1.9 972.80
Ruppert, Lori Manager 385 23 885.50
Boggs, Kimberly Senior 286 145.0 41,470.00
Morrow, Cory Senior Consultant 285 10.0 2.860.00
Mostello, Audrey Scnior Consultant 285 16.5 4.719.00
Ein, Susan 215 1.0 215.00
Cardenas, Olivia Research Coordinator 121 12.3 1,488.30
3589 153,736.90
TOTAL 2,954.5 $1,232,666
Reduction of Non-Working Travel Time (50% of time incurred) (23.3) (13,337)
Less Voluntary Reduction (319.7) (122,308)
2.611.5 $1,096,931
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COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG COPORATE FINANCE LLC

SUMMARY OF HOURLY FEES BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

Project
Code Description Hours Fees
t Planning, Supervision, Administration and Review 025 § 3308250
3 Review Newly Received Documents 97.4 38,825.30
4 General Communications with Unsecured Creditors 48.2 19,999.00
3 Preparation and Review of Info. Requests and Related Matters 129.2 48,851.70
6 Valualion and Related Matters 47.6 28,722.00
7 Liquidation Analysis and Related Mattcrs 51.1 17,340.00
9 Analysis of Long-Term Business Plan and Related Matters 51.1 26,559.50
10 Analysis of Current Operating Results and Related Matters 69.4 29,953.00
including Cash Flow and Availability
11 Revicw and Analysis of Monthly Operating Results 22.8 8,410.00
12 Analysis of Bankruptcy Schedules, Court Documents and other 6l.6 25677.70
Legal Documents

13 Analysis of Tax Related Matters 3047 149,684.60
15 Preparation for and Attendance at Court Hearings 25.6 13,961.40
16 Analysis of Reclamation Claims 1.7 578.00
18 Analysis and Reconciliation of Filed Claims 37.0 12,165.00
20 Analysis of Other Claims 8.5 3,220.50
21 Analyze Liabilities Subject to Compromisc 25.5 9,774.50
22 Develop Hypothetical Claim Estimales 6.4 3,250.00
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ERNST & YOUNG COPORATE FINANCE LLC
SUMMARY OF HOURLY FEES BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

Project
Code Description Hours Fees
25 Preparation and Participation in Mcetings and Conference Calls 182.2 88,324.40
with Debtors and Debtors Professionals to Discuss Status and
Develop Strategy
26 Prepare Information lor and Participation in Meetings with the 1837 100,465.10
Unsecured Creditors Commuitee
30 Analyze Employee Severance, Pension, Retention and Bonus 2371 118,112.80
Program
31 Analyze Employment Benclit Matters 36.5 11,581.60
33 Analyzc Motions to Assume/Reject Real Property Leases 4.0 1,230.50
35 Review/Analyze Value of Real Property Leascs 64.2 20,353.50
36 Analyze DIP Facility Matters 17.4 7,006.50
41 Participate in Negotiation and Formulation of Plan of 6.6 2,408.50
Rcorganization
42 Review of Disclosure Statement 19.3 8,679.50
45 I'irm Retention 107.7 38,066.30
46 Preparation of Fee/Expense Applications 169.4 46,696.50
47 Preparation of Fee Estimates 5.0 1,600.00
48 Preparation of Monthly Inveice and Support Schedules 69.5 26,040.90
50 Analysis of Store Closings/Going out of Business Sales 0.3 172.50
51 Analyze Assct Sale Proposals 295 13,551.50
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COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG COPORATE FINANCE LLC

SUMMARY OF HOURLY FEES BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

Project
Code Description Hours Fees

55 Preparation of Miscellancous Financial Analysis 3150 105,256.75

58 Strategic and Opcrational Assessment Matters 129.1 44.,540.00

G0 Analysis of Turnaround/QOperational Plan and Related Matters 10.3 3.610.00

69 Non-Working Travel Time 46.5 26,675.00

71 Preparation of Financial Models 52.9 19,587.50

72 Analysis of Real Property and Uses Taxes 0.6 165.00

73 Analysis of Tax Attributes 54.0 25,039.50

74 Meetings with professionals to discuss case status and develop 66.8 33,186.50
strategy

75 Analyze Proposed M&A transactions Include Due Diligence 13.7 7,845.00

76 Short-term Cash Flow Projections 36.9 14,104.50
TOTAL HOURS AND FEES 2,954.5 $1,232,666
Reduction of Non-Travel time (50% of time incurred) (23.3) (13,337)
Less Voluntary Adjustment (319.7) (122,398)
TOTAL ADJUSTED HOURS AND FEES 2,611.5 $1,096,931
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CONDIRCO, INC,

ERMST & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETALL QF 5FRVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGI AUGUST 12, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE Py HONRS NESCRIFTION

Miller, David NN 1 0.3 Dafl e-migil to team regarding initial wotk plan and follow up process with
Cotnnitees

Miller, David 14/ 4401 1 0.1 ‘T'elephane call J. Crivert regarding dilipences 2atvg npdate

Grivetti, Juhn (/12001 1 0.1 ‘Tefephane eall T2, Miller reparding diligence statuz npdare

Mestello, Auwdrey ORA2A 1 0.5 Sent copies of all case related docwnentz to EY Atlang HRS personmel

Grivewi, John 0%/2a/01t 1 0.3 FEngopement administration re: sclup

Gifvetti, John 098/19/01 1 n.s Preparation of internal menws 16 ¢338 stams

Lyuitan, James 09/24/01 1 4 Workpapers files imainlenanee.

Von Vuren, Crik 261 1 23 Orgganized filez gnd regearched industry news

Pacini, Durothea 1R2AN 1 06 Proviged M. Williams updates regardilly, ¢ase sats.

Milicr, Lyavid 10/08/01 1 0.2 Wrking with tean regarding updaied work plan items.

Milter, Navid 1/10/01 ] 0.3 Diiscussion with ), Chivelt reparding Comeitter mecting and po forward EY CF
work plan projects,

Crivetti, Iohn 101041 1 0.5 Dizcusaion with 13. Miller reyarding Comniitice tccting and go forward Y CT
wutk plan projecs.

Ciriveli. Juha 101641 1 24 Prepared hilling summary and workplan and sent to inlenal team for review

Cileichenhaus, Stuar 10717701 1 1] Review and edit of drall workplan for 5.0 linger

Ctivetti, John 10/17/01 1 1.0 Cumpketed workplan and sent to e Dallinger

Miller, David 10/19/01 1 0.4 Meeting witl J. Crrivetti reprarding information requests, lax memo and billing
PO,

Grivetii, John L1900 1 0.4 Meeting with 12 Miller regarding inlisrmation tequéste, fwx memo and hilling
PSS,

Miller, David LIZRAN | 0.2 Wwaork plan reviaw.

Van Vuren, [iik F1/0501 1 28 Revrpanized document tracking system - general corp. infos electranie

van vuren, Frik 11/06/0] 1 14 Preparation of docunwnat racking system « general corp. inlb: binders

Desc
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COMDLECO, INC.

EHMNET & YOUNG CORPORATE FIXANCRETIC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROURCT CODE

FRUFESSIONAL. _ _ DATE FCTH HCHRS
van Vuren, [k 1 LAF7AN | 0%
van Yuren, Erik 1105 ! 1.2
Van Vyeen, Frik 11/0040 ! 1.4
Vat Vurgn, Tk 11714401 1 Al
Van Vuren, Crik 1441 1 i
Choguette, Andrew 140 1 1.7
Choyuette, Andrew 11/14/01 1 1.8
Chuguenie, Androw 1171401 1 19
Choguette, Andrew 11/14/n | 1.6
Van Vuren, Erik 11541 1 2
Van Yuren, Erik 111541 1 1.9
Yan Yureh, Erik 11/15/01 t 12
Choquetta, Andrew 11/13/m 1 [ER-1
Chnguetle, Audiew t1/15/01 1 1.6
Chogjuetic, Andrew 11715/01 1 L&
Chuguetns, Andrew t1/15/1 L 14
Van Vuren, Erik 1171941 | 1.2
Miller, Navid 11724k ! 0.2
Yan Yurch, Brik 11/20/01 | 1.}
Yan Vuren, Erik 1 1726/01 1 2.1

FOR THE PERIOD JTLY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGLUST 12, 20

DESCRIFTION

Preapartion nf document wacking system - historical Bnancial infy: clectronic

Preparation of diecument racking syetem - hiseorical finuneial inlis: binders

Preparation of document tacking aysem - projected financial jnfe; cloctronie

Preparation of document travking system - projected financial iufe: binders

Preparation of ducument tracking system - leasing dats: clectionic

Continuily survives document library.

Preparation of docymeny library index.

Preparation of leasing data document libiaty

Preparation vt historical financial dara dpcument library.

Preaparation vl documont cracking system - keasing, data; binders

Piepatatoin of document tracking system - contnyity services data: elevtronic

Preparation of dacument tracking syaltit - continuity services data: binders

Preparation ol document library index.

Preparation ol weneral files for Comdisce document Jibrary.

Prupaation of the miscellanecos Cenudiseo document librory.

Prisparation of ventures dncument lbracy,

Preparation of decumenl ackiig sysem - ventures data: abeclronis

Oirgonizing workpaper Liles,

Preparationh of document tracking syaletn - ventures data: hinders

Prepaation of docnment tracking system - misc, data: electronic

Desc



Case 01-24795 D

103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered

_ 16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 31 of 267

LM DESEN, 1N
ERNST & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED Y PRIMECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGII AUGUST 12, 2002

PHOFESSIQNAL PCIY HOLURS DESCHIFTION

Van Yuren, Erik 1172701 1 2.4 Prepucation ot decument Iraeking system - misc. data: hinders

Van Vuren, Erik 1142801 | 1.t Proparation of decument tracking system - court motiuns: binbers

Choquette, Andrew 11429401 1 1.3 Additions o devusncit library.

Chesquette. Andrew 1142941 1 1.6 Addiuons 1o degument library including filed MOR.

Choquelte, Androw 1144040 | 1.2 Diocutieint ibrary adjustments.

Mitler, David 1240701 1 03 ‘T'elephong gnll ). Grivett regarding discussion of statuz of chrrent wark plan items
and additienal prejects.

Mibler, David 12407401 | o5 Working with I.. Pranco and A. Campbell reganding key igshes ang work plan
ohjertivas.

Grivetti, Iohn 12407401 ! .3 Telephone cull with D.Miller teparding disonssinn of status of current work plan
items end addilional prujcis.

Yan Vuren, Erik 121301 1 2.6 Transivuncd material to EYCF Atlanta

Wan Yurch. Etik 11401 1 4.4 “I'rangitipngd moterial to TY'CE Atlanta

Campbell, Keith /102 \ .5 I'vineuss results of Lnsecared Credilors myccting with team.

Grrivetti, John LA 1 0.4 Review aud vitit of wotk plan for an anatysis of ventures purlisliv and discusgiong
with L.Francu reparding 22,

Grivetti, Juhn D1/ 16 I 0.5 Proparation of work plans discussions regarding billing issucs,

Franco, Luis 0/1TA0R 1 0.5 Review of recent gourt filings for Comudisco.

Franco, Luis o1/17/02 1 B Heview of recent court filings for Comnlisce,

Franco, Luis 0172202 1 1.3 Review of recent Coniliseo news And histary, heginning prior w the liling o
TTesenl.

Grivetti, Juhn 01/28/02 1 1.4 Preparation ol woirkplan tor distriburion to 8.Dollinger.

Miller, Davil 020502 | 0.5 Discussion with J. Creivelti reparding Cnmmittee deliverables and nar wrin work
ntan.

Miller, David Q2/05/02 1 0% Review of analysis of EYCF deliverabler for Cithank.

Girivettt, fohm 02/0302 | 0.5 Diiscussion with [.Miller reparding Committes deliverables and niat tern work

plan.

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPURATE FINANCE LLE
DETATL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
ROR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2000 THIROUGH AUGLST 12, T2

PROFESSIONAL DATE a8 )] HOURS DESCRIPTION

Litiveii, John (207702 | 1.7 Revigwed and adited summary of work producesd o gend to Cithoni.

Miller, Duavid (52411702 1 0.5 Wwarking with 1.. Franca regarding preparation of package of finangial infarmation
for 5. Dollinger nf Citthank.

Kaecpke, Kathy 32/13/02 i 1.5 Preparation nf Comubisce corespoudenos,

Cirivetti, Jahn 02725/02 1 1.2 Preparatinn of internal staff reviews lin Comdizeo cnpagement.

Miller, [3ovid 231102 1 1.0 Meeting with L. Franve und J. Leas regarding work plan development and
infarmation requirsd.

Francn, [.uis 0711702 1 21 Creation ol work plan specifics bagsd on wpdate with Citibank.

Miller, David 031202 | 0.5 Working with L. Eranen ragarding work plan development and infurmalisn requests
propazatict,

Franew, Luls 0L DY 1 0.4 Rapwigw jtems o he completed including vonsulidativn of the cash flows presented
wirh the husiness plans and 5GaA.

L¢as, Jaglyn 03/12/02 1 1.2 Preparation of work plan and list ol infornation needed o complete analysis.

Miller, David 03/22/02 1 0.1 Discussion with L. Fxateo regarding revised work plan from Citibaok.

Miller, Dravid o¥zo/02 1 0.1 Telephone call to |.. Franco regarding status af diliganee and capital calla analysis.

Kospke, Kathy 03/27/02 1 10 Preparatinn of hilling informatian for Fee/Exponac Applicarion.

Miller, 17avid O4/03/02 1 0.3 Nigcussion with L. Franco regarding pleparation of trip report for Citibank und
meeting follow-up with Company,

Miller, Mravid 04/10/02 1 0.4 Meeting with L. Franco rigarding stwtus of claims analysis. Follow-up lom
diligence mucting and upeoming Creditnrs Committes meeting.

Miller, David U/12402 | 0.2 [Hacusaion with I.. Francn regarding his discussion with 5. Dellinger nn EVCE
arcas of work foens.

Miller, David (/1 G402 1 0.2 [Hgcusaion with 1. Franca regarding work plan statug and information request
SLatus.

Miller, Lyavid 04/1842 1 ‘4 Working with 1. Franco regarding work plan magkers.

Eranco, Liis 04/24/02 1 ol Update with [, Miller status DO and revicw of POR.

Cilcichenhaws, Styart 0541102 1 1.0 C:onference call with Creditor Commities sepgarding plan renrganization.

Franco, Luig 03/01/02 1 0.3 Loardination with Latham & Watkins repanding the filing of the signed and

niatarized mipplemental affidavit.

Desc



Case 01-24795 D

103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 6/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 33 of 267

COMDISCW, INC.
FRNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE L1.C
NDETAIL OF SERVICES REXDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH ANGUST 12, 1002

PROFESSIONAL DATE )] HOVRS DESCRIFTION

Franca, Luis DsAmAYE 1 .1 Follow-up on CEO/ Doard candidate recommendations.

Franco, Luix a1t 1 as Update ta . Dollinger and K. Hangon reparding progress on outstanding
information request items.

Miller, David 0343/02 1 0.2 I¥senssion with L. France regarding billing analysis and fubluw up work plan items.

Franuue, Luis 05/20:02 1 4 Ulpdate e-mail (v BY vsatn on Creditor Committee meeting,

Gleichenhaws. Stuatt Oi/01/02 1 1.0 Conference call with Creditors Committes regarding plan reorzanization.

Franco, Luis 060402 1 n.% Telephone calls with 8. Gleichenhans, T2, Kalfen, R. Sheninan, and M. Williams ta
determine level ol review of Austealia and New Zealanit operationz,

France, Luis 064042 1 5 Send e-muils utd Fod-Ex of recently filed DVS b prospective board members of

Comdise,

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINAKCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR TIIE FERIOD JULY 17, 2001 THROUGH ATUGHST 12, 2002

FROFESSIONAL DATE - FCD HOURS DESCRIFTION
Miller, David 0/ 1 102 1 L8] Telephone call tu L. Franvw regaiding wrapping up <ase work and billings.
Frangn, Lais D6/26/02 1 L& Call with Committee Counsel reparding E&Y Australio and work on Comudiscw

Australia Drafl subsequent s-mail 10 E&Y Augtrolia.

1 Total ur.h

Desc
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COWMDISCO, INC,
EHMST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
BETALL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERTOD JULY 17,2001 THROUGH AUGUST 11, 2002

FROFESSTONAL DATE P LY HOI RS DESCRIFTION

Van Yurem, Erik urzlin k 2.5 Review of financial data

Vian Vuren, Erik 27401 3 2.6 Keview of nperational‘orgunizational daw

Mustello, Audisy 075141 3 z Review of hankruptey molion docutnents and company provided dats Jor ciuployes
saveronce and retention plans.

Van Vurcn, Enik n&/06/01 k} 1.2 Analyzed oty charts und vther data 3ent hy Arthur Andersen

Gleichenbaus, Stuart A0 3 nx Reviewed deliverables list prepared by K. Mason and nnted additional itenis to be
jnclndad, discussinns with J. Qrivetti reparding same

ivetin, Joha 0E/O7/0) 3 [iX] Reviewed deliverablus list preparcd by R. Mason and noted additional items to be
included, discussions with 5 .Glgichenhauws regarding same

Cirivetti, John QB/D7/0] 3 1.1 Revivwed and analyzed data sent by Andersen

Vun Vuren, Erik OROT 0 3 0.4 Heviewed oty charts and other data sent by Arthur Andersen

Miller, David O8/20/01 3 1.0 Keview of varaus motions [iled by Debtors with Court

Mustilie, Audrey 08/22/01 3 1.6 Review of new docurewn(@ submitted hy client.

Girivetti, Iohn 093/23401 4 0.l Bavicwud case awbinary from R, Mason

Van Vuren, Erik DR27401 a 20 Analyze latest version of lease apc dent by Arthur Andersen on CD

Millat, David 053001 3 14 Review of Debtors prescolation to efficial Creditors' Comnitive

Gilaichenhans, Stuart o 1201 3 1.4 Review of recent Court filinps

Miller, Tiavid L1701 5 0.5 Revicw of Chebrors coyrt motions filed (exclusivity, EMU, property beases and bar
date)

Gleichenhaus, Sluart 09/24/01 3 0 Review of recent Court filings

Grivell, Juhi 09/24/01 3 2.2 Heview nof various items in Cordiaes )3ata Honm

Yan Vurcil, Erik (49/24/01 3 1.7 Collgcted and read various ilcms o Data Koom EYCF had not previously sect

Miller, David ag/z50l 3 o4 Review of recent Courd filings

van Vuren. Brik 092541 3 1.2 Review of documents vellested from Data Ronm on %24

Desc
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COMBISCU, IR,
FRNAT & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE TLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED Y PROJECT £0ODE
¥R THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGLUST 12, 2002

FROFESEIONAL DATE P HOURS NESCRIFTION
Miller, David 1101 3 0.2 [irafted e mails to EYCF group ecparding Creditors’ Committee meeting.
Miller, David 1o/l Al 3 18 Review of stabemenls and schedulos,
Miller. Lravid 1040541 3 0.2 Review of Deblors’ filed cour mations

Cleichenhaud, Stwart 10/08/01 3 1 Review of varivus mutions o e 60Ut

Millcy, David 10/08/01 k] 0.4 Review of varivus court pleadings.

Grriverei, John 10/10/0L a 16 Reviewed linanvial information from the Committee packaye prescited 1074, as
revised

Miller, David 1072240 3 0.5 Review of various Dehtor matians regarding real property lesses, filing of hank

claima and sertlement of landlord claims.

Miller, David 1Az k] 0.2 Heview of mations regarding approval of inletcompany transactions.
Fakzonc, Micholag 10/31/01 3 ot Review o case materials noveivid during Creditors meeting.
Grivexti, John 11/02/01 A 2.4 Review inluriatioi reecived ar commitize mesting, including beasing buginess

plans aud e propoged inwernational finance structure

Miller, Diavid Tt 3 1.5 Heview of Nebtor's presentation rewarding Conunines mesfing.

Miller, David 1/12/01 3 32 Mue diligence follow up.

Urivetw, John 11/13/01 3 0.2 Reviewed memo regarding Lcadquarters project

Camphell, X eith 12/03/01 3 1.5 Beview unscourcd creditors nweting presentation dared August 21, 2001,

Camphet], Keith 12603401 3 25 Regearch potential lease financing altermatives.

Campbed], Keith 121041 3 ] Review the master request list and comespondence begween E&Y, Debtor and
Committes,

Campbll, Keith 1212001 3 1.8 Raview previous workplans and preacitations prepared for Linsecured Creditors
Cnmmittes,

Miller, Dravid 12¢18/01 k] 0.5 Peeview of Lazard analysis of lcasing, auction.

Cinaveti, John /0802 k] 0.7 Review af revently roetived Movenber weskly cash flows.

France, Laig 010902 3 [T Review nf recently received Wowemnber weekly cash flows.

Desc
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COMDESCD, 1N
ERNET & YOUNG CORPURATE FINANCE TLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENLIERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR TIIE PERIOD JULY 27, Hill THROUGH ATIGUST 12,2002

PROFESSIONAT. DATE PCD HOURS DESCRIFTION "

Camphel], Keith 01/09/02 1 1.9 Summarize Arthur Aidersen responses to Tirece SGEA yueslins, goncrals
additivaat folluw up questions ingluding review nf &9/01 cetention and soveranee
arder.

Pranca, Luis 0111402 k] 0.8 Review vl maleiial presenisd at Committer meeting on 1/5/02,

Franca, [.uis alnz k] .5 Review vl objectin 1 U0 mation ta sl L_P. partnership agrsements without
further courd approval,

Cirivetti, John /14402 k] 1% Anatyeed filsd 10-K,

Prancu, Luis 9111402 3 1.3 Bead and seview recently filed (0K

Cinivewd, John D162 h] 0.7 Reviewed lmest [.ozard analysis and Company presentation to the Committes.

Franci, Lwig 01/16/02 3 1.4 Feview of current divestiture analysis as prepared by 1.avard and Management's
preseniatinn to the Committee.

Crrivetti, John 01/17/02 3 0.4 Review of recent court filings for Comdisee.

Miller, David B1/153/62 3 0.3 Review of prescnlation to Ciediters' Committee.

Miller, David (e FF R ) 0.5 Review of Company's SG&A analysis.

France, Lia 01/23/02 3 2.3 Hoview of recently received purchiase ggrecinent schedules for sales of electronics
and lab & science verticals to GE.
1iseussinn with angagement team W deleuning work plan regording purchase price
allocation to contracts at foreign subsidiarics,

Grivelti, Julin or/amz ) 0.5 Huvicw of recently filed bankruptey schedules

Miller, Lavid 01/31/02 a (Y Review of year end Farm 10-K (iling.

Franci, Luis 2/01/02 kS 1.1 Review vl recent courl motiona invalving Bank of Tokyo - Mitsubishi aid Mellon
Bank L Set-O60 wpeainat prepetition amounts owed.

Pranco, 1uis 02i05/02 5 [ Review vl revontly filed oun motinns.

Franco, Luiy A B0L 3 1.7 Rurwicw of documents recaived fraom the Company.

Francw, Luis AX 1302 3 14 Review of newly received files, including vali with Arthur Anderson reyarding
determination of lzase tape detail and reconciliation,

Franeo, Luis 02714402 3 1.7 Heview of newly received documents and files, Files sent tn ].avard.

Franva, Luis (2702 3 2.5 Review of recently received ventuzes in lommaliun,

Frunta, Luis (13/04/02 3 1.6 Review of presenegtion to the Rquity Cummiltee.

Desc
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FRNAT & YOUNG CORPUORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED #Y FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, T0H THHROLUGH ATIGUST 12, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE T IIOURE DESCIIFTION

Franco, Luis 0L 3 2.3 Netailed review ol prescatation digtributed for the March 7, 2002 Linsecured
{reditor's meelings.

t.gos, Jaclyn sz k] 21 Review of cash flow and S(HEA old and new runoff plans.

Miller, Duvid D3 18:02 k| 0.4 Review ol prelinanary Lazasd voluation analysis.

Franca, Luis IR k! 1.9 Review recently naceived infarmation fram March 19, 206 1 Committes meeting.

Miller, David 03/25/02 3 0.9 Review ol copy ol appendix to Commiiter presentalion given by Debtors to
Committer.

Miller, David 03/25/02 3 09 Review ol vopy of preseniation given by Deblors to Coibminge.

Fratco. Luis Q3/26/02 3 L& Review of recently filed court motivns incloding lease and contract rejestion on
spreificd properties.

Franco, Tuis 03263 3 1.3 Review nf recently received presentation 10 the Creditors” Committee oft March
19th.

Franca, Luis w3202 3 L& Review of March 14, 2001 Creditors Commidtee prescitation and review recently
received infunnation,

Francu, Luis 04/08/02 3 1.5 Review of recently filed motinns by the Dublor, Lease rejection natices, extensiun
of s 16 131c and selicit vates, sale ol assel in Logan, N

Franen, [ uis D92 3 .2 Raview af recently filed mativas, including racent asset sale aprecitients and
motioms pertaining to the sale of the Haaltheare verticud and he Australia and New
Zealand businesses.

Franen, 1.uis /1102 3 12 Raview tecently received presenmation hoak for Creditury’ Colbnittes meeting.

Miller, David 04/12/02 3 a1 Peeview of tax ruling reparding lease stripping clains,

Miller, David 04/12/02 k] 1 Review ol FOR amicles.

Frageo, Luis 04/23:02 A 1.5 Heview newly filed court mations and tews, inzluding extension ol of poriod 1o file
and eolicit aceptance.

Franca, [Luis 0426402 3 0.5 Heview of recent announvenwnd regarding filing nf Company's MOR,

Miller, Pavid 5L 3 0z Review of inlommation reparding intemational recapitalicaiton.

Franen, Luis DSARIAYE 3 0.4 Review af newly received inaterial on valuation/recovencs and KERP.

France, Luis OS2 3 [ Reeview af recently filed soutt motinns.

Francn, Luis DalRsE 3 0.5 Review of recently liled third ompihus nhjection and other (lings.

Desc
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COMDISCO, 1N,
ERNST & VOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

FROFESRTONNAL DATE FLLY ITOURS DESCRIFMTION

Miller, David 0571902 E 14 Review ol varioug conrt fled documias regirding plan confiemation.

3 Taeal 7.4

Desc



Case 01-24795 D 103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 4Q/16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 40 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.
FRMAT & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLL
PETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THFE PERTOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2082

PROFESSTIONAL _ _ DATE FCD HOURS BESCRIPTION

Gleichenhaus, Stuan /249411 4 1.2 Discuagion with J. Grivetti and representatives ol Deulsehe Bank regarding case
stalug and Comdisgo financial structure at filing

Grivewi, Juhn 13/ 2%:01 4 1.2 Drizeuagion with 3. Gleichenhaas and representatves of Deatsche Bank regarding
cage statuz and Comdisen financial sructure at liling

tilcichenhaus, Stuart DR300 4 2.4 {reneral communications with unsecwied creditors

Miller, Dravid (1 T 4 0.2 Telephone call with &, Stape of Lehman Brus, regarding bid deadlines and asset
salen

Grivetli, John (972101 4 0.7 Diigenssion with Jed Hart of Angelo Gordon, 3 Comdiseo hendholder regarding
ca5e stotus

Yan Voreh, Bk 10/02/01 4 8] Coordinated schedules between EYCF, E&Y L1.F and Lazard in preparation for

Creditnr's meeting on 10/4/01

Van Vuren, Erik 100301 4 2.0 Coordinated shedlea botwegn BYCF, E&Y LLP and Lazard in pregaration for
Creditor's neeting an K340

Van Vuren, Enk 1{HN3AN 4 21 Diseugsed pew prigrities with Eazard and AA liollowing e Creditor's meeting

Miller, Dravid 10/05/01 4 o4 Telephane eall tn P. Martin regarding chaples 11 ¢a3¢ status.

Millgr, Mavid 10410/01 4 0.3 Telephane vall t J. Bevry of Lehman Rrothers regarding hankruptey status,

Milker, Dravid /13401 4 a4 Telephone ealk to ). Seery regarding services sale v Sunpard,

Miller, David 11150 4 0.2 Tedephone enll with 5. Rtagg regarding Sungard avyuizition and leasing sales.

Milluz, Lvavid 17 15/01 4 0.6 wprking with T Stein regarding questivns on AJK, mates reeeivable ond other pssets
detail.

Miller, [ravid 11/20/01 4 0.3 Telephane call with I. Svery repacding leasing auction status.

Miller, David 1283401 4 0.3 Telephine call with §. Hart regarding Dehtors financial schedules filed with the:
ok,

Grivetl, Jubn namz 4 1.7 Dristcuzdions with various bondholders regarding filed 10K and ihe relaesd financial
tesuits.

Miller, Cavid N1/24402 4 05 ‘Telephene call with &G, Madigan regarding Movember financial and cash balance.

Girivetti, Julin 03102 4 1.1 Digcuagions with 1. Takin and G. Hunter reganding € ondisee Furnpean stracture

atd curreed gase status.

Criveud, John 020702 4 1.3 13isgussinns with M. Ferko regarding vase stalud,

Miltor, David K 1302 4 2.3 wlogting with £ Girivetti and L. Franco regarding information received.

Desc
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COMDESCO, INC,

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICER RENDERED BEY PRUOJECT CODF
FOR THE PERICHY JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

PROFESSIONAL __DATE FCL HOTRS DESCRIPTION

Girpvedti, John 02/13412 4 0.3 Mocting with Ty, Milker and L. Franco regarding inforination received.

Miller, David 02,2002 4 0.3 Tohephome calt with J. Brecker regarding ¢ase siatus and rentganization aptions.

Mibler, David D32 4 0.3 ‘Telephone call I. Mallock und A. Chronie segarding meeting with Diebtor and
ACCOUNTING questions.

Miller, David 32 4 0.1 ‘Telephone call 5. Daollinger regarding atendees fior meeting with Campuny vn
March Tth.

Miller, David 034114052 4 0.3 5end e-mail to . Dollinger (Citibank) regarding EYCT updated work plan,

Miller, David 0.4/12/02 4 i1 F-mail 1o 8. Dollingur ieparding economic stimulus package and poteitial tax
refunds.

Franco, Luis 03/14/02 4 1.2 Conversations with J, Dakin of Royal Bank of Bcotland regmding infonmation he is
seeking un claiing,

Miller, 11avid 0a3/18/02 F! 0.3 Teleplhane call . Iakin {Royal Bank of Scutland) regarding [azord valuatien
paramcters and claims analysis.

Miller, Dravid 0az0K2 4 [} Send e-mail to 5. Dollinger regmding work plans.

Prancu, Luis 0322002 4 07 Call with C. Swan ol Hybridge Capital regarding miscellancous peneral company
questions.

Milter, David 012302 4 0.1 Dirafl e-mails to 8§, Lollinger reparding tax mesting.

Miller, David 23/23/01 4 al Drrall c-imila 10 5. nllinger regarding work plan changes,

Francn, 1.uis 032702 4 1.0 Crearion of list and e-mail of walcrials 1 be received from R. Mishler. Respond 1w
M. Fodawitz regarding revicw ol Company CE plan.

Francw, Luis 03/28/02 4 w7 Conversalion with |, Madigan, of IFMorgan regarding debt

Francw, Luia 04/01/02 4 0.5 LUpdats with . Bollinger regarding items to be discussed sl meeting with Company.
LIpdate with Lazaid reparding items identified by 8. Dollinget,

Franeo, Luis 04/03/02 4 0.6 Ligh leve] upsdate with 5. Dallinger on meeting cvens,

Miller, David 04/0%/03 4 0.2 ‘Lelephaone coll to TE Park reparding qucstions an January 2002 operating repuil,

Franca, Luis G4 4 13 Revigw of 2nd comrectiuns to updaled Tip Repaort based an comments by L, Milier.

Miller, Lxavid 04/10/02 4 ol Telephone call to P. Martin regarding case status.

Franco, Luis 04/10/02 4 1.2 Cunvetsalions with 1. Hort, A. Gordon and ©. Swan, Hybridpe Capital reganding

various peneral questions regarding Conidisco, such a2 the quality of CDO'% 1T
nfragtrieturs and the expecied tax relind.
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COMDTRCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
BETAN. OF AERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT COBE
FOH THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2000 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

P HOURE DESCRIPTION

Miller, David

Francu, Luis

Franco, Luis

Francw, Luis

Francw, Luis

Franco, Luis

Framuw, Luiz

Franca, Luis

Miller, Duvid

Franco, Luiz

Millia, David

Francn, Luis

Franca, Luix

Franve, Luis

Miller, Lyavid

Franco, 1.uis

Trancoe, Luix

Franco, Luis

Miller, Navid

Pranco, Luts

0a/11/02

04/12/02

D402

04/ 19/02

O 14402

/2302

/25402

D423

D/ 29002

0/ 29:G2

0a/30/02

D512

0%maz

05/01/02

05/06/02

as06a/02

050602

Q5A)7H02

05/08/02

Q348102

& 12

4 L)
4 06
4 .5
L] 141
4 2
+ 3
4 G.5
4 ol
4 1.2
4 0.4
4 11
4 a7
+ a7
4 {2
4 0.8
4 0.6
4 0.5
4 0.3
4 0.5

Telephnne call wn I. Genachowski regatditis ¢4s¢ stas.

Conference call with 3. Doltinger for ypdare om open items and follow-up email
gonfirming understamiling of outstanding, iteme to be addressed.

Cpnference coll with 8. Dollinger v discusg recent evenis ond go farward strategy
reparding taxes,

Comversation with C. Swan of Hybridpe Copital reyarding plan filing and roeent
svents.

Conversation with I. Daykin ol KBS regarding foreign cash Hows and projicd
cash hatance.

Preparation of e-niail updute 0 5. Dollinger regarding conversation with J. Daykin
af Rayal Bank vl Scutland,

Mallow-up e-mail to R. Hanson reprrding open issues and progruss,

Conforenes rall with C. Suan of ybridge capital eparding expecesd or potential
clning .

Telephone call to P. Martin regarding disclosure siatement questions.

Contierence valls with variows Ungegured Creditors reganling MOR.,

Telephone call to G, Madipan reparding questions n disclosare stalacit,

Conlerenee ealla with various 1nsecured Credilors seeking ealenlation of 87 cents
catimared payour to | Insecared Creditors and other quegtions regarding POR.

Explanatinn of and faxed memo 1o Connnines working group of the Company's 87
cent recovery calculation.

Review af and respunse 1o Luthan & Watkins regarding discrepancies i Company'a
Tnwer estimated cash balanee.

Telephene call with Silver Stone Capital regarding questions on digclosure

staiement

Telephone ¢alls with €10 hondholders.

Lraft of ¢-mail to B Hanson and 5. Dollinger reparding cose sohas.

Teleplvane galls with CTChomlholders.

Tulephons call to P. Martin regording claims recovery caleulations.

‘Telephong galls with CTC hond holders.

Desc
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COMDIZCO, INC.
RRNAT & VOING CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
ETAIL OF RERVICES RENDERED BY FROJKCT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THIROUGH AUGLUST 12, 2002

FROFESSIONAL DATE MDD 1IOURS DESCRIFTION

Franco, Luig DS/0W02 4 LK Cnnference calk with CD0 bumdboldere,

Franco, Luis 05710/02 4 1.7 Conference calls with CDC bondbiolds,

Miller, David 0541 302 ] 2 C:ommunications with 11, Kepnur, 5, Dollinger and K. Hanson regarding Prism
related analysis questions.

Frango, Luig 05/13/02 4 1.0 Conference calls with CO bondholdars.

Frato, Luja 05/16/02 4 0.5 Calts with Comdiseo bond holders.

Franga, 115 Q5/21/02 4 n.7 Conference vall with new CLIO bondholders.

Frangn, Luis Q5/22/02 4 0.7 Upidate call with CLC bondholders.

Franc, Luss U5/29402 4 05 ‘Talephone calls with C DO bondhelday and Hybidpe Capiral,

Franco, Lyis 05/30402 4 .5 Conference cull with CDO bondholders snd CSFR.

Franca, Lais 06/03/02 4 0.3 Telephone call with J, Swin from Gordan Asset Management reganding, Company's
amnended DVS aml plan,

Franen, Tuis 06404/02 4 0.5 Telephune catl with J. Madigan fram Morgan Stanley and O Shaket from CSFR
regarding iecently amended /5 and plan.

Francu, Luis OR/O8/02 4 0.2 {anference call with C3FD bonholder ceparding questions.

Franc, Lwis 08/08/02 3 0.2 Conference ¢ all with CSFB bondbolder regarding case questions.

Miller, [avid 03/19/02 4 a.l Fallow up on calls from FFM regarding distributions timing

Miller, David D¥/21/02 4 02 Drat? c-inail o K. Thomton regarding updates.

4 Tutal 44.2

Desc
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COMDISCD, 1IN,
ERNAT & VOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERTIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUICH AUGUST 12, 2007

FROFESSICRVAL DATE FC e HOURS DESCRIFTION

Mustello, Audrey R0 5 4 Preparation of drall data request for the employer retention plana and exestive
employment contraclks

Kalfen, Donald HAIRKY 5 0 Drafied employee wichtion plan and employment conteact infarmation request

Girivetti, Jahn nA0R01 5 1.4 Sent mema W R, Magen reparding current state ol due diligence process and data
TEquests

Grivet, John 0E/08/0 5 2l Reviewed and edited dota raquest for mivnwation regarding retention plans and

execulive citployment gontracts

Mastellu, Audroy OROE01 5 0.4 Revisiony w data request

Grivetti, Jubn 08/0/01 5 25 Preparation of infermation request lists, including discugsions with K. Krakora vl
Andersen and pote o 12 Aronson regarding eoordinarion of requests

Choguetie, Andrew 0B/DR/D] 5 35 Preparaiéon of dociuments sent b C. Forang {Wachtell) and D. Aronson (Lasand)

Gileichenhaus, Stuan (81001 5 X Review and wdit ¢f due diligence dota request st and meno ta M. Fazio regarding
same

Miller, David g/ 1001 5 0.2 Review J. Grevells 1equest lists for due diligence

Grivetu, John o3/ 10/01 B 23 Proparatien of doe diligence daw request ligt and memo to M. Tazio reganding sam

Cirivetti, John 0811501 5 2.1 Proparation of note to . Perlman of Skadden regarding due diligenoc ioguists

Van Vuren, Erik 09/0501 5 1.5 Request list and uther cosrespandence and commumcation 1o Commitiee and Arthur
Amnilersen

Griveli, Juln 0%/06/01 5 0.8 Prepared sumsmany uf desail and infarmation requested and sat yet received from the

deblor and Jerwarded to Sue Dollinger

Van Vuieh. Erik 09/06/01 4 0.7 Discuasion with Arthur Andersen professionads reparding related to reguest list
v
Grivetti, John 09:07/1 5 1.2 Keviewed debtor data room imdex and prepared st of information L reguest and

timctalsle for the next week's visit 1y the daiy ropm

Van Vuren, Erik w001 5 1.4 Triscussinn with Anhur Anderaen professional regarding relaied to request list iiems

Krop, Andrew 09/17/0t 5 1.0 Prepared list ol required data from Skadden Arps

Grivetti, Fohn OR/20/D 1 5 [1}] Reviewed latest requisat bist symmary and sent memu o 5, Lollinger and R. Masen
. regarding same

Girivetti, John N0/ 5 0,2 Niscussion with 8. Dulliper reparding request lists and curiénl GRS BatIs

Van Vuren, Erik (/200 5 Ea| Preparation ol outstandiny items for Arthur Andersun and Creditor Commicee

Desc
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COMDISC0, INC,

ERMST & YOUNG CORPORATE FIRANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERYICES RENDERED HY FROUECT CODE
FOR THE PERICGD TUILY 27,2001 THROUGH ATIGCEST 12, 2002

Yao Yuren, Frik

Miller, David

Van Yuren, Frik

Chogquette, Andrew

Miller, Navid

Gleichenhaus, Stuart

Choquelts, Andiew

Chaquette, Andrew

Choquette, Andrew

Chogquette, Andrew

Gleichenhaus, Suart

Glvichenhaua, Stoart

Cirivefti, Inkmn

Grivetii, John

Millar, David

Van Yurci, Erik

Cirvetliy, John

Ginivedti, John

Millar, David

van varen, Frik

DATE PLCIY HOURS DESCRIPT LN

0%/21:401 5 1.0 Digcnssion with Arthur Anderson professionals regarding international financial
slatements (Meaxico, Austria)

0%/25/01 H 0.4 Review of status reports o finaneial due diligence

D9/25/01 5 2.9 preporation of reguest bisl,

QRN 5 2.7 Eniry and recurding of pew decuments ta lbrary

ORZ90] 5 0.2 Heview of latest information sequest and eommunications from Cifthank

1201 5 1.1 Review and ecit of proposad lisr of analyses to be mulwled in the manthly operating
repurt tu be senl 10 the Creditor commities

10/03/01 5 23 Review dnd revise monthly nperating report requgsr.

1/ 03/01 i 1.3 Review and revise library additions and individual vertical plans,

10/03/01 5 21 Review and revise univapital menthly cperating report.

pE T 5 21 Review tocurmcnt kibrary review for requested imaterials,

W13/ 5 0.6 Review and it of updated Tist of analyses to be incfuded in the manthly vporali
repurl

10/18:01 5 1.3 Review of letter tn N.Dlake nopanding informotion requests and digcasgions with
S, Lollinger regarding sume

19/13A01 H 1.4 K eviewad request Jist fur the ponthly operating report fioit he Dehtor and
forwarded w 5. Dellingc

171540 5 1.1 Reviewed deafl Jotter from S.Dollinger ta Debior mangjzement and provided
comments sugpstions

10/19/01 5 0.z Review and revise denier ta M. Bloke regarding infisrmation requests.

10/30/01 h] 0.5 Coninunieation with AA regarding ouistanding request iteny

11/06/01 5 1.2 Discusaion with 5.Dollinger reparding informatinon received lrom e Lichtor at the
colmmittes meeting and further mfarniation requests to make 10 the Debtor's
repreaentatives and preparativn of a list of requests

11/0641 5 0.2 Digcnssion with K. Krakora rogaeding informatinon requests and set up of 13/7
colference call regarding sume

1LAATHH 3 0.2 Ruview of infarmation requests detailz,

11/07/01 5 1.6 Disenssions with D.Miller, ,Givetti, and K.Xrakora and G.3mith fiom Andersen

teparding information requust and currgnt case statuy

Desc
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COMINSCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENTERED BY PROJELCT CODE
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FROFESSLONAL DATE PCD HOLURS " DESCRIFYION

Girivesti, Jahn 114841 5 Il Rovicwed and edited the kuest summary nfall vl'vur informarion request lists and
sunnpary of U177 conversativns with Andersen

Van Vuren, Erik L1101 5 0.9 Propared updated reyuust lisc for AA

Chagquette, Andrew 11/1201 5 1.2 Taeparation nf outstanding request list items to be subntitted to Creditor's
Cuminities.

Girivetti, John 11413/01 4 04 Reviewed latest request ligl summary

Choquette, Andicw 11713401 A 1.8 Anatysis of previous request lists for accuracy of current request list for subiinigsion
to £ reditor’s Committee,

Yun Vuren, Erik 11/14/01 5 2.4 Erepared request lial history

Van Vuren, Frik 11714/} 5 2.5 Preprared analysis showing haw respoigive the Company/advisors have heen
regurling EYCF request lsts

Van Vuren, Erik 1501 5 1.7 Discusaed request list histury and the Company's rexpomsiveness with Sae Dullinger
and the EY team and edivsd analysis as apprapriule

Williams, Michaul 1601 5 0.5 Diafted information cequest list for taxes

Miller, David 1171601 5 a3 Working with J. Grivetti and T.. van Vuren teparding sending of infonnation
Tequests.

Griverti, John 11/16401 5 11 Prepared -bail 1 h. Tazio regarding information request statug and reviewed and
ediled analyaia of previous and vurrent requests far attachment

Miller, David 11/26/1 5 0.3 Review of information [rom Citibonk regarding Debtor responses o diligoae:
[ CquUeens.

Miller, David 12/04/01 5 a2 Heview of Debtur responacs in information roquests.

Miller, David 12/07/01 ] L4 Send e-nialls 10 Citibank and Lazard regarding ndditional inlomuation requests far
leasing business plang and Ventures dala,

Miller, Lavid 12/08/01 5 0.2 Drralt and send e-mail to Mishler egarding husiness plan diligence request.

Millar, David 1210/01 5 0.l send e-mail in R, Mishler 1eparding diligence meeting,

Miller, David 12/10/01 3 0.2 working with EYCF watn regarding, information requests.

Van Yuren, Erik 12/10/01 b [ Crented SOG&A Tequest [ist for Andersen.

Chnquette, Andeow 1241041 5 1.3 Diewment preparation.

Choquette, Andrew 1211101 3 16 Preparatinn of docurneats for library, additivns o index.

Desc
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Choquatte, Andrew 1271201 5 3.3 Preparation of summary nf vantagepoinl voulure pathers L. P agresment for Atlanta
team.

Chaoquette, Andrew 12/12401 5 1.5 Capying moterials for personmel in Atlanta.

{hoquatte, Andrew 121301 5 1.% Additions tn dacument library, mdex.

Miller, Travid 12714401 5 0.4 Warking with J. Griveni and L. Franvo regarding requests for SG&A data and
information on foreign debt.

Girivetti, John 12114/01 5 n.4 Assisted D.Miller and L. Franca regading, requeats for SG&A daa and information
an foreign deht

manco, Euis l1/212 5 0.5 Preparation of work plan {ur an analysis of ventures portfolia,

Grivitli, Juhn 302 5 0.4 Riwicw atd ¢dit of wark plan for on analysis of ventures purtiislio,

Miller, Lavid /15402 5 0o working with 1. Grivetti and .. France regarding inlonmation requets and
diligenee program.

Giriverti, John o1/1542 5 0.9 Iigeussinm with Tn.Miller and L. Franve regandiog inforation requests and
dilipence program.

Girivetti, John 01715402 5 0.7 Tidit of cash flow yuestion Tist k be prescnted to the company.

Frandn, Luis at/15/02 5 1.0 Creation and compilotion of request list to be submitted. Review of prior request
Tis1s b Fncorporate previausly requested iterns that have nut yel been ceocived,

Frapeo, Lus ol/15/02 ] n.a Review and revise recent information request list.

Francn, Luis RIGER 5 1.1 Creation and compilation of request List b be 2ubinitied. Beview of priar request
lists tn incorporate previously toquested inems thar have net yet heen received.

[ranco, Luis a1/1642 H 0.6 Review and revise most rocenl request list.

Millet, David [HEY ) 3 1.1 Working with L. Franco and ). Grivetti regarding updated master requast list,

iriventi, John at/18/02 3 1.1 Digcusaiong with (.. Fronce and D Miller regarding updated masit toquest list.

Franco, Luis 0118402 b1 07 Heview and revise information request dated January 18, 2002

Franan, 1.uis 01721402 5 1.1 Praparatinn for and participation in conlorone: call with K. Krakora of Arthur
Andersen reparding review nf information requcst s data Lan. 1%, 2002,

Miller, Travid 01/23402 5 4 Waorkinyg with I. Grivewi and L. Franco fegasding Committes requests for asset sale
data.

Cirivesti, John 01/23:02 5 0.4 Working with Tr.Miller and L. Franvo repgarding Connnites reqaests for nmeet sale

dota.
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Orivedi, Johin 01/2%/02 5 1.5 [pdate from Arthur Andersen reparding infarmation request list.

Franco, Luig Ni/2502 5 [ lipdate fram Arthur Anderson regarding infarmation requesi provided on Jan. 18,
and updacs 1n Conmittee members on progeess,

Millet, Dravid 0/30/02 5 i1 {pdate with L. Francu regarding status of information requests.

Frand, Loia 0201702 5 1% Review of information request aml update ¢-tnail to key Committee members.

Ciriveni, John D2DE/02 5 0.6 Reviewer and edited roquest gl reparding SC&A projections.

Franen, 1.uis DH/BE/02 b 0.7 Editing of request list dated Feb. &, 2002 and submissinn t Commitiee fur
comments.

Cirivetti, John Dzin7/n2 3 1.0 Propated infarmarion request lists and forwarded 1o 8. Dollinger,

Grivetti, Juhn 0TI H |13 Prepared informarinn request lists and firwarded 1o 5. ollinper.

Cigevetti, Joho 02A08/02 5 (2.9 Reviewed 5.Dallinger vormononts, cdited lavest request lists, and forwarded o R.
Mishler.

Cirivetti, Inhn 02/08/02 i 12 Reviewed 5.Dolliger commenrs, edited latest request Lists, and lorwarded 10 K.
Mishlcr. '

Grivetti, Juho 02i11/02 H 09 Preparatinn for and participation in conlvienes call with B.Mishler regarding our
ventures request list

Franvo, Luis a2/12/02 5 [HE Updoted information request aod received master list.

Criveiti, John a2/14/02 1) 1.4 Preparation of e-mail 1o B.Mishlet reparding administrative requests around the
munthly infurmiation package.

Frangn, T.uis 02/14/02 5 18 Assembly ol casc aterinla for 5. Dollinger.

Grivetti, Juhn Q212012 5 1.5 Distussiona with Andersen team regarding oulstanding iiems and formularien of
neal request list

France, Luis Q226402 5 1.5 Comversation with Arthur Andersen (ean sizatding ovtstending items and
formulation of next request lisl.

Franco, Luig 02/28/02 5 Lh Reconciliation of recently recwivied vintores infarmation with request list dated Feb.
#. Revisions tn master requust Tist,

Franco, Luis 03/05/02 5 0.5 Preparation of e-mail request for detail on specific ibems in the claims analysis.

Frante, Luiz 03/06/02 5 ol Conference call with Arthur Anceiaon team regarding request for specific claims
analysis information to be proscated at Credinors' Commirtee meeting.

France, Luiz QY1102 5 1.6 Preparation of information request based on work plan
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Lcas, Jaclyn D3/11/02 5 1.5 Reviswinl ropant dated March 7, 2002 "OtTivial Commitiee of Unsecured Creditins”
t patlicipate in developing 2 work plan 2ud develap o list of informativn requests,

Franca, Luis 03/12/02 4 15 Completion of work plan, including ity necded and 1w be eompleted by week's
il

Franco, | uis 03/1202 5 1.2 Lhgeuasiona with Lazard regarting, sevivw of wirk plan and information tems e by
requested and omendment of ity 10 be (queaied.

Mibler, Dravid 03/13/02 5 0.3 [Macusgions with L. France regarding stans of information requests and tollow op
calls.

Frange, | nis 03/13K02 5 0.7 Pdiscusgion and completion ol inlumialion requests pet dialogue with Lazatd,

Francn, [ uis o213 5 2.6 Preparatian for and partivipation in confergnce coll with Company aud Arthur
Anderson an information reyuest sent the wesk of 341602,

Francw, Luly 03722402 5 PR Prepanation of sunkmary of eqll with the Company vn 321402,

Franen, Luis DI/26/02 5 1.2 Summarizatios of calls with company on tnformation request, covering financials,
claims, cic,

Franca, Liis 03/26/02 3 10 Summarization of calls with compatty oil infennation request, covecing linancials,
clpingg, ata.

Miller, David o402 E 03 Review and approve diligeney request and meeting questions.

Framue, Luis 04/ 1 0#02 s 1.5 Updated master information request list file o include miost rEgent requests and
informalion reesived.

Franco., Lyig 0411402 3 0.3 Fullow-up with §. Doblinger regarding infurmation to be requested from the
Cormipany.

Francn, [uis D162 5 0.5 Breparation of information requust 1 K, Mighler based on previows mecling and
recent gomversation with Do Kalfen reparding the compensation analysis,

Franco, Luis D4/ 150 H 0.6 Conference call with L. Cochran o discuas recently sahmitted list,

France, Luiy (4/24/02 5 [ Follow-up call with L, Cochiran of D0 regarding status ol ilems previously
requested and cuntact peraan for hitling inquiries.

Franco, Luis 04730102 b 0.3 Drall of e-mail regarding progress towards infounation received in satistaction of
infurreradion 1] uesNs.

Franco, [ uis 05/01/02 i 0.8 Conference opll with Arthar Andevson iegarding Company estimated cash o
unserurcd ereditors nf 57 cents amd vther questions, inelding explanation of
Exhibil F-1,

Franes, Lyis 05/14/02 5 0.5 Update call with J. Seiametta on outstanding, Information requests.

Frango, Lyia 05/17:402 k) 0.5 Updale wah aitd resehedule of call with ). Sciameia,

5 Total 3
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Gleichenhaus, Stuart E/01/01 o 32 Reviewed varivus analyses reparding valuation and related maners
Gleichenbaus, Stuart 0RO [ 1.5 ariais discussions with 5. Dollinger and review ol analyses regarding Valuation
A related matters
Miller, David 08/02/01 [ o4 Heview of various valualinn analyses
Cleichenhans, Shart 0303411 & 2.0 Reviewed vatious analyses regarding valuation and related matters
Gleichenhaws, Stuart DE/Q50L 6 30 Reviewed varivuy analyses reparding valustion and relaed matiers
Gleichenhang, Suart OB/0&/M & 3.4 Reviewed various analyses regarding valuation snd related matlers
tilcichenhons, Stuarl arAITAN [3 a3 Reviewed varions analyses reygarding valuation and related matcra
Grivetri, Juhin 02/07401 3 [} Aceumlated and analyzed cwrment Debtor bond Gading levels to assistin evilualiog
enrrent value of Deblor aascts
Gleichenhaus, Stuart 08/03/01 & 0.7 Reviewad varivus anatyses regarding valuation and related maiters
Glzichenhaus, Stuart O§/10/01 [} 1.7 Rueviewod varions analyses regarding valwation and related maters
Cileighenhaus, Stuart w241 [3 A0 Reviewed varions analyses repacding vahaation and relaled matsrs
Chogquelte, Andrew 0g/21/01 23 38 Analysis and coropasison of McKinsey and EYCA valuations
Gleichenhans, Stuart D820 § 2.3 Reviewed varivus analyses regarding valuation and ralated matters
Gileichenhans, Stuart OB/23/01 & 149 Reviewed varions anatyses regardimg valwation and related matters
(fleichenhaus, Sluarl (20 [3 08 Favicwed variaus analyses repaiding valnation and relaied matiers
Gleichenbiaus, Sman 03/30411 & 1.5 Reviewed varivus analyses regarding valuation and related matters
Gleichenbaas, Stusrt 0831401 6 1.9 Reviewed various aitalyses reparding valuation and refared matiers
Gleichenbaog, Stuart Q901 [ 1.4 Reviewed various aoalyaea regarding valwation and related matters
(leichenhaus, Sluart 10/ 10401 i 28 Reviewed various analyscs repanding valuation and related matiers
Gleichenhaus, Smant 1412401 & 1.6 Reviewed varivus analyses regarding valuation and related matters
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_ PROFESSIONAL PATE._ __ FCD HULRS UESCRIPTION -
Gleichenhaus, Styart 10715401 & t.8 Reviewud varioua analyses regarding valuation and relaiad matters

Gileichenhavs, Stuart 117401 i ] Revitwed varions onalyses regarding valuation and related mabsers

van vuren, BErik 01/03/02 f 21 Transition of work from CYCF Alanta,

6 Total e
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Ryon, Prances OB/ 1401 7 2.8 Prepared estimates of filed claims relaved 10 prepetition debt for nse in liquidation
analysis

Fyan, Trances ORI L& 7 22 Preparad estimates of filed claims related 10 prepetition deht Bor use in liquidation
analysis

Van Vuren, Erik 082301 7 30 Liquidatiun analysiy - sct up detailed asset sehedule for Leasing segment (net off
D1LRs)

Van Vuren, Erik o8/23/01 7 1.2 Liquidation unalysis - scl up detaited aaset schednls for Technalogy Services
segment [sale proceeds and gusels ot 3old)

Van Vuren, Erik OR30 7 LX) Liguidation amalysis - svl up detailed aszet sehedule for Ventures segment

Yun Vuren, Erik G24/01 7 kX Ligquidatiun anitly2is - get up defailed asset schedule for Corponate

Wan Vyren, Frik 08/24/01 7 1.2 Liquidation analysis - linked s=gment asset schedules wyether and creavsd
congelidared agset sehedale

Van Vuren, Tirik D8/24/01 7 7t Liquidation analysis + set up cluims componcnl w odel {categorization and
frrmulas)

Ryan, Frances DN 1 2.5 Edited extimates of liled claimg related o prepetition deht for use in liguidation
analysis

Yan Vuicn, Erik DRARDI 7 1.4 Liquidation analyais - set up deigiled claims schedule lor Sceurci labilitics

Grivetti, John DE2%/1] 7 1.2 Reviewed and edited drafl liguidation and balance sheet analyses 93 of /23001

Eyan. Frances B2 7 x4 Lidited estimates af filed claims relaled to prepetition dehr for use in liquidadon
analysis

Van Vuren, Erik [ICHERY 7 21 Liquidation analysis - ¢t up detailed elaims schadule for Administrative liabililies

Yan Vurgn, Frik 9/ | 0t 7 1.1 Liguidatian analyais - s&t np detailed claims schedule for Carve-Cut liabalitics

Von Vuren, Tirik 092501 7 .0 Liguidation analysiz » set up detailed claims schedule for Priarity liabilities

Gleichenhaus, Stuart 05/26/01 7 4 Review of current 630 Hyuidativn aalyaiz

Van Vuren, Erik 026/01 7 19 Liquidation analysis - set up detailed claiing schedule for Unsagured liabilities

Van Vuren, Erik DW2THHL 1 24 Eiquidation unalysis - sl up recovery amalyzis

Choguette, Andrew D270 1 2.1 Research ar profissicenals fiw slouctufea &nd other expense mn rates for use in
liquidation analysis

Van Vuren, Enk D49/28A01 Jl 1.4 Performed math check vn Liguidation analysig

Desc
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Van Vuren, Erik 1101 7 216 Ligquidation Anatysis - revised forecas B,0&A assumplions
‘Van Vuren, Erik 10402/ 7 21 Liquidaliun Anatysis - revised forecost assumptions: Sale procesds aod ceidining
auwets o ks of Technolopy Services
Van Yuict. Erik 101201 7 1.7 Analveed reaults of liquidity anabysis and recovery analysis, wrok summary report
Cumpbull, Ecith 12101 7 L.e Revicw information provided by the client to date and gencrav: list of information

7 Tatal 5Ll

needed 6 complere npdated liquidation analysis as vf /30401,

Desc
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Grivetti, Jahn QR/20/01 ] 2.z Raviewed and evaluaied the MoKinsey study on feasibility of |easing business
Gleielenhaws, Smart 02/27/01 o 0.6 Raviewed and evaluated the McKinscy swdy on Teagibility of |.easing husiness
Gleichenhaus, Stoart 0R/29/01 9 1.6 Feeviewed and evaluated the Mokinsey study on feasibility of 1.easing husiness
Gilzighenhaus, Stuart O/04/0t Bl iy Reviewed enalysis providul by Do,
(Gleichenhaus, Stuart 09050} 9 4. Reviewed analysis providid by Diebior with B&AY team.
(iletchenhaus, Stuart DB7/0] 9 1.3 Conference call with Creditosg Copmittes tn discuss issues with Debior.
Glewshenbaus, Stuan /12401 4 28 Reviewed apalysia provided by Debtor.
Griveri, John 1443001 9 14 Reviewed leasing business plans and cvurdinated diatrilwtion of plans to the
C nmmittes
Miller, David 12/03/01 u 10 Feview ol radl husiny, busingas plan.
Cilaichenhans, Stuart 12/04/01 ] 1.0 Review af financial inivrmation of Comdisgs.
Milter, David 12/04/01 o 0.6 Review of draft leazing husiness plan.
van Vyren, bk 1 2/04/01 b 15 Reviewsad lease analysis preparcd by Laztad
Gleichenhaus, Suart 1270540 L 1.0 Review ul linancial inferination of Comdiscn.
Franca, Luis 12714401 L 24 Review uf UD0 business plang, including seenatins for leasing vertivals, bids o
thuse vartivals. ote,
Franco, Luig 12/10/01 [} 08 Suratepy diseyssion for analysis of leasing business plans with copapement team.
Franca, ).uig 12411701 bl R Miscussion on leasing husiness plans wilh cnpapement fepm.
Frangg, Tais 12/12/01 7 1.7 Reviawed the scemarivs for vach el the [cazing ponfolins.
Camphell, Kgith 12412401 n 0.4 Review Lazard preliminary anabysis of lcasitg; company alternatives.
Frangn, Luis 12/13/01 n 1.7 Review nf preliminary Lazard asalysis of leaging gompany hids.
Framen, [uis 1241301 D (%] Review of McKinsey leasing study.

Desc
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Campbell, Keith 1271301 Q 1.2 Review Lazard preliminery analysis of loasimg company aiternatives.
Cleichenhaus, Stuatt | 242701 [ 10 Review vl [inancial infermatinn af Condisco,
Gleichenhaug, Stuark 12/28/01 o 1.0 Review of financial informativn ol Condises.
Gleichenhaua, Swan 01/08/02 N 4.0 Revicw of financial information v Comdisen,
Gleichenbaus, Smart oL/ 14/02 Fl 1.0 Review of financial informastion of Coindiacn.
Gleichenhaws, Stuort D1/15/02 9 1.0 Review of financial information of Camdisen.
Girivetti, John 02/08/02 9 1.2 Feviewed analyscs reparding RG&A prajections.
Franco, Luis 05/06/02 [} 1.1 Review ol Conipany's estimated recovery and cottpariaon to prior estimates of
recyerics,
Franuu, Luis 05/17:02 1 240 Converaations with potential Doard candidates and updote to racking spreadsheet.

2 Toal LIN |

Desc
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Gmivetti, luhn 7310 1] 4.4 Prepared intormuativial package on current finuncial position of Debtor and
summary memo 1o send Lo Lazard

Grivetti, Juhn 0E02/01 10 0.5 Prepared informialioiial packags nn curent finanuial position of Dehtor and
summary memwo Lo seild 10 Citikank

Gleichenhaus, Sluart QRG] 10 .5 Amalyzed lour weck ¢agh flow aached wo DI agnaemicnt

Grivetti, Juhu 30601 10 11 Analyzed four woek cash flow attached o DLP aggreetent

Grivewr, Jobin 0RA640| " 12 Revivwed Foreipn deht schedule attached o DIF apreement and compared Lo Jalest
schedule 1eceived fram the Debtor pre-petition aid doenmented reconciling
difTerenevs,

Civivelti, John 03/20/01 mn 7.0 Revicwed and evatusted financial dats provided by Andersen in advance ol
Cominities meeting, including Veoturea portfolia summary, ¥ LP partocaship
apoemems, consolidating halance sheots, Serviees management repurts, Comdisee
Citlily structure, and recent eyuipucnt puichases

Falrone, Nicholag GR/22/D1 10 fi.3 Review Debtor presensation wn Credivrs Commiittes meting

Giriveni, John B2 0 1.6 Revigwed ond adited consolidating balangs sheet analysis

Grivetti, John QB2 10 ] Niscnssion with D Schuster {1 azard) regarding Comdisco stinciure, leasing
husinesses anil purtliliv valucs, status of information reyuests and ventures
nnrtfolio

Grivetdd, Juhn 090501 10 04 Reviewcd &:30/0) leasing pontfolio detail

Yan Yufen, Frik 0%/1341 1] 13 Revonciled lgase tapes to 10-01 (6/20)

Van Vuren, Erk /24401 1] 2.5 Consalidating balance shocty - summarized ourstanding ssuws wod questions related
tor inzernational roll-up

Crrivetti, John EREATV ) 10 L4 Review of vash Low regulta for Sepiember

Miller, David 11728701 10 [{E:] Review of dutailed weekly cash Aows and MeKingey [easing husiness analysis.

Millet, David 11/29/01 10 0.4 Discussion with J. Grivetti regarding analyais of actual aperating cash fluws.

Grivetti, Inhn 11/29401 L} 31 Reviewad summary of cash low (iroupgh Septemher and prepared quedtions in a
summary tn R_Mishler

Gtivetti, John 11/2%01 10 06 Lhiscusgions with 1. Miller reparding cash fows, | 1230 mesting, Fazio's rezponge

Vau Yuren, Frik 11/2841 tn 28 Reviewed 9430 actual weekly cash flow data, compared to 8/30/01 infornsation,
dlisuibuted 10 gronp

Vaun Vuren, Efik 12:03/01 10 24 Cash [low information - received new info, pul in model

Desc
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Yan Vuien, Erik 12405/01 10 1.z Cash flow infarmarion - received new infu, put in mudel

Yan vuren, Krik 12/06/01 10 4 Cash flaw infarmarion - received new inka, pul n meded

Grivelld, Julit 12407401 10 1.3 Reviewed and edited cash flow anatysis

Camphell, Keith 12/10401 [ 1.2 Review kiquidation and comsnlidating balanue shevt atd Cerober weekly eash finws.

Francn, |uis 12/11/01 10 [E] Familianization with Campany cash (fow p tation ard ling ivems.

Francn, 1.uis 1211501 10 2.4 Review of weekly cash Dow trends for recently received cash flows.

Pranco, Luis 121201 10 1.5 Revitw ubOctober inlinmation packet sent by the company.

Frabeo, Luia 12/12401 10 1.1 Continging review of cash flow trends.

Campbetl, Keith 1241241 10 1.4 Review updated cash flow thraugh Deweber tor review with management.

Grivetti, John 12/14401 m .y Review %30/01 fureign bulancr sheets for Comdisen Swiss and Netherlandy entilies

Van Vuren, Erik 127141 1 9 Cash llow mEnoalion - received new infn, put in model

Miller, Lyavid Ql/08/02 n 0.2 Canferenpe with §. Gleichenhaws and J. Grivewd regarding cash Aows and SGRA
analysis.

Giriveti, John 0140842 ] [1%.] Comfrrence call with §. Gleichenhaus and D Miller regarding each fows and
SG&A analysiz.

Griveiti, Jahn 01/08:402 [ iX] Comference call with D Miller, 5. Gleichcobaua regarding cash flaws and 8GE&A
analysis.

Girivetii, lohn G162 10 0.4 Analyze cwrent buck value of European aperatians and ventures business.

Franeo, Luis Q1602 10 1.4 Ruview and research int curent hoek value of Buropran vpciations atd ventures
Buginess, per request hy 1arard.

Miller, David a1/30/02 12 n.2 Warking with 1.. Pranco regrarding cush flows analysis,

Gitivetti, Jahn Q143102 [1] 0o Preparation for and participatinn in conterence call with Arthur Anderson regording
cazh flows.

Miller, Dravid a2 15402 10 0.4 Ruvicw of Movember packagze sent hy Company.

Franeo, Ling OX15/02 10 2.1 Updare of weekly eash flow to include December nunbers,
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PROUFESSION AL, DATE _ rCD HOURS DESCRIFTION
Franco, Luis a42/18412 10 1.1 Dirail vl answuers 16 1, Millcr cash flow quesrions on consolidated cash flow.
Miller, David 0220:02 1l 0.2 Review ot toreipn balance sheel,
Miller, David 02/20/02 it L6 Review of Q| Form 10-0).
Miller, David 02/22/02 il 0.3 Review of budgel versus astual ¢agh flows and disenss some with L. Franco.
10 Total T
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Van Yuren, Erik 1040301 t 2.6 Prepared list ol items to be provided by the Conmgany te the Unaecursd Creditors in
the honthly Operating Report

Chaquente, Andrew 10101 I 28 MOR resvarch and CIW MOK gesicyal,

leichenhaus, Swan 1041601 i 1.0 Review of Deblors’ monthly upu:‘alill).'. e for Aupust 2041 .

hailler, [pvid 10¢22/01 1 0.1 Review ol Deblors' muonthly operating report for Augual 2001

Crivetti, Jabn 1026401 1 6 Evaluated Motthty Uperating Repory

Vun Yuren, Erik 1431791 11 Ll Evatnated Manthly Operating Report sent by AA

Yun Vwdn, Euk 11412/n 11 14 Reviewed Monthly Operating Repon send by Company, comparcd it b what w
ariginally requestad, summarized variances

Choqueite, Andrew olR02 I 1.1 Review of Dvtaber moenthly eperating report oo lsderal flings,

Choguette, Andrew Q1/08/02 11 13 Court filing search fin monthly operating reparts.

Franua, Luis 02i01/02 11 vy Compilotinn of monthly consolidated cash Bow.

Milker, David 024 503 1 3 Miscussion with 3. Crivetti and 1.. Franco vegarding aualysis of cash Bows and
monthly packaye.

Giriveni, Jahn [xHRY nl 0.1 Driscussion with D.Miller and L. France regarding analysa of eash flows and
munthly puckape.

Miller, Tovid 021 2/02 11 0.7 Review of Cumpany's Novemnber 2001 nionthly financial report {cash flows, income
staleinenly, consulidating lalance sheets, and ventwres data).

Cirivetti, John D2720/02 11 1.4 Revigw ol Campany'a November 2001 monthly firaneinl report (cash flows, income
atatenaents, ennsolidaring bolonce sheets, and ventures data).

11 Tolal I8
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Gilgichenhana, Stuar

Gitivetti. John

Ryan, Franccs

{Glzichenhaus, Stuart

{Griveiti, John

Ryan, Trances

Van Vurer, Erik

Muostello, Awdrey

Ryan, Franges

Van Yuren, Erik

Ryun, Francey

Van Varen, Erik

Van Yuren, Frik

Van Yuren, Crik

Cleichenhaus, Stuarl

Gileichenhaua, Stuar

Van Vyren, Frik

Gleichenbaug, Stvart

Maller, David

Van Vuren, Frik

DATE PL'D HEOLIS TESCRIFTION

orzriol 12 3.1 Reviewed first day motions

U201 t2 4.4 Reviewed fiest day motions, including docunemns relaced 1o cnpleyes retenfion,
prafeassional retention, cash management and business biddity proosduics

Ayl yliNt 12 6.5 Reviewed first day motions, including decwinonts related Lo cnployee retention,
deht o ling, and cash r penicnt

07:30/01 12 27 Revicewed fiest day motions

a7aol 12 iz Reviewvd s day motions, including dogyments relted to emplayee retentinn,
protessional rewention, cash manapgeneht and business bidding proceduras

07/30/01 12 24 Reeoneiled debt outztanding listed in hanknptey filings with detail previeusly
oblaioed from s Deblor

27/30:21 12 a Read, copicd. diatribtied and analyzed court motions regarding establishing
procedures for interim eompensatinn for professionals

RO 1z 2.2 Review nf bunkruptcy molion dovurncnts and company poviged data for eoployee
severance and retentian plans.

07731701 12 3l Reconiled debt eutstandins lstod in batthrupicy Rlings with detail previously
oblained from the Deblor

0731401 12 27 Analyeed ol muetions regatding retention of profesainnals used in ordinary course
ul'busincss

/140 12 kX Keeongiled debr autstanding listed in bankrupicy filings with detail previowsly
abtainged from the Dehinr

NRA1A01 1z 2 Analyzed court motions regarding aulhorizabon to pay prepatilion wiges, salarics &
employee henefils

03A02401 12 2.2 Anubyred vourd molions wyganding authorization o retain Goldman Sachs as M&A
advisur

0B/02/01 12 20 Anatyavd count inoliona regarding avthorization to retain Arthur Andersen as
finanuial advisor

0813201 12 14 Eevicwed variona cour matinns

URNA01 12 i Reviewed varinus count motivns

Q9/20/01 12 1.1 Analyzed motion related W YesTrade conventible profoed atock

1H0O1/01 12 19 Review of the debtor's statements and schicdules Tied wilh the Bankruptey coun

114041 12 5 Review of various court filed matians regarding reliel from stay and s sales,

1171301 12 1.9 Reviewed Sttements & Schedules - Ayixts
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PROFESSIONAL DATE BCI HOURS, DESCHIFTION .

van Vyren, Frik 11413701 12 1.3 Reviewed Statements & Schedules » Claims

Chogquette, Andrew 11714704 12 1.7 Oypanization nf addirional court filings for Comdisco.

Choquette, Andrew 117140t 12 1.7 Review of Comdisen crurt flling docamends,

Miller, Tizvid 11/19/01 12 0.4 Review of vorious motions. including exclusivity crichsion, contract rejecriong and
orhers.

Miller, Duvid 11/2041 12 0.4 Review af documents from Counsel reparding equiny motion ohjecting to HF hreak
up fee, exclusivity, and Ruothschild clention,

Miller, David 11729061 12 0.4 Review of various motions, including Chanin hire, lases assumptian, and others.

Franw, Luis 121140 2 1.4 Review of revently liled cown thotiona {12/10/31).

Fiancd, Lois 1271401 12 1.1 Baview of recently filed count dneuments.

12 Tolat 6l
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Falzang, Michelas QAN 15 .5 Dizcussinn wich L Grivetti, C. Kaolstad ond M. Williams regarding 1ax issues and
planiing report

Kalatad, Charles 9071 i3 0.5 Discussian with I. Grivetn, W. Talzone and M. Williams regarding tax issues and
planniny repart

Williams, Mighget 09/07/1 (] 0.5 Conference call with J. Grivetti, C. Kalstad. and N. Falzoae reganding lax plan

Cnvetti, Tohn 0%/07/01 13 0.5 Conference call with C.Kplstad, M. Williams and N, Falzonc n.'garding Lax plan

Falzane, Nicholas 09/14/01 13 35 Review of Lax fles. Meeting with VI ol lax, discussions with M, Williame and J.
Grivetli noparding same

Williams, Michael 09/14/01 13 3.5 Review of lan Gles, Mecting with VP of fax, discussions withy N.Falzone and
TGriveuti repanding same

Grivettd, John 09414401 13 35 Prepavation for and meeting with Comdisen VP of tax and discassions with M.
Williams amd M. Falzene reparding same

Paeini, Digonhea P 1EAN 13 22 Review and analyze Comdiscn tay atfributes informatien

Kolstod, Charles 09719401 13 23 Discussinns with M. Williams and D. Pavini regarding Lax issues and tax planning
Teport

Williams, Michael 05/ 19/01t 13 2.3 Mevting and Liscussions rogarding s workplan and isgoea with 1nPacing and C.
Kaolstad

Pagini, Duruthea LRR T 1 23 Lyigeugsion with C.Kolaiad and M. Willianis reparding rax workplan. Review
antributes informatian

Faciil, Dorothea 2001 13 1. Comdisee dala room vigit. Review tax work popers. Traft due diligence reports

Sherman, Richard 09/20/01 13 15 Cnmdisen data room visit. Review tax work papers. Drafl due diligence repurty

Falzune, Nicholas 0921101 13 0§ Conlirence call with M. Williaans, . Kolstad and L, Pacini separding tax planning
tepurl to Conamillee

Kolstad, Charles /21700 13 0.4 Conferenee eall with M. Williamg, . Kolgtad and T, Pacini regarding tax planning
Tepart 1 Conmitee

Williama, Michacl /21 13 [ Meweting and discassions reparding tax workplan and issues with M. Falzone, C.
K.ilstad and N.Foacini

Pacini, Dnrothea D9/21 /1 13 1.8 Meeting and discussions regarding tax workplan and issues with M. Falzone, C.
Knlstad and T.Pacini

Williams, Michael 09/24/01 13 a1 Review data rapm warkpapers and proacedures. Planming liscussions, conlfirmoe
calls with [¥. Pacini and R. Sherman

Pagini, Dorothea (o 2 (] 0.5 Discussion with M. Williams and R. Sherman regarding due ditigence results from
daia rapm visit

Sherman, Richard (w/zaM 13 6.1 Driscnasiong with M. Witlinms and T2.Pacini regarding due diligence resutts from

data pootn visit and deaft of initial 1% sammary report
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Williams, Michael 09/25/01 11 19 Review dats room workpapurs and procedures. Plasning discussions, conferenie
calls with [1. Pacini anif R. Shemnan

Pacini, Darnthea Q2501 1 21 Diiscussion with M. Williaos and K. Sherman reparding due diligence resulis frum
data rovnn visit

Shermuan, Rivhard 2501 14 4.0 Discussions with M. Williams ard 12.Pacini rezarding due diligemce results from
data rupm visit and drall ol initial tax swmmary repaort

Sherman, Richard Q2401 14 (A Continued review ol due diligence neies and tax workpapers regarding drafl tax
SUMITELCY TETR

Talzooe, “icholas 201 13 1.5 Conference calls with M. Wiltians and . Kalstad regarding tax planning report to
Cammittes

Kolstad, Clailes {WZHAO 13 1.5 Cundirenes calls with M. Williams and C. Kalstad reparding tax plaoing ropon w
Cominittes

williams, Michaal 08/28/01 13 4.5 EYigopssinns with VP af tax, N. Falzone, D. Pacin and . Kolatad. Attended
Manapement prasentation

Shermazn, Richard 09/28/01 13 1.3 Continued review of due diligenve notes and tas woskpapers regarding droft ax
SLMmAry mema

Williams, Michael 1401/91 13 0.4 Conference call with B. Fahrenbach reparding stote and local tax considerations.

Willianis, Mickacl Io/alal 13 0.6 Call with M. Feligh regarding additional questions on Lux prutite,

Williams, Michael 10:01/401 13 2.0 Meeting/conference call with M. Felish, I3, Pacini, and R. Sherman regarding wax
profile of Comdisco, and intemnal discussion oeparding summary tax memn in be
provided tn Creditors Committes.

Facini, Dorothea 101401 13 5 Review of information prepared by R. Sherman regarding Pederal tax information,
cradits and impact of filings.

Paini, Durothea 1001401 13 2.0 Meeting/conterence cait with M. Felish, M Williams, and R. Sherman regardiny, tax
prudile of Condizea, and incenal disenssion regarding summary tax memo W be
pruvidud 1o Croeditens € otmines.

Siterinan, Kichard 1o/141 13 20 Mectinpioanfergnee call with M. Telish, M. Williames, and I Pacini regarding tax
profile of Candisea, and intemal discussion mga.nlinp. SuiDNEAFy TRX M i he
provided tn Creditors Committee.

Sherman, Richard 10401400 13 1.7 Review additional follaw-up tax issuvs prior to meeting with M. Felish.

Williams, Michael 10/0241 14 L4 Driscussions with D.Pacini and R. Sheiman regarding appreach o tax memo and
updates on status.

Pacini, Durothey 10241 14 1.7 Conterence cudl with M. Felish sepaeding cughion onolysis and anticipated cash
requirements.

Pacing, Durotheu 10/402411 15 1.4 Meeting with M. Felish reparding IRS andits.

Tacind, Durothea 10/42:40] [ 1.1 Meeting with M. Fulish reparding tentative claims for camyback and amemded
returns arising fram | 999 and 2000 filinga and projected losses for 2001.

Pacini, Dorotheu 1042401 15 1.8 Preparation tor meetings with M. Felish,

Desc
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Shermaon, Richard 10/02/01 13 0.6 Discussion with [ Facing (cparding exceutive sumaary,

Bherman, Richard 10/02/01 13 0.2 Discussion with M. Williang separding meeting with M. Pelish on tax issues for
Cumdisve.

Hherman, Bichard 10702401 13 LX) Ruview and revise notes taken from mecting with M. Felish reparding several items
inn ke tax provision {i.c, 3574c) basia siep-up. stapled stock trangactians, sinck buy-
buck ele.).

Talzone, Wichalax 10/03/01 13 L] Dascussions wiltt M. Williama and C.Kobstad regarding upgoming Creditnrs
Cormmillee imeetiog and statua of ax due ditipence.

Falzone, Wicholas 10/03/01 13 0 Dhiscussions with € Kelatad and £, Pagini regarding tax due diligence and executive
SUINCTArY (G000,

Kalstad, Charles 16:03401 13 1.5 Telephong calls with N.Folzane, M. Williams and [3.Pacim regarding tax due
dilipence review.

Williams, Michacl 1IN 14 0.5 [¥iscussinns with M. Falznne regarding creditors Commitiee rneeﬁrlg and skatus ol
fax due diligence.

Williams, Michasl 1040301 13 1.8 Canference vull with D. Pacini ropandiing previous day intetyicwa wish M. Felish
and approach and couleats ol tax suitmany,

Williamns, Michael 10403/01 13 0B Prcpacation for and patticipation in ponfergnes gall with 1azord. Provide
inlizrmation o the st ol e EY icam.

Pacini, Durothia 10/03/01 13 0.6 |Jigcussion with B.Sherman regarding executive summary.

Pacini, Darothea A0 13 [1%:3 Comference call with Lazard regarding status of tax lindings lor nwcting with the
Creditars Commitiee.

Pacini, Marathea 10/03/01 13 1.0 Conterence call with N. Falsone and €, Kelstad reparding statis of iax issnes.

Parini, Dorothe 10/03/01 i3 20 Freparation of atributes secrions analysis of tox issues.

Tacini, Durothea 104337 1% 20 Preparation of patenviol tax cash cuotlay analysis.

Facini, Dorolhea TOAEH 13 L Cmganization of data compiled from data room.

Pacini, Dinrothea 10403401 13 Q.7 Preparation fur cunlirence call with Lazard,

Pacini, Dorcthea 1003401 13 1.8 Conlerence vall with M Witliams oparding previeua day isterviews with M. Telish
and approach and contents of 1Ax summary.

Pacini, Dinrothea 10/a3/1 13 1.0 Ruview and revese Comdizseo bankruptey memao with K. Sherman.

Sherman, Richard 10403/01 13 a6 Driscussions with D. Pacing ieparding review of sunmary of tax stiribites.

Sherman. Richard i0/03/01 13 i3 Cralt ainended celarms and carryback claims gection of exeeutive summary.
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Shuerman, Richard A 13 0.8 Drmafl revised summuary ol tax aluibuies.

Shenman, Richard 10/301 13 24 Drall vl putential cash tiske analysis.

Shernan, Richard 10/03/01 13 1.2 Drrall vl seetion 332¢1)5 and |(6) provisions with tespect to a hankruptcy filing.

Shennan, Richard 1OA¥A0 13 1.1 Draft swinmary of tax amibiies

Sheihan, Richard 10/ 13 1.0 Final wevisions nrade 16 19% attributes sunmary with Td. Pacini.

Sherman, Richard 10/03/01 13 0.4 Finalize draft nf document and forward to Comdisco.

Sherman, Richard 10/03:01 13 1.1 Review and revise draft document lor Comdisco.

Shennan, Rivhand 1070341 13 1.3 Revigiuns 1 amended return and carryback claims seotion.

Sherman, Richard 12/a3/01 13 16 Revisiong (o ¢aab rigks section in include more in-depth discussion and estimates
IHONCIary CXpogurs.

Sherman, Richard 10:/03:401 13 (1834 Diraft of technical mema and bankrupicy rules for sxecutiv summary,

Williums, Michael 10704401 13 &5 Review comments from C. Kolstal n:l.:ardinu 1A% Zumimary.

Williamna, Michael 10414411 13 .5 Driscussions with [, Paciii reggrding tax issnes summary and autcame of
vonfurner vall with Lazad.

Williams, Michael 10:04/01 13 s Mecting with N. Falzone ond I3, Facini regarding conference call wilth Lazued.

Pacini, Dorothea 104041 17 0.3 Telephane call with . Fahrenbavh repacdimy tax iasucs relating to Comdisen.

Pavini, Dorathea HHOS/AN 13 e Mollow up discussion with Mike Wallzains iesasding case statws.

Shernan, Richard HIOSAN 13 0.4 Review revisions W by Wechmcal mema.

Fatzone, Nicholas 10/08/0 1 13 0.3 Mizeting willh L\ Facini regarding Comdisco hankruptey mema.

Miller, Navid 10/08/01 13 0.4 Review and draft emments on the ta issues memo prepared by E&Y tax advisors.

Pacini, [orothea {{MOR/D 13 0.3 Mucling with M, Falzone regarding Comdicen hanknuptcy mema.

Shartnad, Richard TEHOEM 13 0.9 Forward revised cacculive sumingry 1o 1. Pagini. Develoned eontace list for

Comdisen team.
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PROFESSIONAT.

Williams, Michael

Sherman, Richard

Pacint, Darothea

Pacini, Daruthea

Cinivetti, John

Bliecnndn, Richard

Cirivetti, John

Sherman, Richard

Sherman, Richard

Blcrinan, Richard

Williama, Michael

Sherman, Richard

Williums, Michael

Williarms, Michacl

Pacini, Lrorothen

Pacini, Darathea

Pacini, Darathea

Pacini, Doruthea

Cirivatti, Jahn

Sherman, Richard

_DATE,

10/10:01

TV 1DAH

1¢174H

101744

1v174H

1017701

10/18/01

17153/01

1/1MH

10/22001

10/23/01

123401

10/24:01

1201

1o/24/01

1072401

10724401

T0V2kH

10/241H

124401
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rcp HOURS DESCRIFTEON

14 L] Diiscussions with I Sherman eogarding coordination of infarmatinn received from
[ Miller and revising the tax sumimary Metng

13 0.6 Diiscussiuns with M. Williamz repasding coordinotion nf information received from
D. Miller aml rovising the 1a summnary mgma

13 02 Conference call with E. Shernan reparding diaribwtion of Cemdiscn meme.

13 [} Follow-up un volve il lioth M, Williams.

13 1.2 Reviewed tax exceative swiiary mema and provided edits and comments

13 "z Conference rall with [2.Pacini regarding distribution of Condiscw g,

13 2.4 Reviewed tax executive summary memo and pravided cdits and semmwnts

13 0.4 Driscussinn with M. Felish regarding the 2ale to SunGand and the man basis of the
sold entitivs,

[k} 4.0 Revise drdt uf carculive suitkary @ inglyds informarine regarding the sale of
Conlinuity Survices Business 1o Suniard and the sale of the leaxing vertical enlitivs.

13 2.0 Revise draft for the sole of the availability solutions busincss unat and (e affecr on
Comdigeo's tax adributes.

13 (1% Digcussion with R. Sherman regarding revisivns W tax memo and Kess analysis.

13 0.5 Driscussion with M. Williams régarding revisions to tax memo and fees analysis.

12 1.5 Review and revised tan caccutive symniary menn received from R. Sherman.

13 1.0 Review fees analyais summary with R. Sherman and provided inlomation w Iy,
Pacini reparding changes which were made ta the summary. Update w ). Grivett.

13 1.0 1vigewsgion with K. Shermon regarding contemplated restractuing:? and potential
righka.

13 0.5 Revised dncuments and provided chanpes to R, Sherman.

13 0.5 Review ot changes w memo.

13 0.§ Review ol impact ol SunCatd on attribytes.

13 0.2 Lrpilaabe with M. Wilkiaims oo stalug of tax executive summary

12 1.0 Review of D. Facini comments reganding: teview painta in ennnection with

Comdisco's tenbative sale o SunGard.and discusgions regarding same
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Shurrmian, Richard 24/ 13 l Rewiew and tevise iechnical mamo to include discussion of sale and tax altributes.

Pacini, Duruthus W2 12 1.5 Revisud memno and discuzsed revigions with B, Sherman regarding calculation off
impacts ol SunCiard taneaction an anmibutes.

Van Yuteh, Erik 10/25/01 13 ] Revivwed the tag execntive summary prepared by B&Y LLT and upbated rolevaal
noyuust list

Shermian. Richard 25 13 a3 Disassions with 1Y, Pacini regarding revisions to meme.

Sherinan. Richard /25001 13 32 Finalize revigions w eehnical mema to include tax impact of sale ol UK, Canada,
and French subsaidiasies in addition to U5, 2ssets.

Falzpne, Wichplas 10/26/01 13 ] Revigw of executive summary tax memao

Falzone, Nicholas 10/26/01 B} 0.4 Conference vall with M. Williains regarding tatua of tax mema ond upcoming
Crediters Commitiee mecting.

Williams, Micvhasl 104261 3 as Conference vall with ¥, Faleone repanding status of fax memo and upcoming
Crediturs Commitce mcecliog,

Miller, Lavid 10/29/01 13 a2 Revivw of draft tax memorandum.

Crrivefti, John 10/29/01 13 2.5 Reviewed tax exgcutive summary mema revised for additional bids and provided
commenis/edits

Sherman, Ricliard /2941 (R} (1] Review comments lor rovisions w Comdiseo exeeutive summary.

Kalztad, Charles WA 13 1 Review ol tax indmio,

williams, Michael 10/30/M01 13 /8] Hevicw tax memp gomments from J. Grivetti. Coordination ul'lh:livur;,' wilh J,
Griyete, 13 Fagini, 11 Miller, C. Kalstad and R. Sherman

Paaini, [prothes 19:30/01 13 o1 Lizcwssian with K. Sherman regarding changes ta memo based vn HF bid,

Pacini, Dorothea 10/3)/01 13 0.3 Read comments in memw from ). Grivelld and diseassed with R. Sherman regarding
future approach.

Pacini, Dorothea W0 13 (1] Read numwrous cinaili teparding changes to tax memo.

Pacii, Dorothea 10/30/01 13 Qs Reviscd tax ncmo,

Sherman. Richard (it 13 az Drralt e-mails regarding engagement fee analysis and forward revised executive
SUMAMACY U cugagenngal wam.

Sheriean, Richard 1001 13 1.2 Revitw and revise Conwlisen executive ¥, including di ions with
. Paciui.

Williama, Michael {1701 13 a9 Diiscussion with J, Grivetli and M. Falzone regarding tax memo und Creditors

Commilie: mecling,
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Grivetti, Iohn 10/31/01 14 .8 Finalized bx executive summnary mcing and sent w B.Mason znd 5. Dallinger

Falzeme, Micholas 1 1/0L/HL 13 4.5 Driscussions with M. Williams scpaeding potentinl tax issues to he discussed at the
creditor commitiee moting

Williams, Michael 11/01/01 K 0.5 Conference call with M. Falrooe teparding preparstion for Creditors Commities
meeting.

Pacini, Dorathea REHE] 13 ) Updale frum M. Williana regarding potential tax impact fiom issues raised al
Creditors Carmnitbee moctitg,

Kolstal, Charles HTARAH 13 1] Conlirence call withh M.Williama and J. Grivetti to discuss issues raised al
Cormnille: meetifly, reparding intemational business plan and patential Ewopean
legul/lux vostruvluzing

Williama, Michaal 11702701 13 1.1 Cunlerenee eall with C. Knlstnd and I Grivets o discuss issucs raiged at
Coinmiltes peating regarding intemational b phan and petcatial European
Kpal/tax restrociiring,

Williamg, Michael 110201 13 "3 Lipdate I3, Pacini regarding potential tax impact Lo issucs Faised st Credinors
Committes meeting.

Grivetti, lohn 1170271 13 11 Cunference vall with M. Willaimg and C. € olstad to discuss issues rised at
Committee meeting regarding intemational biginess plan and potential European
legal/tax restrucluring

Yan Yun:n, Erik 1EAAN 1% 1.0 Read tax nwonw propaced by E&Y LLP

witliama. Michazl 14/15/01 13 0.4 Dizcuagion with P. Amgter regarding intemnational tax planning - Conference call
with Ferer, 13, Pacini and A. Voortman regarding same.

Pagini, Norothen 11/15/0} 13 nz Conference call with M. Williams, A.Voorbnan and F.Amster reparding
internotinnal tax planning

Kolstul, Charles 11416 1% 0.8 Discussion with M, Williats regarding intemational tax planning

Witliaros, Michacl 11416401 13 0.8 Discussion with C.Kolstad ragarding internatinnal tax planning

Sheman, Richard 117167014 13 n.3 Luocate and review apeess letter for Arthur Andersen tax filos,

Sherman, Richard 11/16/01 13 1K} I3iggngsions with T2, Pacini regarding upeoming duc ditipenee for foreign sales.

Kolstut, Charles 117189401 1% 1.0 Conference vall with 1. Griveiy, L Miller, A Voortmon, P. Amster and M. Wilhams
reparding inlernational tax plamniing inattera.

Witliams, Micliacl 11419m 1% 0.6 Drradted surmnacy comminications for ¥. Amsrer and A. Voortmun regarding
internatiunal lax cenleils of Wy sinmary memn.

Williams, Michacl 171419/m 13 1.0 Comference call with J, Giivctr, 1v. Miller, C. Kalstad, P. Amester and A, Vourunan
regarding mlcrnational taa planning matrers.

Miller, David 11/189/01 15 1.0 Conference call with ). Griveld, M. Williama, C. Xolstad, P. Amster and A.
Waortman regarding inlernational tx planning marters.

Witliams, Michacl 1142041 13 0.4 Follow-up repanding: inteinational tax planning analysis with . Pacini and R

Sherman.

Desc
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Pachi, Doruthea /2040 13 0.3 Tallow-up repanding intctnational lax planning analysis with M. William2 and R.
Shenman.

Sherman, Richard 1172000 13 0.3 Convvergptiong with M. Williams regarding upcoming Internarional Tax Due

Dligence work o condurate ellorts with our intematianal team.

Williams, Michael Lz 13 04 Tetephane calls to P Amster reparding transitinn of informagion related 1o
intermational lax plannimy. Discussion with B. Shenman veparding information
Tequcsla,

Sheiwan, Richard 11/28/04 13 1.3 Comversatiang with M, Williarhs regarding upcoming Intemational ‘Tax Due

Diligence work te cooidinalc ¢tlirs with our intemational team.

Williansg, Michacl 110501 13 0.5 Communications with M. Feligh, Tan Dinsctor at Comdisca ta prepare bin in
advance for the topics which we inended v discuss with him at the mig scheduled
with him in discuss intemarional taacs

Williama, Michacl 12/05/01 (K] 04 Conf vall with Eynn Hiestand of Skadden Arpd w describe wpics which we
intended to caver at the mig w/ Mike Felish re intermational kaxes and far her to
apprave the topics

Witliams, Michacl 12/05/01 13 03 Cont call with Anna Veortman re gopic for digeussion regarding international t3ves
related tn mtg w/ Mike Felizh Comdisen Tax Direclor Stan wisniewski Comdizco
Intermutivnal tax specialist and with an internativou tax representative of Comdises

Williamsg, Michacl 12:05/1 13 0.4 Conlirenve call with C. Athas of Skadden Afpa 1¢ sveess Lo mitg with Mike Felish
1 inlermatiunal topics

Williams, Michaet {ansm 13 133 Conf call wiib Jobn Grivelti W obtan understanding of the reorpanization prospects
of Comdisgn around it Gunonan entity

Wilkians, Michael 120501 14 1.0 Frepare with Rich Slwrenin and discuss with him the preparatian of the lial of lopics
to he discussed with Michac! Felish ar the international tax meeting with Michacl -
farward the documeit to Michacl Folish and Chrds Athas at Skoddan A rps

Wikliaing, Michaet 12405701 13 0.5 Review summary analysis of inlornational tax marters prepared Yy Rich Stwarman for
Anna Voortman

Girivenyi, John 12/05/01 13 2 Discussivn with Mike Williama reparding Comdisee’s German entity

Williams, Michasl 12406401 13 21 Mty with Michael Felish Tax Tireetor of Condiseo and Akn Prosniewski
International Tax Director of Comdisco w/ Anng Yool inan and Sean Thompsan of
EY Ineroational Tax w discuss and analyze Comdisco intetiativoal restructuring
and cash repatriation

willinnes, Michael 120601 13 o8 Memn to David Miller and Johe Grivetli summarizing the intmational tax meelisy
al Comdisca
Falznne, Wicholas 12/407/01 13 0.5 Coilernee call with David Miller and M. Williams wyarding intemational tax

planning stratepies and analysis of thost strawysics

Williams, Mighael 12/07/01 13 .4 Coal all w/ Daavid Miller and Nick Falzone re interiativnal tax planning strategies
and analysis of those siratepies

Williams, Michacl 121441 K] [15] Tax staws call - follow-np w/! Sean Thomsen and Anna Voortman e internationa |
Lax planning
Falzone, X eciolas 12417/01 13 2.5 Tax status call - follaw-ypr w/ S¢an Thomnson and Anna Yaarimon re intematioaal

tax planning
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Wwiiliamg, Michael 01/16/02 13 0.3 Telephong call with J. Grivetti ragarding international ax platnity staus and ofher
relatcd matters.

Williams, Michact ai/21/02 13 05 Fallow-up eoardination related to international tax planaing with A. Yogiman, N,
Falzone, 5, Vhompsen and John Griveri.

Williaing. Michael a1/24/02 13 05 Priparation for and panigipation in eonference call with A. Yourtman, 5. Thoinpsen
and M. Falzene reparding intematinnat fax structuring upporiunilies.

williams. Michaoel Ol1/24:4032 13 1.5 Read inramnational tax planning executive summary.

Thompsen, Sean 01/24:02 14 4.0 Telephone call with 3 Williums peparding potential intemational planning
apporiunities fir Crediters Cummities.

Witliams, Michael al/25/q2 14 0.5 Revizsions to internativnal tax planning sutithary,

Witliams, Michael /2802 14 0 Revise internutivnal plannimyg memo for Creditors Comminee.

Thumpson, Seat 0201102 13 1.0 Confirenes edll will foam reparding internatianal planning opportunities.

Willioms, Michael 02/08/02 13 1.0 Conference call with 5. Thompson regarding update 1o inenional mema/

Sherman, Richant 0208103 13 0.4 Discussions with M. Williams ragatding inteenational resmuctnring and revisinns to
Qur Bxecutive summoary.

Shemmuan, Rivhard UROROL 13 0.3 Review inletnational memn.

Willianiz, Michaal O/11/02 13 ) warking with . Sherman regrarding meme for M. Felish per D. Millr.

Williams., Michael 02412/92 13 0.5 Discussion with J. Grivetti regarding statua of ineenational tax planning mema -
follow-up communicabons with 5, Thoinpson - dissusgion with § Grivetti regarding
update ty executive summary of Lax natee and approach.

Williama, Michael a2/13/02 13 1.5 Reviegw and revise an intematinnal tax planning memo to D, Miller.

‘Thipmpson, Sean 02/13/02 13 .5 Revised intemazipnal tax planning memo lir Creditors Committes,

Miller, Diavid 0211407 13 0.5 Review vl tax update menwe aid send c-nsails 1o 5. Dollinger (Citibank} reparding
tax diligence.

Shermum, Richard 031402 13 0.3 Terview lntcamatiomal tax ibtio with M. Williams and fonvard to . Miller and
other mumnbers ol Conidiseo @,

Williams, Michael 02015032 15 0.5 Conferenee catl with M. Falzone repardiog information needed from Comdisco to
praceed with upitating understandmg of Ciediters Commirtee.

Grivetti, Johm 273502 13 1.4 Vamaus discussions with M. Williams regaeding, laz pojec states and coordination
of potential meating with the Camaisco tax director, including follow-up with
5 Lallinger.

Frangn, l.uis 02/15/02 13 1. Review nf recently received tax information.

Desc
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Willlatna, Michacl 02/25/02 13 95 Reaponse from 1. Miller regarding inquiry from Creditors Comminiee,

Sherman, Richard 02/20/02 13 0.3 Canversation with M. Williams regarding international stucturing and tax atribute
updare.

Williama, Michagl 03/15/02 12 1.0 Meefing with R. Sherman to discuss contents of e-mail W D, Miller symmarizing
{ax% ebsorvatiaons fram eonference call with the tax dineclor of Caindiseo - updaie
firyim K. Shanan as to his conference call with D. Miller.

Wiltiams, Michael 031802 1% 2.0 Read tax update meme o K/ Sherman ond discuss comments and changes with
him - update I, Miller - Communications with M. Falzone reyanting same.

Williains, Michael WHr20/02 13 1.3 Read mema from R, Sherman reparding estimated timing ol noeeipt ol refhod and
cushion ameunt - comments ond discussion with R. Sherman roganding same.

willigma, Michael 03/21:02 13 10 kaviewed natice regarding basis ransactivns (357v) - discwss applicability to
Comdisen IRS examination with R Sherman - Review mictne 10 [2 Miller
reparding the effect of the notice on the liming ol ths § yoear carry back tax refand.

williansz, Michael 03/21402 13 0.5 Head deferrad i information prepared by Luzard providid by 3. Miller.

Sherman, Richard (= 1e N ) i3 ) Review nolic: 2002-21 and forward e-mail tn 0. Miller.

SBhermian, Richard (/220402 13 a.d Cunved sation with M. Feligh and M. Williams regarding tollow-up quustions and
April 2nd rweting.

Sherman, Kichard 403402 13 23 Heview nates with b Williams and discuss relevant issucs suvoundiiy, section
FHZ(H4) steatepry.

Mason, Rahert 04404402 i3 zI Canference call with M. Williams regarding discuasions with the bankmptey plan
and potenrial tax issues.

Williams, Michact (haf3A12 13 1.3 Praparation lisr and pagticipation in conference call with B. Fohrenbach aud R.
Shumian repatding state and local tax cansiderations of the rearpanization proposal.

Willtaers. Michact (02 13 10 Proparation lor and participatinn in conference call with J. Muson und R. Sheitan
wepeding Fegkerad incamie tox considerations of the reonganization propesal - fallow-
utr ¢all 1o 13. Miller repording same.

Sherman, Richard 0404/02 13 24 Peeparation for and participation in confirenve call with R, Faheeibach and J.
Magonh reparding section JE2(1H5) with respect o Comsdiess's reofganization plan.

Fohrenhach, Rohert 04/05:02 13 4 Conference with M. Williams and R Sheeinan reparding stave tox exposure and
isanes.

fberman, Richard 04,0502 13 1.2 Conversations with L1 Tuckuer ceparding additional informatinn on the tax attribubes
and assumplions fur section 352 batikraprcy model. Review nf section 382{1)(5) in
comnection with notes from prior mecting,

Sherman, Richard 04/08/02 13 1.7 Research varinous issues surrcunding sccticn 38201)05) and seceinn FA2(1)(6) in
comnection with Cumdisce revrganization glan,

Sherman, Righard 04/05/02 13 i Raview notes from meeting with 11, Tucker, ‘Telephone eall o Company to
sehedule conference call. Review technical authoritica reparding section 3R201)(3).

shetinan, Richard a4/ 10/02 i3 1.2 Review technical autharities regarding section JB2(1)5) und scotion 34200)(6) A5

well a3 niotes from meeting with H. Tucker.

Desc
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Williams, Michael D4/ 1762 13 0.3 Review of status summary mema prepared by B, Sherman for 1. Miller.

Sherman, Richard 04/11/02 13 1.2 Rummary e-mail reguoding e implication of section $RAIN(F) versus section
IE2(1)(6) with rexpect Lo Comdisuo and the giratepics diseussed with H. Tucker
from Arthur Andersen. Follow up -e-maik and vodes mail 1o H. Tucker regarding
same.

Witliaitig, Michacl /| 2 13 1.5 Rieviewesd Comdisco rent stripping opinion.

Franen, Luis /1 2702 13 0.5 Review of recent tax events regarding renl sirippiay Uaasactions that conld affect
Comdisen.

Wil linms, Michael 041502 13 1.0 Communications with L. Franca, B Miller and 5. Gleichenhans regarding reserves
and liabilities for strip leases - Riview fax fiom L. Franeo regording lahility and
TESETVE 2MOUNLS.

Willioms, Michael 0471502 13 ns Coordination and tiscussions with L. Franca and N. Falrone regarding summary of
the adverse renl sipping Upiicn

Williams, Michael /1542 1% 1.5 Review ol Andantech-Cewdizen rent stripping opinions and vther related
corminenlary in preparation for call with Td. Miller, I Sperka and M. Faloomc,

Williams, Michael 0ud/ 1 5002 13 20 Review of rent sripping npinion adverse to Conuliseu's sale leascback ransactinms
in rhe zarly 1990'5 as forwarded by ™. Falzone.

Pranco, Luis 0/ 502 I 0.3 Conversation with M, Williaiz ol'tax to sprap mesting tomomaw and discuss
recent tax developmunls.

Pranco, [uix /1502 15 0.7 Review ol rovent baags stripping tax mling and stmicture of the fansaction
described.

Falzone, Michulas 0416412 i3 33 Ruvicw Comdiage ren] stripping case, circutate and discuss with EXYCF wam,

Williams, Michacl 0441602 13 1.0 Dyigeussion with R. Shermon in preparation far call with It Millet ieparding
lecating tax aushion worksheet and ather in formation roparding resetvea and
liability - compare nates farm discussions with F1L Tucker aind M, Felish.

Witliama, Michael 0d/| /02 13 2.5 Review of first drafl disclosure stateanent wilh cmphasts on the deseription of the
tox considerations section.

Willioms, Michael 0d/17/02 13 2.0 Reviewed drafl revrpanizativn plan,

Miller, David 1702 15 0.2 Coordinating tax discussion with Company, Lotham & Watkins amd E&LY.

Miller, David T2 15 0.7 Discussions wills M, Williams and N. Falzone regarding CDHO bux atiribules ahd
imipact un Tcorpdaization.

Franco, Luis 04/17/02 13 07 Raview of recent tax npdate on lease-stripping transactiun,

Williaras, Michacl (18072 13 .5 Reviewed 1. Sperka's droft of the brief an the Cowndisco ment siripping case.

Williams, Michael od/ 1802 13 1.0 Rorvivwod ln meino prepared by R. Sherman for I Sperka and D. Miller nevicw,

Desc
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williankz, Michael /1902 13 0.4 Discussinn with B. Shenman and N, Palzone regarding the rent stripping ruling,
Willinms, Michael 2302 13 1.5 Cunununtcaliois with B. Hansen of Latham & Watkins regaiding s
considerations related m the internatianal tax structuring aspects of the plan of
reorganizativn, [ease Sirp claims, and the passibility for a priee 382 owbership
change.

Sherman, Richard 04/23/02 13 1.5 Research and pull Liquidating frust infarmation with respueet b possible revised
restructuring plat fot Comdisoo.

williams, Michael 0d/24/02 K] 2.0 Reviewed x ficdel for bankmaproy rearganizativn proposal propared by Armthar
Andursen and foswarded by 4. [eDuc of Skadden Arps.

Sherman, Richard 04/24/02 15 0.4 Divcussions with M. Williams to review conferenve sl noles réparding srachuring
alturnatives,

Sherman, Richard 04/24/02 13 1.2 Revicw tax structuring alternatives under the Brune plan with H. Tucker, M.
Wiltigms ond 1. Kromsnoble.

Willlaena, Michael Q4/25/02 13 1.5 Heview of taxable income analyses prepared by Comdisce and Arthur Anderscn as
related workpapers in conniction with the reorganization 1ax model.

willigms, Michael 04/25/02 13 1.0 Review ol e updated (rx digelnsure statement forwarded by A. LeDue,

Williams, Michast 04/25/02 13 1.0 Review valualion simmary of Rethschild analysis knwarded by Skadden Arps.

Sherman, Rivhard /25512 13 07 12rpft e-mail regarding tax disclosure stalemnent 10 5. Dollinger from Citigroup.

Slwran. Richard 0442542 13 0.7 Fallaw-up discussions with M. Williamaz regarding rax disclosure stavernunt ancd
liquidating trust structuring alternative.

Slerman, Richard D4/25/02 13 04 Revise e-mail and forwasd to 5. allinger at Citigroup.

Williamx, Michael 4/26/02 13 1.5 Curmnunications with R. Hanson regarding tax disclosure statenment for
Feonpaiization plan. - eommunications with David Miller Eich Shermon and Nick
Falzetie

Williams, Michac (14430702 13 2.0 Keview information reganding reorginization plan s filed with the Bankruptey
Court,

Sherman, Richard Dd/30/02 13 1.2 Review indemnily agreament received from |atham & Watking in conoeution with
claims against Comdisuu in Gonneetion with srip leases,

williams, Michael D5/01/02 i3 1.0 Read tax mamp with cennticing for changes for comsideration in the Diblor’a
rencyanization model propaced by Latham & Watkins.

Shermtan, Richard 05/01/02 17 1.5 Review of Latham & Watking comments regarding canveesaion points brought up
in nur canference call with Skadden, |.atham, Comdisco, and Andersen,

Sherman, Richard 05/14/02 13 0.3 Communications with M. Williams regarding submissions Lo the bankrprey caurt.
Follow-up up diseussions with EYCF regarding the sume.

Sherman, Richard Q5/30/02 13 1.0 Review lorwurded Lax infermarion fiom J. Franco reganling bankrupley (8%
disclisure.

Shernan, Richard il 0% Fd 13 [FR] Call to J. Krunsnuble regaiding the revised renrganization plan and disclosure

statermnent.

Desc
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Williams, Michac| 0605/07 1% 0.5 Jue Kronsnoble of Latbam ceparding tax matters related to amended plan.

Williams, Michacl 06/11/02 X .o Cuoordinale atd dizowss review of ravised evaluation of runoft tax impact prepared
by KI'MG with R, Bherman.

Willians, Michae| 06/t 102 13 0] Fosad communication from K EMU regarding reviewing and discussing 8 fevised
euadwation of rinoff rax impact prepared by KPMO.

Sheeruin, Hichard DE0 13 D& Internal discussions reparding remaining tax services to be provided in coordination
with Latbant and Watking.

1Toal 2047

Desc
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Milter, David ORAp%A1 15 02 Discussion with J. Griverti reparding work plan development and Courl hearing
[T (RA

Grivetti. John (A0 15 0.2 [Mscuagion with [2. Miller regarding work plan develupnicat and Cowr hearing
[ealiiiely (g

Milter, David oRim 15 21 Review of fax from Skadden Arps regarding Count hearing agenda

Dunn, Jamies DR AEA0] 15 i) Call with [2.Kolfen, ). Dum and B.Burretl regarding cxgeit iestimany

Dunn, James OH/29/01 15 1.0 Conference call with M.Cook regarding issues researched Jor preparation nf
wwatimony

Milier, [3avid 08/29/01 15 2 Telephone call with I. Grivetti roganding conrt hearipg on Blake contract

Conk, Martha QB/29/01 15 K} (nnference call with J. Dunn we assigt him in preparation for testimony

Crivetti, Juhn QRN 15 0.2 Telephone call with 1. Mikter reparding cpurt hearing un Blake cuntract

Mustellu, Audrey OR2%01 15 11 Overvigw of status and documents 1o date with 3. D

Trufin, Jamnes 08/30:1 15 101 Preporatiom for and uttenidunce sl cow hearig teparding acceptance nf orm
Rlake's emplnyment contract, including dizeugsions with Jomes Crmn and Till
Rarrett

Cinivell, John 08/30401 15 10.1 Preparation for and attendance al courl hearing reparding aeeeptonce of Norm
Rlake's empluyment vontract, including diseyssions with Jomes Dunn and Bill
Darrett

Mustella, Audrey CRLEOAN 15 08 Freparalion of ¢owr documents for J. Dunm

15 Tatal 154

Desc
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Franco, Luis 031502 in 1.7 Updale Lo claims analyais baged on review,

14 Total T

Desc



Case 01-24795 D

103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Enteredl/16/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 77 of 267

COMDIACO, TNC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERYICFS RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FUR THE FERIO JULY 27, 1081 TIIROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

FROFESSIONAL DATE PLY HOUTRS DESCHRIFTION -

Franuue, Luis H2/04/02 1a 0.5 Raview of regencly fited motion by Henriquez and Howard.

Miller, David DA/25/02 18 0.1 Lhaft of g-mail to 5. Dollinger regarding Company clatms analysis.

Franuu, Luiz Qd AN K02 18 1.5 Review of ¢laimg detail received fram the Company.

Framue, Lais 04412002 8 24 Indévidually and jointed reviewed claims information recetty reccived from the
Conpany.

Fianco, Luig 04/03/02 12 1} ] Review of claims infarmation, conventratiun un cking suppor.

1 2a5, laclyn 04/0302 1% 1.4 Preparatinn of claims balauue shewt analysis.

Francn, Luis 04/05/02 1% |6 Planning uf ulaims woikbook being assembled with information provided by e
Carnpany.

Francw, Luis [IEV LR 12 1.7 utline and revigw of sehedules tn be prepared. Review ol'clanns recanciliation
sohedule propared by 1. 1eas

Leas, Jaclyn 04/08/02 18 15 I¥evelnped spreadshest and made calculations bascd on preliminary claim
recongilintion.

\.2a5, Jachm /05,02 1% 2.7 Prepared claim inlomiabon spraadshect Tor E&Y analysis,

Franco, Luis IR 1% .5 Ruvicw of compongnta of "Other Fiabilities" ax identified by the conmpaay o1
discussion reparding compensation.

Luas, Jaclyn (/00T 12 1.2 [¥evelnp analysis for liahilites through June.

Feanco., Lia 04/10/02 1% 1.6 Review nf cantingent cluims schedules and wiorkbook eompleted by I. Leas.

1.eas, Jaclyn D 1002 I® 33 P'repared Lrip repurl-claims,

Miller, David 4/ 207 1% 0.7 Review of packaged assembled by EYCT team regarding liabiliics atalysis,

Miller, Dravid o4/ 1202 15 3 Workitiy with 1.. Francn regarding proposed revisions b labilites information
packaze.

Franww, Luia D41 2702 13 1.5 Heview of claims warkhnok and work W be cempleled with 13 Miller.

Frango, Luia /1 5/02 8] 25 Review of schadutes to ofF bulanve shecl claims and ¢laims repart.

Luay, Taclyn 0415702 18 30 Revised Cnmdisen mrip report claims.

Franco, Luis N/ a/02 18 26 Preparation of and chonges to Claims workbuok.

Desc
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¥R THE PERIOD JULY 27, 1001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

__PROTESSIONAL DATE PCD _NQURS DESCRIFTION

Miller, David 04/17/02 18 n7 keview nfrevised draft of EYCF labiliics analyais.

Miller, David 04/17/02 18 03 Moeating with 1.. France regarding claims analysis package.

Frameo, 1.nis 0d/17/02 1% LE Finalize claims werkbuok and proparation for sending to Committee wotking
group.

Miliet, David 04/22/02 18 0.2 Foltow up issues reganding pretiminary claims analysis.

Franea, 1.uis 05/29/02 18 2.0 Keview recently filed/received vompany c¢ourt filings, specifically Company's
secomd amnibus ohjection e claims,

18 Tolal kral]
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COMDISC, 1N
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERYICES EENDERFD BY FROJECT CODE
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FROFESSIONAL DATE rep HOLURS N DESCHRIPTION

Miller, 13vid 04/ 1602 ) 0.4 Review inlbrmation repanding leage stripping case and relabed claims.

Franeo, Luis D4/ LE/02 2 IR Cunference call with 1Y, Miller and FAY tax team ta discuss revent hease siipping
ruling and tax planning, sitatey po-forward.

France., 1.yis D/ L&/02 20 a8 [Jpdate e-mails v §. Dollinger summarizing recent discussion on bease sripgiig
mmsactivg and lax planting sirptepy-

fherman, Richard 04/16/02 20 L5 Conlirence call with Comdisen teom to discuss the recent Goutt decision regarding
Comdisee and beaze strip transoctions.

Miller, David Q1702 20 0.8 Cunlisence sall with vy advisors M. Willizms anit M. Falsone repacding leaps
stripping claitns.

Sherman, Richard nglTRoL 20 1.6 Review Andantach case regarding lease strip. Drall c-mail with questions for F.
sperka and 12, Miller to forward ta Crediturs.

Williame, Michae] 0a/149/02 20 [31 Conference call with D. Mitler regarding discads ient sripping communications.

Miller, David 04/19/02 0 8.3 Review amd forwatd information to Committee regarding leaso strippings ¢laims.

Miller, David 0422002 0 0.2 Leuse strippitig claiing issnes.

Franco, Luis (di22K02 0 0.6 Revicw of e-mails received fram K. Hanson regarding direetion for analysis of stip
I¢ase transactions and questions regarding detn behing Company's estimated
intergompany claim liahilites.

20 Tatol 8.5
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COMISCE, 1N,

ERNST & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETALIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD JULY 77, 2001 THROUGH AUGUSRT 12, 2002

FRUYESSIONAL DATE rCD HUURS DESCRIPTION -

Francn, [uis 03/05:02 21 0.4 Review uf cluims anabysis in prezeitation o Fquine Commirdee.

Miller, David WIEHZ b3 0.1 Working with L, Franea regarding onalysis nf claims.

Miller, David 031142 +3] 0.l Drraflt and semd w-mails 1o B, Hanson regarding Prism claim issues.

Miller, David 0312402 21 0.5 Review ol infonmatsn liom Febters regarding Committer presentation and telawd
appendices and Citibank fax of claims analysis.

Franco, Luis #3124 21 (] Review ol Toreign debts i determine prinrity in line ol claims,

Miller, David 03/13/02 1 L5 Whrking with [.. Franco regarding claiing atalysis,

Miller, David 0313002 21 7 Whnrking with E.. Mranco reparding analyss of baskruptey elaims - 1.azad and BY
versus. (00 analysis.

Franen, Luis 03/13/02 Al ni Camparizon of Movemiber wint Decenber claims analysis.

[ranco, Luis D31 HUZ 21 23 Comparison of ¢laims analysis between prior CYCT analysis and conipacy
providid

Eranca, Luis 03/13/02 21 1.2 Review of priotity claims analysis and creation of comparison hetween prior and
current analysis of cluims.

Milker, David 03/14/02 21 0.2 Tel=phane call J. Dakin repgarding anatysés of glaims.

Miller, David [EH EY] Z1 0.3 Working with L. Franco repardiag onabysis of claims.

Franca, Luis n3/14/6% 21 DE Disvusaions with Lazard on claims analysis including breakduwwn ol prigtity. non-
debron clairns, e

Franca, Luis 03/14/02 21 2.4 Heconeiliation of balance sheet claims veisug priodily of claims, including detailed
hreakdewn of halance sheet clanns.

Franca, T.uis 03/14/02 21 14 1Ipdote nf claims analys:s including company vecsos §azard, company versus EYCF
and Mavember versus Drcomber analysia.

Miller, Mavid 0315/02 Z1 0.5 Review of EYCF clabics analysis,

Miller, David D152 21 0.6 Telephune call Lo A, Paliea reparding venrures portfalio strateyies.

Miller, Dravid 3/1502 20 .3 Telephen ¢all 1o L. Franen regarding revisions ta claims raly s,

Franca, Luis D3/15/02 H .7 Review uof prior analysis of other liahilitles and claim:.

Franco, Luis 0V15/02 21 1.3 TIpdate to claims unalysis bascd an review.
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CONDISCO, INC,

ERMST & YOUNG CORPODRATE FINANCE 11.C
DETAIL OF SERYVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT COGDE
FOR THE FERICHY JULY 27, 2001 TIIROUGEH AUGUST 17, 22

PCD HOLRS o DESCHIFTION
21 1.2 Conversativns with Lazard zam regarding claims analysis amd call on Monday.
H| 0.3 Ruview of EYCF analysis of claims.
2l 0.2 Telephone call tn L. Franco regarding analysis uf vlaims for Lazard.
24 0.3 Review af ¢laims analysis and comparison Lo Lazard analysis,
20 1.5 Review and gomection of claims comparisons,
21 2.3 Conference call with Company and Arthur Anderaon on claims questions, claims
anakysis ond subsequent recording of recap,
21 n.1 T-mail ip D. Bava regarding indenture Frustee eloims.
21 Total nr

Desc



Case 01-24795 D 103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered,10/16/02 00:00:00

_ PROFESSIONAL

Pleading Page 82 of 267

COMDISUD, 1N,
ERMNET & YOUNG CORPORATE FINAMCE LIC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED RY PROJECT CODE
FOR TTIE PERIOD JULY 27, 201 THROLGH AUGUHST 12, X002

DATH D HOURS DESCRIFTION ——

Liriveiti, John

Lilcichenhaus, Sman

08/13/01 2z 5.2 Prepared, reviewed and cdited summary of financed leases W delermrine appropriale
secured LR balunce at 6/30

03/31/01 22 1.2 Develen hypothelical claim cstipsares

22 Tutal ad
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COM NSO, INC.
ERMNSET & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETALL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIQD LY 27, 2001 TITIROUGIH AUGUST 12, 2007

PROFESSIONAL DATE rep HBLRS CESCRIPTIGN

Mitler, David nE/29/n 215 0.2 Telephuny vall wilh J, Griventi regarding due diligence status and sul.lim_.'. necling
with Arthar Andersen

(Hleichenhaws, Stuart o101 15 10.1 Paativipaled an incctings at the Debtnr's affices with O, Schuster, other Lazard
Freres prufessionals, and debar management and reviewed information o data
Tonm

Cirivetti, Juhn DA DA 15 6.6 Baticipated in mectings at the Debtar's affices with D. Schuster, oler Lazard
Fiuees profosgionals, and debtar management and reviewed inturingtion in data
[Leeri]

Cirivelt, Juhn /12701 25 33 Driscuzaions with [Jebtor management regarding statuy of lcagiog voatical buginesses

Cerivetl, Jobn (a1 201 15 22 Muecting with Arthur Andersen professionals regarding lase tape detail, methed nf
prtparatian

Ryan, Frances 091 2/01 25 2.2 Meering with Arthur Andersen prafessionals reparding lease tape detail, method nf
preparntian

van Vuren, Frik 09/12/01 2% 2.0 Driscussions with Debtur managcent reparding status of leasing vertical businesses

Van Vuren, Erk 094 2/01 15 2.2 Mocting with Anfiur Andersen professianals regarding lease tape detal, method of
proparalioi

Grivetts, Johin 094 301 15 1.1 Maeting, with Arthar Andersen professional W discasy ineetisigicneica in data
proviged by Company

Ryan, Franges 08/13/01 15 1.1 Meeting with Arthur Andersen profvssional iz distwss ingensisiencies in data
providad by Company

Van Vuren, Crik Q9131 A 1.1 Meeting with Arthur Andorsen professional to discuss inconsisiencies in dala
provided by Company

Van Yuren. Erik w7700 25 0.5 Mcatitip wilh Arthur Andersen professionals regarding o [ing: request items

Griveitd, Jobin 09/15/01 15 .5 Moeting with Arthur Andersen profissional regarding lvasc portfolios

Van Vuren, Frik 091801 25 iLh Mzeting with Arthur Andersen prolussional regarding lease portfolins

Van Vuren, Frik 10/01/01 24 1.5 Meeting with AA te disouss 2atus of request list

Van Vuaren, Erik 1eHOZI04 25 0.6 Moecling wilh AA to discuss status of request list

Gleichenhaus, Stuan 1601 25 3.2 Preparation for Unagonred craditar committee meeling

Wilkiams, Michacl 18003/01 25 0.2 Conturcnes call with E. Van Vuren regarding Creditors Cummiltes nbeeting.

Van Vuren, Erik T30 25 0.2 Cuntiaends vall with M. Wiltinms regarding Creditors Commiltes mesting,

Gleichenhaus, Stuarl W01 25 14.2 Preparation for, attendance at and review of materials pmvidm! al Ungecured

Credditer Committes meeting with she debtor and its represontatives
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COMDESO, INC

ERNST & YOUNG CURPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVIUCES RENIIERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

FPROFESSION AL DATE rei HOURS DESCHIPTION

Miller, David 10ARK 25 A0 Attznd and participate in meclipg between Eebtor and Ungscured Creditors’
LCommittza,

Miller, Travid 10434401 23 (IR Discussions with K. Krakoa and G. Smih of Atthur Andersen ceparding
informatian flew and wwonthly repor.

Williams, Michacl 1070501 25 1.1 Conterence call with 1,Miller and N.Falzone reganding Ceoditors meeting, case
status and tax suEmEey NG,

Williams, Michael MOS0 25 b Triscussicms with D. Pacini reparding conferance call with D.Miller and Creditors
Cnmmittes meeting,.

Falznne, Michubas 11401401 a5 0.7 Discussions with D.Pavin reparding creditor committes moctitg

Falzone, Nicholay 11l 25 A% Preparation lor and participation in Creditors Committcs nieeting. ingluding
discussions with M, Williama regarding developmenis (ron the mesring.

Williama, Michazl 1101401 25 Q.0 Maciing with M. Falzone repuriting developments ar the Creditors Comemiliee
ineeting.

Pacini, Norathea 114701 25 2 Friscussion with N, Falzone repading Creditor Commibies nigeting,

irivetti, John L14n/m 25 5.1 Preparation ki and attendance a1 the mezting hetween the unsceouted creditar
cnmmittes and the Dbt and its representatives

Miller, David 11/07/01 25 1% Telephune call with K. Krakora regarding siatus of inlomnation requests and due
diligence mectings.

Liriveli, John 11/07/01 15 2.4 Dyigcugsions with T2.Miller, E.VanVuren, and K.Krakara and G.8mith Fum
Acidersen regarding information request and current cose status

Grivett, John L1/15/01 15 13 Discuzsed request list history and the Company's responsiveness with Suc Dollinger
and the Y team

v gorman, Anna 12/05M01 15 14 Preparation for meeting with Mike Felish at Comdisco and Intornational tax
directnr.

Vonrtman, Amma 1240001 25 20 Meeting at Cumdisce with VP of Tax and Internativnal tax direetor to discass and
evaluate L5, Joreagn tas crodin and overall foreiyn loss.

Thuupsah, S¢an 12/06/01 23 ot Mucting a1 Comdises with VP of Tax and Laternational Tax Director w discuss and
evaluate US forgign can credit and uvaaall forcign Yose in light of sde of non LS
vpraliong,

Campbell, Keith 12712701 25 1.2 Dhigcazs capital calls with engapemend twam, M. Mekenna and Andersen,

Fraaca, Luis D1/08/02 25 0.5 Telephong rall with AA and company © diseuss quastions on Lhe dircol S&A detail
provided on 12721701,

Camphet], Xeith Q1/08/02 25 i3] phone call with K. Krakora lrom Arthur Andersen tn discuss dircct 5G&A
forceasts.

Miller, Tiavid 0205402 25 0.2 Conference with M. Faziu, 5. Dollinger and ). Grivetti reganbing stand along plan
and SG&A analysis.

Williamsg, Michael 02113402 15 0.5 Communications among M. Felish K. Sherman, S. Thompson, A, Voortmian, N.

Falzone and J. Grivetti regarding mecting ar Comdisco and partivipation.

Desc
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CUMDISCO, 1N,

FERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETATL OF SERVICES RENDEREDR BY PROJECT CODE
¥R THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2007 THROIICH AUGUST 12, 2042

i ] HOATRE _ DESCRIPTION

15 0.4 Communications with 3, Thompaon, A. Voartman, N. Falaone and R. Sherman
reparding preparations Bar ax meating at Comudiscu with Wx Manpgement and
Arthur Anderson.

15 14 Communicativns flom M. Felish tax director of Cumndiseo planning and
prafessionals attending schadilad meeting - Condereses ¢al) with Jaha Grivetti
regariing communications fram Creditars Commitice

25 0.3 Telephone call w M, Pelish regarding conllicls with ibceting for Peb. | 9th and o
reschedule.

23 w7 Varivas conversations with M. Williams regarding the tescheduling of the
Camdisco meeling.

25 R Frrward mussapcs 1 grow regarding re-scheduling ol iy mesting.

25 0.7 Telephune catl with K. Mishler regariting foreign (Eabilities and debt obligations,

il 14 Preparation far and discussions with R, Mishler, nther Debtor empleyecs and
D.Milier regording foreign liabiliticg and debt obligatinns.

25 4.0 Preparation and edit of analysis of foreign and other lisbilitics aud symmary of
rebarcd disenssinn with R.Mishler and revigw of related documenis,

25 (A Preparation and participaicd in conference call with meinbers of ehtor's
management regarding proposed compensation prograns.

25 Q.5 Partivipated in telecon ference with N. Rasi reparding UCC's evaduation ul Delytor'a
prupuscl COMPENERtian programs.

24 1.0 Conferonee call with M. Felish and R, Sherman regarding ellect of the 1 chanpes
ol the connamic stimulus package on e ability to carry back nel operating losses
and bionng depraciation.

15 ] Participated in conferences with N. Xazi, M. Pellechia and Kinberly Bogis
eparding Debine's propused cumpcnzation programs.

25 0.5 ‘Telephone call with M. Williaing regarding state NOL and related issnes.

25 L4 Pasticipated i conferences with N. Razi, M. Pellechia and T2. Katfen regarding
Diebtor's proposed compensation programs,

25 18 Anehded UGG mesting with Debtor regarding presentation of Deblor's proposed
compLusation proprams.

3% 0.2 Patticipared in telecon ference with M, Pellecchia regarding dkata and infermation
roquest with respect in Debtur's proposed compensation proprams.

25 0.5 Preparation and patticipatian in conference call with M. Felish and R, Sherman
toparding requesting information related ta tax considerations of bankrupeey plan
under consideration, including iaulis of Arthur Anderson rooiyanization tax model.

25 [FR] Enllnw-up from M. Felish regarding Arthur Andersen reorganization fax model and
prapnant for o meating - discussion with R Sherman regardang, cutyminication with
L. Miller.

25 1.1 Conferance call with R. Mishler and K. Krakoe (Arthur Anderson) regarding
infarmatinn list and diligence on claims and business plans.

15 0.3 Paticipated in teleconfirence with N, Razi reparding status of infunhation requests

andl Dyebiod's changes to praposed conpensation pesgrams.
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COMDISCO, TNC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
AL OF SERYICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOILIULY 27, Hi01 THROUGH AUGUST 13, 2002

FROTFESSIONAL DATE P HOTRS R DESCRIPTION

willigms, Michael 03/22K2 23 Lo Communivations amedg M. Felish, 1. Miller, N. Falzane and R. Sherman
roparding obaining information related to tax anabysis.

Kalfen, TInnald 03/22/02 25 0.5 Participated in releconferences with M. Razi, M. Pellecchia and K. Bupys cepgarding
latcst changes to Nehtor's propased compensation pragrums.

Miller, Fravid 03/22/02 25 0.6 ‘Telephone call to H. |.ackey and ¥ Krakora (Arthur Anderson} regunling company
wlaina analysis.

Hopgs, Kimherly 03/22/02 25 0.5 Pavierpated worelecanferances with 0. Kalfen, N. Rozi and M. Pellecchya regarding
latest changes w Debtor's proposed compensatian programs.

K.l fen, Nonald Q3/25/02 25 30 Panticipated in ¢onference with UCC, Dehtor and respective counsels and advisors
separding 12chtor's prapnsed eompensatian nrograms.

Bnggs, Kimberly 03/25/02 25 R7i] FPorticipated in conference with UCC, Deblor and mospoctive coutscle and advisors
regording Dehtor's proposed Campensation Prograins.

Miller, David Q32802 2% 0.2 Review of L. Franco summary of walls with Company for sending 1e 5. Dollinger.

Miller, David 03AR02 25 0.2 Ruview of mucting eulling for Company due diligence.

Franea, Luis 03/29/02 15 0.5 Cally and coordination stk Comdises regarding potential visit next week.

Williams, Michael 04/01/02 25 1.0 Preparation for nnd participation in meeting with M. Felish regarding, preparatan of
1ax aspects of the raorganization plan - Discussion with . Sheunan and N, Falzang
repording same.

Kalfian, Donuld 04/01/02 24 1.0 Preparation for and participation in wonfencs call with LCU representatives,
&Y, [.ozard teams and Debivr represenlatives 1o dizcusy rovisions (o sompensation
programs and interim compensative programs proposal,

Franco, Luis 4102 P 1.3 Cnntinued preparation tor mectings a1 Comdiseo, including compilation nf
questions to address.

Framw, Luis (/001702 15 2.6 Proparation for and panticiparion in mesting with the Company. [ncluded
courdinating fieciinga with the Company, reviewing topics to he discussed with the
Company v conference call.

Bogpa, Kimberly 0d4/01/02 a5 1.0 Farticipated in telephone conference with LICC representatives, EY and Lasard
amg and 1 Jebror represantatives to discuss revisions to Compensation Progema
and jureriny Compensation Fragrams proposal.

Shemman, Richard 04,/01/02 25 0.4 Shent revigw nf gase issues with M Wilhams prior 1o meeting with Arthur Arderson
and M. Felish.

Wiltiams, Michael 04/02/02 23 bl Meeting with 1[. Tucker and L. Muldawur o' Anbur Andersen , M. Pelish and H.
Antenitas af Comdisca.

Wilkiams, Michael D402 25 2.0 Preparution for and partivipation in mccting with Arthor Anderson, Comdico, K.
Shermun and . Falcvow - Réview and prepare file for meering - follow-up with B,
Bherman regarding sam.

Miller, David NAIZALL 25 08 Meeting and discussions with L, Franee reparding management mestings and
diligence wepics and requests.

Francu, Luis 9402402 25 a7 Consultation and review ol questions agsembled by E&Y team on mode] integmity
checks af Company's consolidated linanctal statcanty,

Franca, Luix 0402402 2% 1y Review and preparation of questions submilted o the Company and others to be

discussed ot Inmarrnw's meeting.
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COMDIRCO, INC.

ERNST & YOING CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
NETAIL QF RERVICES RENDERED BY 'ROJECT CUDE
KO THE FERIOD ITILY 27, 2001 THROUGIH ACGUST 12, 2042

PROFESSIONAL DATE FCD HOURS LESCRIFTION

Sheviman, Righard 04/02/02 15 a0 Meeting with ™. Felish and H. Tucker at Comdisco reganting bankruptey plan.
Roview notes reparding information received fram meeting regurding lax allributes,

Miller, Navid Qu/03/02 15 1.0 Revigw of Company presentations (business plans, vlaims anakysis and 5GA
coats) in preparation for mestings with Management.

Miller, Navid 04/03/02 25 2.0 Magting with H Lackey nnd J. Seiametta regarding discussion and review ol details
winderlying claims estimates.

Millar, Navid Da/03/02 25 L1 Mezging with €3, Sahatello regarding disvussion of C1% plany and powniial issucs,

Miller, David 04/03/02 25 1.2 Maeting with I Reynolds regarding allocation of asset salvy provesds and domaestic
and fareign cash flows.

Miller, David AT 15 1.9 Meeting with J. Vande Muori: igaeding US leaging buginess and residual cash
flows ussumptions.

Miller, David (471302 25 a7 Muating with Condises Manapeinent ragarding shared services custs.

France, Lyia O/03/02 15 5.6 Dligenee nwgetings ot the Company with D. Reynolds, J. Mowre, G. Sabawello, J,
Seiameta, M. Mekenna, Topics discussed included U8, Leasing assumplions,
Claigng detail, Balonee Sheet and SG&A assumplions.

France, I.nia 0a/03/02 15 1.4 tnitial compogition of document summarizing meeling.

Bnggs, Kimberly 04/03/02 24 a3 Participated in teleconibrences with N, Rai tepatding revisions tn Debtor's
propused COmpENsion programs.

France, Luig (/0402 25 &) Curtinucd composition of document summarizing meeting at Company.

Bogpa, kimberly 04/07/02 15 {1 ] Dafted e-mail comemondence tn . Razi regarding status of UCC counter
prposal,

Begps, Ximherly DA0B/02 25 0.4 Partigipated in telephone conference with M. Ruei reparding statws of information
raquests.

Kalfen, Dunall /11702 15 25 Attemibed conlerence with Dubtor, UCC memibers, cownsel and respective advisors
regarding 1CC Counter Proposal 1o Dobior's propoeed Compensation Programs.

Sherman, Richard 041702 25 1.5 Cunlirence vall with 1, Krongnolyle a1 tarham & Watkins regarding Comdisco and
the inforenation provided eo ug from Arthur Andersen.

Wwilliams, Michael /22402 25 20 Conlerenes call with A. Lelug, Skadden Arps, H. Antanitas, R. Shennaa, J.
Kroasoble and J. Love reparding tax role.

williams, Mighazl 04/23/G2 25 1.5 Preparation fnr and participation in conference call with Skadden, Arps, Comdisea
and Arthur Andersen.

Sherman, Richard 04/23:02 25 46 Prepararion for ond participation in conderence call with Lathain & Watkina,
Skadden Arpa, H. Tusker and M. Felsish reparding bankruptey o lzalom plan,

Williams, Michael 0d/24702 25 1.0 Preparation and conrdination for conference call with Skadden, Arps, Arthw
Arndersen and Comdisen.

Shennan, Richard 0424702 25 | Propaation o and pontici paricn in conference call with I. Kronsnable of Lalham &

Walking, H, Tucket from Arthur Andersen and M. Williams.
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COMDMNECD, INC.

FRNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAMN. OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIODJULY 27, 2000 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2IH2

PROFESSIONAL DATE FCD HOT! DESCRIFTION

Sherttain, Richard Qd4/24/02 25 24 Propaation fior aod panigipation in ennference call with J. Kronsnoble Trom Latham
& Watking, H. Tucher fram Arthur Andersen, A. LeDuc lrom Shadidun Arps and M,
Williatrs,

Williama, Michaal 04/25/02 25 240 Preparatinn for and panticipation in conference call with A, Debue, H. Tucker, H.
Antonitas, J. Kronsnohle and 1. Love regarding updited lax disclosuic stanement
and Asthus Andeesen rearganization tax madel.

williama, Michael 04/25:02 25 1.5 Faotlow-up canferenee call with H. Tucker, Fl. Antanitas and Latbani and Watkéng
teparding 4% rentganizotion model.

Sharman, Righard 04/25/02 25 1.4 Contgrenee call with Arthur Andersen, Skadden Arps, Lalhan & Watking and

Comdisen regarding rearganization plan and tax models,
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ERNST & YOUNG CORMORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERYICES RENDERED BY FPROJECT CODE
FOR TIE FERIOD JTULY 27, 2001 TIIROUGH AUGUST 12, 2042

PROFESSIONAL DATE PO HOLURS DESCRIFTION
Franen, Luis Q5/07/02 15 0.5 Preparation lin confirenes call with Company regarding revised
vt luationy | Coo v erics,
Miller, David Q5/08/02 25 0.2 ‘Telepleone calf regarding fargign entity racapitalizatinn.
Francn, Luis Q5/08/02 15 03 Uonfercnes cabl with the Company.
Tranca, Luis Q5/09/02 25 | ] Conference Calt with the Company ta discuss KTRP and valuation/recovery.
Williams, Michael 05/29/02 25 14 Diizcugsian of chpagement status with N. Falzane and J. Wijas - Communicativns
from 1. Franea regording status and Board selection
25 Total 1822

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered
Pleading Page 90 of 267

16/02 00:00:00

COMDISCO, INC,
ERNGT & YOUNG CORIMORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR TIIE FERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGLH AUGUST 12, 2002

. DESCRIFTION

Barlicipaie on Comntittes eall reparding initial issyea liat

Participate oty Committee eall reparding initinl issnee list

Panicipate on Conwidee eall reparding imitial igayes lise

Freparation tor Creditors Committee meeting inchuling review ol agenda and

Preparation for Crediturs Cormiles tiseting including review of apenda and

Proparalion for and participation st Creditors Committes meeting

Freparation for and attendance at Creditor Cammittes meeting with the Debtor and

Preparation for and atiendance st Crodilor Comanittes mecting with the Deblor

{Coeordinated eflons with Lazard, pulled i from data rupen

Participare on Committee call regarding Count hearing this wesk

Send e-mail to Committer rearding Rothschild hire

Telephone vall 1 D Milkor roygarding Creditors Commiatiog meeting

Telophone call v 3, Gleichenhaus regarding Creditors Committes meeting

Parttcipated m sonlirence call with Creditor Commitiee co chairs to discuss statua

PROFESSIONAL DATE FCD HOIIRS
Gleichenhaus, Stuart Q02101 6 1.5
Miller, Dravid 002101 6 1.5
Ghivend, John OH/02/01 4 1.5
Gleichenhaus, Stuart BHATA] 0 [ Partigipate in Creditors' Committes Call
Miller, David AT AR 24 (1K) Farticipate in Creditars’ Committee Call
yrivetii, John D801 26 [i%] Farticipate in Creditars' Committe= Call
Falzone, Wicholas O8/20/01 26 3.5
related data
Gleichenhaws, Stuart 08/204/01 26 4.1
related data
Falzune, Nichules Q21701 26 10,7
Gileichenhana, Stuarr QR21/08 24 181
ils representatives
Girivetti, Jnhn [T PO ]| 26 10.2
Van Vuren, irik 09/ 10701 16 1.2
Gleichenhaus, Stuarl Y1701 26 1.8 Partivipated e Connnmties confereses ¢all
Miller, Lyavid /177410 b1 R
Miller, Diavid 0%/1741 26 0l
Cirivett, John 017401 26 1.8 Participated in UCC conference call
(leichenhaus, Stuart 09/25/01 26 Q.2
Miller, David aR/25/01 26 0.2
Gleichenbaus, Suart 09/25/01 26 23
und case stralepy
White, Ken D9/28/01 26 23

Adtended mevting at WLRE oflices with Creditlor Committes co chais (o discuss
status and cane strateygy
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Grivetti, John O9/28/01 26 23 Participated in vonlirence vall with Crediter Committes oo chairs to discuss statar
and case strategy

Grivetti, John 10/31/01 26 1.0 Prepared for Unsecured crodilor commiftee maeting

Miller, David P1420/01 26 8| Discussion with J. Qiiveuli regarding Commitree meeting next week and call
inmaraw.

Glaichenhaus, Stuart 11430/01 26 2.2 Attended meeting with Co-chaira of unsecured creditor committes and all its
professionals in MY

Girivetti, John 113041 iy 1z Attended muctiog withh Co-chaira of unseeured creditar commiliee and all itz
prafessionals in MY

Miller, David 12040 20 6.0 Parlivipale in mucting willl Company and Creditors Commitiee represertlal vy
reparding businges plans and leasing auction

Millcr, David 12/05/1 26 02 E-miail to 5. Nollinger reparding meeting tollow up arcas.

Miller, Navid 12/12/01 26 0.4 Telephone call with 5. Dallinger wyarding duc dilipence issues and fax on
FY/l.azard work plan items.

Camphell, Krith 12712401 20 0.8 Discuss Gan o 5. Dollinger on bid valuation model with engagement aim and
plan lbr cunlirence call with Lazard.

Miller, David 12713001 26 1 Conlérenee with C. Fortgang, R. Thomton, Lazard, and P. Price repading vpdate
on Debiors analyais of | .easing hids and Debtary' devision aot 1 sl

Miller, Lyavid 12/13401 26 0.4 Confarence with 8. Dedlinger and Lazard regarding due dilipence requirements
regarding leasing hids and business plan.

Camphell, Keith 12/13401 26 0.4 Conference call with 8. Dollinger and Lazard to discuss wark plan.

Crivetti, Jobn 1214401 BT x5 Preparatien for and participation m Cuemtpings call regarding leasing bid updaie and
including review ol Lazard cvaluation of hids.

Miller, David 12/2041 b1 0.4 Partivipae in Comminee ¢all regarding leasing hid update.

Gleichcnhaus, Swar 0107402 26 0 Telephons call with §. Doltinger of Cilibank W propans Ty 1/10/02 mesling.

Nk, Lavid 01/08/02 26 a4 Conference with R. Thomtan and 5. Dollinger segacding nieeting agenda and
dilipence issues.

Grivetti, John 01/08/02 26 an Conference call with B. Thomton and 5. Dollinger regarding meeting agenda and
diligence issues.

Crleichenhous, Sman 01/10/02 26 25 Meeting with Crediters Commilies and Cothdisco.

Grivetti, Iohn 01/10/02 26 R0 Preparation fur and participation in ¢reditor commities meeting with the Debtor and
its professionals.

leichenhaus, Shaarl 01/16/02 26 50 Telephene call with &. Dollinger of Cilibank,
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Millet, Lyavid

miller, David

Gieichenhaus, Stuart

Miller, Navid

Miller, David

Gleicheanhuus, Stuarl

Miller, David

Miller, David

Millet, Lavid

Miller, David

[Pranco, Luis

Miller, David

Glewchimliauz, Stuar

Miller, David

Franca, Luis

Miller, Duavid

Miller, David

Millet. Lavid

Franve, Luiz

Franvo, Luis

1PATE. rCD HOURS DESCRIFTION

01/23/02 26 0.5 Telephone call with 5. Dollinges regarding infarmaotion request sent to Company.

0172502 24 0.2 Dialug with B, Thomton and . Gleichenhaus regarding meeting this week,

Q1/28/02 . 0.4 Telephone call with 5, Lollinger of Citihank.

Q1/28/02 2 0.4 Discussions with 3, Dallinger and 5. Gleichenhaus regarding coordination for
upoaming mectings.

al/30/02 26 0.4 Treparation for mucling with Citibank, Committee Chair,

arsya 26 25 Tetephone ealt with S, Txallinger and R Thomlen of Citsbank.

a0 26 1.0 Muiting with & €llzichenhaus, R Thornton and 8, Dhellinger reparding leasing sale,
wirk plan, information gzthering and billings,

0241/02 26 1.1 Telephone call with 5. Dullinger icyarding failure of IT leasing zale.

02113402 26 3 Telephone call with 3. Dollinger regarding wark plan status and newly teecived
information.

D2/1542 26 .3 Driaboy with 5, Dollinger regarding tax diligence and netlng,

121802 6 1.4 Update consolidated cash flow hreakdown to include mionthly average of FY ended
M.

D2 19/02 26 2 Fallaw up with 5. Dollinger (Cilibank} reparding mesting in WY and in formativn
and fee onabysis.

02:22/0%2 26 14 Call with Bue Dollinger and Raudy Thormton and Chaim Fortgang of Citibunk 10
dizcuss Comdisvo's plans,

022202 26 0.2 Review ul c-mails reparding Creditors Committes meeting and resulis of
venirenue call.

BZ/2HMNZ 26 03 Chrcation of apendn for Friday call.

G2 25 ol ‘T'efephons call §. Doltinger regarding agonda for call on Monday.

001702 el 04 Whrking with L. France reparding preparation of agenda for calt with 5. Dollinger.

03/04/02 26 R Telephone call 8. Dullinget reparding update an Debtor mestings aud go lorward
work plan.

0X/04/02 ) 0,5 Isisenssion with 5. Dallinger and Laeard rogarding the forwarded list of claims and
request for TACY to creute o cunsvlidated balance sheet os of June 30, 2002 baxcd
on Larard's 3:31:0F analysis und rooently grovided 13730401 information.

03/03/02 ] .7 Lipdate call with 5. Dolinger bascd on apctida dated 371402
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Millet, Lavid

Franca, [.uis

Gleichenhaus, Stuart

Frango, Luis

Frangae, knis

Millar, David

Kallen, Donald

Miller, Dravid

Franco, Luis

K alfen, TJonald

Mitler, David

Boyps, Kitberly

Gleechenhaws, Smarnt

Williams, Michagl

Kallin, Dunald

Kalfe, Lionald

Buyye, Kimberly

Gileighenhans, Sheart

Gleichenhavs, Stoart

Kalfin, Douald

DATE M 1] HORS DESCRIPTION

03/05/02 b1 0.5 Telephone eall . Noltinger and K. Schpal tegarding projected halance shect and
claing analysia.

Q30K 2% ] “[alephane call with 8. Dillenger reparding projecied balance sheet and claims
Analysis.

037412 5 4.5 Megting with Creditars Conunittee and Company.

DT 26 s 1araft of summary of Unsevurcd Creditors' mesting en be distributed.

007/02 24 0 Basticipation for and participation i Unsecured Creditors’ meeting.

(3370802 26 (1 Send e-mail w &, Dullinger regarding fallow up ta Commuitice tecting and impact
on work plan.

0%/11/02 26 0.3 Participated in 1eleconferenee with . Dolbinger and othey sepresentatives of UOC,
Cummitie: counsel and [7. Miller regarding protocels and process for reviewing
Dublur's proposed compensation programs.

Qa3/11/02 1 0.7 Telephone ¢alt %. Dollinger and . Schuster (egarding EYCF wark plan und
usgIETANGe 1o bazard.

03/11402 6 0.6 Conforence ¢4l with engagement tean, meluding Citibank tn discuss recent
Conminee mesting.

[EREN(Y] 6 L4 Participated in teleconforcnce with LICC member, Lazard reprosentativea, EYCF
represantatives and K. Bupps ieparding Dehtor's propased CUIPCIZALiGH PEOgTams.

/18402 16 0.7 Participate un vall with Citibank and Lazard regardiog prelintingry valuation
analysis and coinpeizatio progrom.

03/12/02 26 .o Bartivipated in teleconference with UCC meniber, Lazard representatives, EYCF
represcntatives and 2. Kalfen regarding Debtor'a proposed compensation proyrans,

0371902 20 6.0 Meeting with Creditors Committer and Coimpany.

1YL 26 1.% Preparation for and partivipation in Creditor Commities mawcting with 1. Miller and
3. Cleichanhaus regarding communicotion af the observations it the e-mail
concerning the 542 million refund ¢laim under the sconumiv sticiulus paglage.

03/19402 26 1% Attended UCC mecting with Debtar regarding prosciitation of Debtor's propused
compensaLiot i eErma.

03/25/02 b1 13 Participated in ennference with UCC, counag) and advisors regarding Deblon's
propuicd compenzavion pragrms.

03/25/02 60 1.3 Participated in eonference with LCC, cuunsel and advisors regarding Debtor's
propased Campensation Proprams.

03/26/02 26 18 Meeting with Creditors Commilles,

04/01/02 26 1.3 Proparation and porticipation in canlisrcnce ¢all reparding compensation plans.

04/01/02 26 0.3 Participated in wleconference with Susan Dollinger and FY team regarding Dueblor

to propusad Compensation Pragrams.
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Kallin. Danbald 040 1/02 26 1.5 Participated in confrence call with K. Boggs in review Dehtor's revisions
propuscd Gompenasion programs.

Hopgs, Kimberty 0201702 26 0.5 Parficipated in relecon ference with Susan Dollinger, EY vam and Doald Kalfen
reparding Dehtor's revisions to praposed Compensalion Froprarms.

Bopgs, Kimberly 04/01/02 26 1.5 Participated in conference with Donald Kalfen to review Deblors ievisions to
praposed Compenzation Proagrams.

Kalfen, Ionald 0d/02/02 26 03 Participated in teleonnferances with K. Roges regarding Deblor's mevisions 1o
praposed compensation programs and status of conference call schedule.

Bopis, Kimberty 0d4/02/02 26 02 Parucipaicd in telephong conference with . Razi regarding further Deblor
1GVISIONS 10 CoMPENaRtinn programs.

Baygs, Kimberly 04/02/02 26 iR Participated in teleconfirences with D. Kallen reparding revigions to eompensation
programs and status of con ference call sehedule.

Kalfen, Donald 04/03/02 Zir 1.2 Preparation fur and parlivipation in confirence call with UCC representatives,
Lazard teum, and E&Y tvam to diseuss Licbtora revieed praposed compensation
pragrams and U CC s UCC countel proposal,

Kallien. Donald a2 26 0.4 Parlicipated in venliorenes call with 5. Dollinger and K. Boggs to discuss UCO
counter propusal stratcgy,

Mliller, Dravid /82 26 0.3 Tulephoue call with 5, Dallinger reparding updaie nn management meetings and
diligence resuls,

Hapgs, Kimberty 04/03/02 26 1.2 Participated in telephone conference with UCC represvotatives, Lazard iam and
F&Y tenm o discuss Debter's revised proposed compensation o egrama and 1700 s
1/CC enunter pronosal.

Dupygs, Kimberly 04/03/02 It 0.4 Participated in cenlrencs call with 5, Dollinger and 1. Kalfen to disouss UCT
counter proposal strileyy.

Kalfen, Dunald 04/04/02 26 1.0 Participaled in vonlincies all with Th Sehoster ond K. Boggs regarding UCC
counler proposal,

Bopgs, Kimbetly (/04/02 26 1.0 Participated o wlkephone conferenges with I Schuster and D. Kalfen reygarding
LICC Counter propasal o Debtor's propnsed compensativn program.

Kaolfen, Nonald D4/05/02 26 1.0 Participated in telecomferences with 8. Dullinger, D, Schusa aind K. Bogpata
discuss 1ICC counter proposal.

Kalfen, Dranald 04/05/02 26 14 Participated in teleconfirences with 5. Dodlinger, I Sebuster and K. Roggs to
discuss individual partivipant data and E&Y cost analysis.

Dopps, Kimberly /N0 20 1.0 Participated in leleconfiercnces with 5, Lodlinger, 12, Schuster ond [1. Kalfen to
discuss UCC coumlor propusal,

Dopps, Kimburly (/N2 2 1.9 Participated in Wlcoonfoicnees with 5. Lollinger, 1. Schuster and 0. Kalfen
discwss individual purticipant data and E&Y comt analysis.

Bopps, Kinbetly /0702 26 2.5 Parttcipated in wAooonicrenes with 5. Dollinger, D. Schuster and D. Kalten
wepariling cevisions 10 UG counter proposal tn Debtor's proposed cumpensalivn
PrOLTAING.

Bogps, Kimbely A2 26 0.3 Favsimile bansmission of LLC counter propasal and R&Y cost analywis und
partivipated in leleconlorence with 5. Dellinger reparding preparation for status
telephone conlerence.

Kalfin, Donald C4/NINZ iy 1.5 Participated in wheconlineice with Sugan Dallinger, David Schuster and ather

memhers of Lazard teanm and Kinberly Boppz reparding UCC Counter Proposal
and EY cost analyses.
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Bupps, Kimburly [ERERE 5 215 1.5 Fartivipated in bovonfaence with %, Lallinger, . Schuster and other members of
Lazard team also D Kalfon ieganding UCC gounter proposal and FE&Y cost
analysis.

Bogps, Kimnberly D08 25 0.3 Participated 1o wloeemferenes with § Tiollinger ragarding UCC Counter proposal 1
Debiu's propesed compensation propram.

Kalln, Duoild IHAAYS b1 0.4 Partivipatcd m wlcconfrence with Susan Trollingar regarding UCT Counter
Praposal to Debtor's propestd Compenasation Propram.

K.alfin, Duoald IRARKAL, P13 0.4 Partivipated in wleconfaence with 1uia Franeo of EYCF regarding Debtor's
propused claimy miniinization compengarion poal.

Chleivhenhaus, Swan W1 1702 26 0 Prepaiation for and panticiparion in Creditnes Committes meeting.

Millar, Mavid 11702 6 Q.2 1¥igeussinn with 1.. Franca regarding Creditar Comeniltes mecling igults.

Trance, Luis 04/11/02 26 24 Preparavinn and participation in Crediters’ Conunittes vonforence ol

Gleichenhaus, Stuart 04/12/02 26 1.0 Preparation and panticipation i venlizenes call reparding eompensation plans.

Miller, David [IEREF) I 0.z Telephony call with 5. Dollinget regarding work ptan and POR.

Wilkiams, Michael 04/23/02 26 1.0k L¥isenss and review e.mail communication (v the Creditor Commines s an
regarding the proposed conference vall with Skadden, Arps. Comdigeo and Arthur
Andersen related in a possihle 382 ownership vhangy prios te the plan

Williams, Michael 04/25:02 26 1.4 Keview draft communication to 5. Dollinger and Lazard repatding conecrng with
the Nehror's optionality in the Lax disclosure stalcinent,

Miller, David 04/26/02 6 a.l Dirafled e-mails w Latham & Watkins and Cibank regarding eax diselnsures and
plan.

France, Luis HETEN S b1 1.2 Conderency calls with Unsecwred Creditors reparding POR and management
eytimite of B7 vunt payout 10 Crodinrs

Miller, Lravid 05/10/02 26 a.l Send e-pvailate 5. 1ellinger and R. Hanson regarding inguiry about Prism frotn
A Y erizon).

Miller, David 05/30/02 A6 o] Dizgussion with 1. fanca regarding resulis of Cammitlee mecting,

Tranea, Luis 05/30:02 26 0.4 Farticipatinn in Creditor Commilter update call.

Williams, Michael 05404/02 26 0.5 Fallaw-up with J. Kronsnoble ol Latham & Watking reparding first omended plan.

Williams, Michacl URAA0Z 123 Q.5 Follow-up with L. Franou reparding statuz of tax margrs.

Miller, David 06/11/02 26 0.k Telephane call to &. Dullinger regarding (B¢ ivoices, ¢ags status and ROTY search.
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Williams, Michael 16/13:02 i 1.0 Communication fi wm Citigroup regarding the Crediiors Committee support for he
First Amended Plan of Beoganization - Communications with ). Krunsnoble
regarding meeling whivh . Hanson of Latham & Wotkins.

Williams, Michacl N6/1.3/02 26 10 Telephone eonference with T2 Miller regarding developments and #talws.

Miller, David V60T p13 0.1 Telephune cali o %. Dollinger ragarding fee Committee review resulls,

26 Tatal ienT
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Kalfen, Dunald /AL 30 1.5 Reviewed Comdisee retentinn programs

Kalfen, Ponald a7/30/01 1] 1.5 Revivwed Comdises regntion programs

van Vuren, Firik QB/O3/A1 k1)) 1z Analyead Mot Blake's eontract

Kalfen, Donald ad220 30 0.5 Coordination of Comdiscn respanse

Cook, Martha IEfR I 30 04 Confaranee call with A Mopstellu and ) .Giiveui reparding executive compensation
analysis

Cook, Martha %2201 30 11 Meeting with 1. Ruppert to discuss appiuptiate approoch to henchmarking
exeentiva enmpensation and identiGuation of recent analyses.

Cuouok, Martha NE2200 30 4 Conference call with A Mustellu segarding ¢xaoutive compensation analysis

Grivetti, John 03/22:01 0 Al Telephone calls with L.Rupient, M. Cook and A. Mostello regarding Condises
hunian resuurce issue inglnding the top 12 empluyees relention, incentive and
waveranee packagos, Marm Blake's and Mike Fazo's empluymanl agissingnt and the
vverall vost ol the Cemdisoo retantion plans

Cirivetti, Juhn 220 30 [ Krviewad npdate on employes cumpunaation benchnarking report

Cirivellt. John 0R/22/01 k) 53 Review of data provided by the debror regarding retention/incentive plans and
employment conlravls and discuszion with M. Razd and M. Pellechia reparding same

Grivelti. John 08/32/01 g 4.0 Prepared summary analysis of thanagement compensation levely

Ruppert, Lori Q22N il 0.5 Conference gall with 1. Grivetti, M. Cook and A, Mostelln eeparding Comdisco cuse

Mnsizlin, Audrey ORAZZ01 30 0.8 Conferenne call with J. Grivetti regarding current client needs.

Mostelle, Audicy ORI k' 0.4 Conference call witk J. Griverl and M. Cook o identify potential resvurces baged
om client needs.

Mustello, Avdrey 082201 0 0.5 Compilation of guestions 1eparding materials suhmitted includiug Ui At
Amilersen ropual i urrcit retention programs.

Mnstello, Audrey w224 0 1.4 Peer chapter 11 compensation data compibod.

Miller, Pavid 0323401 a0 0.2 Review of compensation analyses

Gilgichsnhaus, Stuart 03/24/01 A0 4.1 Reviewed and edited summary analysis ol management compensatian levels

Miller, Dravid 03:24/01 30 03 Analysis of compensation s
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Grivetti, John OR/ZH01 Rl 2.4 Conlitued preparation of summary analysis of managemicnl compensation levels

Crivetti, Jnhn 08/24401 M 1.1 Reviewed now date received from Debtor re: management conpenaation bevels and
had discussions with M, Pellechin ra: same

Gleichenhaus, Stuart w/z701 M 2.2 Diiscussions with J. Giriverti ond C.Fartgang re: employee neention plan analyses

Grivett, Jubn [T 30 23 Lhzcusgions witly H. Barrett, . Fortgang and 5. Gluichenhaws ro: severance and
retention plan and exacutive contracts

CGleichenhaus, Sluatt QR728 0 i} 31 Preparation of summary analysis of managemcnt conpelsation levets

Kalfem, Dunald V47284 g = L)l with ). Giriverti regarding expert teslimuony requircanents

Grivetts, Jolin D8/28/01 30 1.4 Call with [1.Kalfen regarding expent wsimony requiremenis

Giriverti, Jahn 08/28/01 kL] 0.4 Call with Or.Kallin, J. Dunn aid R.Harrert regarding expert testimony

Munn, Jamey DR209n X0 1.5 Review Motiong filed related to employment contracls

Dunm, Jumes O8/29/01 30 1.1 Heview dofohase of other Dankrupley cruployment conftacts and retention pan data

Kalfizn, Lyonald D8/2%/01 an (X Call with J. Grivew, J. Dt and Lredditor's counsel tegarding expert Wstinony

ook, Martha OB/ A 0.8 Ruscarch W idenuily broader epmpensation data far the inancial sarvices indugtry

Gleichenbaus, Stuarl R/ 30 21 Aglyze emplayment eantract matters

Cileichenhaus, Stuart ngAaol 30 05 Analyre emiployment cantract matters

Miller, David 03/06/02 30 0.4 Telaphone call D. Kalfin and M, Cook reparding analysis of emergence
compensation plan.

Kalfen, anold Q3/07/02 30 09 Reviewed Deblur's pripased eempensation program term sheet and linwarded to
Emst & Yuunp LEP by Xaznegn Razi of Comdisco ("Debiur”).

Miller, David 307102 30 0.l Telephune calk M. Cook regrarding emergence compensalion projrant.

Kalfen, Tianald 03/0842 30 17 Reviewed and analyzed Debtor's propnsed compensation proyraibs,

Miller. Lravid 0308402 k] ol Talephome call M. Cook reganding cmergencs compensation program.

Miter, David (130902 k1] 0.2 Telephone call to M. Cook regarding fatug of review of emergence compensation

plon and related issues.
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COMDISCO, LN,

FRMAT & YOUNG CORPOBRATE FINANCE LLC
DETAHL. OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGHST 11, 2002

Miller, David

Miller, Lyavid

Miller, Mavid

Franco, s

Franca, [.uis

Kallisty, Donalkd

Kaullizn. Donahl

PROFESSIONAL DATE [N [IOURS DESCRIPTION

Kalfen, Liowald 03/1042 30 a.h Farticipated in teleconference with L Miller Ieparding raview process of Debtar's
proposed compensation progTams.

Kalten, Lonald 310402 30 oy Tirafted e-mail to &. Dollinger vl Cilibank and to the memhers nf the Official
tnsecured Creditors’ Commilies of Comdises ("UCU!) summarizing discussions
with Dehinr's management reparding proposed campensation program.

0310402 3n 0,3 Conference call with 1. Kalfen and ¥, Couk icuarding ¢mergence eompensation
plan review.

Gleiehenbaws, Star 0311002 30 1.0 Telephane call with &. Dollinger of Citicort 10 disowss wpeaming meeting.

03X/ 1102 30 [IK* Participate in conference call with 5. Dollinger, C, Fortgang and [y Kalfen
regording assessment of management's plans,

03/11/02 ) 0.2 Tetephone calt 8. Dollinger teparding isaves related to TY's upfront partivipativn i
review of manygement’s plans,

Kalfen, Donald DA 52 k] 1.6 Participated in ¢onferenee with M. Bubnovich of Arthur Andorsn eparditg
Propescd ¢ompengation programs.

Kallen, Dkmald (571 5002 a0 0.4 Panlicipated in eon ference with K. Buogas reygarding cvaluation of proposed
gompengation programs and prepared dats and infiimiaton reguest reparding
compensation programs.

Kalfen, Danald 03/15/02 an 1.2 Participated in tebeconterence with L, Franco regarding stars of Dehtor's proposed
compensation progranis.

03/15/02 K1l 1.1 Conversalions with M, Conk and 1. Kalfan on their review of Comnpany KERF,
03/15/02 kYt 0.5 Discussions on conpany C15 emergence plan with D. Kallim

Dupygs, Knuberly A1 502 30 16 Paiticipated in releconference with D. Kallin and N, Bubnovich, of Arthur
Anderacn, regarding [lebtors proposed compensation prosrams.

Hapgs, Kimberly 03/15/02 k1] 0.4 Participated in confurcne: with 1. K alfen regarding evaluation of pruposcd
compensation programs proposal atd drafted data and informatiun requuesl.

Roygs, Kimberly a3/15/02 £ 1.8 Reviewed and evaluatgd 1ebror's proposed compensativn programs,

Boggs, Kimberly a3/146/02 a0 1.0 Diralicd swimnrmany of Ihtor's peopnsed compensation prograims,

Kallisn, Donalkl U3/17/02 30 2.0 pirafied memorandum regarding status ol Dublan's propoatd eempensation
Proprams.

05/17:402 10 1.6 Revigwed and analyzed cost af Debtor's propeacd U5 leasing and ventures
COMpensation progroms,

517402 10 1.7 Reviewed and analyzed cost af Deblor's proposcd cleetronies and eorporate
cmnpcnsati-:-n Projirame.

AR 30 1.3 Draitod dacg and information Tequest with respect W Debtors proposed

Dogps. Kimberly

compensation proprams,

Desc
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PHROFESSIDNAL

Gleichenhaus, Stuarl

Kalfen, Donald

Kalfen, Donald

Kalfem, Donald

Kalfen, Donald

Kallen, Donaht

Miller, avid

Miller, Navid

Bogps, Kimberly

Doyes, Kimboly

Bopgs, Kimberly

Ragys, Kimberly

Dopps, Kimbely

Baoygs, Kimbuly

Baopps, Kimberly

Kaolfan, Domald

Kaolfen, Danald

Kalfen, Dranald

Miller, David

Stneckel, Gregory

— DATE__

03/18402

Da/1%/02

031802

03/ 12

03/1%/02

03/ 1802

03/13/02

03/13/02

[ RRT

05/ BIOZ

0371502

03/15/02

031802

O5/1BI02

03/18/02

Q3/19/02

0302

a3/1902

01902

031902

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 16/02 00:00:00
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DETAIL OF SERVICES REMDERED RY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PEREOD JULY 27, 2001 THROATCH AUGTIST 12, 2002

BCD HOURS o DESCRIPTION

30 1.0 Driscuss emengency venmipenzation plana.

30 1.5 Cunducted interviews of ¥ enmwres business unit leader regarding Deblor's proposcd
cumpensation prograiis,

ki) 1.5 Cunducted jntervicw of LIS [.easing business unit leader regarding Debln's
prupesi coinpensation pragrams.

ki) 0.3 Cunducted interview of clectranies husiness unit leader regarding Deblor's
proposcd compunsation Programs.

hld} 1.1 Conducted imervicws of Fayrogican husiness unit leader regarding Debior's prupuscd
UutllptrlQRliDl’l PIOETANS.

ki) 1.Q Reviewed and analyzed Debinr's proposed compensativn progranis,

kL] s Meeting with M. Couk regarding analysis of Debtorg' compensatinn program and
valuation parameters.

M 0.2 Review ol E&Y memu on compenzation Program issues.

A0 1.5 Conductezl inlerview of Ventures husiness unit 1eader regarding Deblor's propozed
Uulllp\:t]&&ll‘ﬁll Pragrama.

L] 1.5 Condwered imerview nf US T.easing business unil leader repanding Lhebwora
praposed eompensation programs.

an /%) {onducted interviews ol electronics bugsinesd uiit Jeader reparding Crebtar's
proposed compensation proyrams.

ME tl Conducted interviews vl Buropean busingss vnit laader regarding Debtor's proposed
compensalion PIUgIAIts,

pli3 0.2 Analysed chapter 17 bquidating company resention compensaliun praciives,

L] 1.2 Drafted sunwnnry of Dehtor's propased compensation prograns2,

30 06 Reviewed and analyzed Debloe's propuscd Cotipensation Programs eost data.

A 0.5 Partivipated in teleconlironcs wid 1Y Sehuster of 1.azard, 8. Gleichenhaus and K.
Bogps regarding valuation of 45801 16Coveriss.

Lt 0.8 Parlivipated in teleconltrence with K. Roggs ragording evaluation of Debtor’s
proposed compensalion proprams.

30 1.5 Reviewed und analyecd Dobtor's propesed eompensation programe.

L1t 0.2 Review uf margement's latest draft of the emergence compensation prugram.

AN 1.9 Ressurched dala and practices of Enropeanan companias to henchmark Deblor's

pruposed Eurppean cumpensalion program.

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL DATE P HOL RS . DESCRIFTION

Buygpes, Kimberly Q5719102 Ll 0.6 Paiticipated in wlecanforence with 1. Kalfen regarding evaluation ol Debtor's
prapuicd conipon3ation proprams.

Bugps, Kimberly Q31902 30 0.5 Participated in welecanfersnce with 1. Kalfen, D. Schuster of Lazard and 5,
Gleicheobaus of EYCF reparding valaation of asset recuveries,

Bugps, Kimberly 03/19/02 it 09 Analyzed casta of Dehtor's propnsed compensation prograns.

Buppa, Kimberly 03/19/02 an 0.2 Diadlenl c-mail garrgapandence to N. Razi and M. Pelleschia al Comdisco rigarnding
slatws of information request with respect tn Debtor's proposud compensation
Pragraing.

Bopypa, Kimberly 03/19/02 an 1.2 Lyrafted swmmary of Comdisca propused European and cloctionics compensation
Programa.

Hiogps, Kimberly 03/19/02 M 1.3 Drafted summary of Comdisca propused US Leasing. ventares and eorporare
compensation programs.

Gleichenhaus, Stuart 03/20/02 X 1.0 Follow-up cull regarding Cacdivs Lommitiee mesting.

Kalfen, Douald RTINS Y] 1.0 Participated in Wlovon ferenee with K. Roggs regarding compensation program
design albemativis, ieview of eomy tian pragrams proposal and discussed neal
sleps.

Kalfen, Donald Q3/20/02 3 0.6 Panicipated in gonference with [.azard team and K. Bupps reganding vRluation of
poruilioa and ather business unit assets.

Kalfen, Nomald 03/30/02 3 0.3 Analyred Nehtor's prapased European umupcnialiun PrOErRImE.

Kalfen, Donald 03/20/02 3 1.2 Participated in telecondiacnce with Lazasd team regarding valuation issues relating
to Debior's proposed cumpensation groprams.

Bugps, Kimberly R0 k| 0.4 Participated in wonferenes with 12, Knlfen regarding analysis and evaluation off
Deblor's proposcd Gompetzation progearms.

Bowye, Kimberly 03/20/02 kL] 0.9 Panmipated in gonference with [ Kalfen aml Lazard team repanding valwation of
pordelios and other business unit assets.

Boyjra, Kimberly 03/20/02 M 1.0 Participated in seleconference with O Kalfen regarding compenganan programs
desipn altemarives, review of compensalion proprams preposdl ong discuss next
steps.

Bogys, Kimberly U3/ 2002 0 1.9 Dmatted cost amalysis ul Dubtn's proposed Eurppean compensation programs.

Dogys, Kimberly 032002 30 20 Drudbed cust analysis of Deblor's proposed 1)5 leasing, ventures and corpurate
cumpsnsalion programs.

Boyys, Kimberly [EREETi 02 30 1.4 Revivwod and atalyzed praposed compensation programs documents, appendices
und addional data obaingd fiom Erebior.

Kallin, Dunald 032102 30 0.7 Partivipaled in teleconfersnce with [0 Miller and K. Dogys 1o discass the sucecss
shiaring ¢oinpenzation |programs propased hy Dehtor.

Kallea, Donald 032102 kil 1.7 Reviewed and analyzed Nehtor's propnsed US leasing and vemlaies compeigation
Prograins.

Kallin, Dunald 3102 30 1.7 Reviewed and abalyzed Dobtor's propnsed electronics and curperate cumpensalivn

PIULTaIng.

Desc
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Kalfen, TInnald

siller, David

Miller, David

Roggs, Kimherly

Bogps, Kimberly

Roggs, Kimherly

Bugpes, Kimberly

Boppa, Kimberly

Rogys, Kimherly

Fin, Susan

Kalfen, Lronald

Kalfen, 13omald

Kalfan, Donald

Kalfan, Donald

Kallen, Donald

Kalfii, Donald

Milker, avid

Bopes, Kimberly

Eapgs, Kimberly

Bopgs, Kimberly

_DATE

0321/02

0321/02

n3/2102

/2102

a2z

02102

03/21/02

032102

0372102

032102

03/22/02

Q3/22/02

Q322192

Q32212

U5/22K2

0322402

03/22/2

0322402

03:22/02

03/22/02

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 4g&{16/02 00:00:00
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COMINISC, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDEREDR BY FROJECT CODE
FOR TIE FERLOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH ATGUST 12, 2002

rCD HOURS DESCRIPTION

a0 1.7 Reviewed aud analyced Lichtor's pronased Euronean campensation progiatis,

Mt a4 Telephane call W D. Kalfon regarding status of KTERP review and 1ssue of Whreshold
muasures and incontiyce,

0 04 Telephene ¢all w %, Gleichenhaus regarding development of tuesholds for KERP
plans.

k1) 04 Participated in ekeonference with [, Kalfen and D. Miller  discuss Liebtor's
prupascd success shating compansation program.

k1) 0.9 Participated in telkeconference with 0. Kalfem to discuss evaluation of Debtor's
prupased sudtess sharing compensation programs.

k10 1.9 Rovicwed and analyzed Lebtor's propnsed compensativn programs.

30 (.6 Frepared summary analysis vl Deblur's piopoged compensation plans by Debtor
business unit.

K 1.9 Reviewed and analyzed US Leasing participant dota received from Deblor.

50 0.7 Reviewed and analyzed venberes porticipant data received fromm Debtot,

30 1. Drafled {udividual-level apgregate cost analysis based on Bubtor-provided
pa licipant data.

In 1.6 Reviewed and analyzed Debtor's chatipes to proposed LIS leosing compensatian
programs.

an .G Reviewed and analyzed Debtor's changes 10 proposed ventures compensation
programs.

aun () Reviewd and aualyzed Debror's changes in proposed electronics and ¢orporate
I.'ul::llpl.'l:l:ali\)ll PIORrAams.

A 1.9 Ruviewud amd evised EY cnsr analyses nf Debior's proposcd US Leazing and
venlures SOMPENaMinn progranis.

k1) 04 Revigwed ond revised IY cast analysis of Deblor's propoaed eorparate
compangatian pragrams.

3n 20 Participated in comfierence with K. Buypg (o review and analyze Debtor-provided
participant data and revised cunpCnsAtion pORrams simmaries.

k1] n.a Various e-mails and discussions reparding status of review and diligence issucs,

an n.& Prepared updated cust analyais of Pebtor's propased compensation propram W
reflect updated participant data recgived friom Tebior and changes (o propusail
compensabion program.

30 [ Drafted sumniary ot proposed Evrapean, sl=ciranics and corporate compensation
programs.

30 1.5 Drmafted summary of proposed Us Leasing ond Venhres Compensativn Progranis,

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

... PROFESSIONAL

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 103 of 267

COMPISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERYICES RENDERED KY PROJECT CODE
FOR TIE PERION JULY 27, 201 THROUGH AT/GUST 12, 2002

Buyue. Kiberly

Buups, Kimberly

Boppa, Kimbgrly

Boypa, Kimberly

Baopps, Kimberly

Kalfen, Danald

Kalfen, Danald

Kallisn, Donald

Kaltzu, Lonald

Boe, Kimberly

Bogps, Kimberly

Dogps, Kimbedy

Boypa, Kimberly

Kalfen, ixanald

Kalfen, Danald

Doy, Knnbotky

Buopys, Kiinbely

Bugps, Kimberly

Bowus, Kimberly

Lilcichenhaua, Smuarg

DBATE JFCD HOURS DESCRIPTION

03/22/02 30 1l Reviewed compensation aualysis from N. Bubnavich, of Arthur Andersen Lebtor's
HE advisne, and updated information from Dehtor reganding compensation
programs individual payuuat levols,

0322:02 30 1.1 Reviewed and analyzod updated panicipant data and draled EY wost analyaes
related Lo s,

03/22402 30 1.2 Preparcd fevised EY cost analyses of Debtor's propused US Leasing and Venrres
Cumpensation Faopiams to reflect changes to program.

03/22/02 3) 1.0 Prepared revised EY cost analyses of Dehtor's prapused Corpotate and Furnpean
Compensation Progas 1o refleet chanyes tn program.

03/22/02 K 2.0 Partivipated in conference/working session with Donald Kalfen to yeview and
analyze Deblor-provided participant data and revised Compensation Programs
summaries.  [dentilicd need for additional information.

23/23/02 Ar 2.0 Preparad iweniceandum gummary of Y analysis ol Deblor's propessd US leasing
und yentuies compensation programs.

0323402 20 1.5 Preparsd memorandum summary ol EY analyais of Dehtor's proposed elecironics
and epminTate compensatiun prograris.

03/23/02 n ] Prepared memorundun suinnaty of BY analysis of Dehtor's prupuscd Evrogcan
compensation programs,

03/23/02 3 4.4) Partivipated in conterence/working sessinn with K. Dupps 1o thalige EY cosr
analyses af Deblur's proposcd compengation program in preparation fot mecting
with UCC and Dieblor in New York.

03/23/02 30 iR Assembled dala aned vaiious doguments in preparation lor micetiog with LCC and
Diwblor in New Yaork.

93202 kli] a0 Participated in eonference’working session with Lanald Kolfen to finalize EY cosl
analyses of Nebine's proposed Compensalion Projgram in preparation for meeling
with UCE and Dabtar in New Yurk.

03/2302 30 1.4 Raviewed and revised EY cost analysis of individual partivipant data celating o
Drebtar's proposed Vemtures Compenaation Programs,

03,2302 H 1.7 Reviewed and rovised EY com analysis of individual participant data relating ra
Diebtur's pruposuil US Leaging Compensation Prograns,

03/24/02 At 1.8 Drvaflud analysis of Debtar's propased 118 leasing and ventures compensation
PrOgrans,

s 0 1.7 13rafted analysis of Dehtor's propusad corpotats, elscmonics and Furopean
cnpengation programs.

03/24/02 30 [ Participated in teleconferencis with Donald Kalfen regarding preparation fur
meeting with Debior and DICC in New Yaork.

03/24/02 an 06 Tomafted comespundenue b Sugan Dollinger regarding preparation Jor UCC and
Nehtor meeting in Mew Yk,

03/24/07 an )] Prepared apgrepate cust suminary of propased Compensation Propeans by buginess
unit.

03/24/02 30 0.4 Prepared analysis ol pulcatial pryments under Debtar's proposed Conipehaation
Programs by covered vinployce,

03/25/02 30 2.0 Review materials for muecting with Creditors Commitiee on 3/26/02.

Desc
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Kalfen, Donald

Buyys, Kimberly

Gleichenhaws, Stort

Kalfin, Donald

Bapes, Kimberly

Bopgs. Kimberly

By, Kiinborly

Kaltia, Lonakl

Kalfen, Lyenald

Kalfen, Donald

Dogys, Kimbaly

Bapgs, Kimberly

Bogps, Kimberly

Roygs, Kimberly

Boggs, Kimberly

By, Kimborly

Buyes, Kitnberly

Bogyza, Kimberly

Buyps, Kimberly

BATE  FCD HORRS DESCHRIFTION

03/25/02 an In Fantivipated i conferenesfvorking sexsion with K. Bopys o prepaee memo
raviewsng, Debtos's propesed eompensatian progeam in propw stioh for meeting with
CC.

02/25/02 30 26 Partivipwied in conferencefwnrking session with Donald Kalfen to prepare meme
reviswing Lichtors proposed Compensation Program in preparation for meeting
with UG,

D3/26/G2 30 1.0 Mty with 5. Dallinger, R. Thertun, D. Schuster and I Kolfen to discuss
cempensalion plan.

03/26/02 3 1.2 Participated in cotiference call with K. Bogps W dratt UCC counter prapnsal.

03/36/02 M 1.2 Participaled in eonference with Kimberly Bopps t drafl LCC Counter Proposal w
Dicbilur's proposed Compensation Programs.

03/26/02 3 0.5 Reviewed and analyzed Debiur provided compeneation data for 175 Leasing
coployses. Caleulated average 1994% and 2000 otal compensation of US Leasiny
Hmplovees and compared same t base pay plus payments under Dueblor's propogad
Compensation Programs.

03/26/02 n 0.7 Prepareit compasisen of (xebtar's initial 2001 Compensativn Programs and proposed
2002 Comipunsalion Froprams.

03/27402 k) Qs Partivipated i feleeonferance with 5. Gliechenliaus and K. Boggs regarding
preparation of UL caunter prapusal b Deblur's propessd eompensation
pruyiams,

ny27/02 EUi] 1.3 Roviewed and revised Committes summiary of UCC eoynter promnsal o Drebtor's
proposcd LIS keaing and ventures compunsalivn programs.

(1372742 30 10 Reviewed am revised Commitiee summary of LCC counler proposal to Lebror's
propnsed carponite and cliEcAronics fompensation programs.

03/27/02 30 0.7 Drafted anail 1 Susan Dollinger; fax to Susan Dullinger fegarding LCC Counter
Prupusal.

03/27/02 M 0.5 Participated in wleeonferance with Stuart Gleichvnliaua and onald Kalfen
ropaeding LCC Counter Propasal te Deblor's wontipensation program.

Q3/27/02 k10 0.2 Revised UCE Couneer Proposal to Bebior's proposed Compensation Programs,

w322 30 [T Reviewed email cormespundence and revisions to Debtor's praposcd Conipensarion
Programs received (ruin Chobilor,

[{ER R 0 1.0 Revised BY coslanalyses of Debror's prapased Campensativn Programs o reflect
Debtor revisions hrrcto,

04/02/02 an 'K Email and Lalephong corgspandence with BY team, Lazand and LUCC representative
to schedule confirence eall.

02/02 a0 0.3 Enail corfeapendence: to EY team and UCC represciitatives regarding confirmation
of conferens call.

/0202 A0 1.7 Prepated revised summary of proposed Cumpengation Progrom enst by business
unit 1 reflect 1ebtors changes ta the Campunsation Frogram.

D4/02/0F a0 1.2 Revivwed and analyred Tebtors revised panticipant data for U5 T.easing.

Desc
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Bogps, Kimberly

Bogps, Kimberly

K alfen, Donald

K alfen, Donald

Dogps, Kimberly

Bopps, Kimbety

Buges, Kimbedy

Baopps, Kimberly

Bopgs, Kimberly

Kallen, Donald

Kalfen, Lronald

Kglfen, Donald

Ropgs, Kimberly

Dugs, Kanbinly

Bupys, Kamberly

Bopgs, Kimberly

K akfen, Taonald

Enlfen, Donald

Kaolfen, Dorald

Bopgs, Kimberly

DATE

Q40202

Q4/0z/07

040302

040302

(403702

04/03/02

0410302

04/03/02

04/03/02

Ud0302

a4/04:02

040402

04414:02

Q444402

0404102

4d/04/02

04/05/02

40502

04/05/02

04/03/02
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COMIMSCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE. FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES KENDKRED RY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 20i0 THRONIGH AUCTUST L2, 2602

rCD HOURS DESCRIPTION

EN] Lo Reviewed aml analyzul Debiora revised paricipant data for Ventures.

0 1.3 Rosvivwed revised compengation programs participant ats and compan: W indliat
compensation proytans proposal.

Al 19 Prepared UCC counter propesah to Dehtor's praposed 1758 leasing and ventures
compensation progran.

k10 1.0 Prepared UCC counter propesat th Dehtor's praposed corporate and electrenivs
compensalivn progiam-

L1} 1.5 Analysed Debwors revised participant data for U5 Leasing.

30 1.5 Analyzed Nebtar's revised participant duata tor Venluies,

30 07 Analyzed chapter 11 lquidating company retvalion progtams.

an '] Reviewed ond revised compensalion progiama surningry dociment to reflect Debtor
revisians thereto. UCC's counter propoaal w refleet moge recent revisions,

K [ER] Prepared 1,CC's Counter propusal [ Debors revissd praposed Compensation
Programs.

30 19 Prepaved LCC's counser proqinsal to Debtor's revised proposcd Gonkgeensation
proprams.

0 1.4 Prepared cost anzlysis of Deblor's revisid progosed compension programs.

i 3.8 Participated in conference call with K. Bopps o prepare UCE counter praposal and
LAY costanalyses,

) kR Participated in vonferences working sesgions with 2. Kalfen with respect to the
preparation vl UCC couiter propeaal ty Debrar's proposed compensation progran,

30 0.5 Oipanized data forwarded hy Diehtor.

30 04 Dyafted and sent e-mail comespondence tu schedule onfeiencs call with LG,
Lazard and eounsel regording counter proposal v Deblor's proposed gompensation
program.

k) 24 13rafied 1O Counter prapusal b Duebtn's proposed vompensation Program and
F&Y cost analysis of same.

n 1.9 Dirafted 1ICC counter propusal ke Debiorg proposed compensation program.

n .o Revised B&Y cost analyzig of Debtor's proposed eonpensation program.

n 22 Participated in conlerence call iegarding warking session with K. Boges regarding
preparation of LICC cuunter propusal w Delior's propesed eomnensation program
snd &Y cost analysis uf sume.

30 2.2 Participated in conferenceiworking scssion with I Kalfen o revise UCC's counder

propasal to Dehtor's proposed compensation programs connter and FAY onst
anplysiz of same.

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL DATE FCD HUURS . DESCRIFTION

Roggs, Kimberly /0502 30 0.3 rafied e-mail oontespendence fu schedule weekend conference calt with 100,
B&Y ream, Counsel and Lasand to discuss UOC's counter propasal to Debtnr's
propased compenzation \proprams.

Rogps, Kimberly U4/054)2 30 1.7 Darafied UCC counter propusal L Dubtor's proposed compensation programs.

Rogpa, Kinsberly Q4/05/02 Kl 1.7 Fropared E&Y ¢ost analysis of Debtor's praposed compensation programs.

Kabfen, Nonald /0702 30 15 Pamigipated in weloconfttenos with 8. Dullinger, D Schuster and K. Boggs
regarding revisions W UCC coualer propasal to Debtor's proposed compensation
proprams.

Kalfen, Dvmald 444702 kL] 1.5 Revised |ICL eounter proposal 1o US Jasing and ventures compensation progzams.

Kalfin, Ponald 04/07/02 E 1.5 Revised U/CC connter proposal to corporare amd cleslronivs vompensalivn
programs.

Kalteq, Donald 04/07/02 £l ] Revised JCC counter proposal to Burnpaan ¢ompenaation propranis.

Kalfen, Donald 04/07/02 30 1% Reviged EY vost analysis of company plan.

Hogps, Kimberly Q4/07/02 30 0.2 Feer reviewod analys ¢l vompunsation progrum participants’ compensation
comparison and E&Y e0al analyais,

Buyps, Kimberly 04407/02 kiU 1.4 Revised UCC counter propesal.

Bopys, Kinberly 04/07/02 K 19 Rovised EdtY cost enalysis of company plan.

Kalfen. Donald 04/08/02 30 X} Kevised O cuunter proposal o Deblor's proposed LA, compensation prograng,

Kalten, 1onald Q470802 Ll 1.3 kevised UCC countor propusal to Debtor's proposed Curopean compensatinn
prOgrang.

Kalten, Danald /R 3 1.7 Revised LAY cost analysia of UGG counter proposal w U5, sonpensation
programs.

Kallin, Donald 04408402 Ao 14 Revisions E&Y cost analysis nf 1 J0C counter prapasal to EWopean comiprnsation
prugrams.

Hopga, Kimberly 0d/08/02 30 1.2 Proparcd linal creditor infurmatian requests for presentatinn to N. Hazi,

Ropps, Kimbaly 04/03/02 ] 0.3 Lraited e-mail correspundence to UCC representatives and Tazard 1gam Foowarding
reviged UL counter proposal and E&Y cast analysis.

Boggs, Kimberly 40802 30 0.7 Paxr reviewed and 1cvise UCL vounter proposal and [&Y cost analysis.

Ropps, Kitnbetly 04/08/02 30 0.3 Reviewed updated and revised participani data received from N. Razi of Delbor,

Bopys, Kinburly D4/DE/02 £l 1.7 Ruvised UCC counter praposal ta Debtor's proposed compensation program,
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FROFESSIONAL DATE L8 }] HOIIRS
Ropgs, Kimberly 04/08/02 30 67
Eopgs, Kimbearly D4/08/02 an 07
f.alfen, Nanatd Dd/0R/02 30 1.9
Kaolfen, Monald /002 0 0.4
Kalten, Donatd DDWDZ R Lz
Franco, Luis [FER N 5 n.s
Kallen, Donald D4/10/02 0 1.e
Kalfen, Donald 0/ 10/02 30 [1X]
Franvo, Luts 1002 kiE 1.4
Fruoua, Luls 1002 5y e
Kalfin, Donald a1 1Az 30 1.4
Franeo, |.nig 04/ 15702 Rl 0.3
Miller, Dravid 0417162 M ]

A Tolal FETA |

DESCRIFTION

Reviged E&Y cost analysis of Debtor's propinsed compensalion programs.

Drrafled e-mail eorrcapondenge en 1. Miller, T3, Schuster and D Kallen reparding
Satus of discussions with Neblor.

Propared UCC Counegr Proposal tn Tiehtor's proposed European Compensalivn
Froprains,

Reviewed and revigions LICC Counter Proposal to Debtor's propusud Europcan
Cotnpengation Programs.

Reviewed and revisians European section of UCC Counler Propogal,

Cnnversation with D. Kallem - EYHRY reparding claims minimization pool
questions.

Prepared [JCC Counter Propusal 1o Debior's European compensatian pragram.

Ruvicwed and zevised UCC Caunter Prapasal to Rebtor's Curopean compensation
progian.

E-mail tn EY HRS team and Citihank resarding claims minimization and patential
issue pertaining tn the SIF liability.

Beview of contingent liabilities thal may be inctuded in elaimg minimization poal.

Prepared for meeting with Dublor to discuss LT Counrer propesal to Debtor's
propused Compensation Frogralh.

Cunversation with 13, Kalfen regording claims minimization poul and status of
EERF analysi

Telephane call toy [ Kalfen regarding resolution ol cingloyes congensation
programs.
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FROFESS10NAL DATE D HOURS DESCRIPTION

Mosiclle, Awdrey D7/3 170} n 23 Review of Comdisen amployment agreements

CGleichonhaus, Stuart DR/ n 1.1 Heviewsd Monn Blake's employment contract

Griveri, John /22701 1 0.7 Heviewed Nomi Bloke's emplnyment contract

Ruppert, Laoni 08/22/01 i1 1.9 Review Comdisco employment agreements

Momow, Cony 082201 k1 2.4 Researchad market pricing fur compensation of CE poaition

Momow, Cory 08/2201 3 1.1 Researched market pricing far compunsation of VP Europe

Mormow, Cory DE/22ML A 1.2 Researched macket priving lon compengation of VP Ventures position

Mosrow, Cary 08722400 31l 0.6 Rescarched marker pricing for compensation of presently availabls position

Merraw, Cony 082201 il 08 Recearched market pricing for compensation of EVE opeiations pegition

Mo, Cary 08/22/01 # 1.0 Researched murket priving lor compengation of CH0) position

Mormow, Cury /AN 31 0.6 Resvarched inaket priging for compensatinn of CO0 pesition

Cardenas, Olivia GE2X0L 31 2.4 Asgigiced in the reaearch of market compensation for various exveative manapEement
positions

rriveti, Iohn 08/22:01 n i Reviewed CT.(} market compensativn repuct and propared suminary analysis on
thnnghts an Warm Blake's emplaymient vantract

Ruppert, Lori DE/2311 1 0.9 Research retention bonus practices, Enploynent agreements and compensation
amangements in cunncelion with bankruptey

Mutrow, Cury /23N H 1.4 Researched ekt pricing for compensstion of GM IT Cap. Europe positiun

Motiow, Loy 0823001 31 0.7 Rescarched market pricing for compensation of Managing Eir. Venutes pogition

Cardenas, Olivin 08/23/01 1 ] A ggisiad in the research of market compensation (o various exeoutive management
positions

Tainn, James 08/29/01 31 1] Revigw materials on Moman Blake contract and eropluyinesl histary

Dunn, James DRI 1l 1.5 Review ul Comdizseo ciployment agresments

Dhunn, James NH2%AN i 2.4 Review und analyze Andeisen repont on executive employment contrcls

31 Total 165

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL.  DATE_ e HOITRS DESCHIFTION
Van Vuren, Erk 10/24/G1 KR 214 Arlalyzﬂd coln matians related to Rockwell real property study
Choquette, Andrew 10/30H 3 1.1 Analysis of Rockwell Gemini real propaily study

3% Total 4.0

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL DATE | ] HOTIRS DESCRIPTION

Malezyk, Bill H/0EAN 35 29 Auatysia of fsture leasa payments for the lab avd scicnli fie verieal

Waleayk, Bill 10001 35 2 Analysia of PV of funire lease paymenls {ur the electionics verfical

Malezyk, Dill IRAFIAH 35 10 Analysis of PV of fitture lease payments for the clectronics vertical

Malvayk, Bill 11/ 07;01 35 32 Analysis of PV of fiture lease payimenta for the glecronics vertical

Malczyk, Bill DEARA 35 15 Analysis of FV nf future tease paymunts for the Teleeom vertical

Malczyk, Bill DR/ 35 2.5 Analysis of PV of future kease payoicies for the Ventres vertical

Grivelti, John DE/OS/01 as 1.4 Fvaluated leasing portblivs and prepared sunymary data

Malczyk, Gilt ORAXAN a5 25 Amdlyeed the averape duratinn for leases on all verlicals

Grivelki, Juhn OR/TO/D1 a5 22 Evalvation of ksasing pontfolins

Gaivent, John 08/13/01 as 1.0 Fvaluatinn of leasing ponifulivy

Malezyk, Bill 08/13/01 a5 1.7 Analyzed hook residual value for all leases in all verticals

Maloxyk, Bilt QB/14/01 K 0.5 Analyzsc pocentage of invesmment grade leages o k] loase portfolio for all
verlivals

Matczyk. Bill [ERET 33 1.8 Cotiploted ealewlotinn of percentage of investnont grade leases t dotal fzase
portfiolio far alt varticals

Griven, John a4l 35 [EX] Evaluation nfleasing portfolios

Choyuetic, Andrew 08/28/01 35 [/} I.ease valuation discussion with E, Van Vuren

Van Vuren, Bk 02064 a5 29 Leasing poitfilic analysis - valuation, PLRs, BV

Von Vuren, ik U7 a5 18 Luastny porifolio analysia

Choguette, Andrew (TR 35 p3] Hualthears [easing portfotic analysis.

Choquette, Andrew DOTAN i5 1.8 Televom Jeasing portfolio analysis

Krop, Andrew mAkm 35 a0 Sensilivity analysis 0f lab and science Jeasing pontfiolio

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL NDATE rCD HOURS DESCRIFTION
Krop, Andrew QROEA1 45 18 Rensitivity unalysis of lab and wicioe ieaging portfolio
Krop, Andrew QU | i5 1.8 Hensitivity analysis of [ab and spience deasing portfolio
Chroguette, Andrew QW10/A1 A5 13 Telecom leasing portlila analysis
Krop, Andrew AT 15 2.5 Sensilivily analysis of cleetronics leasing portfolin
Krop, Andrew R 1% 13 Creation of st summary ienplate of sensitivity analysis across afl verticals
Krop, Andnew LAl a5 20 Pupulation of master summary of sensitivity analysis across all verticals
Gleicheinhava, Stuar %/ 14001 a5 23 Revwicw and edit of various analyses re: 6/30 lease ponifulio
Van Vuren, Tirik 1143001 35 10 Reviewed caleulations ol lease porifalieg inchiding % of investment grade beases,

averaye remaining duration amd net beok value.
A5 Total [ F]

Desc
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PRUFESSION AL DATE MDD 1HOURS PBESCRIFTION

Gileichenhaus, Stuan OB/OG1 5 (LG Raviewed and onalyzed THF agreement und Jie stracture, including conparison o
marker

Cirivetti, Inhn 0B/06/Q1 34 il Reviewed and onatyzad DRIP agreement and fise stravture, incluling coitgparnson ©
markes

Choquette, Andrew QB/AT/O1 kL 33 {Inicapital and Finava DI inancing rescach

Choquette, Andrew 0B/IE/O1 16 4.6 Crention of [P financing tevms comparison and benchniarking wble

Gleichenhaus, Stuart QB/9/0] 16 23 Assisted in the preparation of marked compartsun ol proposed DIF s

Cirivetti, Jubm Q8001 Kl 2.3 Assisted in the preparation of markat compatison of proposed NIP fees

Yan Yuren, Erik a1/l 36 1.2 Preparativn of Fee/Egpenss Application

¥4 Tatal 17.4
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Franca, Lvia 057 1 ver 41 o Revigw of potantial CRCYBoard candidates.

Miller, Lavig 05713/02 43 0.5 1dentifying patentiol ROT candidates.

Frangg, [ nis 05/13/02 at 1.4 Fallow-up with Y prafessicnals on sugygestions for potential Board/CED
candidates fior Comdiisca. Campiled list of putential vamlidaics,

Frangg, [ uis 05/14/02 Al 1.5 Inirinl colls to prospective canditutes fur CEOQ £ Buard of Comdisee.

France., Lais 05/15/02 a1 [{&] Telephene calls tn potential Doard/CEQ candidates regarding their iplerest in the
pasition.

Franen, Luis 05/16/02 41 14 Continued contact with putential Buard and CEQ candidates.

Miller, David 15 19182 at 0z Ruview uf BOD candidatces.

Fraiwo, Luig D520:02 4t 190 Umlale willh Board candidares, A Palles, 5. Meimark and B. T'lamundon.

41 Tutal b

Desc
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Franco, Luts

Franco, [uis

Miller, David

Miller, Navid

Milker, David

Franca, Luis

Miller. David

Millur, David

Niller, David

Francn, Luis

Franco, Lus

Franco, Luia

Miller, David

Franco, T.uis

Miller, David

Miller, David

Milles, avid

Miller, [ravid

Millct, avid

Milier, David

01707

/11802

04/22/02

04/25/02

Q4/2902

LIETFL M)

04/30/02

030,02

043002

04440402

04/30/02

04/30/02

Q50102

Qx01/02

U5/02/02

05/02/02

05:02:Q2

Q54542

05/06/02

05/08/02
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DETAIL OF §ERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOUITLY 27, 2001 THROUGH ALGUST 12, 20602

rCD HOLURS DRESCRIFTION

42 0.5 Raoview of PO and disclosure stabsment dialls,

42 1.5 Review of tocently received POR and disclosure statement.

42 1.0 Review of daft POR and disclosure statenent docunieigs.

42 0.2 “Ledephone eall to M. Williams reganding pontial issues with 1ox disclnsures.

42 0.1 warkinp with [.. Franco reganling review and analysic of disclosure stasemenl
nimbers.

42 1.1 Heginning review of disclosure siatcncnt.

42 'K ] Telephune call 1o 5. Glechenhaus regarding recoveries nad Prisin claitng.

42 0.3 Waurking with L. Frageo regarding analysis of fnancial weoverics,

42 0.3 Rovivw of eourt decuments regarding disclosurs stavsnent filing.

42 0.6 Comparisnn of POR projections/assumplions with prior analysis.

12 3.0 Review al newly moccived Lisclosyre Starement.

42 1.6 Reviewwd 1cuently received caleulation of Campany 37 veita estimated and
prepared guestions to be anawersd by Arthur Andersen.

42 03 Waorking with |.. Francn regarding analysis of linancial amonnts

42 25 Revisw of POR, company estimate of 57 ¢ott payont and summarize couversalions
with the Company.

a2 1.0 Review of Deblors disclosars slaement.

42 .t Telephon vall with L. Frangs regarding diligence on diselogsuts etatengnd
ducunmnt.

41 0.1 Telephune eall with 5. Gleichenhaus reparding update on diselogure diligence.

42 02 Review of 1 .. Francn analysis of disclosure stalcutent and financial figures.

42 0.5 Wautking with L. Franeo regarding preparation Lar call with Company regarding
financial issucs,

42 ol Discussion with L. Franee regarding Foard OF Directer vandidates.

Desc
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RATE PCH IIOURS DESCRIPTION

Williams, Michael

Williams, Michagl

060302 42 2 Read Comdisco Brst umended plan disclosure stwtement filed on 5/31 with focus un
Federal income tax matters.

0603402 42 2.0 Read Comdisen first amended iotganizmion gplan filed 503102

42 Total 143

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL DATE PLLY HOLRS DESCHLFTION

Grivetti, luhn [P RE 43 [ Drafted EYCA letiet of understanding

Chaguette, Andrew 0712701 43 1.8 Cumpilation ol inkercsted partics jn preparation for conmectivas check

Grivet, John 0773043} 45 45 Cuntinued drafl of relemion doguments, including review of condlict sulities list
from Skadden

Chuguetie, Andriéw IFFEA0I 43 1.3 Cumpilativn of interesicd partias in preparation for connections check

Grivit, John WA 45 2.7 Continued draft of retention dpcuments, including LOU sent @ Conninee eounsel
ik cu-chiirs

Choguette, Andrew 07/31/01 45 10.3 Compilation of intarested partias in preparation lor conncetions check

Gleichenhayg, Stuart 08/21/01 45 V3] Koviewsd draft of retentinn dacuments

Choquette, Andrew 08/01/01 45 6.5 Preparation of firm retention docwncniz

Chuguette, Andrew szt 45 4.3 Preparation of finn retontion doguments

Chaquedte, Andrew 08/03/01 45 i3 Preparatiom of firm retention documenls

Cirivetti, John 0810401 45 7.4 Preparation nf firm retention documenls

Cirivetti, Juhn 0B/14/01 45 25 Preparation ol lirm retenticon documents

Grivetl, Juhn 81501 45 1.6 Proparativn of firn rerention documents

Chogquetre, Andraw a8/ 16/01 45 5.k Conneetions check. Draft nf follow up emnails and now Sonagce reaearch / input intn
dacnment

Grivetti, John QB/20/01 45 0.3 Discussion with B. Barretl re: rebontiog ia5uca

Cirivetti, Juhn QBIZHA 45 1y Preparation ol linn retention docymenta

Miller, David Q20401 45 0.l Discussion with ), Grivelti ve. EYCA retention papers slalus

Griveli, Jubn UR/THN 45 ol Discussion with 1. Miller re. FYCA retention papers status

Crivetii, Tohn 0B/249401 45 1.9 Preparation of firm retention ducuhents

Chagquette, Andrew 08/25411 45 1.4 ¢ omnections check ducument vonsalidation

Desc
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Lrivetu, Juhn 08531701 45 1.1 Preparation of firm retention dacuments

Grivelli, Juhn 00g/01 45 1.2 Preparation of firm retentinn documents

Choguette, Andrew [GIGRYN 45 1.4 Connevtiona cheak review for retention documents

Choguctic, Andrew 09/05/0t 45 1.8 Review nf application for retention

Gleichenhaus, Sleart 09/00/01 45 0.6 Eeaview nf it retention related decumenis

Chiovquette, Andreaw 00/06/01 45 1.3 Revisions o retentivn docurments

Choquerte, Andrew 09/06/01 A5 x5 PFronfreading of retentivn docurnonls

Miller, David (L ER) 43 0.5 Roview of firm vetention related documents

Grivew, John aw/13al1 45 F A Preparatinn of firm retention decuments

Cirivett, Johm 0517401 45 4.5 Freparatian of tirm ritention documenis

Grivatti, Inhn 0913401 45 6.2 Revised EYCF retentivn application

Van Vuren, Erik LEAER 45 26 Reviaed EYCE retenrion application

Krup, Andicw 0% 19401 45 [i%3 Fetivery nf application o Gardner, Carton & Douglag in Chicage

Frante, Luia 03/06/02 45 {8 Review of prior conneclivns vhock n preparation for npdate 1o he completed.

Brango, Luis n3/13/02 43 (X Review and prepasation of subgontract agreemen for trinsaction services review off
CIS plan.

France, Luis M AEL 45 0.5 Conversations with E&Y raom regarding Yipes Communicationg, including
researeh into Comdisee's mvestmeant in and amounts due liom Yipes.

Francw, Luis (4104042 45 0.1 Call o J, Cirivetti regarding supplemnental affidavit w b filad reparding new
gonncition to Yipes Communications.

Franco, Luis /1 2 45 0.4 Call with M Hoshach, TY General Counsel ottice regusting, iovired discioanre for
néw conngcrion with ¥ines commemications.

Franco, l.uis 04/10/0Z 45 0.5 Calls with EY tzam o Yipea communications regarding the Lype of work @ be
perlommued, wheie they are in the retention process/

Franco, Luis 0a/11/02 45 1.6 Draft and review of Mew Connection affidavit fur Yipes Comtunications bared om

aample of 5. Star.
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Miller, David 03/12in2 45 0.2 Working with L. Franue regzarding updated diselosun: reparding Yipes connectinn.

Franco, Luis 04/12/02 45 1.2 Review and revise affidavit ti he Gled for Yipes Communications.

Franuw, Luis | RAY2 45 H] Cunsubation wilk A, Stovkaan of Latham & Wwatking and incomperation af her
comments into supplemnental allidavit,

Miller, David 4/ 1902 45 0.1 Telephune call to 5. lewhenhaus sagrding supplemental affidavir and eall with R
Hlansun regarding same.

Frangi, Luia /19002 45 1.1 Further editing of Supplemenial Affidavit hased om comments hy A. Stockman.

Franto, Luag | ERZEN P 45 0.6 Finulized Supplumental A fTidavit reparding Yipes, Rell Foyd and DentalXChange.

Ingles, Reatrice Dev3/02 45 1.0 Preparation nf May FeeMixpense Applicativn.

Ingles, Beatrice e 43 1.0 Prepamatinn nf May Fee/Expense Applivation.

Ingles, Bralrice 1A 02 45 1.0 Prepanstion uf May Fow/Expunse Application,

Ingley, Bealrice Dearthinid 45 1.0 Prepanitivn of May Foow/Expense Application.

Ingles, Beatrice 0&/07/02 45 1.0 Prepararion nf May Fee/ixpense Application.

Miller, David 06/17402 a4 0.3 Working with 1. France regarding disclesure of B&Y Auvatralia proposed work and
supplemental affidavit.

Miller, David 617412 43 a.l E-mails to Counsel reparding proposed work by E&Y Austrolia.

Franow, Lujs Ui/ 172 43 a4 Compuose new suppluncatal Alfdavit based on E&Y Australia picking up audit
Lavks lor Comdisco Australia aud NE.

Millar, David 06/18:02 45 0.2 Send e-maila to Comminee counsel Tegarding disclosure ol E&Y Austratia
enpagenent by Dehtors.

Franca, Luis 0619402 45 1.4 Compilation nf new supplemental aifidavit 1o disclos: E& Y Ausltalia connection
hased an comments of Committee Counsel.

Miller, David QB/20/02 45 0.2 Working with I.. Franco regarding E&Y Australia hircd by Deblors,

Pranca, Luis 06/20/02 45 0.4 Calls to F&Y Austrolia te discuss work dene by E&Y Australis fin Comdisee
Augtralia and Mew Zealoand.

Ingles, Deatrice 06/20:/02 45 1.4 Preparation of May Fee/Cxpense Applicatiun.

Pranca, Luis 06/21/02 45 0% E-mail update of conversation with &Y Australia and further lollow-up otk 135

work performed.

Desc
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DATE Py HOMIRS . DESCRIFTION

Millar, David

Miller, Davsd

anT602 43 0.3 ‘Lelephong call to B, Hanson regarding Deblurg desiae to hirg FEY Austmalia and
conflicy potential.

212 45 1 Raview of draft nf TYCF supplemuntal affidavit.

45 Tutal 1077
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PROFESSIONAL DATE PCLr JIOURS DESCRIPTION
Choyuette, Andiew (49/263/01 EL 1.7 Analysis of detaited huurs and cagenses Tor use in fee application
Milter, David 10705401 46 0.2 Preparativn ¢! uly-S¢piember time details for Fee Application tequests.
Chuguent, Andrew 10/L 1/D1 4h ) Assisted in propaiation of monthly invaices
Grivetl, John 10/t 2/01 a6 1.6 Prepared August and Sepreber fime summaries to be used i foe applieation
Cluquete, Androw 10/12/01 a4t 1.7 Billing detail collection for fee application.
Cloquente, Andrew 10/1541 a4 18 Colleciean and ereation of fee application.
Choguette, Andrew 1141 4 2.8 Cotlegtion of hours and aljustments tor foe Application.
Aherman, Richard T0/30:0H 44 0.5 Review and revise engaguerticnt foe analysis.
Williams., Michagh 11/0201 46 0.5 Prepuration of lax (e Applicarion matters with R. Sherman
Sheeman, Richard 110201 ETS 2.6 Paeparation of tax fee application matters including diseussions with M. Williams
Chaguents, Andrew 1171 4o 46 .6 Preparation nf hilling for current lic application.
Grivatti, Jahn 1141501 46 2.4 Preparatinn of fie application schodulea and other billing reluted itenns
Engles, Buatrice a2 4 1.0 Praparation ol July-Diceember 2081 Pee/Txpense Application,
Ingles, Beawice: atmz/a2 a6 1.5 Preparation of July-Negember 2001 Fee/Exponse Application.
Ingles, Reatrica a1/02/02 46 1.5 Proparation of Tuly-Drecember 200 Fow'Exponse Application.
Ingles, Peatrice aaAz 46 1.0 Preparation nf July Decemnber 2001 Foo/Expense Application,
Girivetti, Juhn 1H7:02 46 14 Preparation of Fee/Expense Application.
Cirivetd, Julm alaTo 46 09 Preparation of Few/Expinge Application.
Ingles, Bealrice 011 /02/02 46 1.0 Preparatian of July-December 2001 Fee/Fxpense Application.
Grivetti, John BLAYMIR 46 1.5 Preparatinn of Fee/Tixpense A pplication.
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PHOFESSIONAL__ DATE PN NESCRIPTION
Grivelli, folin 01/09/02 46 1.4 Preparation nf Fee/Txpunse Applivaliot,
Inples, Buatiice 0171002 46 24 Preporation ot July-December 2001 Feo/Expense Applicatinn.
Grivet, Juhn al/1t/02 46 1.1 Preparation of Fee/Expense Applivation.
Ginivetti, Juhn arinoe 46 11 Preparation of Fee/lixpense Applivation.
Ingles, Beatrice ol/11az2 46 24 Preparation vl July-Dicecinber 2001 FeeExpense Application.
Inyles, Beatrice 0111402 46 0.5 Revisions to July-Decomber 2001 Fee/Fxpense Application.
Griveti, John 01414402 4 1.1 Proparation of Fee/Expenss Application.
Grivetti, fohn 01/1402 a4 1.0 Preparation of Fee/Fxpense Application.
Inglos, Beattiee L1402 44 [0 Revisinns to July-Drecermber 2001 Fre/Hxpense Application.
Inples, Beatrics 01714702 46 1.8 Revisions to July-December 2001 Fee/Expense Application.
Inples, Reatrice 0171402 LT 0.5 Ruvasions o July-1%cember 2001 Fee/Expense Applicativi,
Ingles, Rreatrice 01/15/02 a6 0 Revisions w July-Deeember 2001 Fee/Expense Applwation.
[uploy, Beatrice QL1602 46 1.0 Revisicms ta July-Decembur 2001 Fee/Expense Application,
Lugdes, Beairice ai7m? ELS 1.0 Preparation vl Fu/Exprnse Application.
[nples., Beatrice al1/18/02 At 1.5 Preparation ol Fie/Expenss A pplication.
Ingles, Beatrice o1/20/02 E 2.5 Preparation ol Fec/Expenss Applicatinn.
Ingles, Beatrive DZIKL 45 25 Preparation of Pea/Txpanze Applicativn,
Ingles, Deatrive 072002 46 2.5 Preparation of Pee/Txpense A pplicativo,
Miller, David /231 £ 1.0 Beview an revise fee application schedules.,
Miller, Mavid 0L/2302 4 0.5 Working with J. Griverti reparding written fee application.
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ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERYICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
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PROFESSIONAL DATE D HOIIRS DESCRIFTION
Grivetti, John 0142302 46 3N Adjugtinents an the written Fee Application draft and discussions with D, Miller
1cyarding same.
Ingles, Beatrice N12302 46 35 Priparation of FeeHxpense Application.
williams, Michact 01724402 46 Q.5 Discussion with J. Grivetti reparding fee applications.
Cirivetti, John 01724002 46 1.5 Proparation of Fee/Expence: Application.
Grivetti, Iohn 01/24/02 6 et Preparation of Fee/Fxpense Application.
Ingles, Reatrice 0l/24/02 46 4.5 Preparation of Fee/Txpense Applicatian.
Williams, Michael 01/2502 E 1.0 Reviewed and revised descriplion from M, Fataone regarding fiee applications.
Cirivetti, Johm 01/2502 4 an Prepamation of Fee/Expense Applivation for 5, Dallinper.
Chrivelei, John 1/25/02 46 a7 Froparation of Fee/Ex penge: Applicatian far 5. Dollinger.
Crriveri, John 01/25:02 a6 4.6 Lantinyed preparation of Fee/Txnense Application und rclated analysis,
Ingles, Beatrice 01/25/42 46 S0 Preparation nf Fea/Tixpense Applivalion.
Grivetti, John 01/27/02 a6 4.5 Continued preparation of Fee/Expense Application and related analysis.
Miller, David 01/28:02 46 'K} Rovicw draft of fiegt imarim fee opplication.
1ngles, Reatrice 0l1/28/02 46 1.0 FPreparation of Fes/Fxpense Application.
Miller, Taavid 01/29/02 46 0.3 ¥inal review of fee application and retated schedules.
Ingles, Beatrice 012942 45 2.0 Freparation nf Fes/Tixpense Applivalion.
Miler, Davil 14302 46 [(F: Telephony call ). Griverti reszarding final comments an initial fer applicatisn.
Crivelti, Juhm DAL At 04 Telephene call D. Maller 1eaeding final comments on initial Fee Application.
Inyles, Beatrice 0130002 4 1.3 Prepamation of Fee/Expense Applivatiot.
Van Yuren, Frik 01/31/02 46 44 Preparation of Fes/Tixpensa Applicatian. Sl to Dv. Millee for review.

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL DATE FCh HOURS DESCRIFTICN
Ingles, Reatrice o1/31/02 a6 1.5 Preparation of Fee/Lxpense Applivaliot,
Van vuren, Erik 02/01/02 35 A Deliverables tist by PCD For D, Miller as suppost for Fea Application.
linglea, Bearrigs 02/a1/02 445 1.% Preparation of Pee/Txpanse Application.
loglea, Heamice 02/01/02 46 1.4 Reconciliation af Fuly/Aug/Bept/OctyoviDee bills,
Ingles, Beatrice 02/04/02 A [} Reconciliation of Tuly/Aug/SeprOet o ee bills.
Tngles, Peatrice 02/05/02 a0, 1.5 Revisions W reconciliation of July/Aup/Sept/Oct S ov/Tec hills.
Inples, Deatrive 120603 A3 .0 Preparation of July/Aup/SeptOct NoviTee FeeMixpense Application.
Miller, David 2ARA02 46 .5 Favicw and revise detail ime entries per discussion with Citibank,
Inples, Reatrice 42111402 LT 1.4 Prepamation of July/ A ug/SeptOot/Noviiee Foo/Expense Application.
Girivetti, John 212002 s Al Adjusted Fee application liles baged on eomments fiom S, Dollinger.
Inples, Beatricy uzhziz 44 20 Preparation of July/Aup/Sept/OoiNov/Tiec Fee/Tixpense Applicalivr.
[nples, Beatrice 021442 46 10 Revigiens to Juby/Aug/Sept/OctMNov/Dec FewEapense Application,
Ingles, Beatrice 02:18:402 4 1.5 Reevisions to July/Aug SeptOutMovDen Feo/bixpenge Application.
Millar, David 02120002 af 0z Review and revise deafl fee application.
Ingles, Deawice V22002 46 1.0 Preparution of Foc/Eapenes applicarion.
Ingles, Beatrive N2/21402 46 29 Proparation of Fee/Expenae Application.
Inples, Heatrice 0312402 A6 1.4 Preparation nf Drecember/January/February Fow/Expense Application.
Ingles, Beatrice n1/20/02 a6 24 Preparation of Decembher/fanuaryFebraary Fes/Exponise Application.
Ingles, Deatrice DAL 46 1.0 Proparation of December/Janyary/February Pee/Txpense Apphication.
Sherman, Richard D3728402 a6 04 Review billing infunnation with B. Ingles ond M. Williams.

Desc
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ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROUECT CODE
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PROVESSIONAL DATE PCD HOLURS DESCRIPTIUN

Ingles, Beatrice D262 46 ] Prepanutiun of Decemnbui/Tahuary/Febmpry Fee/Expense Application.

Sherman, Richard 032702 46 0.3 Fallow-up cunversation wilh B, lnplea regarding billing.

Sherman, Richard 02702 44 03 Review hilling infurmation with B, [ngles and prepare invoice to EYCF.

Ingles, Beatrice DM2TAZ 44 20 Reconcile Deccmbor Janwary/Febmary hills to WIP.

Shermum, Richard 1F4/2H0% L 04 Review imvaice information for billing amaunt with M. Williams and B. Lnples,

Ingles, Beabrive ¥/ 2802 £ 10 Revisiens 1 December/langary/Fehmary hills.

Williang, Michael 02/29/02 44 0 Llizcugaion of Fee application with David Miller.

Miller, Travid 032902 ET 0.3 Review and finalize Fivst lutorio Fee Application.

Ingles, Beatrive D320z 40 Q.3 Revisieny b Deceinber/lanuary/Fehrary hills.

Ingles, Deatricy M1/02 dfi 1.0 Propatation of Dectroler/March Pee/Txpense Application

Ingles, Beatrice (4/03/02 46 LI Preparation of NecemberMarch Tee/Expense Applicalion

Ingles, Fieavrice 04/05/02 44 10 Frepamation ot December/March Fee/Expengs Application

Grivetti, Juhn /1602 46 a.d Ruview and Revise Ivcember/March Fee/Expense Application

Grivelti, Juhn 04/19/02 46 1.7 Raview and Revise Ievembar/March Fee/Expense Application

Ingles, Beatrice 0472302 46 ] Revigions o Tecember/March Fee/Eapense Application

Ingles, Bearice 0/ 2602 £ A0 Review and Revise December/March Feo/Eapenas A pplication

Inglas, Reatrice 04/30/02 a6 1.0 Tinalize Drecember/March Fee/Expense A ppligation

Williams, Michael 05/01/02 LTS 2.0 Review fee application Jox December 2001 through March 20020 Discuss with E.
Mills and K. Sherman.

williams, Michacl D5/09/02 a4 1.1 Thigeugsion nf Mecember thraugh March tives analysis with Lavis Miller and B.
Inples.

Williams, Michagl 05/14/02 13 1. Freparation of April fees analysis lor B, Ingles.

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL DATE PCD HOURS DESCRIFTION
Shernian, Richasd B31402 3y & Reviewed time for invoice summary. PCD voeded lie incuried for submiscion to
Rankmptcy Court.
Frunuo, Luis DS/16A2 a6 15 Revisinns to Decemher - March Fee und Expense data, Deafl of Second Fee
application for the periad.
Franco, Luix 08/17/02 46 bR Lipdate ond review aof Second Fee Application.
Miller, Davsd D3:720412 a6 0.5 Review of initial draft of Secoml Interim Foe Application,
Fratw, Luis D5/20/M2 ET 1.5 Revisiuns Lo 2nd Fee Applications baged of cottments from 0. Miller.
Ingfes, Reatrice 06AIH02 46 2.0 Freparation ol Fu/Expense Application.
Ingtes, Beatrice 6052 E"] 1.0 Pregaration of Fee/Expense Application.
Ingles, Bualrics UBMGAIZ 40 1.0 Preparation of [ee/Cxpense Application.
layles, Beatrice GATHL af 1. Preparation of Fee/Expensc Application,
Millgr, 1avid 0617402 46 0.1 Finahiv and sign sceond imcrim foe application.
Franco, Luix 06/17/02 44 [ Review of feg application and calls ta Committee counse] for Aling procedurss,
Franco. Luis URRA03 44 0.3 Calls with Committee Counsel 1o Ble Sceond Fee Application,
Franee, Luig 04'19/02 44 Q.3 Finalize Secund Few Applivation,
Ingles, Begtrice O6/20/02 46 1.0 Preparativn vl Fue/Exponse Application.
Miller, David 06/10/02 46 ol Heview of eover pape regarding secand interim fee application.
Franu, Luis 062002 46 0.4 Review ond finalize second fiee application summiary o be §16d with the Court.
Ingles, Beawice DGS21/02 46 240 Preparation of Fee/Expense Application,
Inglcs, Beatrice D810/02 46 1.0 Preparation of July hilling statement.
Miller, David 08/27/02 46 01 E-wait to team reparding effective date and tdming of final applivatiots.
Miller, David 08/28/02 46 w1 Laraft g-mail e team reparding effective date and Hming ol linal Fos Applisations,
46 Total 1649.4

Desc
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FPROFESSIONAL DATE D HOURS DESCRIFTION
Van Vuren, Frik 01/23:02 47 2.0 Review of [lecember hilling information.
van Vyren, Frik i /25702 47 an Roevigions to August Movernher billing

47 Tutul a0
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PROFESSIONAL DATE [ L] HOURS
Shuctnai, Richard 10719401 48 2.1
Pavini, Dorolica 10722403 48 0.1
Sherman, Richard 10722/ 48 03
Grivett, lohn 10/23/0) 48 1.2
Shennan, Richard 10/23/01 48 0.6
Pacini, Dotathea 10/24/01 45 (L2
Cmivetti, fohn 10/24/01] 44 1.1
Shemian, Richad 10426431 48 02
Williama, Michasl 10/30/01 45 93
Pacini, Darathea 10730701 44 0.3
Pacini, Dorathea 1073001 a8 0.1
Shetnad, Richard 10740701 48 0.2
Sherman, Richard 10/30/01 43 .z
Miller, David 11/02/01 44 .4
Sherman, Richard 11/15/1 a4 14
Shemad, Richard il 4B 0.7
Sheroian, Richard /20001 48 14
Miller, David 0172202 48 20
Milker, David a1/2802 48 0.2
Gitivetli, Fohn al1/28/02 48 0.2

UESCR)FTION

DPeveop copapement fee analysis for billing,.

Review of billing summary pravided by R. Sherman.

Riview frax for detait relating in C. Kalstad's time in conucouwon with Comdisen
wirk.

Preparation of menthly invaices

Rovige enpagement fee analysis o segregale amounts bewecn Ortober and
Soptember,

Driscussiom with M. Williams regarding billing information.

Preparation ol mionthly invoices

Phone call to A. Copuett reparding hilling information for Commdiso,

13igquasion with [3.Pacini regarding billing and Unalizing memo.

Discwssion with M. Williaca teqarding billing and finalizing memo.

Discussion with B. Sherman vegarding hilling.

Liizcwssiona with B, Ingles regarding the farmat ol the engapetnent for analysis.

Adjustment 1n fae analysis re: ©. Kolstad regarding ieversing rime inta o chargeahle
oowla.

Preparation of case W date fime and Cxpenses.

Review time on WIPS 1 detenning time: hos been transferred comrectly for billing
PUurposes.

Forward billing information to B Ingles and J. Griveus repaiditg billing
infoanation

Convereation with B. Ingles regarding the classitication of tinw for the Cheroher
invaiee.

Review of July, Aupast, Septerther, Qctaber and November draft foe and expenses
invaices,

Discuseions with J. Grivetti reparding hilling matters.

Liiacusaions with TLMiller regarding billing matwrs.

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 6/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 128 of 267

CONMDES, N
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PROVESSIONAL DATE o HOUKS DESCRIFTION

Franco, Luis D2/RAZ a5 12 Compilation ol support schedules ko be submiteed fo Commines,

Girivetti, Jahn 02/07/02 a3 1.4 Compitation af suppurt schedules for July throvph November to be submitted to
Committae.

Franco, Luis V207102 4% Xl Organization and compilation of schedwles to be submided to Committee.

Frunco, Luis yzAR 4 16 Compilutivn ul suppuit schodules for July thraugh Movember to he submitted 1o
Commities.

Franco, Luts NZAIRL 4% 1.0 Assenibly ul billiny support to be provided fo Comminee.

Francw, Luts OLOR02 48 1.2 Assenibly ot billing support te be provided to Comminee.

Franen, [Luis on11/02 EE 1.5 Revisiong to FCT) deliverable.

Franco, Luis 02/11:02 4 .5 Reaview of deliverables ducumenl.

Framco, Luis 0212412 48 7 Final update ol PCD deliverable, compasition nf cover letter to 5. Daollinger.

Miller, David Ay 102 48 .4 Revicw and adiust invoices from reduced fees agreed with Citibank.

Milter, David 0320402 a4 2 Warking with B. Ingles reparding i application and inveiees.

Miller, David 93422402 44 5 Review of revised invoices Jiom B, Egles and send e-mail regarding ndditdonal
chanpes.

Miller, David GAIZHAIL 43 0.3 Review and linaliz¢ moithly bills from First Interim fee perind.

Milier, David 03/20/02 48 nz Yrarking with B. Inglea regarding detailed time analysis.

Mills, Clizabeth 03,2342 44 Ih6r Niscussions with M. Williams, B. Sheanan, and B, lnglea regarding fae estimates
and billing.

Mills, Elizabeth 03/28:42 4% 1.9 Preparation of invoice tu EYCF.

Miller, Dravid G242 44 0.1 Coordinate LLP Bill paynrenl,

Franco, Luis [(EHAE ) 44 0.5 Organization, cumnpilation and dulntission of time to B. Ingtes for upcoming hilling.

Bopys, Kimberly U473 49 2.5 Preparation of billing analysia.

Doy, Kimberly 04/18/402 a3 2.0 Preparation of billing analysis,

Desc
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FROFESSIONAL DATE - FCD HOURS DEACRIFTION
Rngps, Kimherly 04/19:02 48 1.7 Preparatian of hilling analysis.
Rogpa, Kimherly 04/20:02 48 1.5 Preparation of hilling analysis.
Rngys, Kimherly Q4/21:02 48 20 Preparation of billing analysis.
Miller, Tavid Q4/24:42 4K a3 Review and revise Ducember-Mach 2002 bills.
Miller, David 04/25402 4K 0.3 Warking with D Ingles reganding chanpes to [ecember-March 2002 bills.
Williams, Michael /20112 48 2.0 Analysis vl Febiuary and March services for Fee Application.
Franeo, Luia 4/26/02 48 L Raeview next fee application and invoice including backup.
Kalfen, Nenald 04/28/02 48 4,0 Kevigwed detniled billing analysis.
Bogys, Kimberly Q4204012 L4 1.5 Freparation of billing analysis.
Kallisn, Duarald 4507002 43 2.0 Rovicwed detaited billing analysis.
Baopes, Kimberly 04/30/02 48 kX Preparatioh of bilking onolysis.
Miller, I7avid 05/01/02 F1 L4 Keview of updated Mecember 01-March 02 munthly bellifg satenents
Millar, Mavid 05/05/02 24 [ Review and revise Dwcemnber 01-Maich 02 billing satements.
Miller, David DIARAT EE] 0.2 Waorking with B. Ingles 1carding inveie epvisions.
Miller, David DA/ 4B 0.3 Raview of final drafts of the Necember 01-March 02 billing staivrnemis.
Eranen, [.nis D5/10/02 a4 s Anmmary of [lecemher throagh March 2002 billig,
Praneo, T.nis 05,2302 43 0y Preparation of estimate of hours to be incwred until eonglvgion of enpagement.
Pranco, 1.uis 05/23/02 44 1.0 Review of Decemher - March bills and vreation of sunimary.
Miller, Mavid 05/23/02 43 03 Review of initial draft of April 02 billing skalemicnt,
Miller, Mavid O | /02 18 1 Keview of April 2002 fee Invoice.

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL DATE rCn HOT'RS BESCRIFTHON

Ingles, Bualric [Erditn ] 45 1.0 Treparition of Foo/Expenss Application.

loyica, Beatrice 070302 ik} 1.0 Proparatiom of Fae/Expense Application.

Ivgles, Beatrice: 0712702 48 1.0 Preparation of Fee/Expensze Application.

Shernan, Richard 0772202 48 4 “I'ax enngulting work in preparation of submission W banktuptey conr.

Sherman, Richard 07/21/01 45 4 Review tax gnnsutting work detail with B. Ingles and E. Millz for sabmisgion
Rankmptey Court.

Ingles, Reatrice 0772302 4% [} Preparation of Fee/Expense Application,

Willioms, Michuel 0731702 Et 1.0 Cngagement sconomics review with [3, Miller, B Milla and other team members for
Diecernber-March lie statcneit,

Shennan, Richard oMz 48 23 Revivtw Tax consuliing infarmarinn for suhmission to the Dunkruptey Court.

Franco, Luis 0R/07/02 48 P51 Revigw of Tiecemher-March hilling schedules.

Pranca. Luis QR/DTINZ 4y 0.5 Review nl December-March lilling slaenicnts.

Ingles, Deatrive QEOTINZ 48 0.5 Review ol Decernber-Maich billing starements.

Franuo, Luis OHANR2 48 0.3 Ruview of May and Jung hilling schedules

Fratica, Luis QOF/0%/02 48 23 Revigw of May-June hilling statementy.

Miller, Diavid OR/ORY0Z a4 0.2 Meeting with I.. France regarding veror i Doeccimber-Margh billing schedules.

Franco, Luis QBAENOZ 41 0.3 Review ul'May and Junc billing schedubes

Fraoca, Luls GRAR2 48 1.1 Review ol May aiid June billing schedutes and errors with D. Miller. Drall caver
Tetter Lo fo wotitnittee detailing errnr and rebilling for December-March period,

Miller, Dravid ORI 48 0z Meeting with L. France regarding December-March hilling statements

Franua. Lujs URARNG2 48 [{X] Rasvicw ol May-Jang billing statements.

Frunva, Luis QRN 48 L.l Review ul May-June Lilling statements. Droft caver letter ta fee Connnitice
detailing rebilting Lor Liceetnber-Mareh hilling parind.

Milter, David aRZ7i02 48 0.3 Processing leter und related teind regarding wpdased hills.

Desc
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Miller, Lravid 0R/27/02 48 3 Processing letter and related seins regarding updared hills.

48 Total w8
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Miller, Exavid 1240541 S0 3 Warking with A. Campbell regarding potential special servicers.

50 Tutal L
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Miller, David Q812751 H 2 Warious e-matls to beam regarding; insurange for MA&A deals

Van Yuren, Erik AH17/01 5l 17 Analyzed Ford leases tu be sald 10 EMC

Grivetti, John au/15/01 51 1.3 Compared listing of Ford Jiases a1 603 w sale praposals of leases to TMC

Gleichenhaws, Stuarl 10/0%/01 A1 1.3 Review vt Sungund bid inlinmation,

Miller, David TIHORAN il 0.7 Review ol Ssugard bid information.

Gibwiclicnhaus, Stuan 11041 51 0.2 Reeview of Chage/si prapnsals to finance Sungard Dt bid Lr services divigion.

Milier, avid 1010401 53 0.2 Review of Chase/TPM prapnsals to finance Sunpard Irawd bid for services division.

Cirivatti, fohn 10410401 51 0.4 KReview of Sunyard hid information.

Falzone, Micholus 1031241 3 0.4 Conference vall with C.Kulatad separding porential suitars for Dehtor leasing
purtivlios

Gleichonhaus, Stuatt 1y 12401 3l 0.4 Reviewiny dutuils of aalc af services to Rungard data (press release, counsel muine,
revised confidentialiey, ee...).

Kuolsad, Chailes 10/101 51 'Y} Conferenee ¢all with N. Falzone regarding putemtial suiters Lor Leboor leaging
porifiplios

Miller. Iavid 1o/12v01 il 0.5 Rurertwing detnils of anle of services ta Sungard data (pross clowse, vounsel memos,
revised confidentialiny, etc...).

Girivetti, Jahn 10/12401 il 0.2 Reviewed articles re: Sunyguand's succcssf] bid for Availability Selutions

Miller. David 1023240 H 0.4 Review of mulions 1eaarding approval and ohjection tn sule of availability solulions
business.

Miller, David 1 10 31 0.5 Revicw of cout maotions regarding sale of availability solutions.

Ciivetti, Johm 1171301 51 04 Reviewsd summary of leasing hids

Cirivetti, fnhn 11/28/01 51 [vRi] Reviewed Fazio letter to Citi, and the leasing bidz and disengsion with 8. Dollinger
e same

Miller, David 11730031 51 0% Review of leasing bid inlonoation

Mitler, David 12:03/01 51 0.2 Telephone call with J. 1Eallock regardimg leasing auction reswts.

Miller, David 12404401 51 0.2 Keview of lepsing anction information.
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Grivetti, Jahn

Grivetti, John

Franco, [.uis

Camphell, Keith

Camphell, Keilh

Camphell, Keilh

Miller, David

Grivelti, Jehi

DATE FCD HOLRS DESCRIFTION

12/13/6] | i7 Pativipate in various Comminze conference calts reganbing leasing bid update and
review of Lazard analyses re: same.

DLOZZ H| kB | Review and discussion of Campany's proposed sale of 4 existing intecsts in ventirg
captlal funds and disenssions with [.Franca, 5.Gleichenhaus, and 5, Dolling:

01/02/02 51 1.3 Review and discogsion of Campany'a proposed sale of 4 existing intervsls i venturg
wapital Junds,

01/07/02 1 1.8 Reusearch Cotlet Capital ransaerion with 1.ucent in determine the pussibilitics of
selling tho Condigen venharg porténlin,

o1z H 1.6 Oblain publicly ovailable information on Cemdisce venlugs portiolio ond review
congkdering potential suitors.

O1/09/02 53 L3 Rezearch Coller Capital and ather putential fundiny soufces for Ventre Portfolio.

01/14/02 il al 1.eaging sale resalts review.

01/23/02 51 15 [iscassions with R.1[anson and Acthor Anderson representatives regarding
elecranics purchase prive allocation issues and review of related docunents.

51 Tatal s
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Van Vuren, Erik DRG0 55 2.4 “Tested Venture Jease portfolio - set parameters of (st and identified leases to be
tested

Van Vuren, Erik OHAOTI 55 29 “Tested W enture laase portfolin - read throogh sctual lease files te recend seleoted
leage muetrics

Wan Vuren, Erik QAT 55 25 ‘Tested Ventyre lease poetfolio - compured lease tape data & intarmarion fnd in
actual leaze files asked Camdisco employees to explain Uic vatiance

Van Vuren, Erik QAR 55 20 ‘Lested 'l'elecom lease pomtfolio « set parameters of vest and identified leases fo he
waled

Wan Yura, Erik ARG 55 2.5 Tested Telecom lease portfisliv - nead though acwal lease files to record selected
lease metmics

Van Yuion, Erik 0841301 55 24 Tested Telecam lease purtfoliv - vemparcd ease tape data tn information found in
acrnal lease files; asked Comdiseo cinployees W ¢¥plain the variances

Yat Vuren, Erik 08/14/01 55 e Tested Lab & Scientifiv [oasc portfolio - st parometers nf test and identitied Juses
1o he tested

Van Varen, Frik 03415401 55 2.0 Tuested Lub & Scicorific lease partfolio - read through aciual Jease tiles w0 peeord
seleuled 16ase N3eLics

Yun Yuren, Eiik 1813401 55 ) Tested Lab & Scientific Jease pomifolio - comgared leaze g dota to information
found in actual lease Ales; asked Comdiseo cnplovecs o explain the variances

Yan Vuren, Erik 0314001 55 24 Tested Henlthcare lease porifuliv - sot paraibicicrs of iest and identified leases to be
rested

Van Yuten, Erik 08/ 17101 55 29 Tested Healthcare lease pordiliv - tead throwgh aetiol lease fles to recond selected
lease metrics

van Vuren, Brik DB/20/0L A5 2.0 Tested Healthem e Iues partfolio - enmpared lease tape data to informatien fiawsl
autual least files; asked Comdiseo employess to explain the varianoes

Van Yuren, Etik (/200 35 1.7 Testad Flectranics lease portfolio - set paanetera of el and idestified leazes to he
tested

Vam Yurem, Btk 0R721701 55 240 Tegted Flectronics lease partfolio - read throupgh actual lerse files to recard selevted
lease memics

Vah Vuten. Erik 08/21/01 55 12 Tested Clectronics lease portlulio - compared lzase tape data to information B
in actual lease files; asked Coandiseo employess to gxplain the variances

Choquatte, Andrew 08/21/01 ah 13 Divisional balanes shicl ioll-np and ereation

Van Yuren, Crik QE/22/m 55 25 Tested I [ease portfalin - set parameters of lest and ideified loases v be tested

Van Vuren, Grik QRIZ2AN 35 2.5 Teated I'L [case portfolio - read through actiual lease liles b record seleqted lease
melis

Van Vuren, Erik 0E22/01 55 27 Tested IT lease portfolio - compared lease wpe data W infsrmation found in aciusl
Tease Gles; asked Coindizco cinplayees to explain the varances

Kiop, Andrew 08/22/0) 55 4.1 Review of electomiv balanve sheats for lepsing verticols
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Chayuette, Andrew (F4mM 55 23 Balance sheet analysig’deseriptinn detail

Chaquette, Andrew /s 55 22 Balance showt analyaig/deaeription detail

Krap, Andrew 0a/n7/m 35 ] Review of cleclronic income statements

Girivetts, lahn oL 55 3.6 Ruviewsd intorniation in company data reom, including leasing porttidic daa o be
used in analysia of Icaging balances on halance sheets

Choyuette, Atdicw 012 55 R Intcrinational balanee sheet reconciliation for Asia, Austia, Canada and Ceska

Choyuette, Andiew [ N 55 1.2 Tnternational halanee sheat recancilistion for Mexivo, France, and Haly

Choguere, Andrew 91201 55 a3 Intemnational balance sheet reconciliauon liv Germany, Japan, and [reland

Krop, Andrew 08/12/01 hal 30 Preparation ol DLR sumntary acioss all verricals and regions

Krup, Androw /1 2] 55 2.8 Freparation of inggmatinnal halance sheets

Krup, Anditw 09/12/01 55 24 Proparation of varionce analysis for balance sheets by rogion and by verfical

Gileichanhas, Stuart 0971301 55 1.7 Review and edit ol vanious analyscs re; 630 leage portfolio

Girivetti, John a9/13/01 55 13 Reviewed and cdited analysis of diseonnted tease rentals by leasing business
purtiutiv

Grivend, John U301 55 148 Hevicwed and adited 6/30 international balance sheet analysiz

Chuyuetic, Andrew 09/13/01 55 1.7 Iimerngtignal halance sheet consolidation

Krop, Andrew Q9/13/0] 55 24 Crentinn and population of supplemental (inancial darg reccived from Arthur
Andersen

Krop, Andrew 09/17/01 55 1.0 Creation of template o viaily accuracy of Ventures portfolio halance

Krop, Andrew qui17/0) 85 1.0 Analysts of bard copy financial data inin electranic firmat

Krop, Andrew AUIBAN 55 1.7 Anatysis ol International balance ghaet hard capy inta electronic lommat

Krop, Andrew Q8/18/01 35 0.8 Anabysis ol International income statenicat hard copy intn electromic format

Grivetti, John 0/20/01 55 L4y Reviewed £/30 lease portiblio dats received frons Andersen and gampared o

previously received information for chanpes
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Kivp, Andrew %/20/ 1 55 1.3 Vuificd accuracy of debtor finangial statermnents to underkying data files

Krap, Ainlriw (w2inl 55 22 Verilivd aveuracy of debtor finangisl stotements o undertying duta files

Chuyucne, Andrew w2401 55 28 Addition o LIK ineome staement tn consolidated income statement roll-up

Glcichenhaws, Stuart A%25/01 &3 1.8 Reviewed and cdited financial onalysis of consolidating balance sheety

van Vuren, Enk 10403/01 55 2.5 Lisgwssed consnlidating halance sheets with Luzard

Gilgichenhaus, Stuart 1040501 3] 22 Review nf 4/30/01 consnlidating balance shevl analysis and provided comnwenrs to
F.VanVuren

Van Vuren, Erik 10/08/01 % b Prepored lease portfolio analyss tor Sue Dollinga - developed a financial maodel set
up ta track changes in lease porLlilio

Gleichenhaas, Stuarl TIFREO 55 1.8 Review and linalize #/ME01 congolidating balance sheet analysis

Grivetti, John 10/09/01 55 32 Edited leased asser and halance sheet analysis and sent w 5. Dillinger,

Van Yuren, [rik 10/09/01 55 5 Prepared lease portfolio analysis for Sue Dublinger - % investaicnt prade leases:
™.A.

Grivetti, John TIHTHO1 55 0.3 Diiscussion with P. Honvy of Bolh ro: leased asest halonces

Van Yuren. Erik W10 55 27 Preparcd kasc postfolio analysis for Sue Tollinger - % investment prade leases:
Eurvps:

Van Vuren, Frik 10/10/01 55 .4 prepared lease portfolio analysis for Sue Dullingur - % investment grade leaaes:
Pac. Rim

Van Vuren, [k 10/11/01 55 8 Prepared lease portfolio analysis for Suw Dollinger - Ay Bemaining Duration:
H.AL

Van Vuren, Erik HI12/01 33 2.6 Prepared leuse purtiolio analysis [yt Sue Dollinger - Avi. Remoining Duratian:
Luraps

Van Vurett, Erik L/ 12 55 1.3 Prepared leaso portfsliv anadygia for Sue Dollinger - Avg, Remaining Duration: Pac,
Rin.

van vuren, Frik 10/15/01 55 ] Prepared lease portfolio analysis for Sue Dollinger - Net Book Value: NA,

van Vuten, Erik 14/ 5/014 55 1.7 Prepaicd 1case poitfolio onalysis for Sue Dinllinger - et Book YValue: Europe

Van Yuren, Erk 10415401 55 20 Prepared loase pestlolio analysis for Sne Dollinger - et Book Yalue: Fav. Rim.

Van Vuren, Erik 10/1&/01 5% 24 Prepared lease poctlolio analyss for Sue Lellinger - # of leases: N.AL

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10Q/16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 138 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.

ERNET & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES HENDERED BY FR{OJMECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD JUEY 27, 2001 THROIIGH AIIGUST 12, 2002

PROFESSIINAL DATE PLL HOURS DESCRIFEION

Van Vuren, Lrik 10/18/01 55 2.4 Prepared lease puiifolio analysis for Sue Dollinger - # of leases: Europy

‘Van Vuren, Edk 1O TN Y 55 28 Proparal [case por[fnlio analysis for Sue Mnllinger - # of leases: Pac. Rirm.

Yan Vuren, Erik 1/17/m 55 2.5 Proparcd [case porifolio analysis for Sue Dnllinger » Top Customery: M.A,

Vun Vuren, Erik W2l 55 1.9 Prepared lease portfilin analysis for Sue Dollinger - Top Cuslomers: Erope

Van Vurcn, Ertk 10/18/01 53 2.1 Prepared [ese portfolin analysis for Sue Dollinger - Tep Casloners: Pac. Rim.

Van Vusen, Erik 10/18/M1 55 20 Prepared lense portfnlio analysis for Sue Dullinger - Other Suminary Siotisties: N.A.

Yai Vuren, Erik 10/18/01 55 24 Prepared lease portfolio analysis lor Swe Dollinger - Other Snmmary Statistics:
Eurape

Choguette, Andrew 10/ 5401 HE] 1.4 Preparation ol durativn alculation MRV percentage investmenl grade leases lix
Televon.

Chuyuetie, Andrew 10718401 33 1.3 Freparation of duration calgnlation NIV percentapge investment grade [eazsea for
“Teleon,

Choquette, Andrew L0/18/01 55 1.4 Preparation duration calculution ol NBY perconlape invesmment grade leases for
L&S.

Van Yuren, Frik 19/19/01 55 LE Prepared lease porllblio analysis for Sue Eollinger - Other Summary Statistics: Pac,
Rim.

Vun Voren, Brik W1 35 2% Propined [eaze povtfolic onalysis for Sue Dellinger - Reconviliation ¢f MBY from
Luass tapes o internal financiale M.AL

Yan Vuien, Etik H/1901 35 1.0 Preparcd lense portfolio analysis for Sue Doellinger - Reconciliation of WAV fFrom
lezage: tapes wn internal financials: Curupe

Van Vurch, ik 10/194a1 35 29 Prepared leose portfolio analysis for Sur Dullinger - Recongiliation of NEY from
Teass tapes tn internal finuncials: Pav. Rio,

Chiquette, Andrew FULEIA] A% 13 Review anl revise caleulation, poreentags invasiment gmde, NBY calculation for
Telecom.

Choquetis, Andruw 141 35 2.1 Proparation of duration calenlatinn, percentage investment grade, NBY calcubation
lur L&,

Choquetis, Andrew 1A 35 2.4 Preparation of duration calculation, percentage investment grade. NBY caloulation
lor L&S.

Choxquette, Andrew 1419411 35 25 Ruview and reviag duration galenlavion, percentage investinent prade. NBY
waleulation for Teleesm.

Cirivatt, John 122411 35 50 Reviewed and cdited 6/30/0] |easing portfpling analysis for 5. Dollinger

Van Vuren, Gk 10422401 E) 1% Lease Portfdiv Analysis Tor Suc Dallinger - Cleaned up made] o make il sasicr o

s in the Liture
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Chuguetle, Andtcw 104201 55 28 Analysig of leasing customers over 310M.

Chuoguette, Andicw 10022031 55 21 Analysie of leaging for 1.&5, healthcare and electronius.

Chuguestle, Andrcw 10520 55 1.3 Review of 6/41AH lese portfolia.

Van Vuren, Erik 10/23/01 55 2.5 1.eaae Parifolin Analysis for Sue Dollinger - Cleaned up mode] to nake it easier to
nae in the futurs

Yan Yuren, Erik §0/26/01 55 L1 Raviewed IT - Nurnpe lease file (received from AA on 10/26)

Chodquette, Andrew 10/26/01 55 1.4 Analysis of IT Rurape 5/30/01 portloliv ol Auslia, Belgium, Czech, Crermany and
Hungary.

Choquette, Andrew 10/26/01 55 0.4 Analysis af IT Eurape §/30/01 portfolie of Ireland, Netherlands and Spain.

Choquette, Andrew 1HZ6A 55 1.5 Ana[ygig of IT Eutope £/30/01 ponifolin of Sweden, Switzerland and the UK,

Yan Vurcn, Eiik 125 | 55 an Reviewed 11 - FEurnne lease file (received from AA un 10/26)

van vuren, Frik 102941 55 2.1 Replicated partfoliv analysis with now data

Van Vuren, [rik 102941 55 23 Created revised roport for Sue Dollinger regarding tease portfidio analysis

Chayuette, Andrew 1241 35 1.4 Preparativn ot analysia duration for IT Eurape.

Chaquelie, Andrew 10/25401 35 1.1 Review and revise net bank values for IT Europe.

Choquette, Andrew 10/29/01 55 22 Review calculation ofthe percentape of inveatment prade leazes for [T Europe.

Chogquette, Andrew 10:29401 hE] 28 Preparutiun of analysis sellecting addivion of I'T Furape and its related efbects on
total portfuliv metrivs.

Van Yuren, Erik 10430411 35 2.6 Cunsulidaled varioud lease partflin analyses files inte one model

Van Yurcn, Bk i 35 3.1 Cruated senaitivity analysis for [T lease portfolio, analyzed poifolio valuation bageid
un dilTerent cuteemes for [T Europe

Van Yuren, Enk 1240700 55 18 Metherlanda & Swiss holance sheets - requested froim Andereen and analyzed

Campbell, Keith 1241041 55 1.6 Review all infiinatiot provided by the client in date and generate list off
information necded o complets Ventyres analysis.

Van Vuren, Erik 12411704 55 38 Centinued cvaluation of unfingded venture commitments (Ouk & Vanlagepoint)
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Mitler, Dgvid 12/42/01 55 04 Meeting wilh L. Franso and A, Campbell regarding analysis of Ventures capital
witlls.

Fianco, Luis 121201 55 0.6 Call with Arthur Andersen reparding current CLXO capiral ealls for existing L7,
ApTeemenly.

Francn, |ais 12/12/01 55 0.8 Calla wilh chgapement teans and Arthar Andersen to discuss funding of recent LI
wapital calls,

Van Vyren, Frik 12/12/01 55 4.1 Evaluated unfunded ventore gommi (Qok & Vantagepaint)

Franca, 1.5 12/13/01 55 1.6 Dhiscussion with chiagpement team reyarding capital calls. Ressarch on potential
manapets or purchagers of CIYs venture parténlin.

Franco, Luis 1213/01 55 L4 Call with Arthur Andersen regarding current DY capital calls for existing L.P.
apreements.

Francu, Luis 1214/ 5% (] Review of DO LP apreement with focus un ponaltics By default on capit) calls.
Turther research on potendial managers vr purchasers tor CLEOYS ventwee business.

Miller, David 1AM2 i 0.3 Working with L. Franvu repsarding, cash balances and 5CG&A analysis.

Miller, [avid 471602 35 0.5 Ruvicw and asalyee potcntial vonturg portfirlio analysis.

France, Luis 01,2902 55 L1 Preparation of cash flow hased on weekly domestic cash Nows.

Francy, Luis AWETH ] 55 1.3 Preparation of cash fluw analysis.

France, Luig M3 AR 35 2.2 Duetailed compilation of wnselidated cash low bazed on October and Mavember
intormation presented.

Grivetti, Iohn 013402 55 2.2 Ruvicw of the laest 12731701 leasing datoil files, including comparison to 6730 files
amd varianes analysis.

Miller, David 03/15%/02 55 0.5 Rankinp peneralization with L. Grivetti and L. Franco repanling analysis of forcign
tiabilities.

Grivetti, Juhn 021402 535 0.4 Tyiscussinn with D2.Miller anl L. Franco reparding analysis of forcipn fiabilitics.

Franco, Luis 210402 55 0.7 Telephone vall with K. Mishlur and separdity, deb al foreign entities.

Franen. L 21642 55 1.4 Revisivns b incene detailing forcigh liabilities and digtribution to Commicee.
Update convorsation with Artbur Atdersen regarding follow-up items.

Franea, Luis 2/ 19412 55 1.7 Initial dralt ol ewane e Comuniites sanumarizing call with B. Mishler and Arthur
Andersuny tbay on Borcign dobts,

Franco, Lbis /1942 55 1.0 Initial dralt ol e W Cenmittee sammarizing ¢all with R. Mishler and Arthur
Andersona loday on [oreigt delbts,

Girivetti, Johw 02/20/02 55 0.7 Follow up c-mail e R.Mishlcr on sdditional question regarding foreign abilities

und vbligations and cevicw of hig response.
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Franco, Luis 12,2002 55 1.1
Franco, Luis Q22102 53 1.0
Griventi, John 02/22/02 55 2.7
Frangn, l.uis 02/25/02 55 1.4
Grivetti, Inhn 02/27/02 55 2.3
Grivetti, John 03/01/02 55 n.3
Francu, Luis q30102 33 0.8
Franvw, Luis O%01/02 55 27
Francn, 1.uis Q3/04/02 55 1.1
Miller, David 03/05/02 55 1.4
Grivetti, Juhn Q30502 55 01
Faaiei, Luig 03/05/02 55 22
Miller, David 03/06/02 55 04
Grivetty, Jahn 03/06/02 55 thd
Francu, Luis AHN0E 35 26
Franco, Luis 03/046/02 55 0.7
Miller, David 03/08/02 55 0.2
Franco, Luia OX/0%/02 55 1.5
Franco, Luia 03/11/02 55 1.3
Franco, Lui 031202 55 2.0

LESCRIFTION

Follow-up an 219 ¢all an gash flaws and foreign Liabililies.

Revisions to projected cash balanee as of 323 1/021. Revisions to variance analysis of
original vash progoaction B december 31 versus actuat,

Analyzed 6/30/01 and 12/31/01 foreign balanve sheels w dolennine compasability,
discussions with 5.Txallinger and R_Mishler reparding sam.

1 pdare of projecrad cash halance.

Reviewed the venture portfilio detail received and follow wp diseuasiona with

K.Phelps of Andersen.

Created venture financial projection spreadshect T 5 Dollinger.

Review vl mewly woeived veituics information.

Uptlates 1o 3-31-02 projected eash halance hased on December actual receipts and

disburstinenta.

Preparation nf projected halance sheet.

Niscussion with [ Pranca regarding preparation of projected balance shesr.

Discussions with L.Franwe sopatding projection of holance sheet ta 6/30/02.

Preparauwon of initial moded layont for 6-30-02 balance sheet,

warking with .. Franco regarding analysis vl prujecied balance sheet,

Triscussion with [.. Franco regarding status of projection of 64402 balance sheet.

Continucd developitnt of projected balance sheet, including separiting the mudel

into three shucts (cuncdt basia, adjpsrments/asser sales and ultimately projected).

Upilates 1o prejecied balanee sheet.

Discussion with 1. Franeo regarding analysis of June 30, 2002 balanes sha,

Compilation o priyeced balanes sheet based on information provided at Unsucurud

Credstors' mectiig,

Conmipleted consolidation of halance sheets for 1.5, Leaging, Vertures and
Euwopcan business plang.

Review ol new business whit balance sheets dor roll-out and accuracy.
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Leas, Jaclyn 03/13/02 53 16 Develop inodet of a consalidated eash flow statement for Curopean subsidiary to
revongile new aml old runolY plane a2 presented mareh 7, 2002,

Luas, Jaclyn [NERENIb 55 29 Developed modul ol a congolidated eash flow statement for U5 leasing o reconcile
new and uld runadt plans as presenied march 7, 2002/

Leag, laclym 03%/13/02 55 1.2 Develoged inodel ¢f 2 pongolidated cosh flovw statement for Ventures subsitiary W
recunile new and old mnof¥ plans o5 presented march 7, 2002,

|.¢a5, Jachm 03/13/02 55 2.3 Developed model of a oonsolidated cash flow statement e lic US Loaging,
Eurapeai and Ventures subsidiarias inte Comdisco Ine 1o reconvile ow and old
vusad¥ plans aa presented march 7, 2002,

Leas, Jaghm 03/14/02 55 1.3 Freparation of analysis and preparation nf Tist to the company stating detail
inforination needed for cnnsnlidated cash flow statements for new run-olf plan,

Frange, V.ais 03/21/02 55 1.4 Update of workplan based om eall with the campany and cunversation with
Ciribank.

Franco, Luis 03/26/02 A5 16 Review nf capital call for Redwood Vealures, Rescateh and fotlow-up with
Skadden, Amps.

Mitler, Liavid 03/27/02 55 0.2 Wurkiog with L, Frango regarding Ventures capital call motion.

Fronce, 1.uis 03/27/02 55 2.5 Follow-up on Redwood Yentures Capital vall.

Miller, Mavid 03/28/02 55 0.2 working with [.. Franco ragarding Redwaownd Ventures analvyais,

Francu, Luis DARNI0Z 55 2.7 Additivnal fullow-up on Redwosd Ventres Capiral gall ineluding additional calls
with Skadden, Arps Anhet Andersen and Citibank.

Fraica, Lviz 03/29/02 55 05 Drrall of c-marl to Cregditarg Committes on Redwand Ventures Capital Call.

Frango, Lais 0a/0202 55 1.5 hecka of finangiak statement footing and integrity.

1.eas, faclyn D4/02/02 55 3.1 Raview and analyze calculations for cunsulidated income satcinenl and batance
sheet.

Leas, Jaclyn Mz 55 1.5 Update vutstanding issucs concening congolidated financials.

L, Jacdyn (ERTYVES 55 Ll Preparation of spreadshect # trace Comdisn systems envieonment.

Lasas, Jaelyn (4/D5/02 55 1.1 Proparation ¢ waiplaie ©w char gystems environment.

Leus, Jaclyn [FERGET 55 b3 Completed spreadshoct and Wme ling to chart systems environment shut down.

Framtu, Luis (/304Y2 55 06 Reviewad reconuilistion of conipany POR projeered cash versus prior projections of
expected cash.

Franvu, Luis 8152 35 04 Review of revised analysis prepared by Latham & Workins on POR cash estimate
compared to privr estimatcs.

55 Total T
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COMDISC, INC,
ERNAT & ¥YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, H02

PROFESSIONAL DATE D HOLIRS DESCRIFTION

Falzone, Micholas O 1 300 58 .5 Conlfrence with 5. Gleichenhans, C.Kalstad, J. Grivetti and D. Miller ceparding
stratepic analysia of Jeaging and vanture leasing businesses

Gleichanhaus, Stuart 08/15/01 5§ 1.5 Conferenge with N Palzone, O Kolstad, . Grivett and D, Muller reganding siratogic
analysis of leasing and venture leaking businesses

Miller, David 08/15/01 L] 1.5 Conferenge with 8. Gleichenhaus, N. Falzane. ). Grivew and O, Kolgtad regarding
gtraregic pnalysis of leasing and venture leasing businesiry

Griverts, Jahn 08/15/01 58 1.5 Conference with 8. Gleichenhaus, N. Falzane. ! Grovett and O Kolstad eeparding
sirategic analysis of leasing and venture leasing businesscy

Lunn, Janwes 08/20/01 L] 0.7 Keview materiols on size and structure of Comdisco business unils

Knlstad, Charles 0905401 3H (] Driscussion with C. Flowd reparding industey view of quality of Comdisen beasing
files

Grivetti, luhn V12411 SR 2.6 Reviewed Tewse dats tapes and devekoped testing methndolngy

Ryan, Frapcea e/ 1201 58 is Revicwed leaae data topea and developed testing methedolsgy

Van Vuren, Brik a/12/01 5B 24 Analyzed lense tapes

Ryan, Frunces 13401 An 11 Performed guality cuntrol revicw of work on leaze dars files onakysis for various
lease porifulios und assisted i coppletion of the detail

Van Yuren, Erik LA R R 58 28 Designed mutinl Iy feetitye loase rapes

Clogquette, Andrew 0%/13/01 3] 2.1 Verfical sampling for lease examination

Choaquatte, Andrew 09713401 58 1.9 "Template creation for sampling of leases by vertival

Choyuette, Andrew /13401 A% 0.5 Lease dats analysis demon stration

Van Yuren, Etik [P 38 30 Anulysis wf subsidiary cotmpanics

Van Yurch, Erik a9/1441 3] 25 Tustod varicus 16226 1apea in dats ranm

Chaquele, Andrew ac/1441 55 4.1 Elvelsomics Jeade sampking and analysis

Choquette, Andrew Q14401 58 1.2 Preparation of lgase sampling analysis far Lab amd Science, Telvoonh

Krop, Androw %1441 55 29 Anatysis of “Tefecom leass partfolin halances and files

Kaop, Andrew (1 14401 E 2.6 Analyiis of lab and seience lease portfolic halances and files

Desc
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FROFESSIONAL

Van Vurer, Erik

Krop, Andrew

Krop, Andrew

Van Vuren, Lk

Van Vuren, Crik

Kiop, Andrew

Ko, Andrew

Ciriverti, John

Ryan, Francex

Van Yuren, Erk

Ryan, Franeos

Gleichenhaus, Stuart

Van Vuren, Erik

Chuguelle, Andicw

Clisqueine, Andrew

Van vyren, Frik

Van Vuren, Frik

Chaquette, Andrew

Chaoquette, Andrew

Choquette, Andrew

DATE

08/17/01

a1 7ol

LS FR

V1801

D TANl

/1801

09/1 801

O/ 1301

o101

09/L 901

09/20/01

08/21/01

OHZ401

15/24/01

0%/24/01

09/27/01

09/ 25/01

10/1 5/

10/16/01

10/16/01

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1

16/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 144 of 267

COMIHSCD, INC,
ERMST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANLCE LLU
DETAIL OF $FRVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CONE
FOR THE FPERION JULY 37, 1101 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2IMI2

PCLY HON RS BRESCRIFTTON

5 19 Tested Healtheare ponfalio

58 2.8 verified acouracy and existenve of Teleccom teases in Comdisco system

58 2.2 verified acenracy and existence ol lab and 3¢icnee leases in Comdisco system

54 13 Teswed Venmore lease portfolioe

58 1.7 Reviewed tests performed on [T lease portiolio

53 2.4 Verified accuracy and ¢aistenes of lab and seience leases in Comadisco gyslen

b} A0 Verified avouravy and caigtenes of Ventures leases in Conudiseo system

AR 24 Perfomuad quality gontrel review nf wark on Jease data [iles analysis for various
Tease pirrlfislios and assisted in completian of the detail

i8 7.1 Peatornsed qualily eontrol review ot work un Jease data files analysis for various
YKese portfoling and assisted in completion of the detail

58 2.4 Amalysis of companies and Uvrs

i3] 1.2 Perfarmed yualily contrul toview of work an lease data fles analysis [or various
Tease portivlios and assisied in completinn nfthe detail

LE] 0.8 Review vl vareit statys of lease detail portfalio revicw

k1. 25 Tested ' beases a1 Comdisco data ruem

53 1.6 {reation of IT leasing sample

54 2.3 Audit of sample IT lease cotlracle

Rt 2.4 Evuluation vl loase 1apee fior 11 portfolio « Mexico & Pavilic Rin

4% 2.5 Evaluatiun ot leage tapea for 1T portfolio - Mexico 4 Pacifie Rim

ig 3l Proparation of donestic lease portfolia detail Lle roview.

H] 2.3 Treparation of domestic lease portfulio detail Gls review,

4K 1.2 Preparation of inlernatianal lense partfolio detul like review,

Desc
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COMIMSCT, INC.
ERNAET & YOUNG CORPORATY. FINANCE LLD
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERE D BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD JULY 27, 2001 VHHOUGH AIICURT 1, 2002

Choguette, Andrew

Choquette, Andrew

Chogucite, Andrew

Chogucite, Andrew

Cirivetti, Jnbn

Miiler, Thavid

Grivetil, John

Choquette, Andrew

Miller, Davad

Franco, Luis

Franen, [Luis

Camphell, Keith

Camipbell, Kelth

Franca, Luig

Franea, [uis

1.eas, Tachyn

Miller, David

Miller, Dravsd

DATE rCD 1IOLRS DESCRIFTION

107 16/01 k) 1.2 Discussions wiill Debilors leasing attendants regarding inlcrnational and domestic
missing vontracts

10418401 54 L4 Preparation of iinemational lease porifalia detail ([{le roview,

10/17:01 54 27 Review and finalizc isternational lease partfoliv detail lle jeview,

18/17/01 53 22 Meeting with Leaging attendant to find missing donrestic and international leases for
detail file revicw.

10/25/01 5 23 Revivwed wnd edited executive summary of leasc Jike detail testing peocedures
perlontied in September/Cictnber

10730461 B ol Roview and revice lease file analysts.

194041 8 13 Fitialized executive summary of lease Gl detail testing procedures performent in
September/Octnber

104011 58 32 Leaging test summary preparation for subnission e unsecured Creditory’
oimimitees.

12/03/01 5§ e Heview of infurmation teyarding potentiol special servicery.

12/14/01 58 0.9 Calls wilh cogagement team regarding SGEA analysis, including infarmation to he
Teyuested.

12/14/01 S8 0.4 Dhall of information request for SGE&A inlmmation from the Company.

12128401 3} 1.8 Anatyze detniled SGAA expenses lor run-off seenarios for each vertial,

1228001 3! 2.2 Analyze detailed SGS&A cxpofises.

D3/12/02 54 0.5 Driscussion wilth M, Podowitz regarding review of Cumndizeo CES emergence plan.

01402 A% Q.5 Review of C15 seope review prepared by M. Podowinz,

D314z 3% 15 Analyzed and developed recunciliation tor 5G&A propasal presented to unsecured
creditars March 7, 2002,

0471 502 58 a0l Review of initial memo tegarding asseegment of CIR shared services plan,

05/10/02 58 (%] Cpmmunications with varweus EYCE/FRY and ather parties regarding pateitial RO
condidates.

5A Totel 1281

Desc
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CONMLISL, INC.

ERNET & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE L1LC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOIR THE PERIOD MULY 27, 2001 THROUGH ATICUST 12, 2002

FROFESSIONAL__ DATE 1] HUL RS DESCRIPTIUN

Franco, Luis DAL 60 26 Analysis vl mocently reecivied breakdown of direct BGEA.

Grivett, John 1A 60 3] Revicw of icstitly received breakdown af projected direct SG&A and headeount
and provide somments o L Franee.

Franco, Luis V1A 0 2.2 Review ol recently wocived breakdown of projecred direct BG&A and headvount.

Franco, Lurs DA 1AR 60 1.2 Completed summary ol discwsson with Anfeampany regarding direct S8 A detail,
alunyg with gdditivnal Soliow-op on bioth direct and indirect RG&A items.

Frando, Luis DirLeT &0 1.1 Dhiscuszion and preparation of work plan far review of CDO venlunzs portiolio and
buginess.

Fraico, |Luis ol/18:02 &0 1.1 Follow-up call with Arthur Andersen regarding SG&A quistiond, Wiite-up
sutnimary of 5G4 questions. Revised & updated reguest lsts o rollect angwers to
S0kA questions.

Francn, [ .nis 03/26/02 &0 1.3 Review of recently received presentition w the Crediten ' Comnittes on March
14th.

50 Lotal n.a

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC.
ERSAT & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PRAUMECT CONE
FOR TIE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGLST 12, 2002

PROFESS1IONAL LATE FCD HOURS DESCRIFTION
Gleichenhaus, Stuart 01/09/02 4l .0 Mon-woreking travel time.
Gleighenhaus, Staan a1 162 &l (K1) MNon-working oavet time.
Gileichenhaus, Saarl 03/07/02 &t 345 Mon.working travel time.
{ileichanhaus, Stuart 03/07/02 &t 50 MNon-working travet tnie.
Gileichanhaus, Stuar D3/19/02 Oy 35 Non-working travel e
Gleichenhaus. Stuail 312 (1] 15 Non-working tavel img.
Gleichenhaus. Sluarl 0472402 & 3.0 Not-working traved time.
Kalfin, Danald 03/24/02 1] 4.0 Travel fime to MYC to attend Credioes’ Committe sonfsrenge with Dehtar.
Hopgs, Kimberly 03/24/02 a i) Travel time to MY C to attend IDCC and [bror megting.
Kalten, Donald 03/2%/07 [ 4.0 Trave] e fiotn MY to Chicapa.
Bupgs, Kimbuly 03/A5/02 3] 1.0 Trawel ime Trom MY to Chicage.
Miller, Pavid 04/03/02 L] 24 won Waorking Travel Time

69 Todal 465

Desc
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COMIMSCE, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENTIERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERMNY JULY 27, Ml THROUGH AUGUST I, 2002

PHOFFSSTONAL. ~ DATE FCD HUOUHRS DESCRIPTION

Van Yuren, Enk /2 71 20 Created conselidatiun incomc statement radel

Van ¥ uren, Erik OH/Z0AN 71 2.0 Built consulidating balases shect madel by vertical: secup 1T and Tlectronics {NA,
Eurupe and Pac Rin)

Van Vuren, Erik BR/29A1 7l 1.7 Buill consulidating balaiaos shoet model by vertical: s up Ventares and Telecomn
(™A, Europe and Pac Rim}

Van Vuren, Erik [RIE | Ti 18 Built cousolidating balanes sheet model by vertical: ser up Healthcare and Lab &
Scientific (NA, Burope and Fac Rim)

Van Vurcn, Enk BRAANT Tl 25 Buil consolidating balanes sheet nwadel by vertical: linked venticals together and
added consatidated (WA, Furape and Pac Rim)

Van vuren, krik 09/05/01 Tt 24 Ruilt conaolidasing internatinnal halance sheet modet by country: o up A,
Austtia, Uanada ond Ceska

Van Yuren, Erk D9/080] 71 2.9 Ruilt consolidaring international balance sheet madel by country; g2t up France.,
{rermany, [reland and Maly

Van Yuren, Crik 09/07/01 | 19 Duilt consolidating internativnal batance sheet odel by eountry: set up Japan,
Mexicor, Taiwan and UK

Van Yuren, Erik oA T 2.5 Built consulidating imcnational batanes sheet model hy country: linked countries
topcther and added congolidaied

Yan Yuren, Erik 0971081 71 24 Reviewed congolidating income statement by vertical for muath civors (3 nenth)

Van Vuren, Frik 0971 /01 71 2.4 Reviewed consntidating income statemnent by vortical R imath ereors (% month)

Van Vuren, Erik /20001 H 24 Recanciled conselidating balanve sheet items o leage tape detail (ToT.Rx, leased
assets)

Van Vuren, Erik 0a/20i0 Ti 1.2 Prepared revised balancs sheet inodel for Lazard and Sne Dollinger {removed links
to ulher worksheels and e formartted)

Civetti, John [F TS 71 50 Pregaration of balance sheet reconcilintinn model and discussions with Amicr Baiy,
157 SRt

Yan Vuren, Erk D9/21/01 71 2.0 {-onsolidating halance sheet - reconciled o 10-Q

Van Vuren, [rik 09/21/01 71 24 {omsnlidating halance sheet - recencilod o 10-4)

Van Vuren, Grik 09/21/01 T 23 Consolidating balance sheet - reconciled (o imcrational data

Grivetti, lohn 0244 71 1.4 Reviewed amt edived conselidating balance sheet maodel

Gerivetti, fohn 09/25/01 ‘N 1.2 Reviewed and edited consolidating balance sheet model

Grivetti, John D9/26/0]1 71 1.3 Reviewed ond edited consolidating balanve shect el
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COMDIECO, INC,
FRNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DEVAN, OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOITULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, MH2

PROFESSIONAL DATE N HOURS _ DESCRIFPTION
Grivetti, John a9/2741 71l 14 Feviewed and edited comsolidating balance shet inodel
Gleichenhaua, Stoar a%/23/01 71 1.1 Revicwed conanlidating balance shest model
Millex, David 1%/2940 | 71 0.8 Feview of draft analysis with respect ta bafmve shocts by fanction and geography

71 Towal 510

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do 03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 6/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 150 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT COLE
FOR THE PERIOGIN JULY 17, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, Z00F

PROFESSIONAL DATE ) MDD HOURS DESCHIFTION

Sherman, Richard DaD4D2 72 0.4 Meeting with M. Williams ta discuss fullow-up meeting with ). Magen and Tr.
Miller as well a3 open isswes reparding Comdisee's bankrupiey plan.

72 Total on

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC.
FHNST & YOUNGC CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
BETAN. OF SERVICER RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOH THE PERIOD VLY 27, 2001 TIIROUGHE AUGUST 12, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE a8} HOTRS
Vourtman, Antia 120001 T3 10
Thoipaon, Sean 12/06/01 73 19
Milka, Dyavid D1/20/02 73 L)
Miller, Lyavid 01/30702 73 (£
Criivedti, John 01/30/02 73 L]
Sherman, Richard 122 3L rd T 04
Williams, Michael 021202 bR ]
Shermran, Richard 2/ 1302 73 L.l
Miller, Pxavid 0225702 73 o1
Williams, Michasl 031302 e 1.0
Williams, Michael D3/14/02 15 14
Sherman, Raclard 13/ 14702 73 )
Sherman, Richard 03/14/02 T 0.5
Sherman, Richard D3/15/02 s 1.5
Sherman, Richard 03/ 1807 7 d &
Sherman, Richard 31802 73 04
sherinan. Richard (/18702 73 1.8
Milter, David i3/ 1972 73 0.2
Shermun, Richard B3/1902 i 03

UDESCHRIFTION

Asscssment of LS. tax attributes (foreign tax credit and overall lowigh 103s).

Agacgsmaent 0f LS tax attribues {foreign tax credit amnd overall foreign Toas) in
proparation for meeting at Comdiscn with VP of tax amd Jatcrmational Tax Lyregtor.

Eeview draft of iax memorandum.

T'elephone call with J. Grivetti regarding interoalional @x anslysis.

‘lelephone call with D. Miller reganling intcrnational a4 analysis.

Drraft e-mail to M. Felish reganding follow-up informatinn regarding tax attribules
and recent transactivns.

Discussion with B, Sherian reparding approach to tax update.

Pull inlormation regarding recent transactions and prepare e-muil o M, Felish
repanding tax information update.

Send e-mal to 5. Dallinger reparding tax analysis,

Conversation with . Miller and ™. Falzane regarding potential opporiunity tor 5-
year carry hack of Comdisee WOLs - send lepislarive history and statute 1o D1 Maller
- update uther Lux Wain inambers - Communigations wivh Citigroup through B
Miller

Communications will [t Milice ieparding the rax aspects of the scomomic stimulus

package and jts eilikct un Cundigen - Preparation for comference call to Comdisco
and coordinale with B, Blernian - wpdare M. Falzone.

Conversatiom with M, Felish regarding the impact an Comidisce's Lax sinbules alc
Lhe w1 4w changes.

Reviewed nutes regunling M. Feliah's impresaions of the impact an Comdiscu's tax
aftributes.

Review discussion notes with M Williams.

Review notes and diatl suinary of discossion poins.

Review poitis with M. Williams.

Reviae and e-mail analysis ta . Miller.

Telephoae call w M, Williams regarding follow up un impact ol cconwmi stittulus

packape.

Review D. Miller's cominents reparding delivery of the Comdisce's tax attribute
memL.

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1Q/16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 152 of 267

COMDISCD, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR T1E FERIGD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH ATICUST 12, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE rCD HOURS _DESCRITMTION

Williamis, Michael 03/20/02 7i 1.0 Orbtain and read partions ol Conwdisco 10-k filed for its %3041 year for comments
related to delerred taxes and pro and post petiton s,

Williams, Michael 03/20002 73 2.0 Inguiry lrum D. Miller cpaeding timing of receipt of refund for 5 yeur carry back
and compunents of delirred 1axes, cushion and pre-petition and post petitivn
amounts - discuss with Rich Sherenan - analysis and read file notes related to
amount and nature of claim.

Milber, Lavid 03/20/02 73 1.4 I'rrofi ond send e-mail to Citibank and Lasacd weparding 1% analysis and refinds.

Milter, Dovid 03/20/02 73 s Review memn friom M. Williams and sending numerons e-mails with follow up
questions.

Sherman, Richard 03/20/02 7a 1.1 Triscussions with M. Williame repandity Comdiacos tax anribute memo.

Sherman, Richard 0320/02 73 2.} Review notes and drall ¢-nsil to 13. Miller regarding the timing vl'the AMT NOL
carry back clain. and tbe LY. of $105 mitlion.

Miller, Dravid 03/22/02 73 (134 Follow yp wirth W. Williams and R. Sherman regarding s refated diligenee issues

Sherman, Richard 03/22/02 73 6 Triseussions with M. Williams relating w mecting with M. Pelish.

Williams, Michael QDO PES 3.0 Mesting with K. Sherman regading tax manars reloied to the Comdisce plun.
Preparation vl analysis atd compariaon of nhservations.

Williamss, Michaet 04/0%/02 73 1.0 Proparation for and pamiciparion in meeting with R. Shemian, Review of etz and
abservaliong fromy meating with M. Felish and Arthur Andeisen,

sherman, Richard 04/05/02 73 D4 Conversations with R. Farenbach regarding Connliseo mecting notes. hMessage to
Ly Miller reparding same.

Williams, Michaet 04/09/02 73 1.0 Tiiscussion with B. Sherman regarding discossion with H. Tucker at Arthur
Andersen and his meeting with Skadden Arps, 1viscuagion regarding coordinating a
conference call with 11 Tucker relaled 0 the updated numbera and renrganization
issnes and changes in assumptivns and tax model for the tox aspects of the
TenrEanization program.

Milter, Dravid 01712102 T 0.2 Review of e-mail trom R. Sheman fepading results of meeting with Debtor.

Williams, Michael /16402 kX! 0.5 Communications with [} Miller atid intreduetions with R. Hanson of Latham &
Watkins, F. Kronsnoble and eonimunications relative to discussion with 5.
Dallinger.

Williams, Michacl /16407 73 29 Conference call with 13, Miller, 1. Prance, R. Sherman and Nick Falcony W disouss
tax madters and i55uc ariging our of eomnumications with M. Felish ol Coindisco
and H. Tucker of Asthur Andersen.

Miller, David 4164002 73 a2 Fullow-up discuszion will 5. Dollinger ragarding Comdisew tax mccting

Williants, Michael ad4/17402 73 0 Conferenes call with | Kronsnnble and J. Love of Lathaio & Watkins and with R.
Sherman Lo discugs tax congiderations related to the plan of reorganization propaal,
sharing of vur knowludge: of ariluates and rheir reduction ansd himitations undee the
nlan.

Wiltiamns, Michael 04/19402 1 K1} Communicativns with J. Kronsnoble - Lrafied ¢-mails and reviewed

communication from K. Shoeran - locats and forward former tax memos regarding
Comdiseo and firward to 1. Kiongnoble at Latham & Watkins.

Desc
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COMDIZCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE |LC
DETAIL 0OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
¥OR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE FCI2 HOURS | DESCRIPTION

Willizms, Michack (/14402 73 Q.5 Diacusaion with K. Sherman regarding coordination rle with Latham & Wotkins
and fotlow up call to 1. Kronsmoble regarding neal sieps on the tax discussions with
Aither Andersen and review of tax maodel.

Miller. Lravid 041002 73 a1 Send e-mail to tax team regarding coordination of thx wark with 1atham &
Watkins.

Miller. Lavid Q418402 73 0.4 Telephane call with M. Williarus reparding POR atains and coordination with
Laotham & Watkins regarding lax (52ucs,

Miller, David 0422402 73 .z Raview of e-mails from tax cxpets reparding coordination with Latham & Watking
nn POR taxes.

Miller, David N4/22402 73 a1 Review of e-mails from tax experts repardiiy potcntisl ewnership chanye issues.

Sherman, Richard /22402 13 1.5 Review informmation provided by H. Tucker and M. Felish regarding sttip kase
claimy und thy eeeit court rwling in Andantech.

Sherman, Richard /2N PA) 0.9 Conversalions with M. Williams regarding section 332 and a prior owhership
chalye.

Shemian, Richard LERRRN] 73 06 Lraft e-mail to Latham & Watking regarding seelion 147 and a prior awnership
change.

Shemian, Richatd 04/2/02 73 0.4 “I'elephone call to I. Kronsnoble and 1. Lave foom Latham & Watkins.

williams, Michael 0d/24/02 T3 1.0 Preparativn {or and paiticipation in conference call with J. Krunsnoble reparding
SIP and other related 1a% maiters.

Williams, Michael Q472502 73 0.5 Prepaation for and participation in conference call with D. Miller and K. Shennan
1o distuag tax disclnsure and tax aptional of the tax struclutc alicenativea currently
being in contrel of the Debtor.

Williarns, Michacl 04/25/02 73 03 Preporation for and participation in ventérenee ¢all with I. Kronsnoble and J. Love
reparding significant tax topivs for vontorsnes call with Comgisen, Skadden, Arps
and Arthur Andersen.

Williarmz, Michae) 04/25/02 73 0.4 Follow-up conference call with 1. Kriosnobbe and R. Sherman to discuss next
actinn staps as a result ol group cunference call and o diseuss tax aspects of Prism
excess boss aceouml

Williams, Michael 042502 7% 0.5 Mesting wilh K. Shertnan to disquss and compare camments repanling feview of
the Arthur Andcrsen Wy reargonization madel.

Sherman, Richard O4/26/02 71 1.6 Ruvicw stiucturing Altematives regarding tx tisclosure and vonferscs call with
Skadden Arps and Arhur Andersen.

Sherman, Richard U3/0202 73 [(F] Fevicw faxed materiols regarding lease sirip infonnation,

Sherman, Rivliard (1503402 71 1.4 Revicw 14 rearganization plan in connection with Ui use of liquidaving frusts
winder "Ermng” model as cnmpared to an (B5) approach that retaing rax ofiributes.

Williams, Michacl 06/11:02 73 .0 Read revised evaluation of runelltax inpact prepared by KPMG per Latham &
Whatkins.

Williarms, Michacl 6/ 1 2K12 73 2.0 Compmunigntions with I Kransnoble regarding, the tax analysis regarding the run-oft
and the reorgonization plan.

ATl 540
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COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE L0
DETATL OF 3ERVICES BENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THIROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE PCD HOURS DESCRIFTION

Glgichanhaus, Stuart 07/30/01 74 [ Triscussion with J. Hallock and J. Qrivetti re: ¢age sieateyy and qir mole

Griventi, John 07/30/01 T4 05 Thiscussion with 1. Hallock and 5. Gleichenhaus 1 cage stratepy ond owr role

Gleichenhaus, Stuarl DTALAN 14 .8 Driscussion with 1. Agonson {Lazard), and ). Grivetti re: case srateyy and
background intormatiun un Debior

Grivetti, Iohn 07/31/01 74 [{k:) Triscussion with DL Asomson (Lazard), and 5, Gleichenhaus re: case sirategy and
backyround informiticen un Deblar

¢pleichenhaus. Stuar DE/02/01 73 0.7 Conference calls with D. Millee and 3, CGriverti regarding initiol Committes call
results and yo furwanl work plan

Miller, David N2/ 14 0.7 Cunfirence calls with 8. Gleichenhaus and ). Grivetti reparding initial Commitive
all results and g Lorward work plan

Cativeti, Jahn DEALOL 74 0.7 Confgrenge colls with 8. Gleichenhaus and DrMiller regaiding initial Conmitres
call results ond go forward work plan

Cileichenhaus, Stuart 03/06:01 74 0.4 Participated in meeting {via phane) with J. 1lalluck of Ciedit Lyonnais and I
Cirivetti re: case strategy and aur rule

Grivefi, John 03/06/01 74 1.4 Participated in meeting {vis phone) with 1, Hallogk of Credin Lyonnais and 5.
Gleichenhaus re: cuse straleyy aod out’ rale

Miller, David DR/ 74 Nl Telephone call tw D, Aronson repardiog work plan issnas

Miller, David DA 74 0.z Calla with 1. Atonson nf l.azard regarding due diligence issucs

Falzone, Wichalas 0810401 74 0.7 Conference call with John Griveit and meview basc cass informatien.

¢Heichenhaus, Stuarl 08/10401 74 3 Telephone call with O.Miller reparding work plan and firm retention issues

Miller, David (LRI T4 0.2 Telephune call with 5. Gleichachans reparding wark plan and firm retention issuey

Miller, David D 10AH T4 0.1 Roview of waork plan submitted hy Iy, Aronson

Giztveli. John & 10/01 T4 0.4 1discussion with M. Falzone re: case issues and background

Grivefi, John 08/ 10001 74 0.z Reviewed initial cut hy D. Arunson of deliverables 1o provide to Committes

Kolatad, Charles 05/15/01 74 1.5 Conf: & with §. Gleichenk ™. Falzoae, ), Grivetti and 2. Miller reagarding
stratepic analysis of leasing and venture leasing businesscs

Cieichenhaus, Smart 02/22/0t 74 0.5 Telephnne call with D Miller regarding results of Cofimitee mesting with Debtors

Miller, David 02210 74 1.3 Telephnne call with §. (Heichenhaus regarding results of Commities meefing with

Tebtors

Desc
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CONDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOIUTHE FERIOI NILY 27, 2001 TTIROUGH AUGUST 12, 2102

PFROFESSIONAL DATE rCh HOURS DESCRIPTION

Grivetti, John 50/ 29704 74 0.2 Felgphone call with D. Miller regarding dui diligenee stans

Falzone, Nicholas N&/3LAN i a7 Parmicipare i team call re. case strategy (duv diligenes, coun hearing results, and setl
up of meating with Committes prulisssiuuals)

Gleichenhaus, Start B/ 74 a7 Partivipate inteam call re case strateyy (due diligemes, sourt hearing resules, and set
up of inceting with Committes professionals)

Kulstad, Clatlca D10 4 1.5 Faricipate in team call re: case straleyy (duy diligenee, conrt heoring results, and set
up of meeting with Committes protussionala)

Miller. Lravid 08/31/0) 4 {Lb Pamicipate in team call re. vase strategy (dug diligence, eourt heaning results, und set
up nf meeting with Commette: protessionals)

Civivelti, John 08/31/01 4 a.7 Panicipate in weekly tearn gall g, gase strotegy (due diligence, court heanng 1esulls,
und skl up ol mecling with Cammirtes professionals)

Faolzone, Nichalas 09/07/01 4 0.7 Partivipate vn wam ¢all repasding ‘wrvrk plan far due diligenee.

rleichenhaus, Stuml [SGTFE| T4 Q.7 Fanticipate on teom call reparding work plun for dut diligenee.

Kalstad, Chinles 09/07/01 T4 7 Participate on team call reparding woik platy for due dilipence.

Milles, 12avid 03/07/01 74 0.3 Participate on Leam call repandi; wark plan for due diligence.

Griveti, Jnhn Q40701 13 Q.7 Participale on wain ¢all reparding work plan for due dilipeoce.

Miller, David 14701 74 0.5 ‘Fetephone calt wich 1. Grivetti regarding due diligeoce waork

Cerivelti, Julin 9/10/0) 74 1.5 Telephone call with D Miller regarding due difipence work

Miller, Lavid 09/14/01 74 n.& Telephone call with ). Grivetti reparding due diligence results

Grivetti, Jahn 08/14/01 74 0.6 Telephone call with . Miller regarding due dilipence resulis

Gilgichenhaus, Stuart 09/17/01 74 2z Telephone call 10 1). Miller regarding Dehitors' appatent reurganizalion stratepies
and issuca relaied therete

Miller, David P17 74 13 Telephang gall tn 5. Gleichenhaus regarding Dubtwrs’ appargnt seorganization
stratepics and issues retated theretn

Gleichenhaus, Sluart w/2Rm1 74 1Y) Sirategy wpdase call with CYCF prolussionals

Miller, Naovid 0828/01 7a 0.6 Stratepy update call with EYCF professinnals

Giriventi, John 09/24:01 a 0.4 Siretepy updald call with BYCF professinnals

Desc
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COMDESC, [N
ERMST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERYICES RENOERED BY FROMECT CODE
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FHROFESSINONAT, DATE rCD HOURS e DESCRIPTION

Talzone, Nivhuls 10/0540) 74 1.1 Conlerenve call with DoMillcr and M. Williams regarding Creditors mesting, case
shatus und tax swmmary o,

Miller, Dravid 1403/ 74 0.8 Parlicipate ai weekly eall with M. Fatzone and M. Williams reparding Cominitice
it tesubts and next steps.

Talzone, Michulas 104124 74 [{X] Conlirenge call with JGriventi ang M.Williams regarding status update oo tascs,

Williams, Michacl 10712 74 [} Cunlerenee call with ™, Fatzong and J. Grivetti regarding statuy update on laxcs,

Crelyednd, John 10/12701 74 (1] Canforence eall with M. Falzone and M. Williams reygarding stalug updae: o @aues.

Falrone, Nicholas 10/31/01 74 0.9 FYiscussion with 1. Grivetti and M. Williams regaeding 1% memo and Creditors
{ammittes meeting.

Griveni, Inbhn 10731701 T4 0y Dliscussinn with M. Williams and N, Falzone ieparding x memo and Creditnrs
Committes meeting.

Miller, David 1 LAD& 74 0.5 Discussion with J.Urivelli ier ¢Ase 2atys and strategy and state of information
rexquests

Grvetti, Jolin 1 EAMGD 74 0.5 Digvussion willl 12.Miller re: case status and stratagy and stale ol'inlommalion
iquests

Williams, Michael 1 /0901 74 0.4 Participate an call with Dr.Willer and J, Grivedt regarding ransoetions and work
plan.

Miller, David 11/09/01 4 0.3 Farticipate un call with M. Williama and J. Grivetri regarding transzctions and work
plan.

Grivetti, Juln 1 3801 74 0.6 Partivipalc un call with M, Williams and [1.Miller regarding munsactions anl wok
plan.

DHeichaliliaus, Swart 1172901 74 0.8 LYiacusggions with J.Cirivatti and D.Miller re: case status, 11730 mectioyg and cash
flows

Miller, avid 11729/ 74 (R Conference with 5. Gleichenhaus and J. Grivell ieganding isaues from discussion at
meeting and diligence progress.

Grivetti, John 11/29/01 74 1.2 Discussions with 5. Gleichenhaus and L, Mikler re: gase stohus, 11/30 meeting and
cash flows

Miller, David 1143040 74 0.6 Discussion with J.Grivetti 1¢; resuits of meeting and preliminary issues with Teasing
business plans

Crivetti, Julin 11530/ 74 0.9 Discussion with Ly Mitler re: results of meeting and preliminary issues with hasity
businesy plana

Williaras, Michacl 12/067/01 74 05 Dige w/ Lt Miller rg international tax planning strateyies and analysis - forward
pettinen iitformation to 5. Thampsan and discuss schedule relawed 10 sales of
vertical leaging units

Miller, David 12/ 74 0.5 Candirence with M. Willigms reparding results af tax meeting with Comndiscs atd
polonbial tax SRICEIER,

Miller, David 12407101 74 0.5 Weekly call with EYCE and EY wam regarding update an Commitiee meeting and

stutus of leasing bids,

Desc
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COMDIECO, INC,

[

DETAIL OF SERYICES RENDERED BY FROJECT C0DR
FOR TIIE FERIOD JULY 27, 2000 THROUGH AUGLRT 12, 1002

PROFESSIOMNAL DATE oo HOLRS DESCRIPTION

Franco, Luis 12/07/01 74 1.4 | 'pdote with engagement team on propress ol tax, liquidation and ather anatysis.

Camphell, Keith 12/10/01 74 (1% Tisenss the status of the engagement with Leam members and e plan gaing
firward.

Franco, [.uis 121201 74 LY Progress and siotus update om analysis and recenl events with crpacment eam.

Miller, David 1214401 74 4 Analysis of putential isswes pogarding Debtors' degrmination 1 move forward on
stand alone basis.

Grivetii, Juhn 41802 74 1.1 Lipdate calbs with ESeY Loamn 12 diséuss progress on the follnwing iems. RGEA
folluw-up yuestions aml dizssemtalion o the eompany. Open-items and up coming
Committee meeting.

Franco, Luis AR 74 1.1 Lipdale calts with E&Y i (o discnsa progress o the follnwing ivems. BGEA
follew-up yuestions aml dizséntnation to the gompany. Open-items and up coming
Committes mecting.

Francn, Luiy o310z 74 0.3 Lpdale with E&Y-wan [caders on Linseenred Creditors Committes meeting.

Miller, David 01/11/02 74 3 Telephone call with ). Grivetti and 5. Gleichenbaus regarding Comimimgs mesting
and inypoaai nn leasing auction.

Grivetti, Jahn 0141102 74 5 Telephnne call with D. Miller wnd 5. Glewehcnhaus repanding Committes meeting
and impact on leaging auction.

Crivedti, Juhn (/23002 74 1.0 Telephone cull with 8. Duollinger wegarding the progress and approach to analyzing
and requuesting, inforenation fram CIE.

Franco, Luis /23702 74 1.2 Teleplione ¢a)) with S. Dollinger ragarding the progress and approiach o analyzing
and requicsting infanmatian from GO,
Fotwarded infarmntian request to Lazard and updated group.

Miller, David D1/2402 74 4 Conference with J. Grivedi and L. Franco ragasding sats of infamation requests
and new work plan items.

Griveni, Juhn D1/2402 14 . Conference with D.Miller and L. Frageo reparding stats of information requests
und new work plan itvins.

Franco, Luis B1/2407 74 0.4 Discussion with cngapement wam regarding approach to acquiring information
trum the Company and viyzoing Jack of response.

williams, Michsel VXA A2 74 10 Prepanation for and panicipation in conference calt with D. Miller regading status
ol bankruptey and tax congiderations related theretn - disc international planning
memo wirh 5. Thempson and M. Falzone,

Miller, David D/01/02 74 0.8 Canference call with M. Williams and &, Faleune repatdang 1) leasing aale,
international tax meme amd updating aualyss ol taa selated atribins.

Miller, David 02/01/02 74 0.1 Telephane calt with 5. Gleichenhaus regarding 11 lcasing sale and Committes
meering next waek.

Franco, [nis 02/04/02 74 0.5 Update om meeting with 8. Dallinger (Citibank).

Franco, Luig 02714402 74 1.0 Discussion with EY enpagement ream nn next steps based on newly receivid
inforneation. Liiscusgion wirh 8. Dallinger ahmut informition recived and nest
s,

Miller, Pravid 0220/02 74 0.1 ‘I'ebephene call with 1. Grivetti regarding M. Fuaxio resipnation and venhangs mp-oif.

Desc
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COMIMSCO, INC.

FERNAT & VOIING CORPORATE FINANCE. LLC
DETAIL OF SERYICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 17, 2001 THROAVGH ATICUST 12, 2002

o FROFESSIONAL DATE PO HOIIRS DESCRIFTION

Crivelti, Juln DX20/02 74 al Telophone cull with DuMiller regarding M. Fazio resignation and ventures run-uii

Miller, David 02/25402 74 03 Telephune call tw 5. GEeichenhaus regarding Committee call and revrganization
plan developments.

Milker, David @3/04/02 74 0.2 Tulephone vall §. Gleivhenhaus regarding, disvussion with Commitiee chair and
wurk plan.

Girivetti, Johh Q02 T4 (14 Lyizcugsion with L. Franco rexarding clicat sequest.

Franco, Luis 002 74 6 Ligtussion will E&Y cogagement kaim on nicthedology for vteatmy ptojeeted
balahoe sheel as of 6-30-02.

Frangn, 1.uis 31102 14 7 Megting with gnppagement oeam (o discyss work plan and w do ivema baged an
wpdate with Cittbank.

Leas, Jaclyn 031 1402 74 0.5 Meering with .. Franen to discuss ense stotus and develap strotegry for wark plan.

Miller, David 031942 74 03 Telephune call o 5. Gleichenhaus regarding Committes meeting resulls and nexi
sleps,

Sheriman, Richard 0322/02 74 0.3 Dralt c-imail W D, Miller regarding upporiunily W discusys bankruptey model for
Conndiseo with Anhur Andcrsun pan o,

Williams, Michael 0525402 74 Lt Ciomninication Trom £ Miller reparding Citiproup approves planncd mocting
reparding tax aspects of Arihur Andersan rearganization tax model - Dizcuss with
K. Sherman - updarg for N. Falzong - T'elephone call to M. Feligh to confinn
mgeting and gnnfimm with 13, Miller.

Miller, Tiavid 0N 74 .1 ‘Tebephone eall w L, Franco repaeding dilipenee follow up wills Company.

Mitler, David 03/27/02 74 0.1 1.pdats with 5. Gleichanhaus rejrarding meeting rasults on KERP.

Franco, Luis 04/02/02 T4 0.5 1lpdates with [azard pn items to be discussed ai meeting.

Miller, David 04/05/02 T 0.2 Telephone call to 5. Gliechenhaus regarding follow up issues from meeting with
Company.

Eranca, | uig (405402 74 0.5 Eevap ol ineetnp with CI5 Bansaction supporl e and discussion oa valuc of
funare conversations with the Company.

Sherman, Richard Q4/05/02 74 0. Fallow-yp discussions with M. Williams and ealis to 13. Miller reparding same.

Francg, 1.uis 0441042 74 V] U pdare mecting with L, Milier cegarding recent developients, elaing
niniinization, new Yipes connection and aubscquent follow-up sequest te be
prepared tor the Conpany.

Willisma, Michacl /11402 T4 .3 Conference call with I Miller reparding status of banktuptey tconganizaton plan
proposal - fitlow-up with K. Shorman teganling same.

Hherman, Richard 1 1HAR 74 e Firllow-up discuasions with M, Willians repaudiog Condiseo,

Desc
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COMIMSCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
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FHOFESRTONAT, DATE rCD HOURS N DESCRIPTION

Tranco, Luis 041702 74 0.3 Conference call with 5. Dellinger reparding statns nftax issues and next sieps.

fherman, Richard Q417102 4 0.4 Darit e-mail upiliste.

Aherman, Richard Q41702 74 0.6 Follow-up discussions witli M, Williang regarding next steps and & mail to D
Miller o apprise of stalug,

Sherman, Richard 04/1 8/02 74 0.6 Fusllow-up discuasions with M. Williams regarding Comulisco.

Miller, David 0g4/19/02 74 0.5 Tetephune call w K. Hanson reganding eoardination of efforts on POR 1ssuss (Laxes,
claimes and 45501 2a168).

Sherman, Richaed 0d4/19/02 74 3.5 Diseussiona with M. Williams regarding e-mails from Latham & Watking and [
Miller rewanding change of &Y tox role. Follow-up conversaions with N. Faleong
reparding same. Draf} a-mail to J. Kronsnable regarding saimne, Fullow-up ¢all w
Latham & watkins to discuss next steps.

Miller, David 2302 14 0.5 Driscussions with L. France. M, Williams and 2-mails to Council regarding FOR
and diligemie.

Franco, Luis 04/25/02 74 a5 Conference coll with at Lazard regarding consolidated vaslt [low and componens.

Wingles, Roheri Qd/T602 74 04 Conference call with M. Williams nogarding discussiona with the bankriptey plan
and polential Lix issues.

Miller, David 04/26/02 74 0.1 Dratted e-mnails 1o R. Hanson icyarding communication nf tax plan issaes.

Miller, David 04/249/2 74 0.t Diralted ¢-mails @ K. Hansan regarding conrdination of plan related work.

Frango, 1.nis Q5/06/02 74 0.5 Warking with [2. Miller regarding revicw ot o de ietig and corrent steins of case.

Franca, 1.uis Q5/06/02 74 0.5 Lipdate call with Larard on stalus of tieir analysis and upeoming calls.

Miller, David Q5/DRINZ ‘T4 0.1 Telephone vall with 5. Gleichenbawa regarding conference call on disclosure issues.

Francw, Luis ORI 74 0.5 Upthats vall wilh 5. Dolinger an ta dn irems, status of Doard candidates and billing
Qqustictid,

Franga, Luis Q5/30/02 74 0.2 1pdate T2, Miller an Committee update vall, Rovap of Conunitee ¢all with 5.
{Gleichenhaus.

Miller, Lravid Q6/05/02 74 it Idiggngsion with [.. Pranco regarding BOD candidales

Midler, David O/ 3/02 74 0.1 Telephane call to M. Williams regarding status und cunclusion of wirk,

Miller, David 06/) 5A¥2 74 0.1 Revicw ol'e-inail and lenier supporting the FOR.

74 Total 6.8

Desc
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COMDLSCO, INC.
ERNAT & YOUNG CORPORATE FENANCE ELEC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODF
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PROFESSIOMNAL TDATE e HOURS BESCRIPTION .
Gleichenhaus, Stuart D8/15/01 75 2.k HReviewsd Services sale documents
Gleichenhaus, Stuart DE/16/01 75 24 Raviewed Services sale documents
Cirivetti, Juhn DB/16/01 7 4.2 Reviewsd Services sale documents to delermine bneluded aseets and prepare

esrimates of assets from halance sheet data a1 331 repotl
(ileichenhaus, Siuart DE/2%/M1 Th 1% Reviewed Circles acquisition agresment
Cirveui, John B2 15 1.2 Reviewed Circles acquisilion agrecnenl
Miller, David 1A 75 0.6 Review of drall proparcd repapding circle sales agreement
Grivetti, John 10712701 75 a4 Reviewod Sungard consent request
75 Toial 1.7

Desc
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COMDIACO, TNC.

ERNST & YOUNCG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED Y PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERKI JULY 27, 2001 THROUCH AUGUST t2, 2002

Grivett, Joht

Yan Vurens, Erik

Campbel], Keith

Yan Vuren, Erik

Girivatti, John

Franco, Luis

Fruovo, Luis

Campbel], Keith

Framea, iz

Franco, Luis

Grivetlt, Jole

Grivetti, Jaht

Franco, |.uis

Franco, Luis

Mhller, David

Grivetti, John

Girivetti, John

Eranen, Ivia

Frango, Luis

Miller, Pavid

DATE PO HOLRS . DESCRIPTION

01/07/02 76 3 Review vl muonthly cash ows and discussions with 5.Dallinger reyarding
Testuciusing expenseys and cyuiphient purchases

01/07/02 76 2.5 Iurged vash flow inforsvation inte eensolidated file.

O1/08/02 76 0.8 Contirenwe call witl 1eam to disenss prepararion of cash flow fur Lazard,
coordingion with Arihur Andersen, and review of direct SURACA exnenses.

D1/0%/02 76 29 Al Bovenben information inte cash flow files.

01/09/02 % a7 Prepatation of shon-term eash flow projection through 3/31/02.

21/0%/02 76 1) Analygis of prowection roll-farward cash halance as of 3-31-02 based van actudl
results thenugh November 2001,

D102 s LE Cnmpletion, review and distribution of prupected roll-lotwaid cazh balanes aa of 3-
3102 hased om August through Wovemnber setwal weekty cash Nows,

(11902 76 1.2 Estimate March 2002 cash flows based on 1ecember husiness plan.

01/15/02 76 0.8 Additionsl review of Qetober and Novemher cash flow questions with fucws on
Beplember and Cetaber.

0502 71 1.9 Analysis and compilation of cash flow questions Jor October and Naviember

M A3002 76 1.5 Reviewed and edited Lutest cash Dow projection,

01/31/02 76 0.4 Ruviewsd and adivod Latesl cash flow projecrion.

02/1%/02 76 23 Updale of consolidaied cash flows ta include September infurmution reccived
Ry,

02/20002 T 1.7 1lpdate cash flaw analysis to include in Beplembur vash flows fimceast.

242102 76 0.2 Working with I. Grivewti reganding cash balanee analysis for Conmittee.

221402 76 0.2 Wurking with I.Milka wgarding cazh batance analysis for Commitize.

QL2102 76 0.9 Reviewed and vilited projected cash balance analysis.

QX2 102 76 1.8 Revisions te projected uesh Lalange as af W31/02] Rewvisions to varionce analysis of
oniginal cash projeetion for Jyecember 31 versus actual.

02/22/02 76 1.4 Updats of monthly cash rell forward.

0225402 76 0.4 Working with L. Franco segarding analysis of Decgmhber 2001 and 02 2002 cash

flows.

Desc
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COMIHACO, INC.

ERMST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETALL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
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PROFESSIONAL DATE rep HOVRS . DESCRIFTION
Franeo. Luia 22540 76 1.3 Update ol projeeied cazh balance.
Girivefti, John 26002 T 0.6 Review and edit of updared cash flow prajection and variunce analysis,
Franco, Luia 202 76 1.5 Update Lo caah variance analysis.
Miller, Lavid D30102 76 0.4 Wuaking with L. Franco regarding Q2 cash flaw analysis.
Frange, 1ais 031402 76 a5 Review of complered cash flow consolidation and SG& A comparisun.
76 Tutal 0

Grand Tutal

2,954.5

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
SUMMARY OF EXFENSES INCURRED BY CATFGORY
FOR THE PERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROUGH AUGUST 12, 2002
COACH TAXL
PROFESSIONAL DATE AIRFARE MEAILS LODGING CARRENTAL TELEFHONE {THER TOTAL
RBoggs, Kimberly N3/18/02 71 70
Boggs, Kimberly 03/19/02 b 45 5t
Roggs, Kimberly 0322402 15 15
Boggs, Kimberly 03/23/02 12 12
Boggs, Kimberly 1.3/24/02 g25 205 88 1218
Bopis, Kimberly 03/25/02 fi7 &7
Boggs, Kimherly Total 925 21 205 143 0 1 1,433
Choguette, Andrew 117189/ 29 21 50
Chogueite, Andrew 12/10/02 74 7
Choquetts, Andrew 12/12/02 21 21
Choquette, Andrew Total 0 2% 0 42 78 0 142
Lunn, James (8/31/01 1,398 22 202 26 54 1,772
Dunn, James Total 1,398 12 202 96 1] 54 1,772
Falzome, Micholas 08/24/M £185 185
Fulzune, Nicholas 08/24/01 1,599 1,599
Falzeme, Micholas 09/14/M 1,599 1,599
Faleone, Nicholas 10/31/01 123 3 155
Falzone, Micholzs 10/31/m 1,482 1,482
Faleone, Nicholas 1t/01/01 217 217
Falzone, Nicholas Total 4,805 k1l 402 0 0 1] 5,237
Federal Express /15/02 58 58
Tederal Express (¥2/22/02 23 23
Federal Express Total a 0 i} 0 0 ¥l 81
Franco, Lewis 3403702 612 632
Franco, Lewis Total 632 U 0 0 1} )] 632
(lgichenhaus, Stuart 089/1(401 1,515 3l 37 10 1,593
Gleichenhaus, Stuart 0Os14/01 75 104 179
(ileichenhaus, Stuart 09300 al 257 12 329
Gleichenhaws, Stuart 10/04/01 1,518 111 1.629
(ilcichenhaus, Stuart D1/03/402 1,408 136 86 5 1,724
Gleichenhaus, Stuart 01710702 136 136
(ileichenhaus, Stuart 01711402 30 n
Gleichenhaus, Stuart 03/07/02 657 il 658
Cileichenhaus, Stuatt 3/08/02 14 14
Gleichenhaus, Start 03/24/02 1,335 227 1 1,508
(ileichenhuus, Slouard N3/25/02 50 227 78 11 65
Gleichenhaus, Stuart 03/26/02 & 11 14
Gleichenhaus, Stuart Total 6,542 164 a3 399 86 130 8,303
(irivetti, John 11/30/01 1,476 97 1,573
Grivetti, John 0110902 234 24 258
{irivetti, John 0110402 952 14 66 1,024
Grivetli, John Total 2428 6 134 186 u 0 2,854
Kallen, Donald 03/24/02 925 116 223 03 1,329
Kalfen, 13onald 03/25/02 45 86 131
Kalfen, Donald Total 915 161 223 151 0 0 1,460
Krop, Andrew 0N E9A 10 10
Krop, Andrew Total ] 0 0 0 0 10 1o
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COMDISCOG, INC.
ERNST & YOUNMG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
SUMMARY OF EXI'ENSES INCURRED BY CATEGORY
FOR THE FERIOD JULY 27, 2001 THROHIGH AUGUST 12, 2002

COACIL TAXL
PROFESSIONAL DATE AIRFARE MFEALY  LODGING CARRENTAL TELEPHONE OTHER TOTAL
Miller, David 10/03401 Pl 2 212 " ‘ 1,194
Miller, David 13/04/01 46 46
Miller, David 12/04/01 54 54
Miller, David 12/04/01 1,221 1,221
Miller, David 12/05/01 24 24
Miller, David 12407411 19 19
Miller, Navid 12712401 21 N
Miller, David 01/31/02 11 I
Millgr, David 04/03/02 532 A6 578
Miller, Duvid (04114102 & b
Miller, David 04/22/02 [ )
Miller. David (14/24412 7 7
Miller, David Total 2,722 21 213 12 0 19 3,187
Pacini. Dorothea 10/08/0 | 17 17
Pacinl, Dorothea Fotal 1] 0 0 17 [ 1] 17
Kyan, Frances (9/12/01 35 35
Ryan, Frances 09/13/01 is 35
Ryan, Frunces [H)/24/00] 23 23
Ryan, Frances Tatal ] ] a 3 0 0 93
Bherman, Richard 10/05/01 14 14
Sherman, Richard (102152 20 29
Sherman, Richard Total 0 14 0 29 i] 0 43
Van Vuren, Frik 09/24/0] 110 110
Van Vuren, Erik Total 0 1 /] 110 0 0 110
Williams, Michael (m21/01 3 3
Williams, Michael (/2801 157 t57
Williams, Michacl 04/02/02 43 48
Williams, Michael 1206402 55 55
Williams, Michael Total 0 n 1] 260 ] 0 291

Corand Total $20,377 §500 $2,462 51,878 5163 5295 515,673




Case 01-24795 Do‘O

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered

Pleading Page 165 of 267

COMDISCO, TNC.

“6/02 00:00:00 Desc

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY PROFESSIONAL
FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER 1, 2001 THROUGIH DECEMBER 31, 2001

PROFESSIONAL POSITION RATE HOURS FEES
Restructuring Advisory Services
Gleichenhaus, Stuart ~ Managing Direclor 5650 4.0 $2.600
Miller, David Managing Director 575 16.1 9,258
Grivettl, John Director 475 87 4,133
Ryan, Frances Vice President 375 0.0 0
Franco, Luis Asgociate 340 24.8 8,432
Van Vuren, Erik Associale 320 31.8 10,176
Campbell, Keith Associate 320 234 7,488
Choquette, Andrew Analyst 275 0.5 2,613
Subtotal 118.3 44,699
Ernst & Young LLP

Tax Consulting Services
Falzone, Nicholas Partner $650 3.0 1,950
Voortman, Anna Pariner 650 5.0 3.250
Williams, Michacel Principal 605 8.8 5,324
Thompson, Sean Senior Manager 580 4.0 2,320
Subtotal 20.8 12,844
TOTAL 139.1 57.543
Less Voluntary Adjustment (19.0) {6,478)
120.1 $31,065




Case 01-24795 Do 03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 6/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 166 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG COPORATE FINANCE LLC
SUMMARY OF HOURLY FEES BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER 1, 2001 THROUGH DECEMBER. 31, 2001

Project
Code Description Hours Fees
1 Planning, Supervision, Administration and Review 8.1 % 2,842.50
3 Review Newly Received Documents 8.1 2,719.50
4 General Communications with Unsecured Creditors 0.3 172.50
3 Preparation and Review of Info. Requests and Related Matters 13.3 4,273.00
7 Liquidation Analysis and Related Matters 1.9 608.00
9 Analysis of Long-Term Business Plan and Related Matters 18.6 7.848.00
10 Analysis of Current Operating Results and Related Matters 202 6,822.00
including Cash Flow and Availability
12 Analysis of Bankruptey Schedules, Court Documents and other 2.5 850.00
Legal Documents
13 Analysis of Tax Related Matlers 11.2 6,885.00
25 Preparation and Participation in Meetings and Conference Calls 6.3 3,552.00
with Debtors and Debilors Professionals to Discuss Status and
Develop Strategy
26 Prepare Information for and Participation in Meetings with the 12.3 6,414.50
Unsecured Creditors Committee
50 Analysis of Store Closings/Going out of Business Sales 0.3 172.50
51 Analyze Asset Sale Proposals 4.1 1,987.50
35 Preparation of Miscellaneous Financial Analysis 172 5,712.00
58 Strategic and Operational Assessment Matters 59 2,067.00

73 Analysis of Tax Attributes 39 2,402.00



Case 01-24795 Do 03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 16/02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 167 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG COPORATE FINANCE LLC
SUMMARY OF HOURLY FEES BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER 1, 2001 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2001

Project
Code Description Hours Fees
74 Meetings with professionals to discuss case status and develop 4.9 2,214.50
strategy
TOTAL HOURS AND FEES 139.1 57.543
Less Voluntary Adjustment (19.0) (6,478)

ADJUSTED TOTAL HOURS AND FEES 120.1 $51,065




Case 01-24795 Do

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 6/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 168 of 267

COMIMETO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNGC CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
RETAIL 0F SERVICES RENDERED BY PRGJECT CODE
rOR THE PERTOD DECEMRER L, 2000 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2001

PROFESSIONAL _ _ DATE FCD HOURS DESCRIPTION

Miller, David 12/7:2001 1 0.3 Telephone eall I. Grivetti regarding discussion vl staws of current work plan items
and additional projects.

Miller, Dravid 129200 1 0.5 Workioys with L. France and A, Campbell regoarding key issues and work plan
ohjectives.

Cirivetti, John 12/7/2001 1 0.3 Telephone call with D.Miller regarding diseussion of status of corrent work plan
jtetns and additiomol projects.

Van Vuren, Erik 12/13/2001] 1 2.6 Transitioncd matetial o EYCF Atlants

Van Yuren, Esik 12/14/2001 1 4.4 “I'vansivioned macerial to EYCF Aftanta

1 Total g1

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1Q/16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 169 of 267

COMDMECO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED By FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER t, 2000 THROUGIH DECEMBER 31, 2041

FROFESSIONAL DATE PO HOURS LESCRIFTHON

{"amphell, Keith 12/372001 1 1.5 Review unseeured creditors megting presentation dated August 21, 2001,

Campbell, Keith 12/3/2001 k] 2.5 Research potential lewse [nancing altematives.

Campbell, Keith 12/10/2001 3 1.8 Review the master roquest list and eotrespondence hetween E&Y, Debtor and
Committee.

Campbell, Keaith 12132001 k) 1.8 Review previous wolkplans and presentations prepared for Unsceured Creditors
Lommithes,

Millce, David 12/ 18,2001 3 0.3 Review of Lazard analysis of leasing uction.

3 Total %1

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc¢3103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 170 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANUE LLU
DETAIL {}F SERYIUES RENDERED BY PROJFCT CODRE
FOR THE FERION DECEMAER 1, 2001 THROUG:H BDECEMBER 31, 200

PROFESSIONAL UATE PCL HOURS DESCRIFTION —

Millee, Lavid 12/3/20601 q 03 Telephane call with J. Hart rayarding Deblars tinancial schedules filed with the
court.

4 Total 0.3

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/16/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 171 of 267

COMDISCO, TNC.
FRNST & YOUMNG CORPORATE FINANCE LILC
DETALIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROMECT CUDE
FOR THE PERION DECEMEER L, 2001 THROUGH BECEMIER 31, 2001

PROFESSIONAL DATE PO 1HOURS DESCRIFTION

Millce. David 1242001 3 02 Review of Nehtor rexpanses (o infornation requests.

Miller, Lravid 12472001 5 04 Send e-mpits 1o Citihank and Lacard rogarding additional information requests lor
leusing businesa plans and Vertures data.

Miller, Mavid 12/8/2001 3 0.z Dreadt and send c-mail to Mishler regarding business plan dilipence request.

Miller, David 12/10/2001 H Q.1 Send e-mail W R, Mishter reparding diligence meeting.

Miller, David 12/10/2401 5 0.2 Waorking with EYCF ieam regarding information requests.

Van Vuren, Erik 121072001 5 1.4 Created SGAA request lian Tor Andersen.

Choquette, Andrew 127102008 5 1.3 Ducumenl preparalion.

Chuguette, Andrew 1260172000 5 1.6 Preparation of doguments for library, additions o index.

Chuguetie, Androw 1241272011 5 13 Preparation of summary of vanlagopoinl vetuse patmers [P ngreement for Atlanta
L.

Krop. Andrew 12/12/2001 ] 1.5 Copying materials for personnel in Atlanta.

Choquerts, Andrew 1271372001 5 1.8 Additions L docurment library, index.

Miller, Lavid 12/14/2001 5 04 Waorking with 1. Griveti and L. Franeo regarding requests for SO&A data und
inlurimation on foreipn debt.

Girivetti, John 12/14/2001 k] 04 Assisted T.Miller and L. Fianco veparding requests far SCG&A dats and information
o fercipn debt.

5 Total 133

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc 3103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 172 of 267

COMDISECH, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAJIL, OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR TIE PEIRIOD DECEMBER 1, 2001 THROUGH DECEMBER M, 2001

PROFESSIONAL _ _ DATE pCh HULRS DESCRIFTION

Caunpbell, Keith 12:11/72001 7 1.9 Review inforrtion provided by the client to due and yeoerate list of information
needed to complete updated byuidation analysis as of 9/30/01.

7 Total 1.9

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered

16/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 173 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PRUJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER 1, 2001 THROUGH DECEMBRER 31, 2001

PROFESSIONAL LATE FCD HQURS DESCRIPTION
Miller, David 12732000 v L.y Review of droft laasing business plan.
Miller, Davvid 127472000 Bl 1113 Review of droft leasing business plan.
Von Vuren, Nk 12/4/2001 9 2.5 Raviewed lease anulysls preparcd by Lazrad
(leichenhaus, Stuart 12/4/2001 9 I Review ol finunuial infonmation of Comdises.
Gleichenhaus, Stuart 12/5/2001 9 I.n Review of financial infonnatien of Comdises.
Franco, Luis 12/ 1042001 9 T4 Review of UDO buzinesa plans, including scenarios for leasing verticals, bids for
those verticals, ete.
Franuw, Luis 12/ K20 9 0.9 Strategy discussion for analysis of leasing business pluns with engagcowit wany.
Franco, Luia 127112001 4 0.9 Lriseusgion on lensing husiness plans with engaganenl weani.
Franco, Inis 12712/2001 4 1.9 Reviewad the scenarias fur each ol the leasing portfolios,
Camphell, Keith 1¥12/2001 9 0.9 Review Larard preliominary analysis of leasing company alternutives.
Francu, Luis 12/13/2001 9 1.7 Ruview of preliminary Lazard anplysis of leasing company bids.
Franco, Luis 12/13/2001 9 08 Review of MoKingey leasing stuly.
Camphell, Keith 12/13/2001 g 1.2 Review Lazard preliminary analysis of [easing company alternatives.
(ileichenhaus, Stuart 12/2°0 8001 9 1.0 Review of financial information of Comdisec.
Ciluichenhaus, Stuart 12282001 9 1.0 Ruevicw of linaseial information of Comdisco.
2 Total BT

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered /02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 174 of 267

COMDISCO, [NC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES REXDEREDR BY PROMECT CODE
FOMR THE PERICD DECEMRBER 1, 2001 THROUGH DECEMRBER 51, 201

PROFESSIONAL DATE D HOURS DESCRIFTION

Van Vuren, Frik 127372001 1 25 Cash flow information - received new inti, put in model

Van Vuren, Frik 12572001 [ 1.2 Cash flow information - received new info, put in model

Van Vuren, Erik 12/t 2001 10 18 Cash flow information - received new inlo. pul in model

Grivetti, Juhm L2/7/2001 10 1.3 Keviewed and adited cash low analysis

Camphell, Keith 12 12001 10 1.2 Ruvicw liguidation and canselidating bakenee sheet and Octoher weekly cash
flaws.

Franco, Luis 12/11/2001 10 .5 Fawiliarization with Company cash ow presentation and line itemns.

Franca, Luix (27112001 10 24 Review of weekly cush ow wends for recently received cash flows.

Francu, Luis 12/12/2001 1 1.5 Review uf (ketober inforniation pagket sent by the company.

Franeo, Luis 12/12/2001 10 11 Continuing review of cash flow trends.

Canpbuil, Keith 12/12: 2001 10 1.4 Review updated cash low through Octoher for review will oanagemncat,

Crivelti, John 12/ 1472001 19 03 Rewvisw 9/20/01 lorcign balance sheets for Comdisco Swiss and Nethotlaods
chtitics

Van Vuren, Brik 12421720010 10 aa Cash flow information - received new info, put in modet

10 Tatal .2

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do 03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1Q&l6/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 175 of 267

COMDISCH, INC.
ERNST & YOURKG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAJL QF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FURTHE PERIONR DECEMBER 1, 201 THROUGH DECEMPBER, 11, 2001

PROFESSIONAL _  DATE rep HOLHKS DESCRIPTION
Franco, Luis 12/1 t72001 12 1.4 Review af recently tiled sourt motions (12/10/3 1,
Franci, Luis 12/14/24H11 12 1.0 Review of recently filed court documents.

12 Totat 15

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

PROFESSIONAL

Williams, Michoel

Williams, Michael

Williams, Michaet

Williams. Michaet

Williamns, Michact

williams. Michact

Williaus, Michack

Grivetri, John

Williams. Michael

Willtarns, Michack

Falzone, Nicholas

Williams, Michnel

Williams, Michael

Falxzone, Nicholas

12/5/2001

127572001

1232001

12/5/201

12/5/2001

1245/2001

1542001

1245/2001

12/6/2001

12/06/200)

12/7/2001

1272001

12/14/2001

12/172001

e

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1

6/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 176 of 267

COMBISCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FPROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD DECEMRER |, 30l THROUGH DECEMBEHR 31, 201

BCL HOURS DES(.‘RII"I'IPN

13 [\ Cotiunications with M. Felish, Tax Director at Comdisco to prepare hing in
advance lor the topies which we intended to discuss with him at the mitg scheduted
with him to disenss internatiomal taxes

12 0.4 Canf call with Lynn Elisstaond of Shadden Arpa to describe topics which wa
intended to cover at the mig w/ Mike Felish re international wees and for het to
appruve the tupits

12 na Caonf call with Anna Yourtman 1o wpic for discussion regarding intemational foxes
related 1o mitg wi Mike Felish Comdisco Tux Director Sian wisnivwshks Comdisen
Intermatiomal lax speciadist and with an intemnationo] tax representative of Comdiseo

13 0.5 Canference call with €. Athas of Skadden Arps re access b milg with Mike Feliah
T2 inlemational Wwpivs

12 02 Canf call with John Grivetti 10 obiain nnderstanding of the reorganization
prospects of Camdisco arpund ils Gernan cotity

12 1.0 Preparc with Kich Sherman and discuss with him the preparation of the st ol
topics to he discwssed with Michasl Felish at the intetmationnl thy mesting with
Michael - forward the dncument to Michael Felish and Chrls Athas ac Skadden
Arps

12 0.5 Review suemmary analysis of intemational tax matters prepared by Rich Sherman
far Anna Vourtman

12 0z Diseussion with Mike Williams re: Comdisco's Cremman entity

13 z1 Meetitig with Michael Pelish Tox Director of Camdisea and Stan Prosiiewshi
Internabional Fax Dicetor of Comdisco w/ Anna Voorrman and Bean Thompson of
FY [nternatiomal Tax o discusy snd analyze Comdisco intemational restrucharing
and cash repatriation

13 ne Mema ta David Miller and Joln Griveei summarizing the intemnational tox meeting
at Comdisco

13 [[R] Canference call with Tiqvid Miller and M. Williams regarding inlcenational tax
planning stratepivs atd analysis of those strategies

13 0.3 Canf call w/ David Millar and Nick Falzome re intermational tax planning siratcgics
and analysis of thoae strategics

13 0.3 TR status ¢all - follow-up w/ Sean Themsun and Anna Voottan re international
tax planoing

11 25

1% Total 1.z

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 177 of 267

COMMSCO, INC
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LILC
DETAIT. OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD DECEMRAER 1, 2001 THROUGH DECEMBER 3,21

PROFESSIONAL DATE FCL HOURS DESCRIPTION

Vootthan, Annz 12/5/301 25 1.0 Prepatation far mesting with Mike Falish at Conmdisco ond International tax
digictor.

Voorman, Amma 12/6/2001 23 2.0 Meeting at Coindiseo with VP ol Tax and Internatienal ax director 1o discuss and
evaluate U.5. foreipn tax credit and overall loreign loss,

Thompaot, Scan 12:6/2001 25 2.1 Meeting at Comdiseo with VI of Tax and International Tox Director to discuss and
evaluate VIS foreipn lax credit and overall foreign Toss in light of sale of non LS
operotions.

Compbell, Keith 12/12/ 1001 25 1.2 Disenss capital calls with engageownt team, M, Mckenta and Andersci,

25 Total 3

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 178 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.
FRNST & VNG CORPORATE FINAMCE 11.C

DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED IY PROJECT CODE

FOR THE PERIOD DECEMRBER 1, 2001 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, X1

PROFESSIONAL o DATE FCD HOURS DESCRIPTION

Miller, Dravid 12/4/2001 20 6.0 Participate in meeting with Corpany and Crediters Committes representatives
rugarding busingsa plans and l=psing auction

Miller, David 12/5/200 26 0.2 E-mail to 5- Dallinger regurding ety follow up areas,

Miller, David 12/12/2001 26 0.4 Telephone call with &. Dotlinger ieparding due diligence issues and fax an
EY/Lacard waork plan items.

Camphell, Keith 12/12/2001 26 0.8 Discuss e rom 5. Dallinger on bid valuotion mode] with engageiment team and
plan for conference call with Lacard.

Witler, David 1Z/13/200 ] 24 0.7 Cuonfercuce with C Fortgang, R. Thomton, Luzand, and 1P, Prce regarding updare
om Debtors’ analysis of Leasing bids and Debtors' decision nal 1o sell.

Miller, Liavid 12/13:200) 26 &4 Confercnee with 5. Nollinger and Lazard regarding due diligence requirements
regarding leasing bida and business plan.

Campbell, Keith 12/ 32001 26 %] Confarcnce call with R, Dellinger und Lazard 10 discuss work plan.

Grivetti, John 12/14/2001 20 25 Preparation for and participation in Committes ¢all regarding leasing bid update
and including review of lozard evaluation ol hids.

Milter, David 122002001 26 n4 Participate in Conunitiee call regarding leasing hid update.

26 Totsl 123

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 179 of 267

COMDISCD, INC.
ERNET & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE L1.C
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERION DECEMBER 1, 2001 THR(UGH DECEMBER 3, 2001

PROFESSHINAL DATE [N ) HOURS DESCRIFTION

Miller, Dravid 125,101 3 0.3 Warking with A. Cainpbell regarding potential specinl servicers.

5 Total 03

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 180 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERTIOD DECEMBER 1, 2001 THROUGLH DECEMBER 31, 2001

FROFESSIGMNAL DATE PCD HOURS DESCRIMFTION
Milter, David 1232001 31 0z Teleplone call with J. Hallock regarding teasing auction resules.
Milker, David 12/4;2001 51 0.2 Resvicw ol easitg asction informintion.
Grivetti, John 12/13/2001 51 kW) Participare in various Committes conference calls regarding Jeasing bid updale aad
review of Lueard analyscs 1¢: same.
51 Tual 4,1

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 181 of 267

COMDISC, INC
FRNAT & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER 1, 2001 THROWIGH DRECEMBER M, 2ikn

PROFESSIONAL DATE ™MD HOURS LESCHIFTION

Van Vyren, Trik 12472004 55 19 Wetherfunds & Swiss halance sheets - requasted from Andersen and analvzed

Camptzll, Keith 12/ (0200 55 1.6 Review all information provided by the clisnt to date and generate list of
information needed to cotmplete Vel s analysis.

Van Vuiren, Exik 12711720401 35 1G9 Continued evaluation of unfunded venture commimaents {Oak & Vaintagepoint)

Miller, David 12122001 55 (34 Meeting with L. Frante and A. Cainpbell regarding analysis of Ventures capital
calls.

Franco, Luis 12/1 12001 35 %4} Calt with Arthur Andersen regarding surrend CLO capital calls for existing 1..P.
dgreEmenis.

Frapto, Luis 12/12:200% 55 0.9 Cnlls with enpagement team and Arthur Aaderscd to discuas funding ol reeent L.,
capital calls.

Van Vuren, Erik 12/ 12/2000 55 4.1 Evaluated unfisded voutare conunitments (Uak & Valagepoint)

Franco, Luia 12/13/2001 55 14 Niscussinn with engagement team regarding cagital calls, Rescarch on potcntizl
managers or putchasers of CLO's venlure portliliv.

Fronca, T.uis 12/ 1373600 | ERl 0.4 Call with Arthur Andersen regarding current CDC capital colls for existing 1..P.
agresments.

Framun, Luis 1211472001 55 1. Review of CO LI aprecmcnt with fucus un penaltics Tor default on capital calls.
Further research on potential managers or purchasers far CDO's venture busineas.

55 L'otal 17.2

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1046/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 182 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,
ERNMNET & YN CORPORATFE FINANCE LLC
DETAIT, OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER I, 2001 THROVGH DECEMBER 3, 21

PROFESSIONAT DATE L BPCD HOURS DESCNPI'UN
Miller, David 123/2001 58 0.6 Feviow of inlomustion regarding potential special servigers.
Franca. Loz 12142001 EL) 0% Calls with cngageinent feun regarling S0 A analysis, including information w be
requested,
Franco, Luis 12/14/2001 58 0.4 Drafl of infurmiation request for SGA&A information from the Company,
Campbell, Keith 12/28/2001 58 1% Analyze detailed SGaA cxpenses lor ren-olF scenarins for each vertical.
Canpbell, Keith 12/24/2001 53 2.z Analyze detailed SG5A capensea.
58 Tutal 5.0

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 183 of 267

COMDISCO, 160
ERMST & VNG CORPORATR FINMANCE LLC
DETAMN. OF SERVICES REMDERED BY PR(MECT (C(0DF.
FOR THE PERIOD DECEMRBER 1, toti THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2001

FROFESSIONAL DATE . P HOURS NESCRIPTION
Voorttman, Anna 12/6/1001 73 20 Assessment of ULS. tax attributes (foreipn tax crodit and overalt foreign Tnss).
Thompsan, Sean 12/4/2001 11 1.9 Assessment of D5 tax attributes (foreign tax credit and overall foreign loss) in
prepatation for nueutmg at Condisco with VP of tax and Intemational 1'ax
Ditcetor.

73 Tatzl A9

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 184 of 267

COMDLSC0, 1N,
ERNST & YNNG CORPORATE FINMANCE LLC
RETAIL OF SERVICES RERDERED BY PROECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD DECEMEER 1, 3001 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2001

FROFESSIONAL DATE BFCD ITONRS DESCRIMTION

Williams. Michac) 12,7201 74 08 Ltise w/ Lt Miller re international tax planning stratepics and analyaia - forward
pertinent information to 5 Thompson and discuss schedube relsted to sales of
vertical leazibng units

Miller, Cravid L2/3/2001 74 0.6 Conforencs with M. Williams regarding resules of tax meeting with Comdisee and
polential tux strategies.

Miller, Dravid 122001 T4 0.3 Weekly call with EYCF and EY wuan reganding update on Commities meeting and
statug of leaving bids.

Frune, Luix 12777201 74 1O Update with engagement team on progtess of tax. liguidalivn und other analysis.

Campboll, Keith 12/10/200t 74 0.4 L¥iscuss the status of the engagement with team olembers and the plan poing
forward.

Franco. Luia 12112/2001 74 Dy Progress and status update 1m analysis and recent events with enpagement team,

Miller, Duvid 12/14/2061 74 u4 Anulysis of potential issues regarding Debtors’ determination 10 owve forward on
stnd alone basis,

74 Tatal 4.8

Crand Total

13%.1

Desc



01-24795 Doc 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1
case ‘ Pleading Page 185 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY PROFESSION AL

FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

PROFESSIONAL POSITION

RATE HOURS

Restructuring Advisory Services

Gleichenhaus, Stuart ~ Managing Director

Miller, David Managing Director

Grivetti, John Director

Franco, Luis Associate

Van Vuren, Erik Associate

Campbell, Keith Associate

Cheguette, Andrew Analyst

Ingles, Beatrice Client Setving Associate
Subtotal

Ernst & Young LLP
Tax Consulting Services
Williams, Michael Principal
Thorupson, Sean Senior Manager
Subtotal

TOTAL

$650
575
475
340
320
320
275
140

$605
580

Reduction of Non-Working Travel Time (50% of time incurred)

Less Voluntary Adjustment

WOZ 00:00:00 Desc

FEES
284 $18,460
16.6 9,545
72.0 34,200
43.2 14,688
16.7 5,344
10.1 3,232
34 935
45.6 6,384
236.0 92,788
7.0 4,235
4.0 2,320
11.0 6,555
247.0 99,343
(6.00) (3,900)
(324)  (12,689)
208.6  $82,754
e e e y——
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COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG COPORATE FINANCE LLC

SUMMARY OF HOURLY FEES BY PROJECT CODE

FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1,2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

Project
Code Description Hours Fees
1 Planning, Supervision, Administration and Review 58 % 227250
3 Review Newly Received Documents 15.1 6,086.00
4 General Communications with Unsccured Creditors 3.3 1,617.50
5 Preparation and Review of Info. Requests and Related Matters 12.9 5,513.50
9 Analysis of Long-Term Business Plan and Related Matters 6.0 3,900.00
10 Analysis of Current Operating Resulls and Related Matters 53 2,428.50
including Cash Flow and Avajlability
11 Review and Analysis of Monthly Operating Results 34 935.00
13 Analysis of Tax Relaled Matters 9.5 5,647.50
25 Preparation and Participation in Meetings and Conference Calls 1.6 528.00
with Debtors and Debtors Professionals to Discuss Status and
Develop Strategy
26 Prepare Information for and Participation in Meetings with the 225 12,837.50
Unsecured Creditors Committee
36 Analyze DIP Facility Matters 1.2 384.00
46 Preparation of Fee/Expense Applications 799  22.686.50
47 Preparation of Fee Estimates 5.0 1,600.00
48 Prcparation of Monthly Invoice and Support Schedules 2.4 1,360.00
51 Analyze Asset Sale Proposals 12.9 5,202.50
55 Preparation of Miscellaneous Financial Analysis 5.8 2,207.00
60 Analysis of Turnaround/Operational Plan and Related Maitters 3.0 3,168.00
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COMDISCO, INC.

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/‘#02 00:00:00

ERNST & YOUNG COPORATE FINANCE LLC
SUMMARY OF HOURLY FEES BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PER10D JANUARY 1,2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

Desc

Project
Code Description Hours Fees

69 Non-Working Travel Time 12.0 7,800.00

73 Analysis of Tax Attributes 0.7 382.50

74 Meetings with professionals to discuss case status and develop 6.9 2,962.50
strategy

76 Short-term Cash Flow Projections 23.7 9.152.00

TOTAL HOURS AND FEES _ 2479 99,343

Reduction of Non-Travel time (50" of time incurred) (6.0) {3,900)

241.0 395,443

Less Voluntary Adjustment (32.4) (12,689)

ADJUSTED TOTAL HOURS AND FEES __208.6 __ 582,754
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PROFESSIONAL

Coampbell, Keith

Guiventi, John

Grivetti, John

Francn, 1uig

Franco, Luis

Franen, 1.uia

Grivetti, Joln

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 188 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LIC
RETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CONE

FOR THF. PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THRGUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

DATE rcCn HOLURS DESCRIFTION _

11072402 1 0,5 Drisewas roaults of Uisecured Credidors mestite weth team.

L/n/za02 1 04 . Review and edit of work plan for an analysis of ventures portfolio and discugsions
with L.Franco regarding same.

/1672002 1 0.5 Preparation of wark plans discussions regarding biiling issies,

171772002 1 0.8 Review of recent court filinge for Comdisco.

11172002 L 0y Ruview of recent court filings for Comdisca.

12aro02 1 1.3 Review of recent Comdisen news and histary, beginning prior 10 the tiling to the
present.

1/28/2002 1 14 Freparation of wurkplan for distribaition 1o 5. Nallingur.

1 Tota] %8

Desc
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COMBISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERETY BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THRQUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

PROFESEIONAL DATF. FCD HOURS DESCRIPTION

Cirivetti, John 1/8/2002 3 07 Review of recently received Movember weekly cash flows.

Frongo, Luis 17942002 3 Q% Ruview of recently received November weekly caah flows.

Campball, Keith 1/9/2042 3 L9 Summarize Arthur Andersen responsea to Ditect SCAA queations, genciate
additivnn] follow up questivns including review of 8/%/01 retention and severancy
arder.

Franco, Lais LA 172002 3 0.8 Review of material presented at Cotumittes meating on 1/9/02.

Frango, Luis 11172002 3 0% Heview af ohjeetion to CDO motion to sell L.P. parthetship agreaments without
furthet ¢ourt approval,

Cirivetti, John 1/14/2002 3 19 Anslyeed filed 104K,

Franca, Luis 1/14/2002 3 1.3 Read and review ragently filed 10-K.

Franeao, Luis 1/16/2002 3 &1 Review of current divestiture anelysis as prepared by Larard and Managemeni's
presentation ta the Cottniltes.,

Grivelti, Juhn 1/16/2042 3 0.7 Reviewsed lateat Lazard unalysis and Cotnpany presentation to the Comtiitlos.

Grivedi, John 11773002 3 04 Review of recent cowt lings for Comdiseo.

Miller, David 1/18/2002 k] 03 Review of presentation to Creditors’ Committee,

Miller, David 173272002 3 0.5 Review of Company's SG& A analysis,

Francw, Luis 1/23/2002 3 23 Review of recontly received purchase agrocinent schedules for sales of clectronica
and Inh & seience vertivals to Gl
Discusaion with engagemonl loam to determing work pla regarding purcbase price

Grivetti, John /2872002 3 0.3 Review of recantly Filed bankruptey schedules

Miller, Duvid 173172002 3 03 Review of year cod Form 1K filing.

3 Total 151

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/46/02 00:00:00
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COMDISCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LL(:
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT C(DF
FORTHE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 1, 2H12

FROFESSIONAL _ DATE  _  rop HOURS DESCREPTION
Gmivetti, John 171472002 4 L7 Discussions with vartnus hondholders cegurding filed 10K and Lhe ralnted fnascial
results.
Miller, David 1/24/2007 4 ns Telephane call with (. Madigan regarding Navember financial and cash balance.
Crivetti, John 1/AL/H0} 4 11 Digcussiuns with I, Dakit and G. Mnter regarding Comdisco European structure

and current case statug.

4 Total 33

Desc
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COMINS00, INC,

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE |LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 YHROUGH JANUARY M, 2002

PROFESSIONAL _ DATE PCI HOMIRS DISCRIFTION

Franga, Luig 1732002 5 0.g Ireparntian of work plan for an analysis of ventures partfolio,

Grivetti, John 1/3/2002 5 0.4 Review and edit of wark plan for an analysis of ventures partfolio.

Mitler, David 171572002 5 0.9 Working with I. Grivetd and L. France regarding information Tequesty and
diligence program,.

Cicivetti, John 17132002 3 09 Drigcussion with D.Miller and L. Franco regarding itdarmation requests ang
diligence program,

Grivetti, Joha 1/15/2042 5 0.7 Edit of cash flow question list to be presented to ihe company.

Franco, 1.uis 171572002 5 L Creation and compilation of requeat List o be sybmitred. Review of prior request
lists to ibcorparnts previously requested items that have tot yet heen reccived.

Franco, Luis 1/1%/2u02 5 0.6 Beview and revise recent intormatios request list.

Eranco, Iuis L718/2002 5 L1 Creativn and compilation of request list to be submitied. Review of prior request
lists to incorpornte previously requested itsms that have not yet been received.

Franco, Luix 1/16/2002 5 nG Review and revise most recent request lisl

Millet, David 1/1R/2602 b 1.1 Working with I.. Franco and ). Grivetti regarding updated master requicat list.

Grrivetti, John L/18/2002 5 1.1 Discussions with L. Franco and D.Miller regarding updared master request list,

Frameo, L 11182002 5 7 Review and revise information requast dated January 18, 2002,

Franco, Luis 1/21/2002 5 1.1 Preparation fur and panticipation in conference oot with K. Krakora of Acthar
Andersen regarding review of information request fist dnta Jan. 18, 2007,

Miller, David 1/23/2002 5 4 Wurking with ). Girivetti and L. Franco regarding Committce reguests for assut sule
data.

Grivetti, Juhn 17232002 5 n4 Waorking with L.Millar and L. Franco regarding Committes requests for asset sale
data,

Grivetri, Jubn 1/29/2002 3 Q.5 Unpdnte from Arthur Andersen regarding information request lst.

Franeo, Luis 11292002 5 ns Update from Arthur Anderaon cegarding informatinn request provided on Jai. 18,
and update to Cotnmittes members un progregs.

Miller, David 1730/2002 5 01 Update with L. Franca regarding status of information requeats.

5 Total

129

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC.
ERNYET & YOING CORPORATE FINANCE 11O
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED RY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIGD JANUARY 1, 201 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2007

PROFESSIONAL DATE  PCD HOURS DESCRIPTION

Van Vuren, Erik 1/3/2002 6 2.1 Transition of work from EYCF Atlanta.

& Tatsl 2,1

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LL(C
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/16/02 00:00:00

_. PROFESSIONAL DATE PCD HOTURS DESCRIPTION
Gllsichenhaus, Stuart 1/8/2002 ] 4.0 Review of financial information of Comdisca,
Cileichenhaus, Sluart 1/14/200% 9 1.0 Review of financial infarmation of Comdizcn.
Glaichenhaug, Stuart 1/15/2002 ] t.o Review of financial information of Comdisce.

Tutml 60

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/16/02 00:00:00
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COMDISCO, INC,

ERNST & YQOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD JANUARY |, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 3, 100

Miller, David

Grivetti, John

Grivettd, John

Grivestti, Inhn

Francn, T.uia

Miller, David

Grivettt, John

DATE FCD HOURS DESCRIFTION

L7&/2n02 U] 03 Conferciice with 5, Gleichenhans and ). Griveti mgording cash Noves ind SG&A
analysig,

17872002 10 0.8 Conference call with 8, Gleichethaus and Dn Miller regarding cash flaws and
SG& A annlysis.

1/R2002 e O.R Conference call with D. Miller, 5. Gleichenhaus regarding cash flows and S0 A
analysis.

171672002 10 0.4 Analyze cusrent book value of Eurapean operations and ventures busiscss,

/162002 n 1.4 RReview and reavarch into gurrent book valye of Bwpean operations and venmreg
business, per request by Lazard,

173072002 10 a2 Working with L. Franco regarding sash flows Analyeia.

1/3172002 1 o8 Praparation for and participetion in confarence coll with Arthur Anderson regarding
caah flows.

10 Totul 53

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL

Pleading Page 195 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DRETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PRCMECT ('GDE
FOR THE FERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROWIGH JANUARY M, 2003

Choguatts, Andrew

Choquette, Andrew

_ _DATE . FCD HOURS DESCRIPTION
17872002 It 1.1 Review af October monthly nperating report from fuderal flings,
119/2002 11 23

Cour filing search for monthly aperating reports.

U Toal  a3a

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC,

ERNST & YOUNG CORFPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY L, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

FROVERSIONAL DATFE BECD HOURS DESCRIPTION

Willinma, Michael 11672002 15 0% Telephons eall with I, Griveni regnrding international tux planning status and uther
reluted matterg,

Willinma, Michael 22002 13 L] Follaw-up caordination related to intenationql tax rlanming witl: A. Yoortmag, M.
Falzome, 5. Thompsan and John Grivettj,

Willinme, Michael 173472002 13 0ns Preparatian for and parlicipation in conforence call with A, Yooulmnn, 8.
Thempaon and N, Falzane regarding internationgl fax SthlcLuring opportinities,

Willinma, Michasl 172472002 13 1.5 Read international tax planning execytive sumitary.

Thompaoun, Sean 172472002 13 49 Telephone cntl with M Williams regarding potentn! imteonntional planning
opportonities for Creditorns {ommiltee,

Willinma, Michae] 1725/24H)2 13 03 Revisions to intermational tax platning gummary.

Willieme, Michael 1/28/2002 13 20 Revise inlernational planning memo for Creditors Comtittes,

13 Total 2.5

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/16/02 00:00:00
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COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THRQUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE PCD 1I{MIRS § DESCRIPTION
Franco, Luis 1/8/2002 25 0.8 Telephone call with AA and eoinpany to discuss queetions on the direct S&A detal
provided an 12/21/01.
Campbell, Keith 17872002 15 0.g Phane call with K., Krakora from Arthur Andereen to discuss direct 5G&A
forecasts.

25 Tatal 1.6

Desc
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3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1048/02 00:00:00
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COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE L1i-
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROVECT CODF,
FOI: THE FERIOD JANIARY I, 2001 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

FROFESSIONAL DATE PCD HOURS
Gteichenhaus, Stuart 17772002 15 2.0
Miller, Dravid 1/8/2002 6 (E]
Grivetti, John 1/8/2002 26 0.8
Grivetti, John 171072002 ] 2.0
Gleichenhaus, Srart 11072002 26 23
(Heichenhaus, Stuarl 1/16/2002 26 30
Millee, David 172372002 26 0.5
Miller, David 17252002 16 a.z
Gleichznhaug, Stuart 1/28/2002 26 0.4
Milter, David 1/28/2002 25 0.4
Miller, David 173072002 26 a4
Gleichenhgus, Stuart 173172002 26 25
Miller, David 173172002 28 1.0

26 Total ns

DESCRIPTION

Telephone call with §. Dullinger of Citihank 1o preparc for 1/10/02 meeting,

Conference with R, Thomton and 8. Bellinger regarding meeting agendn and
diligence isgucs.

Conference call with R, Thomton and &, Doliinger regarding mesting sgenda and
diligence ixsues,

Preparatiom for and participation in ctecditar conimittas meeling with the Debtor
and its protessionals.

Meeting with Creditors Committes and Comdisco.

Telephone catl with 8. Dollinger of Citihank.

Telephone cnil with 5. Dolliiger regarding information request sent to Company,

Dialog with . Thotnton and 8. Gleichenhaus regardiog meating this week.

Telephone call with 5. Dollinger of Citihank,

Discussinng with &. Mollinger and 8. (fleichenliaus regarding coordibaiion tor
upeoming mestings.

Prepacation for ineeting with Uitibank, Committes Chair,

Telephone eall with %, Dollinger and R Tharmten af Citibank.

Mesting with 5. Gleichenhaus, R, Thormton and 5. Dallinger regarding leasing galo,
wark plan, inforniation gatering nnd Billings.

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED RY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 TIIROUGH JANUARY 31,2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE _ _ FCD HOURS DESCRIFTION

Van Vurem, ik 113172002 36 1.2 Preparation of Fee/Expense Application

36 Tneal 1.2

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC.
ERNET & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAHN. OF SERVICES RENDERFED BY FROJECT CODE.
FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 3, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE PCD HOURS DESCRIFTION _
Ingles, Beatrce 1172002 46 1.p Freparation of July-Devembar 200] Fue/lixpense Application,
Ingles, Bratrics 17212002 16 1.5 Freparation of July-December 2001 Fea/Expense Application.
Ingles, Beatrice 17272002 16 1.5 Frepneation of July=Negember 2001 Fee/BExpense Applicaticn.
Ingles, Beatrice 1733002 18 10 Preparation of Tuly-Pecember 2001 Fee/Exprnse Application.
Cirivetti, John /772002 16 Lo I'reparation of Fee/Tipense Application.

Grivesti, Inhn 17772002 46 0.9 Prepuration of Feo/Expense Application,

Ingles, Beatrice 1/R/2002 46 1.0 Preparatiun of July-December 2001 Fea/lixpense Application,
Grivetti, Johm 17972002 44 i.5 Preparation of Fee/Bxpense Applicatinn,

Grivetti, lohn 1/4y2002 46 1.5 TPreparation of Fes/tixpenae Application,

Inglex, Reatrice 171042002 48 10 Preparntion of July-Derember 2001 Fee/Expense Application
Cuivetti, John /L1202 46 1.1 Proparation of Feo/bxpanse Application.

Tnglea, Beatrice LTL/20402 45 24 Preparation of July-December 2001 Fee/Fxpense Appligation.
Ingles, Baatrice 171142002 46 03 Revigions ta July-Decemher 2001 Fae/Fxpenac Application,
Grivetti, Johty JEA R ¥rilil] 46 1.1 Preperation of Fee/tixpense Application,

Ciriventi, John 171472002 16 1.1 Treparation of Fes/Txpense Applicntion.

Ingles, Reatrice 1/14/2002 46 (3 Eevisions to July-December 208 Fee/Expense Application.
Ingles, Bentrice 1/14/2002 46 1o Revisions ta July-December 2001 Fee/Fxpense Applicaticn.
Ingles, Reatrice 171472002 45 0.5 Revisiang ta July-December 2001 Fea/Expense Application
Grivewi, lohn 111442002 46 L0 Preparntion of Fee/Tixpense Application,

Ingles, Bentrice /1372002 4 10 Revisions to July-December 2001 Fee/Expeie Application.
Ingles, Bentrice 1 1672002 46 Lo Revisions to July-Dacember 2001 Fee/Expense Application,

Ingles, Reatrice 1/17/2002 16 1.0 Preparation ufl’ Fee/Expaise Application.

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC,

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE 11.C
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGIH JANUARY 31, 2002

PHOFESSIONAL DATE FCD HOURS DESCRIPTION
Ingles, Beatrize 17187200} 46 ] Preparation af Fee/Expense Application.
Ingles, Bealtice /2042002 46 15 FPraparation of Fee/Expense Application.
Ingles, Beatrice 1/21/2002 a4 2.5 Preparation of Feg/Expense Application.
Ingles, Beatrice 1/22/2002 4 2.5 Preparation of Fee/Expenze Application.
Miller, David 142372002 46 1o Review and revise fee application schedules.
Miller, David 1/23/2002 46 0.5 Working with ). Girverti regarding written feo application.
Omivetti, Joho L/23/2002 Ab 39 Adjustments on the written Fes Application draft and discussions with . Miller
regarding same.
Ingles, Reatrice 1r23/2002 45 s Preparntion of Fee/lixpense Application.
Witliams, Michacl 172472402 46 0.5 Discussion with 3. Cirivetti regarding fee applications,
Criventi, John 1/24/2002 a6 1.5 Preparation of Fee/Expenue Application.
Ingles, Beatrices 1/24/2002 A6 4.5 Preparation of Fee/Expenss Application.
Grivett, John 1/24/2002 44 K| Preparation of Feo/Hxpense Application,
Willinmg, Michasl L/a5/2002 16 1.0 Reviewed and ravised description from N. Falzane regarding tee applications,
Grivetti, John 12572002 46 L33 Preparation of Fes/Tixpensc Applicntion for §. Tollinger.
Ingles, Beatrige 1/2%5/2002 44 h 1] Breparation of Fec/Expense Application,
Grivetti, John 1/25/202 16 07 Prepneation of Fee/Fxpense Application fo §. Dallinger.
Griventi, John 17252002 45 dh Cantinued preporation of Fee/lixpense Application and relatsd analysis.
Lirivetti, John 17272002 db 4.5 Continued preparntion of FesfTixpense Application and related aualysis.
Miller, David 1/738/2002 16 0.4 Review draft of first interio fue application,
Ingles, Reatrice 17282007 16 ] I'reparation of Fee/Txpense Application,
Miller, David 17292002 44 ns Final review of'tes Bpplication and related schediles.

Desc
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PFRIFESSIONAL

DATE

Ingles, Nentrice

Miller, Navid

Grivetti, John

Tngleg, Buatrice

Ingles, Bealrice

Van Yuren, Mrik

172972002

173072002

173072002

1/30/2002

173172002

173172002

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1046/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 202 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SFRVICES RRNDERED BY PROJECT CODRE
FOR THE. FERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

D HOWRS DESCRIPTION

46 240 Prepurntion of Fee/Expense Application,

46 0.4 Telophome call J. Grivetti regarding finnl cotnments on initial foe application.
46 DA Telephane call D. Miller regarding final comments on initial Fee Application.
46 15 Preparation of Fee/Expense Application.

46 1.5 Preparation of Fee/Expense Application.

46 30 Preparation of Fee/Expense Application. Sent to D). Milter tor review.

46 Total 79y

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLI:
RETAIL OF SERYICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 200

/02 00:00:00

PROVESSIONAL DATE _._ MDD HOLURS DESCRIITION
Van Vuren, Erik 1/23/2002 17 20

Review of December billing information.

Van Vuren, Mk 1/25/2002 47 in Revisians to August Novemher billing

47 Total 30

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETA!L OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PRCMECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOT JANUARY 1, 202 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

FROFESSIONAL ~~ DATE rCD HOURS DESCRIETION
Miller, David [/22/2002 4% 2.0 Review of July, Angust, Saptember, October and Noventbor draft fe and expenses
invoices.
Miller, David L2R/2002 43 0.2 Digeussinng with 1. Cirivetti regarding billing matiers,
Griveni, John 1/28/2002 48 "2 Niscussions with 1.Miller regacding billing matters,

48 Totul 1.4

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCF LLC
DETAIL (}F $ERVICES RENDFERED BY FROJFCT CODE
F(1R THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

PFROFESSIONA L DATE FCD HOLUBRS DESCRIFTION

{irivetti, John 1732042 51 kR Revicw and diseussion of Company's proposed sale ot 4 eAisting Lnteresty in
venture capital funds and discussions with L France, 4.CGleichenhaus, and 5.
Diollinger.

Frango, Luis 1/2/2002 51 1.3 Review and discussion of [ ompany's proposed sale of 4 existing interests in
VENtW e capital fimds,

Camphell_ Keith 1/7/2002 31 1.5 Research Coller Capital transaction with Lugent 1o detarmine the poasibilities of
selling the Cenndisco venture partfulio.

Camphell, Keith 17872002 51 &) Obtait publicly available infurmation an Comdiseo ventre portfolio and review
congidering potential suitors.

Cumphell, Keith 1/9/2002 k| 1.5 Reacarch Caller Capital and other patential funditng sources for Venturs Portfolin,

Miller, Navid 1/14/2002 51 o1 Leaging cate rasults review.

Grivetti, John 172372002 51 35 Digeusgions with R.Hanson and Acthur Anderson representatives regarding
electronice purchase price allocation jzsues and review of related documents.

B Total 129

Desc
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COMDISCO, INC,
EXNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FPROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 11, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE FLD HOURS DESCRIFTION
Miller, David L/%/2002 54 Qs Warking with 1., Franca regarding cash balunces pnd §G&.A analysia,
Miller, David 171672002 55 0.5 Review and ailalyze potential vonture portflio analysis.
Francoe, Luis 1/25/2002 55 11 Preparation of cash flow based on weekly domestic cash flaws.
Franvo, Luis 1/30/72002 55 1.5 U'repnration of cash tlow analysis.
Franco, Luis LA1/2002 35 12 Detniled compilation of consoliduted cash flow based on October and Novensber

55 Tatal

8

information presented.

Desc



01-24795 Doc 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/16/02 00:00:00
case Pleading Page 207 of 267

COMDLSCHD, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES HRENDERED 8Y PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

FROFESSIONAL DATE D HUURS . DESCRIPTION
Franco, Iaig 1/2/2002 &0 kX Analysis of récently received breakdown of direct SG&A.
Cirivetti, Juhn 1371002 40 4.3 Review of recently received bregkdown of projected direct SG&A and haadeount

und provide comments to L.Francg,

Frango, Luig 17372002 60 12 Review of vccently received breakdown of projected dircot $CGd& A and haadeount.

Frunco, Luig I/t1/2007 bl 12 Completed summary of discussion with A A/company regarding direet SG&A
detail, along with additional follsw-up on both direct and indirect BG&A ilems,

Frangp, Luis L/TL/2002 60 1.1 Diseusion and preparation of work plan for review of CD0 ventures partfolio and
business,

Franco, Luia 11&/2007 2] 1.1 Follow.up call with Arthur Andersen regarding $G&A questions, Write-up
Suinmary of 3G& A questions. Revised & updated request lists to reflact answers to
5G& A questions.

60 Total a0

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/46/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 208 of 267

COMDISCO, 1ML,
ERNST & VOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LI
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CObE
FOR THE. PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE FOD HOURS DESCRIFTION
Cleichenhaus, Stuart 1/9/2002 69 60 Non-working traval time,
Citeichenhaus, Stuart 171172002 a9 6.0 Nan-working travel time.

69 Toal 120

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/16/02 00:00:00 Desc
8 Pleading Page 209 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,
ERNET & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT COD#
FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2012

PROFESSIONAL. _ _ DATE __ pn HOLRS

DESCHRIPTION
Millgr, David 172%/2m2 73 a3 Feview draft of tax imcmorandum.
Mitler, David 173072002 73 2 Teiephone call with J. Grivett regarding international tan analysis.
Cirdvetti, Joln 173072002 73 0.2

Telephons call with T, Miller cegarding intermationnl tpx analysis.

73 Total 0.7



Case 01-24795 Doc

PROFESSIONAL

{rivetri, Jobhn

Franca, .uis

Franco, Luix

Miller, David

Cirivetti, Juhn

Cicvetti, Jlohn

Franeo, Luis

Millee, David

riveiti, fohn

Franco, Luis

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1046/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 210 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

NATE PCD HOUKS DESCRIPTION

L/RMI002 74 1] Update valts with E&Y team to discuss progrege on the fallowing iems. 5G&A
Eollow-up questions and dissemingtion (0 the company. Opensitems and up roming
Committes meeting.

L/&2002 74 1.1 Updute calls with E&Y team Lo discuss progress on the following itema. SCaA
follow-up questions and dissemination 0 the company. Opet-itens 2nd up coming
Commities meering,

1/10/2002 T4 0.3 Updute with B&Y-team lenders on Unsssured Creditors Commiltes mesting,

141142002 74 0.5 Telephene call with J. Girivetti and 8. {ileichenhaus regarding Commites mesking
end impact on lenging austion.

171172002 74 n.s Telephate call with I, Miller and 5. Gleichenhaus tegarding Comtnittes mecting
nnd impact on leasing auction,

1/25/2002 74 1.0 Telephone call with 8. Dollinger regarding the progress nnd approach to nnalyzity
and requesting infonmation from CDO.

1/23/2002 74 1.2 Telephone call with 8. Dollinger regarding the progreas and approach to pnalyziog
and requesting information from CDO.
Furwarded information request to [agzard and upiedpted group.

1/24/2002 74 a4 Conferenca with J. Griverti and L. Fruneop regarding statug of OLfrmation requests
and new work plan itetns.

172472002 74 0.4 Confervace with T Miller and L. Franca regarding status of infotrmatinn Tequests
nnd new work plan jtems.

172472002 74 0.4 Diigeussion with engagement team reyarding approach to nequiting information
trom the Company and ungoing lack el response.

74 Total 6,9

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

3-1

Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 211 of 267

COMIMSCO, INC.

ERNST & VOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLU
DETALL (}F SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD JANEHARY 1, 2002 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2002

FROFESSIONAL DATR PCD ROURS DESCRIFTION .

Van Vuren, Enk 1/7/2002 H 25 Merged cash flow information into consolidated file.

Grivetti, Juhn 1/7/2002 76 3l Review of manthly cash flaws and diseussions with 8. Dollinger regarding
restruGiutitiy expenses and equipment purchases

Camyphell, Kuith 1/8/2002 Th 0.8 Confercnuy vall with team ta discuss preparation of eash flow for Laszard,
coordination with Arthur Andersen, und reviaw af direct $G& A expenses.

VYan Vuren, Erik 1/8/2002 76 2.9 Added November information intn cash How files,

Campbell, Keith /92002 76 1.2 Estitniats March 2402 cash flaws based on December business plab.

Franeo, Luis 11972002 76 L& Analysis ol protection roll-forward cash halpnce pg of 3-31-02 based oty actual
repults through Movembar 2001,

Franeo, Luis 179720452 76 2.8 Completion, review and distribution of projected rolt-forward caah balance as of 3-
31-02 baged on August theough November actual weakly cash flows,

Grivetti, Joha 11902002 e 17 Preparation of eliti-term cash Aow projectian thraugh 3/31/02.

Franco, Luiz /1572002 i) R Additional review of Qutoher and Movaember cash flow guestiona with focus on
September and Cotober.

France, Luis /1572002 76 B Analyeia and compilation of cash flow questions for Qetober and November.

Grivetti, John 173072002 76 1.5 Reviewed and ¢dited lutest cash fow projection.

Grivetti, Johu 173172003 74 0.9 Reviewed and ediled luest cash flow projection.

76 Tatal BT
Grund Tatal

147.0
———

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 212 of 267

COMDISCQ, INC
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY PROFESSIONAL
FOR THE PERIOD FEBRUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2002

PROFESSIONAL POSTTION RATE HOURS FEES

Restructuring Advisory Services

Glcichenhaus, Stuart  Managing Director $650 1.0 $650
Miller, David Managing Director 575 9.9 5,693
Grivetti, John Director 475 39.0 18,525
Franco, Luis Associate 340 57.4 19,516
Van Vuren, Enk Associate 320 3.0 a60
Ingles, Beatrice Chent Serving Associatc 140 17.0 2,380
Subtotal 127.3 47,724
Ernst & Young LLP

Tax Consulting Services
Williams, Michacl Principal $605 8.5 5,143
Thompson, Sean Scnior Manager 580 1.5 870
Sherman, Richard Senior 275 4.3 1,183
Koepke, Kathy Staff 44 1.5 66
Subtotal 15.8 7,261
TOTAL 143.1 54,985
Less Voluntary Adjustment (21.1) (7,655)

122.0 $47,330



Case 01-24795 Doc 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1@/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 213 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,

ERNST & YOUNG COPORATE FINANCE LLC

SUMMARY OF HOURLY FEES BY PROJECT CODE

FOR THE PERIOD FEBRUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2002

Project
Code Description Hours Fees
1 Planning, Supervision, Administration and Review 62 % 242850
3 Review Newly Received Documents 10.2 3.468.00
4 General Communications with Unsecured Creditors 22 1,105.00
5 Preparation and Review of Info. Requests and Related Matters 17.0 7,035.50
9 Analysis of Long-Term Business Plan and Related Matters 1.2 570.00
10 Analysis of Current Operating Resulls and Relatcd Maiters 4.7 1,950.50
including Cash Flow and Availability
11 Review and Analysis of Monthly Operating Results 5.8 2,490.50
13 Analysis of Tax Related Matters 10.8 5,446.50
18 Analysis and Reconciliation of Filed Claims 0.6 227.50
25 Preparation and Participation in Mcelings and Conference Calls 9.6 4,650.00
with Debtors and Debtors Professionals to Discuss Status and
Develop Strategy
206 Prepare Information for and Participation in Meetings with the 3.8 1,860.50
Unsecured Creditors Committee
46 Preparation of Fee/[xpense Applications 238 5,215.00
48 Preparation of Monthly Invoice and Support Schedules 11.1 3.949.50
55 Preparation of Misccllancous Financial Analysis 17.4 7,167.50
73 Analysis of Tax Attributcs 2.8 1,130.00
74 Mectings with profcssionals to discuss casc status and develop 3.6 1,737.50
strategy
76 Short-term Cash Flow Projections 12.3 4,552.50



Case 01-24795 Doc 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 214 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG COPORATE FINANCE L1.C
SUMMARY OF HOURLY FEES BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERTOD FEBRUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2002

Project
Code Deseription Hours Fees

TOTAL HOURS AND FEES l4g 54,985

2L1) (7,655)

Less Voluntary Adjustment
122.0 $47,330

TOTAL ADJUSTED HOURS AND FEES



Case 01-24795 Doc

PROFESSIONAL

Miller, David

Girivetid, John

Milter, David

Ciriverti, Joln

Miller, Navid

Koepke, Kathy

Giriverti, John

DATE

02/05/02

02/0%/02

02/05/02

0207402

Q211702

a2/13/02

1/25/2002

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 215 of 267

COMDISC, INCL

ERMNST & YOUNL CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FUULTHE PERIOD FEBRUARY 1, X2 THROWGH FEBRUARY 18, 2002

rCD HOURS DESCRIFTION

1 s

| (U]
1 0.5
1 1.7
1 .5
1 1.5
L b2

Diigcnssion with J. Grivewld regarding Cotmittes delivernbles and near wrm work
plan,

Discussion with [2.Miller regarding Committee deliverabhies and near wro work
plan.

Review uf analysis of EYCF deliverables for Citibank.

Reviewed and edited summary of work produced to send to Citibank.

working with L. Pranco tegarding preparution uf package of finaneial infermation
for 8. Dollinger of Citibank,

Preparation of Comdisco comespanduce.

Preparntion of interal swfll reviews for Condisce engagement.

L Tolal &2

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

PROFESSIONAL

Franeo, Luis

Franco, Luis

Freaneo, Luia

Franco, Luis

Franco, Luis

Franen, Luis

DATE

02/01/02

02/05/02

021302

02/13/02

02/14/02

02/23/02

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 216 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORFORATF FINANCE LLL!
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERET BY PROMECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD FEBRUARY 1, M2 THROUGH FERRUARY 23, 2002

FCD

3 Total

HOLURS DESCRIFTION

Bieview of recent court motions invalving Mank of Fakya - Mitsubishi and Mellen
Bank to Set-Off against prepetition amaunis owed.

Breview of recently filed court motions.

Bevicw of documents received from the Company.
Review ot newly received filcs, including cail with Arthur Anderson eegredingg
determination of lease tape detail and reconciliation.

Heview of newly received documents and files. Filex seut to Lazard.

Review of recently received ventures infurmiation.

10.2

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

FROFESSIONAL

Grivetti, John

Milter, David

Grivetti, Inhn

Miller, Mavid

DATE

02/07/02

021502

/1302

02/20402

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 217 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCEF, L1
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED RY PROJFCT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD FEERUARY I, 2002 THROUGH FEBRUARY 23, 2002

PCD

3

4 Total

HOURS DESCRIFTION

13

0.3

03

Diccusaions with M. Ferko regarding case status.

Meeting with J. Grivetti and L. Franco reganding inforimation received.

Meeting with D, Miller and 1.. France regarding miormaticn received.

Telephone call with I, Brecker reyanding case sialus and recrganization eptions.

1

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

FPROFESSIONAL

Franen, Luis

Griverti, John

France, Luis

Crivetti, John

Crrivettt, John

Cimveltt, Julm

Ciriwettt, Joln

Grivetti, Joln

Franco, Lwis

Ciriveld, Juhn

Franco, Luis

Grivetti, John

France, Luis

TFranco, |.aix

DATE

02/01/02

0206102

02/06/02

020702

/72002

O2/0%/02

27872002

02/11/02

212002

02/ 1a/02

02/ 14/02

02/26/02

02/26/2

G202

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1046/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 218 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE L1.C
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT C'ODF.
FOit THE PERIOD FEBRUARY 1. 2002 THROUGH FEBRIJARY 28, 2002

PCD

3

& Total

IOURS

¥

04

o}

0.9

a9

o

2.0

17.0

DESCRIFTION

Review of information requeat nnd update e-mail to key Commiltee menthets.
Reviewed and edited Tequest list regarding S(id&A projeetions.
Editing of request list dated Feb. 6. 2003 gnd submission e Comnntee fior

COofmnchis.

Prepared information request lists and forwardesd o 5. Dollinger.
Prepared information request lists amd forwarded w 8. Dollinger.
Reviswed S.MNollinger comments, cdited lawsy requeat lists, and forwarded to R.

Mishler.

Revirwud %.0allinget comments, edited lateat request lists, and forwarded o R.
Mishler.

Preparation for and participation i conference calh with R.Mishler regarding our
vetilures request list.

Updated information tequest and receivesd master hist.

Preparation of g-mail to R.Mishier regarding adininisirative requests around the
monthly intormatian package.

Asscnbly ol case marterialg for 3. Dollinger,

Discussions with Andersen team regarding outstanding iterns and formulation off
nexl teguest list.

Conversation with Arthur Andersen team regarding outstanding icms and
formulation of next request Tist.

Reconciliation of recently received ventures mfotmation with request list dated Feb,
8, Revisions to master request lest.

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 219 of 267

COMIMACY, TNC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
BETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FUL THE PERIOD FEBRUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2002

FROFESSIONAL TATE FCD HOURS DESCRIFTION

Cinlvetti, John 02/05/02 o 1.2 Reviewed analyses reparding SCidA projections.

% Total 1.2

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

PROFESSIONAL

Miller, David

Franco, Luia

Franco. Luis

Miller, David

Miller, David

Miller, David

DATE

02/13M02

Qx/13/02

n2fisiz

O2/20/02

22002

N2/22/02

FCD

10

10 Total

03-1

Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/16/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 220 of 267

COMDISCO, 1N,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLO
DETAILF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD FEBRUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2002

HOLRS

04

2l

0.2

0.6

[

DESCRIPTION

Eeview of Novemnber package sent by Company.

Lipdale of weekly cash flow to include December numbets.

Ditalt ol unswers to 1. Miller cash flow questions on consolidated cash flow.

Buview of foreign bplance sheet.

Review of (11 Farm 10-0.

Review of budyet versus actual cash 1lows and discuss same with L. Franco.

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

PRUOFESSIONAL

Franco, Luis

Miller, David

Grivetti, John

Miller, David

Grivetti, John

DATE

0z

u2/13/02

w2132

o2/ 1802

02/20002

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 221 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.

ERN5T & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FPROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERICD FERRUARY |, 2002 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2002

MCD

[}

11 Tota!

HOLURS DESCRIPTI{N

L7

a3

0.7

58

Compilation ot manthly cansolidated cash flow,
Discussion with I, Grivetti and L. Franeo regarding analysis of cash flsws and
monthly packnge.

Drscussion with I.Miller and L. Franco regarding analysis of cash fiows und
monthly ppckage.

Review af Company's Neavermber 2001 monthly financial report {cash Hows, income
stements, comsalidatmy hulabee sheets, and ventures datal

Review af Conpany's November 2001 monthly financial repurt (cash Nows, inceme
stptemenis, consolidating balanee sheets, and ventares data}.

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL

Thompson, Scan

Williains, Michael

Shertuan, Richard

Sheeman, Richard

Williams, Michael

Williams, Michael

Williamns, Michazl

Thompson, Sean

Sherman. Richard

Miller, David

Cirvettt, John

Williamz, Michacl

ranco, Luis

Willigms, Michael

Shermnn, Richard

DATE

02/01/02

02/0R/02

02/08/02

02/08/02

Q27114102

02/12/02

0213402

GL/1302

02/14/02

0201402

Q2715407

02/13/02

021502

QIR0

02/26/02

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 222 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,

ERMAT & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANUE LLO
DETATL OF SERYICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
F{}R THE FERIQD FEBRUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2042

Py

13

13

I3

13

13 Total

HOTIRS

1.0

0.4

03

0.5

.5

03

0.3

.5

0.5

0.5

0.3

108

DESCRIFTION

Conference call wilth heam regarding intemational plaiming opportunities.

Comfereace oIl with 5, Thompson regarding update o international s/
Ihscussions with M. Williams regarding intemational restruciuing and revisions to
sur execitive symmary.

Heview milematiomal memo.

Wrorking with R. Sherman regarding, incoo for M. Felish per 1. Miller.

Driseuszion with ). Grivett regarding status of intemational tax planping memo -
£ollow-up communications with 5. Thinpsom - discussion with I, Grivewd regarding
update 10 exceutive sutrtuary o kex matters and gpproach.

Review and revise an international tax planning memse w 13, Miller.
Revised infernationn! tas planming memo for Creditors Comnsitree.
Review Intenational s meme with M. Willigms and forward to D, Miller and

other metibers of Comdisen tear,

Review of tax update n1iemo and send e-mails ko 8. Dollinger {Citibank) regarding
tax diligence.

Various discussions with M. Williams reganding 1ax projeet status and cogrdination
of potential meeting with the Comdisco lax directer, meluding fallow-np with
5 Drollinger,

Conference call with N. Falzome regarding information needed from Comdiseo o
procecd with updating understanding of Creditors Comimittee,

Review of recently received Lax infonnation.

Responae from I Mitler regarding inguiry Irom Creditors Commiftee.

Comversation with M. Williama regarding interational strwcturing and tax atribute
update,

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc‘S-l Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00

FRIFESSIONAL

Franco, Luis

Mibtler, David

Pleading Page 223 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.
FERNST & YOUNG CORPFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODRF,
FOR THE PERIOD FEBRUARY 1, 1002 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2002

DATE FCD HOURS DESCRIFTION
G2/04/072 1% 0.5 ieview of recently fited motion by Henriquez and 1hward.
2125002 1R 1 Draft of e-mail w &, Dallinger regarding Company claims analysis.

18 Total (X

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

PROFESSIONAL

Miller, Navid

Williamy, Michael

Williatnz, Michael

Williams, Michac]

Sherman, Richard

Sherman, Richard

Sherman, Richard

Mitker, David

Grivetti, John

Grivetti, John

DATE

02/05/02

02/13/02

0205402

02/15/02

Q1502

2/15/02

02/18/02

n2/19/02

R L)

02/1%01

FCD HOURS
15 0.2
15 0.5
25 0.3
25 1D
25 03
25 0.7
25 )
15 uy
25 1.4
25 4.0

1% Total LX)

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/46/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 224 of 267

COMDESCO. TN,

ERNST & YO UNG CORMIRATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL O}F SERVICES RENDERED BY PR{MECT CODE
F(OK THE FERIOD FEBRUARY 1,200 THRULUGH FEBRUARY 1B, 1042

DESCRIFTION

Conference with M. Fazio, §. Dollinger and I. (i vett regarding stand alone plan
and SCidA analysis.

Communications amomg M. Eelish R, Sherman, & Thompson, A, Vooriman, N,
Talzome and J. Ciriveit regarding meeting at Condisco and participatton.

Communicationa with 5. Thompson. A. Veorunan, N. Falzone and R. Sherman
tegatding preparations for tax meeting ar Comdisco with tax management and
Arthur Anderaon.

Conmmunicationa fremm M. Felish rax director of Comdiseo planning and
prafeasionals attending scheduled meeting - Conference call with John Griverti
regarding communications from Creditors Comnittee

Telephone call to M, Felish regarding conflicts with meeting for Feb, 19h and to
reschedule.

Various conversations with M. Williams reparding the rescheduling of the
Comdisce meeting,

Porwnrd messapes to pronp regarding re-scheduling of 1ax meeting.

‘Telephone call with B Mishler reparding, foreipn liabilities and debt obligations.

Preparation for and discuasions with R, Mishler, other Debtor emplovess and
D.Miller regarding foreigm linbilities and debt ebligarions,

Prepnration and edit of analysis of foreiyn und other liahiltties and summary of
relnted discussion with R.Mishler and review of related documents.

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

FROFESSIORAL

Miller, David

Miller, David

Miller, David

Franca, Luis

Millgr, David

Miller, Navid

Cileichenhans, Sl

Franen, Luis

DATE

02/01/01

02/13/02

02/15/02

02/18/02

02/1%/02

n2/22/02

uz/22/02

N2/ARIO2

3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 225 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,

ERNST & YOLNG CORPORATE FINANKCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVIUES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD FEBRUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH FEBRUARY 18, 2003

FCD

26

26

26

26

26

16

rl]

I

26 Total

HOURS

Q.1

0.3

0.3

0z

01

0.3

AR

DESCRIFTION

Telephane cull with 5 Dollinger regarding failure of [T leasing sale,

Telephone call with % Dollinger regarding work plan atatus and newly received
information.

Nialag with 5. Dallinger regarding wx diligence and meeting.
Update congolidated cagh flow breakdewn to include monthiy averaye of FY ended
w30,

Fullow up with 5. Dollinger (Citibank) regarding mesting in NY and mformation
and fire analysis.

Review of c-mails regarding Creditors Committee meeting sl results of conlirence
call.

Call with Suc Dollinger and Randy Thomton and Chaim Fortgany of Clitibank 1o
digeuss Comdisco's plans,

Creation of agenda Tor Friday vall.

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

PROUFESSIONAL

Ingles, Beatrice

Ingles, Beatrice

Vah Yuren, Erik

Ingles, Beatrice

Ingles, Beatrice

Ingles, Bentrice

Millgr, David

Ingles, Bearrice

Ingies, Beatrice

Grivetti, John

Ingles, Neatrice

Inghs, Beatrice

Miller, David

Ingles, Teatnice

Inples, Reatrice

DATE

02/01/2

020142

02/01/02

02/04/02

02/05/02

02/06/02

030802

02711402

02/12/02

P radiind

02/14/02

N2/1%/0%

02/20/02

02/20/02

0272102

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1046/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 226 of 267

COMDLSCD, INC,

ERNNT & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERYICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD FEERUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH FERRUARY 28, 2002

rCD

46

46

At

L1

L1

kL

46

46

46

46

46

46

L1

46

46 Total

HOURS DESCRIFTION

L5

Preparation of Feo/Expense Application.

1.0 Reconcitiation of July/Aug/Sept/Oct/Nov/Diec bills,
3.0 Debiverables hist by CL for D. Miller as support for Fee Application.
1.3 Heconciliation of July/Aug/Sept/Det/Nov/Dec hills.
.5 Hevisions to reconciliation of July/ Awgy/Sept/OctNoviDec bills.
20 reparation of JulyiAup/Sept/OctMNov/Dec Fre/Txpense Applicauon.
0.5 Review and revise detail time enries per discussion with Citibank.
1.0 Preparation of July/Aug/Sept/CotMNov/Dee Fee/Expense Application.
28 Breparation of July/Aug Sept/OctNov/Deg Fra/Txpense Application.
3 Adjusted Pee application files based an comments from 5. Dollinget.
2.0 Revisiona to July/AugSepi/Oct/MoviTee Fee/Expense Application.
1.5 Revisioms o July/Avg/Supt/Oct/Mov/Dec Fee/Expenee Application.
.2 Review and revise draft fee application,
1.0 Preparation of Fee/Expense Application.
20 Preparation of Fee/Fxpense Application.

s

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc@l03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10446/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 227 of 267

COMMISCO, INC.
ERNET & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDFERED BY FRUOJECT CODE
FORTHE PERIOD FEBRUARY |, 2002 THROUGH FEBRUARY 2§, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE PCD HOURS DESCRIFTION
Franco, Luis QX062 4% 1.2 Compilation of support schedules to be submitted o Commitee.
Cirivetti, John 02/07/02 4% 1.2 Compilatiom ot support schedules for July through Movember to be submited w

Committee-

Franco, Luis Q2/07/02 48 21 Qrganizatinn and compilation of schedutes to be submitted ta Committes.

France, Luis 02/07/02 48 2.6 Comnpilation of support schedules for July throvgh Navemnber to be submyitied o
Cammiitee.

France. Luis 02/08/02 48 1.0 Asseinbly af billing suppart to be provided 1o Commillse.

France, Luis 02/08/02 43 1.2 Assemnbly of billing suppart to be provided 1o Comenitiee.

Francn, 1.uis 0211102 48 0.5 Revisions to PCD delivernhle.

Franco, Luis n11/02 48 0.5 Review of delivernhles docwincut.

Franca, Luis 02/12/02 48 07 Final update ol PLIL deliverable, composition of cover letter w %, Dollinger.

4% Total 1.1

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

FROFESSIOMNAL

Grivetti, John

Miller, David

Grivetti, John,

Franco, Luis

Framco, Luis

Franca, Luis

Franco. Luis

Giviventi, John

Franeca, Lok

Frmco, Luis

Grivetti, Jolm

IFranea, Lais

Lirivell, John

DATE

02/13/02

02/19/02

02/19/02

02/19/02

La/19/02

02/1%/02

N2/19/02

02:20/02

02:20/02

v2:21/02

02/22/01

02/2502

022702

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1046/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 228 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERYICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERICOD FEBRUARY 1, 1002 THROUGH FEBRUARY 1B, X002

FCD

i3

53

535

53

35

35

35

55

3%

35

a3

55

£5 Total

HOURS

12

0.3

03

07

0.7

1

174

DESCRIFTION

Review of e latest 12431700 leasing detail files, meluding compatison to /30 files
and variance analysis,

Banking generalization with J. Grivetti and .. Franco regarding analysis of forcign
liabitities.

Digenssion with Dn.Miller and 1. Frunco regurding analysis of foreign liabilitics.

Telephone call with R, Mishler and regarding debl st foretgn entilics.

Revisions to memn detailing foreig babilitics and digoribution o Comminee,
Update conversatiom with Arther Andersen regarding fallow-up itema.

Initial draft of mema to Committee summarizing call with R. Mishler and Arthuy
Andersona today on foreigm debts.

Initial drafi of memo te Committes summarizing call with R. Mishler and Arthur
Andemona kiday on foreign debta,

Tollow up ¢-ruail 10 B.Mishler on additional question Tegarding foreign lahilities
and obligutions and revicw of hig responae.

Follow-up an 219 call on cash Mows and forcign liabilities.

Revisions to projected cash balange as ol 331021 Kevisions to variance analysis of
original eash prajection for December 21 versus actual.

Analyzed 6/30/01 and 12731401 foreign balance sheets t determine coparability,
discussions with 5.Dollinger and R, Mishler regarding same.

Updnte of projected cagh halunce.

Reviewed the venture purtfolio dewil received and foltew wp discussions with
K Phelps of Andersen.

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

FROFESSHINAL

Sherman. Richard

Williams, Michnel

Sherman, Richard

Mittee, David

DATE

Q2/11/02

42/12/02

02/13/02

Q32502

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 229 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,

FREST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
NETAIL (IF SERVIUES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
Fi}R THE FPERIOD FEERUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH FEERUARY 28, 2007

FCD

73

73

73

73

73 Total

HOURS DESUCHKIFTION

JXs]

0.1

Direfl e-tuail 1o M. Felish regarding follow-up information regarding fax athmibutes
and recenl IRuSactons.

LHscuasion witl B Shermian regarding appronch o tax npdate.
Pull information regarding recent transactions and prepars ¢-mail o M. Felish
regarding lua information wpdate.

Semd e-mal to Y. Dollinger regarding tax analyais,

18

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc

FROFESSIONAL

Willigms, Michael

Miller, Mavid

Miller. David

Franco, Luia

Franco, Luia

Miller, David

Crivett, Johm

Miller, David

DATE

02/01/02

02/01/02

0201402

02/04:02

02/14/02

/22

L2/20/02

02/25/02

PR

74

74

74

T4

T4

74

74

74

74 Total

03-1

Filed 10/15/02 Entered 10/46/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 230 of 267

COMIMSC, TN,
ERMET & YOUNC CORPURATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERYICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR TITE FERIGIG FERRLARY 1, 2002 THROUGH FERRUARY 1R, 2M2

HOURS

1.0

0.5

0.1

0.5

ol

a.l

0.3

LR

DESCRIFTION

Preparation R and participation in conference cult with I3, Miller regarding starus
of hamkrupley and 121 considerations related thereto - disc intemational planning
mema with 8. Thompson and W, Falzone,

Confirenee call with M. Willinms and M. Falzone regarding IT leasing sale,
international Lus emo and updating analysis of tax related autributes.

‘I'elephone call with S, Gleichenhaus rewarding 1T leasing sale and Committee
eeting next week,

Update on mesting with 5. Dollinger {Citibank),

[Hacussion with Y engagement Watin on Bext steps based on newly received
information. Piscussiom with 5. Dollinger about information received and next
steps,

Telephone call witl ). CGrivetti regarding M. Fazio resignation and ventoures sus-off.

Telephone call with . Miller regarding M. Fazio resignation and véntares run-off,

‘Telephone call to 8. Gleichenhaus regarding Conmiinee call and reorganization plan
develupinents.

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do 3-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1 /02 00:00:00 Desc
Pleading Page 231 of 267

COMIMSCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF 3ERVICES RENDERET BY FROJECT (CODE
FR THF, PERIUOD FEERUARY 1, 2002 THROUGH FERRUARY 28, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE FCD HOURS DESCRIFTION
Trancy, Luis 02/ 19402 76 2.3 Lpdate of cobsolidated cash flows to include Sepiember mfonnation received today.
Franeo, Luis N2/20/02 T 1.7 Lipdate cash flow analysis to include in Seplember cash fows forecast.
Miller, [avid 02/21407 76 02 Warking with J. Grivetti regarding cash balance analysis fur Continittee.
Linvettd, Jalim nAIn2 76 0.2 Warkitlg with D.Miller regarding cash balance analysis for Cenumitee.
Franco, Luis n2/21/02 T |} R.evisions to projected cash balance as of 3/31/021. Revisions to variance analysis of

original cash projection for December 21 versus actual.

Griverti, Jobn 02/21/02 iy (] Reviewed and edited projected sash balance analyzia,
Franco, Luwis 02/22j02 G 1.4 Update of monthly cash roll ferward.
Franco, Luis 02/25/02 G 1.3 Lpdate of projected vash balance.
Miller, David N2/2501 76 04 Working witle L. Franco regarding analysis of Decemhur 2001 and 02 2002 cash
flows.
Citivetri, John 02/26/02 76 [z Review and edit of updated cash {low prajection and variance analysis,
Franca, Luis 0227/ TG 1.5 Updnte tn cush vanance analysis.
16 Total 1.3

Girand Total 143.1
—



Pleading Page 232 of 267

Case 01-24795 Do%OS-l Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1&3/02 00:00:00 Desc

COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY PROFESSIONAL
FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2002 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2002

PROFESSIONAL POSITION RATE HOURS

FEES
Restructuring Advisory Services
(Gleichenhaus, Stuart Managing Director $650 34.8 22,620
Miller, David Managing Director 575 254 14,605
(Grivetti, John Director 475 1.2 570
Franco, Luis Associate 340 89.4 30,396
Leas, Jaclyn Analyst 275 18.6 5,115
Ingles, Beatrice Client Serving Associate 140 95 1,330
Subtotal 178.9 74,636
Ernst & Young LLF
Tax Consulting Service
Williams, Michael Principal $605 18.5 11,193
Fahrenbach, Robert 584 0.5 292
Sherman, Richard Scnior 275 16.8 4,620
Mills, Flizabeth Financial Management Advisor 175 1.6 280
Koepke, Kathy Staff 44 1.0 44
Subtotal 384 16,429
Human Resource Services
Kalfen, Donald Partner $589 80.4 47,356
Stocckel, Gregory 512 1.9 973
Boggs, Kimberly Senior 286 79.4 22,708
Ein, Susan 215 1.0 215
Subtotal 162.7 71,252
TOTAL 380.0 162,316
Reduction of Non-Working Travel Time (50% of time incurred) (16.3) (8,862)
Less Voluntary Reduction (33.1) (11,165)
330.6 $142,289




Case 01-24795 Do‘OB-l Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1“3/02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 233 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG COPORATE FINANCE LLC

SUMMARY OF HOURLY FEES BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2002 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2002

Project
Code Description Hours Fees
1 Planning, Supervision, Administration and Review 64 % 2,201.50
3 Review Newly Received Documents 14.3 5,219.00
4 General Communications with Unsecured Creditors 52 2,144.00
5 Preparation and Review of Info. Requests and Related Matters 14.9 5,039.00
13 Analysis of Tax Related Matters 7.4 4,015.00
16 Analysis of Reclamation Claims 1.7 578.00
21 Analyze Liabilities Subject to Compromise 254 9,717.00
25 Preparation and Participation in Meetings and Conference Calls 230  10,741.90
with Debtors and Debtors Professionals to Discuss Status and
Develop Strategy
26 Prepare Information for and Participation in Meetings with the 324 17,569.60
Unsecured Creditors Committee
30 Analyze Employee Severance, Pension, Retention and Bonus 1322 59,019.30
Program
45 Firm Retention 1.1 374.00
46 Prcparation of Fee/Expense Applications 13.4 3.152.50
48 Preparation of Monthly Invoice and Support Schedules 3.2 1,200.00
55 Preparation of Miscellaneous Financial Analysis 373 12,444.00
58 Strategic and Operational Assessment Matters 36 1,085.00
60 Analysis of Tumaround/Operational Plan and Related Matters 1.3 442.00
69 Non-Working Travel Time 32.5 17,725.00
73 Analysis of Tax Attributes 16.8 7.485.00



Case 01-24795 Do 03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered /02 00:00:00 Desc

Pleading Page 234 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG COPORATE FINANCE LLC
SUMMARY OF HOURLY FEES BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2002 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2002

Project
Code Description Hours Fees

74 Meetings with professionals lo discuss case status and devclop 4.0 1,764.50
strategy

76 Short-term Cash Flow Projections 0.9 400.00
TOTAL HOURS AND FEES 380.0 $162,316
Reduction of Non-Travel time (50% of time incurred) (16.3) (8,862)
Less Yoluntary Adjustment (33.1) {11,165)
TOTAL ADJUSTED HOURS AND FEES 330.6 $142,289




Case 01-24795 Do

03-1

Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1Q4l6/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 235 of 267

COMIISCLY, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BEY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD MARCI 1, 2002 THROQUGH MARCIH 31, 2002

FHROFESSIONAL DATE (L] ITOL RS RESCRIFTION

Miller, Izavid 03/11/02 1 1.0 Meeating with T, Frango and ], [.eas regarding work plan development and
information required.

Franzo, Luia 03/11/02 1 2.1 Creation of work plan apecifics based on update with Citibak.

Miller, David 03/12/02 1 L] ‘Working with I, Franeo regarding work plan development and information requegls
preparntian.

Framzo, 1.uis 03/12/01 1 N4 Review iteims 1o be completed ineluding consolidation of the cash flows pregented
with the business plang and 3G&A,

Leae, Jaclyn n3/12m2 1 1.2 Preparation of work plan and list of information needed to completa anubysis.

Miller, David 03/22/02 1 1 Drigeusaion with L. Franco regarding reviged waork plan froon Citibank.

Miller, David 03/26/02 1 1 Telephone ¢all to L. Franco cegarding status of diligence and capital calls analysis.

Kuoepke, Kathy 03/27/02 1 1.0 Prapneation af billing information for Fee/Expense Application.

1 Total fid

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do‘

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 6/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 236 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 22 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2002

PROFESSIONAL TIATF. D HOMIRS DESCRIFTION

Franco, Luis u3manz 3 L& Review of presentation to the Equity Committee.

Franca, Luis D3/0T02 1 a1 Detailed review of presentation distributed [or the March 7, 2002 Unaecured
Creditor's meetingg.

Lena, Jaclm 031202 3 21 Review of cash flow and SG& A old and new numolf plans.

Miller, David 03/18/02 3 0.3 Review of preliminary Lazard vatuation analyris.

Franco, Luis U322M2 3 19 Review recently received information from March 19, 200 1Cammittes meeling.

Milker, David 3/25082 3 0.9 Review of copy of appendix to Committes presantation given by Deblocg to
Commities,

Miller, David 03/25/02 3 4.9 Review of copy of presentntion given by Dehtors le Comtiitice.

Franco, Luis N3/26/M2 3 1.6 Beview of recently Gled coutt motions including lense and cantract rejaction on
specilled properties.

Franeo, Luis 03/26/02 3 1.3 Review of recently received presantation to the Creditors' Conunittes on March
1%th,

France, Luis 03/27/02 1 1.6 Review of March 19, 2001 Craditors Committee presentation and réview recently
received information.

3 Totul 14.3

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 6/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 237 of 267

COMDISC, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2002 THROUIGH MARCII 31, 2002

PFROFESSIONAL DATE LT HOURS RESCRIFTION

Miller, Dravid 03/n1/02 4 0,3 Telephone call I. Hallack and A. {’hronis regarding mesting with Debtor and
accounting gquestions.

Millet, David 03/01/02 4 0.1 Telephone ¢ell 5. Dollinger regarding attendees for meeting with Company on
March 7th,

Mitler, David 03/11/02 4 03 Send e-mpil to 5. Dollinger (Citihmnk) regarding EYCF updated work plan,

Mitler, David 03/12/02 4 0.1 E-tmail to 5. Drollinger regarding economic stinulua package and potential tax
refunds.

Franco, Luia 03/14/02 4 1.2 Cioirversationa with J. Dakin of Royal Bank of Seotland regarding information he ia
aeeking on claims.

Miller, David 03/1%/02 4 03 Telephane call I. Nnkin (Rayal Bank of Scotland) regarding 1.arard valustion
parameters and claims analysis.

Millse, David 03/20/02 4 03 Bend e-mail 1o §. Dollinger regarding work plans.

Franeo, Luia 03/22/02 4 a7 Call with C. Swan of Hybridge Capital regarding miscellancoua general company
questiona,

Miller, David 03/23/02 4 ai Draft e-mails to 5. Dollinger regarding tex meeting.

Miller, David OX2ZH02 4 ol Draft ¢-mails to 5. Dollinger regarding work plan changea.

Franco, Luis 0327/02 4 1.0 Creation of ligt and c-mail of materials to be received from R. Mishler. Regpond to
M. Pedowitz regarding review of Company CI5 plan,

Franco, Luis 03/28/02 4 a7 Conversation with . Madigan, of JPMorgan regarding debt.

o Tikul 5.2

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

Franco, Luis

Frango, Tuig

Frunco, Lus

Bunx, Jaclyn

Franco, Luis

Franco, Luis

Miller, David

Franco, Luis

Frasco, Luis

Franco, Luis

Franco, Luis

Franee, Luis

03-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 6/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 238 of 267

COMDESCL, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETATL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD MARCIT 1, 2002 THROLGH MARCIL 31, 2002

DATE I“CD HOURS DESCRIPTION

030502 5 0.5 Preparation of u-mait request for detail on specilic items 1o the ctabms analysis.

03/06/02 5 07 Conference call with Arthur Anderaon team reparding request for specific claima
annlysis informarion to be presented ot Creditors’ Committes meating,

D312 3 La Prepuration of information request based on work plun

03/11402 5 .5 Reviewed repart dated March 7, 2002 "Official Committes of Unsecured
Creditors” to participate in developing a wotk plan and develop a list of infornation

03/12/02 1 1.5 (nmplation of wark plan, including items needsd and to be completed hy week's
vod.

03712702 1 1.2 Dikcussions with Lussrd regarding review of wark plan and infurmatian items 1 be
requested and amendment of itena to be requested.

N313/02 B 0.3 Discuseions with L. Franco regarding gialug of information reguests and Tollow up
calls.

03/15/02 h] 0.7 [Jiscussion and completion of infarmation requests per dialogue with 1.azard.

03/21/02 5 28 Preparation for and participation in conference call with Company and Arthur
Andeérson un infurmation requesl sent the week ol 3/10/02.

03/22/02 5 21 I'repuration of summary of call with the (Compeny an 3:21/02.

03/26/02 A 1.2 Swomarization of calls with cumpany on information requesl, cevening financials,
claims, exc.

N3/26/02 b Lo Summarization of ¢alls with company on information sequeat, eoveting fhancialg,
claims, ete.

5 Total 14,9

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 6/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 239 of 267

COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODRE
FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2002 THROLUGH MARCH 31, 2002

FROFESSIONAL DATE o HOURS DESCHIPTION

‘Williains, Michac] I31502 13 1.a Mucting with K. Sherman tw discuss vontents of c-mail 1o LY. Miller summanzing
tax observations from confevence catl with the tax divector of Comdiace - update
from B, Sherman as to his conference enll with T, Miller,

Williams, Michael 031802 13 2.0 Read tax update memeo from B/ Shennan and discuas comments and changes with
him = updnte T, Miller - Communieations with N, Falzone regarding same,

Williaris, bichacl {3/20/02 13 1.5 Read memo from L. Sherman regarding estimated timing of receipt of refiund and
cughion amowt - comments and discussion with K. Sheran segarding same.

Willinmg, Michnel 4321402 13 1.4 Reviewed notice regarding bagis trangactions (357¢) « discuss applicability to
{’nmdisca IRS examination with R, Sherman - Review mema to ID. Miller regarding
the elfect of the notice on the tining of the 3 year carry back tax refund.

Williams, Michae] 13/ 1/02 13 0.5 Read deferred tax infrrmation prapared by 1.azard provided hy [, Miller.

Sherman, Richard 03/21/02 13 1.0 Reaview notice 2002-21 and forward s-mail to . Miller.

Shermia, Richard 3122102 13 0.4 Conversation with M. Felish and M. Williams regarding fotlaw-up questions amd
Apnil 2od meeting.

13 Total 7.4

Desc



Case 01-24795 Doc¢3103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1Q/16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 240 of 267

COMDIEC, INC.
ERNST & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CORE
FOR THE PERIOT MARCH 1, 2002 THROQUGH MARCH 31, 2002

PROFESSIONAT. DATE PCTY HOURS DESCRIFTION

Franca, Luis 03/15/02 16 1.7 Lipdata ta claims annlyxix buaed on review.

16 Fotal 1.7

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entered
Pleading Page 241 of 267

6/02 00:00:00

COMESCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORFORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT COME
FOR TIIE PFERIOD MARCH 1, 2(012 THROLGH MARCH 31, 2{H12

PROFESSIONAT DATE FCD 1OMIRE DESCRIPTION

Frangg, T.uis 03/05/02 21 0.4 Reviaw of claims analysis in presentation to Equity Committee.

Miller, David 03/06/02 21 0.1 Working with L. Franco regarding analysis of ¢laims.

Miller, Duvid 03/11/02 21 0.1 Drafl and send c-niailg w F. Hanson regarding Prism claim jasues.

Miller, David 03/12/02 21 1.5 Eeview of information From Debtors regarding Cominitles presetation and velabsd
wppendices and Citbank fax of claims analysts.

Franeo, Luis D3712/02 21 (] Review of forgign dehts ra determine priority in line of clnims.

Miller, David 03/13/02 n 5 Working with I., Frango regprding clnims nnalysis.

Miller, David 03/13/02 2 0.7 Working with L. Franuo regarding analysis ol bankyupioy claiuns - Lazad and EY
versus. CDO analysis.

Franco, Luig 03/13/02 21 1N Comparison of November and December claims onalysis.

Franco, Luia 03/13/02 21 13 Comparigon of ¢lgimg analysis between priar TYCF nnnlysis ond company
provided.

Franco, Luiz 03/13/02 Pl 22 Review of priority elaima anelysis and greation of compprison betwsen prinr nnd
current nonlysis of claims.

Miller, David D3/14/02 21 n.2 Telephone eall 1. Dakin regrrding annlysis of #laims,

Miller, David D3/14/02 21 0.3 Wurking with L. Franeo regarding analysis of claims.

Franco, Luig 03714702 21 0.3 Discussions with Lazard on ¢laims analysis ingluding brealkdown of poerity, none
dehtar claims, eta.

Franco, Luiz 03/14/02 11 2.8 Recongiligtion of halange sheet clpims versun priority of claims, including datailed
breakdown of balance sheet claims.

Francn, Luis 03/14/02 21 Ya | Update of claims analyeis including company versus Lazard. company varsus
EYCF and Novetnber verauns December analysis.

Millar, [mdd 03/13/02 b4l 0.5 Review of EYCF claims analysizg.

Miller, [2avid 03/13/02 2l 0.6 Telephone call to A. Palles reparding ventures partfolio strategies.

Miller, [avid 03/13/02 2l 03 ‘Telephone vall to L. Franco rogarding revisiona 1o claims analyais.

Francn, lisis 03/13/02 21 0.7 Review of prior analysis of othet liabalitica and elains.

Desc



Case 01-24795 Do

103-1

Filed 10/15/02 Entered 1Q46/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 242 of 267

COMIDISCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2002 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2002

PFROFESSIONAL DATFE P HOURS RESCRIFTION
Franco, Luia 03/15/02 11 13 Updnte tp clnims annlysis hased on review.
Franue, Luis 03/15/02 21 1.2 Cionvergations with Lazard team regarding claims snalysiz and epll on Monday,
Miller, David 03/17/02 FA| 0,3 Review nf RY{'F nonlysis of olaims.
Mitler, David 03/17/02 21 n2 Telephane eall to 1., Francn regarding analysis of claims for Lazard.
Millar, Lavid 03/15/02 21 0.3 Review of claima analysis and comparison to Lazard analyais.
Franeo, Ludz 0321702 pal 1.1 Review and correetion of claims eomparisons.
Franco, Luia 03/22/03 11 L3 Conference call with Company and Arthur Anderson an claims questinns, claims
anglysig nnd subgsquent recording nfrecnp.
21 Total FER

Desc



Case 01-24795 3103-1 ' Filed 10/15/02 Entere /16/02 00:00:00
Pleading Page 243 of 267

COMDISCO, INC,
ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINAKCE 114
DETALL OF 5ERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD MARCH 1, 2002 TIIR(OUGH MARCH 31, 2002

FROFESSIONAL DATE  _ _PCD HOURS DESCRIFTION

Kalfen, Donnkd 13/08/02 25 k] 'reparation and participated in canference call with members of Debtar's
management regneding propossd compensation programs,

K alten, Donald 031102 25 0.5 Vatticipated in teleconference with M. Ruwi regarding UCC's svaluation of Debtoc's
proposed fOMpPENEAtian programe.

Willipms, Michael Q3/14/02 15 1.0 Conference eall with M. Felish and K. Shetman regarding ettect of the tax changes
of the economic stimulus package on the ability to carmy back net operating lesses
and homus depreciativil.

Ealfen, Donatd 03/ 1802 15 10 Prrticiputed in conferences with N. Razi, M. Pallechia and Kimberly Bogge
regarding Debtor's proposed compensation programs.

Royus, Kimbuorly 03/18/02 2% 1o Participatad in conferences with N. Razi, M. Pellechin and 1. Kalfen regarding
Tishtar's propossd conlpensation programs.

Fahrenbach, Robert 03/18/0% 235 0.5 Telephane call with M. Willianis regarding state NOL. and related isuea.

Boggs, Kimberly 03/19/02 25 39 Auended UCT meeting with Nebtor reguding pregentation of Thehror's proposed
COIMPENSALion programs.

Boggs, Kimberly 03/19M2 15 0.2 Participated in teleconference with M. Fellecehia regarding data and information
request with respect to Debler's proposed compensation programs.

Willipms, Michael 03/20/02 15 0.3 Preparation and participation in conference call with M, Felish and K. Sherman
regarding requasting information related to tax eonsiderations of hankrupicy plan
wnder consideration, ineluding results of Anthur Anderson reorganization tax

madel.

Willisms, Michns! 03/21/02 25 0.5 Follow-up from M, Feligh regarding Arthur Andersen reorganizstion tax model and
propossl far a mesting - discussion with R. Sherman regarding communicalian wity
. Miller.

Miller, David 03/21/02 24 1.1 Canference call with R Mishlet and K. Krakora (Acthur Anderson) regarding

infprmation list and diligenee on claims and businers plans.

Boggs, Kimberly 03/21/02 15 03 Barticipated in teleconferance with N. Razi reparding status of information requesta
and Debtor's changes to proposed compengation programs,

Williams, Michnel 03/22/02 25 1.0 Cusnbunications among M, Felish, 1. Miller, N. Falzone and R, Shermnn regarding
obtaining informntion ralated Lo tax analysis.
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Knlfen, [Jonald 03/22/02 25 ns Parficipated in telaconferences with M. Raei, M. Pellecchia and K. Popga regarding
lntest chonges o Debtor's proposed compensation programs.

tlillar, Iavid 03/22/02 25 0.6 Telephoms catl 1o B. Lackey and K. Krakora { Arthur Anderson) regarding company
claithe analysis,

Baygs, Kimherly 03/22/02 15 VR Partivipated in wleconferences with D. Kalfen, N, Rezi and M. Pallecchia regarding
farwst changes to Debtor's proposed compensation pragrams.

Knlfen, Donald 03/23/0% 25 a0 Participated in conference with UCC, Debor and reapective connsels and advisors
regarding Lehtor's propased compensation programs.

Bogps, Kimberly 03/25/02 25 an Participated in comference with UCC, Debtor and respective counsels and advisars
regarding Debto's propescd Compensation Programs,

Miller, Mvid 13/28/02 25 02 Review af 1.. [runco summary of calls with Company for sending to 5, Dollinger.

Miller, David 0372802 25 [i¥} Raview of mepting ouline for Company due diligence

Franen, 1 uis 03/29/02 25 ] Calls ang conrdinntion with Comdisco regarding potential visit nest week,

P Toral 230

Desc



Case 01-24795

3103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entere /16/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 245 of 267

COMMISCA, INC.

ERMNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE LLC
DETATL OF SERVICES RENDERFED BY PROJECT CORE
FOR THE PERIOI MARCH 1, 22 TITROLUGH MARCIL 31, 2H12

PFROFESSIONAL DATE FCH HOURS DESCRIFTION

Miller, David D3/01/02 26 .1 Telephone coll §. Bnllinger regarding agenda far call on Mondoy.

Miller, David DIANMAZ 26 04 Working with 1., Franen regarding praparation of agendn for cndl with K. Dollinger.

Miller, David 03/04/02 26 By Telaphone call 8. 1Jollinger regarding updats vo Dieblor meetings and go forward
work plan.

Franeo, Luis N03/04/02 26 05 Biggngsion with 8. Dnlkingar and 1.azard Tegarding the forwarded list of claims and
request for E&Y 10 create a cansalidated balanve sheet us of June 30, 2002 based
ot Laward's 331702 anabysia and recently provided 12/34/0] information

Franeo, Luis 03/04/02 26 0.7 Vpdate call with 5. Doellinger hased on agendn dated 3/1/02.

Miller, David 030502 26 ns Telephone call 5. Thyallinger and K, Sehgal regarding prajecred balance sheet and
clnims nnaolysis.

Franeo, Luig N3/05/02 i 0.6 Telephone catl with 5. Dillgnger regarding projected halance sheet and claims
annlysis.

Cleichenhaus, Swwarl a3/07/02 26 45 Mueting with Creditors Committee and Company.

Franco, Luig 03/07/02 26 0.3 Draft of summary of Unsecured Creditors’ meeting to be distribwted,

Franco, Luis 03/07/02 14 30 Partigipation for pnd participation in Unsecured Craditors’ mesting.

Miller, David ORI 4 0l Send e-mail to 5. Dollinger regarding follow up to Committes meeting and impnct
on work plan,

Kalfen, Dronald ax11/02 26 [/ FParticipated in teleconference with 5. Dollinger and other repreaentatives of UCC,
Comimittee counael and D. Miller regarding protocols and process for reviewing
TNebtor's proposed compensation proprams.

Miller, David 03/11/02 24 n7 Telephone gall 5, Dallinger and 1, $chuster ragarding 1Y CEF work plun and
assistuncs ko Lazard.

Franes, Luig Q311702 16 0.6 Conference call with ¢ngagement team, including Citibank to discuss recent
Comnmittes meeting,

Kalfen, Donald Q3/18/02 " 10 Participated in teleconference with UCC member, Lazard representatives, EYCF
representatives and K. Bogge regarding Debtor's propesed compengation programs,

Miller, David {3/18/02 1§ w7 Partivipate vn call with Citibunk and Laward regarding preliminary valuation
analysis and compensation program.

Boggs, Kimberly 3/18/02 14 1.0 PPartivipated in telecomiarence with UCE member, Lueard representatives, EYCEF

reprosentatives and . Kal fon regarding Debior's propoicd coinpeisation prograimns.
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Gleichenhays, Stuart

Willinms, Michael

Kalfen, Donald

Katfen, Donnld

Bogwy, Kimberly

Gleichenhaus, Sruart

DATE PR HOLURS DESCRIFTION

03/19/02 6 60 Meeting with Creditors Commillee apd Company,

AN 26 1.5 Praparation tar and participation in Creditor Committes meeting with D Miller and
4. Gleichenhaus regarding eommunication of the observations in the g=mail
concenming the $42 millian refimd cluim under the economic ssimulus package.

a3/19/02 24 3n Alended UCC mesting with Debtar rogarditg presentation of Dabtor's propused
Gompenaation programs.

0372502 6 13 Participaied in conference with 1(C, sounsel and advisors regarding Debor's
propoged campensation programs.

05/23/02 26 1.3 Participated in conference with UCC, vounsel and advisers regarding Debiar's
proposed Compenanation Programs.

03/26/02 26 18 Meeting with Creditors Committes.

26 Total 34
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Miller, Travid n3/06/02 30 Q.4 Telephane call D, Knlfen and M. Couk regarding analysis of emergenes
compensalion plan.

Knlfen, Donnld 03M7/02 30 0.9 Reviewed Dobtor's proposed compensation propram tenn sheet and forwnrded to
Ernzl & Young LLP by Nazneen Ragi of Comdisee ("Nehtor”).

Miller, David G30742 30 0.1 Telephone call M. Cook regarding emergence compensation progrom.

Kalfen, 13onald B3/08/02 an 1.7 Reviewed and anatyzed Debtor's proposed compensnation programs.

Miller, Pavid D3/08/02 ED] .l Telephone call M. Cook regarding emergence compensation progoam.

Miller, David 03/0%/02 30 02 Telephone call to M. Cook regarding stntys of review of smergence compensation
plan and related issues,

Kalfen, Donald 03/10/02 30 0.6 Participated in teleconference with T, Miller regerding review pracess of Debtor's
propossd fOIMPETARLioN Programs.

Kalfen, Donald a3/10/02 30 07 Drafted e-miail to 5. Dellinger of Citihank and to the memhers af the (Official
Unseeured Creditors' Cammitiea of Comdisco ("UCC") sinmarizing discussions
with Debtar's menagement regarding proposed competsation program.

Mitler, David 03/10/02 kli} ns Conference anll with T2, Knlfen and M. [nok ragarding emergence compensalion
plan reviaw.

Gleichenhiaug, Stuart Q3/11/02 M 1.0 Telephane call with 5. [allinger of Citsorp Lo discuss upconing oeting,

Miller, Lhavid 03/11/02 an 3 Participats in gontarancs call with %. Dollinger, (.. Fortgang and . Kallen
Tegarding nssessment of manayement's plans.

Miller, David 03/11/02 30 0.2 Telephone call 8. Dollingsr regarding issues related to F'Y's uptront participation in
review of management's plans.

Kalfen, Donnld G311 542 30 K] Participated in confoosnes with M. Bubnevich of Arthor Andergen regarding
proposed compensation programs.

Kalfen, Donakd 03/15/02 30 0.4 l'articipated in confersnce with K. Bogge regarding svaluation of praposed
compensation programs and prepared sdata and information requast regurding
COIPENIALion programs,

Kalfen, Nenald 03/15/02 an 1.2 Participuted in wheconforetce with L. France regarding status of Debtor's proposed
COMPERIation programs,

Franco, Luie 03/15/02 an 1.1 Conversations with M. Cook and D Kalfen on their review of Company KIIRF.

Franeo, Luis D3/15/02 30 0.3 Ditcusgions on company CES emergenee plan with [, Kalten

Boggs, Kimberly 03/15/02 3n 1.6 Participated in teleconference with D. Kalfen and N. Bubnevich, of Arthur
Anderaen, regarding Debtor's propesed compenaption programa.

Pogge, Kimberly 03/15/02 30 04 Paplicipated in conferenee with D. Kalfzn regarding evaluation of proposed
canpensation programa proposal and drafted data nnd information request.

Boggs, Kimberly 03/15/02 30 1L Reviewed und evaluaed Doblor's proposed compensation programs.,

Boggs, Kimbetly 03/16/02 3 1.0 Tieptted summnry of 1Jehtor's proposed compensalion progama.
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Kalfen, Donald 03/17/02 30 20 Drafted memorandiom regarding status of Debtor'a proposed compensation
PrOgTams.

Ealfin, Donald 03717762 30 L& Reviewed and aonlyzed cost of Debtor's propoaed US lensing nnd ventures
COMPENARLON prograns.

Kalfen, Uonald D312 30 17 Beviewsd snd snplyzed cost of Deblot's proposed electronies and corporate
cOMpensation programs.

RAoggs, Kimbecly 011702 30 [ Ditafted data and intarmation requost with respeet to Debtor's propesed
COMmpensatinn pragrams.

Cileichenhaus, Stuart Q31802 £l 1.0 Discuss gmargency compensation plang.

Kalfen, Tronald 03/18412 30 1.5 Comducted intecviews of Ventures buginess unit lsader regurding Debter's proposed
GCOIMPENGALION Programs.

Kalfen, Nenald O/ LR/02 an L3 Conductsd intervicw of U5 Leaging business unit leader cegarding Debrot's
proposed compensation programs.

Kalfen, Donald n3/14/02 30 ni Canducted interview of clectronics bugineas unit 1aader regurding Debior's
prupused compensation programs,

Kalfen, Danald 03/18/02 W 11 Conducted iinetviews of European husinass unit leader vegarding Debtor's
propased compensation programs.

Kalfen, Donald O3/ 1802 30 10 Reviawed and unalyzed Deblor's proposed compensation prograis.

Miller, David 03/18/02 30 1.5 Muoeling with M. Cook regarding analysis af Debiars' compenaation program and
valuation parameters.

Miller, David 03/18/02 in 0.2 Keview of E&Y memo on compgnsation program issucs.

Taggs, Kimberly 431802 EN ] 1.5 Conducted intarview of Venturas buxiness unit leader regarding Debtor's proposed
compeneation programs.

Rogpgs, Kimberly 03/18/02 an 1.3 Conducted interview of US Ieasing business unil leader regarding Nebtor's
propoged campensation programs.

Boggs, Kimherly 03/18/02 in .5 Conducted interviews of elgetromics business unil leader eegarding Debtor's
proposed coOmpeneation programs.

Boggs, Kimherly D3/LB/02 30 1.1 Conduoeted interviews of Europepn business unit leador regarding Debtor's
proposed compenantion programs.

Roggs, Kimhacly 03/18/n2 30 0.2 Analyzed chapter 11 liquidating company retention conpensation pragtices,

Baogga, Kimberly 03/18/02 kL 1.2 Nrafted summary of Delior's proposed compensntion pragrams.

Bugpes, Kimberly 03/18/02 30 (K] Reviewed and nnalyzed Debin's proposed Compeneation Programs cost data.

Kalfen, Donald B3¢19/02 an 0.4 Panicipated in teleconference with D. Schuster of Lazard, 8. (leichenhaus and K.

Bogge regarding valuation of ussel recaverics.
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Kalfen, Dionald 03/15/02 an ¥ Participated in leleconference with K. Boggs regarding cvaluation of Debtot's
propascd compsenantion prograing.

Kalfen, Donnld NIN902 n .5 Reviewed and gonlyzed Deblot's proposed compengation pragrania.
Miller, David 03/19/02 k) 02 Review of management's latest draft of the ¢lnergenee compeigation program.
Boggs, Kimberly 03/19/02 k) o Participated in telesontecancy with 1D, Kalfen regarding evaluation of Debtor's

proposed compensation programs.

Bapgs, Kimberly 03/19/01 3 0.5 Partivipated in telaconferencs with T, Kalfen, D. Schuster of Luzard and S,
Gileichenhsus of EYCF regarding valuaijon of agest recovericd.

Boggs, Kimbecly D3/19402 30 ne Analyzed costs of Debior's proposed competsation programns.

Bogps, Kimberly 0319102 10 032 Drafted e-mnil carrespondence to M. Rued and M. Pellecchia at Comdisco regarding
status of information request with respect to Nebtor's proposed compensation
programs.

Boggs, Kimbwaly a3/19/02 1] 1.2 Dafied swmmary of Comdisca proposed European and slectronics compensaliot
programs.

Brggs, Kimberky DA/1HN2 30 1.3 Drafted summuy of Comdisco proposed US leasing, ventures and corporale

compensation programs.

Stoeckel, Ciregory 03/18/0% 30 19 Rescarched data and practicss of Europeanen companies (o benchmark Deblor's
propoesed Furopeat compenantion program.

Gleichenhaus, Siuart 03/20/02 k] 10 Follow-up eall regarding Creditars Camunittes mesting.

Ealfen, Donald B3/20/02 3n 10 Participated in telecanferance with K. Boggs regarding compensation progmm
design alternatives, roview of compensation programs propogal and discussed next
teps.

Knifen, Donald a3/20/02 a0 0.6 Participated in conference with Lazard team snd K. Baggd regarding valuation of

portfoling and other business unit asacts.

Kalfen, Donald 03/20/02 30 n4 Analyzed Debtar's propoged Europenn umpensation programs.

Kalfen, Donald 032002 30 1.2 Participated in téleconference with Lazard team reyarding valuntian issuea relating
1o Dehtor's propased compensation programs.

Boggs, Kimberly 43720002 30 a4 Participated in gonference with D. Kalfen rogarding analysis and evaluation nf
Lebtor's proposed compenaation programs.

Buggs, Kimberly 03/20/02 30 0.9 Participaled it conferenca with D, Kalfen and Lasard team reyarding valuation of
porifolic and other business unit agsets.

Boggs, Kimherly 03/20/02 30 1.0 Purticipated in telecanference with 1, Kalfn regarding compensalion progroms
1 g Cy
desigil alternatives, review of compensation programa propasal and discnss naxt
sl
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Boggs, Kinberly 3/20/02 an 19 Drafled cosr analyais of Debtor's proposed Eurupean ¢otipensation programs.

Boggs, Kimberly 03/20/02 an 0 [rafted cost analysis of Debtor's propased LIS lanaing, ventures and corporate
catNpensation programs.

Bogga, Kimherly 03/20/02 k] 1.4 Koviewed and analyzed propnsed compensalion programa documents, appendices
and additionnl data obtained from Debror.

Kalfin, Donald ni21/z a0 .7 Participnted in teleconlersnce with D, Miller and K. Boggs to discuss the suecess
sharing compensation [programs proposed by Debior.

Kalfen, [Jonald n3/21/02 30 1.7 Reviewed and solyzed Debtor's proposed US leasing and venturas compensation
programs,

Kalfen, Donald 03/21/02 in 1.7 Reviewed and analyzed Debtor's proposed elecirenics and corporate compensation
PEOREAME.

Kalfen, Donald 03/21/02 3 1.7 Reviewed und analyzed Debtor's proposed Furopean compensation programs,

Miller, David 0321402 an 04 Telephant call to It Kalfen regnrding status of KERF review and ismue of threshold
meaaures and incentives.

Miller, Diavid 03/21/02 30 .4 Telephone call to 8. Gleichenhans regarding developnient of threshelds for KERP
plans.

Boggs, Kimberly 03/z1/02 i0 [ Paricipated in teleconference with 10 Kalfen and D. Miller to diseuss Nebtor's
proposed success shating compensalion program.

Boggs, Kimberly Q3/21/02 30 ny Participated ib teleconterenes with 1, Kalfen Lo discuss evaloation of Deltor's
prapased success sharing compansation programs.

Bergpa, Kimberly 03/21/02 an 1.9 Reviewed and analyzed Dreblor's proposed compensation programs.

Boggs, Kinbetly 43/21/02 30 4 Prepared summary aualysis of Debtor's proposed compensation plans by Debtor
husiness anit.

Buygs, Kinberly 03/21/02 30 19 Reviewead and analyzed US Leasing participant data received from Debor.

Boggs, Kimberly 0321402 30 n7 Reviewsd and anatyzed vontures participant dntn received from Debtor.

Ein, Susan 03/21/02 3 1.0 Nrafted individual-leve] aggregate sost annlysis based on Debtor-provided
participant data.

Kalfen, Donald n3/22/2 an 1.6 Reviewed and annlyzad Deblor's changea to proposed U3 Teasing compensation
Proframs,

Kalfem, Donald 03/12/02 30 [ Reviewsd and annlyzed 1ebtor's changes to proposed yenhres compansalion
pmgrams.

Knlten, Donald a3/22/02 30 3 Keviewed and analyzed Dehtor's chunges 1o propaesed cleetronies and corporite
coinpengation pragrams.

Kalfen, Donald 03/22/02 n 1.9 Reviewed and revised 17Y cost unalyses of Debtor's proposed U3 leasing wnd

venlufes compcnsntion Progrums.
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Kalfen, Donald nifzaz 30 R} Reviewed and revised EY cost analysis of Rebtor's proposed corporate
campenstion programs.

Kalfen, Danald 03/22/02 k(] 2.0 Partigipated in conference with K. Boggs ta review and analyze Debtor-provided

: prrticipant data and reviged compensation programs sumoaries.

Miller, Mavid 0372202 k1] a3 Varioua e-mails and discussions regarding atatug of review and diligence isgucs.

Bogps, Kimberly 03/22/02 30 i I'tepared updated cost analysis of Debtor's propesed compensation pragram Lo
reflect updated participant date received fom Debtor and changes to proposed
COMpPEnsation program.

Boggs, Kimberly 03/22/02 30 1.2 Drafted summary uf poposed European, electronics snd sorporate compensation
programe.

Bogpa, Kimberly 03/22/0) kL] 15 Tratted sunmary of proposed US Lapsing and Venlures Compensation Frograms.

Rogus, Kimbaly 03/22/02 30 1.1 Reviewsd campensation analysis from N, Bubnovich, of Arthur Andereen Debtor's
1R advisor, and updated information from Debtor regarding compensation
programs individual payout levels.

Boggs, Kimberly 03/22/02 30 1.2 Reviewed and analyzed updated participant data and drafted TY cast analyses
related to same.

Bopus, Kimberly U3/22/02 El 12 Prepared revised EY cost analyses of Dehtor's propused US Leasing and Ventures
Compensation Programs to retlect changes to program.

Rogps, Kimberly 0322002 30 ] Erepared revised EY cost analyses of Debtor's proposed Corparate and European
Compensation Program to reflect chenges to proyram.

Boggs, Kimberty 03/22/02 30 10 Panicipated in zonterence/working gegsion with Donald Kakfen to review and
analyzs Debtor-provided panticipant data and revised Compensation Programs
gummpries. ldentified need for additional infarmntion.

K.alfen, Donald 03/23/02 30 2.0 Prapared memorandum summary of EY analysis of Debtoc's proposed US leasing
and veniures COMPENsation programs.

Kantfen, Donald 03723402 G 1.5 Prepared memorandum suiunary of EY analysis of [ahtor’s propaged clectronies
and corporats compensation programs,

Kalfen, Donald O3/23M02 an. 1.0 Prepared tncmorandum summary of BY analysis of Debtor's proposed Turapean
COMPENaation progmms.

Kalfen, Donald n3/23/02 a0 4.0 Participuted in conference/working session with K. Boggs (o finalize EY cost
anulyses of Debtor's propossd compansution progeam in preparation for meeting
witl UCC and Debtor in New York.

Hoggs, Kimberly 03/23/02 30 0.2 Assembled data nnd various docwnenia in preparation for masting with UCC and
Nehtar in Mew Yuck.

Rogps, Kimbarly 03/23/02 e 4.0 Participated in conference/warking session with Donald Ealfen to finalize EY cost
analyses of Nebtor's pruposed Cotnpensation Prayram in prepatatian for meeting
with IO and Debror in New York.

Boggs, Kimberly 03/23/02 i ] Reviswsd and tevised EY cost annlysis of individual pacticipant data relating ta

Debtor's propased Ventures Compansation Programs.
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Tagys, Kimberly 032302 kL 1.7 Reviewed and revised EY cost analysis of individual pariicipant data relating to
Debtor's propased US [easing Compensalion Programs.

Kalfen, Dumald 3/24/02 30 15 Drafled analysiz of Debtor's propased U4 irasing and veiuwres compensation
PIORIaINS,

03/24/02 an 1,7 rafted analysis of Debrors proposed corpornte, elactranics and Ewropean
carnpetsation programa.

Bogs, Kimbely 03/24/02 30 04 Participated in teleconferences with Denald Kalfen regarding preparation for
meeting with Dabtor and UCC in New York.

Ngys, Kimberly n3/24/02 30 .6 Drafied correspondence to Susan Doellinger regatding preparation for UCC and
Debtor meating in New Yark.

Rogps, Kimberly 03/24/02 30 1.0 Prepured agaregate cost awmmary of proposed Compensation Programa by busingss
widt.

Bowgs, Kimbedy 03/24/02 30 08 Prepared analysis of potential payients under Debtor's proposed {ompensation
Programs hy covered cmployee.

Cileachenbaus, Stuart 03/25/02 30 2.0 Review materinls for meeting wilh Creditors Committes on 3/76/02,

Kalfen, Donald 03/25/02 30 26 IParticipated it conference/working session with K. Boggs to prepare insmo
reviewing Debtor's proposed compensation program i preparation for meeting
with UCC.

Boggs. Kimberly 03/2542 30 2.6 Prrticipated in conference/working session with Tonald Kalfen to prepare incme
reviewing Debloe's proposed Compensstion Progrum in preparation for mecting
with UCC.

(Hmichenhaus, Stuart N3/24/02 30 1.0 Mecting with 5. Dollinger, R. Tharton, 1. Schuster and D. Kalfen to discuss
compensation plan,

Kalten, Dunald 03726402 30 1.2 Paicipated in conference call with K. Bogys to drall OCC cowter proposal,

Bogga, Kimberly 03/26/01 EL 12 Portigipated in canference with Kimberly Boggs to draft LU Counter Proposal 1o
Tiehtar's proposed Compenization Programs.

Rogys, Kimbarly 03/26/02 30 s Revicwed and analyzed Debtor provided compenxation data for US Leasing
cnployees. Caloulated average 1999 and 2001 Lotal compenaation of 1S Lensing
Employees and compared same to base pay plug payments under Dehtor's proposed
{ompensation Irograms.

Boggs, Kimberly 03/26/02 an n? Prepured comparizon of Debtor's initisl 2001 Compensution Progeams and
priposed 2002 Compensation Programs.

Kalfen, Donald 03/27/02 an 0.5 Participated in telsconference with 5. Glicchenhaua and ¥, Tlogys regartding
preparatian of UCC counter proposal to Debtor’s praposed campensation
Programs.

03/27/02 i0 i3 Reviewsd anel rovised Committee summary of UCC counter proposal 10 Debtot's

Kalfen, Danald

propased US leasing and ventures compensation progratis.

Desc
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PROFESSTONAL DATE D HOURS DESCRICTLON

Kalfen, Dronald 03/27/02 10 1.0 Reviewad and revised Cnmmittee summary of UCC counier proposal to Dhebtor's
proposed corporate and eleconics Compenaation programs.

Roggs, Kimherly 03/27/02 10 0.7 Drafted emapil to Susan Dallinger; fax to Susan Dallinger regarding UCC Counter
Propossl,

Boggs, Kimbesly 03/27/02 k(] [} Parlicipated in teleconference with Staart Glgichenhaus and Donald Katfen
regarding UCC Counter Propoant to Nebtar's compensation program.

Haygs, Kitnbetly 32702 M 03 Revised U Counter [roposal 1o Debtor's propoaed Compensation Programs.

Bargps, Kimberly 03/29/02 n 0.6 Reviewed email correspondence and revisiong to Dhebtor's proposed Compensation
Progratos roceived fiom Thebtar.

30 Total 1322

Desc
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PROFESSTONAL DATE (M) HOURS DESCRIPTION
France, Luis D3/06/02 45 0.5 Raview of prior connections check in preparatian for updnte to be completed.
Franco, 1uis D3/13/02 45 LX) Review and preparntion nf subcontract ngreemant for transaction services review nf
1% plan.

AToml 11

Desc
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FROFESSIONAL DATE PCD HOURS DESCRIFTION
Ingles, Beatrice 03/12/02 a6 1.r Preparation of December/Janvary/February Fee/Expense Application.
Inglee, Beatrice 03/20/02 44 .0 Treparation of December/Tanuary/February Fee/Expense Application.
Inglus, Beatvics 03/25/02 46 L Froparation of Desemboer/January/Fobruary Fee/Expense Application,
Ingles, Beatrice 03/26/02 46 0] Preparatiom of |ecember/lanuary/Fehruary es/lxpanse Application.
Sherman, Richard 03/26/02 L1:] 0.4 Reaview billing infarmation with B, Ingles and M Willinms,
Ingles, Beatrice n3/27/02 46, 20 Recenctle December/Tanuary/Felruary billg v WIP.
Shertnan, Richard 03/27/02 44 0.3 Folluw-up conversation with B. Ingleg regarding billing.
Shermarn, Richard a3/2702 46 0.3 Review billing infurmation with B. Ingles and prepare invoice 1o EYCE.
Ingles, Reatrice 03/28/02 15 0 Revisions to December/Jamnry/Febmuary bills.
Shernan, Richard 03/2R/02 ddy 0.6 Review inveice information for billing amount with M. Williams and B. Ingles.
Miller, David 0372902 46 n3 Review and finnlize First Interim Fee Application.
Tnyles, Rentrice 03/29/02 a6 n4 Revigiona to Decermber/Tanyary/Febraary billa.
Williams, Michael 03/28/02 46 24 Discuszion of Fee application with David Miller.

46 Totl 134

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL DATE PCD HOURS DESCRIFTION

Miller, David D310 4R 0.4 Review and adjuat invoices from reduced fees agreed with Citibank.

Miller, David 05/20/02 43 0.2 Wurking with B. Ingles regurding feo spplication and invoices.

Miller, Mavid 03/22/02 18 05 Review of revised invnices from 1. Ingles nnd send e-mail regarding addittonnd
changes.

Millar, Dravid N3/26,/02 4R 0.3 Review and finalize monthly bills from First Interim fee period.

Miller, Dravid D3/28/02 48 0.2 Working with B. Ingles regacding derailed time analysiz.

Mills, Flizoheth 13/28/02 4% 0.6 Dimcussions with h. Williems, R. Shermean, and B. Ingles reguarding fee extimates
and billing.

Mills, Elizabeth 13/28/02 4% 1.0 Prapamtion of invaice tn TY(F.

48 Tokal

Desc



Griveati, Jul

Franco, Luoia

Franco, Luig

lranca, [-uis

France, Luis

Grivetti, John

Miller, David

Franco, Luis

Franco, 1uis

Grivetti, John

Miller, David

France, Luis

Millet, David

Franco, Ly

Frango, Tuig

Leus, Faclyn
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DETAIL OF SERVICES RENDERED BY FROJECT CODE
FOR THE FERIOD MARCH 1, 2002 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE PCD HOURS DESCRIFTION

2/112002 a5 03 Created ventwre financial prajection aprendshest for 8 Deollinger,

Q0102 55 ng Review of newly received ventures intormation.

ax01/0k 55 2.7 Updatea to 3-31-02 prejected cash balance based on Nacember actunl receipts and
dighurgements.

03/04/02 55 1.1 Pyeparation ol projected balance sheet.

13/05/02 55 2.2 Preparation of initial mndel layout for 6-30-02 balanca shest.

03/45/02 55 0.3 Discussions with 1. France reyarding projection of halance shest 1 6/30/02.

QAN 55 0.4 Criacuseicon with L. Franse regarding preparaticn of projected balance sheet.

030602 55 24 Continued development of projected balance sheet, including separating the maede)
inte thres sheets {runoff basis, adjustnenta/asset aales and ultimately projected),

13/06/62 55 0.7 Updates 10 prujected halance sheet.

B3/06/02 L1 04 Digenssign with 1., Franco regarding status af projaction of 6/30/02 balance sheet.

D3/06/02 15 0.4 Working with L. Franco regasditg, analysia of projected balance sheet.

N3/DR/N2 55 1.5 Compilation of projected balance sheet baged on information provided nt
Unseeured Creditars’ meeting,

D3/OR/D2 55 0.2 Digewsaion with L. Franeo regarding analysia of June 30, 2002 balnnce sheet,

D3/L1/02 55 1.8 Cuampleted consolidation of balance sheets for LS. Leazing, Veutures and
European buginess plana.

n3i/12/02 55 14 Review of new business unit hulance sheets for roll-ou and scouracy.

03/13/02 5% 2.4 Develop model of a consclidated cash flow statement for European subeidiary io
reconcile new and old runoft plans as presented march 7, 2002,

03/13/02 55 149 Develaped madel of 0 consolidated cash flow stotement for LS leasing 10 reconcils

Lens, Inglyn

new and old nmoft pluns as presentad march 7, 2002/

Desc



Case 01-24795

3103-1 Filed 10/15/02 Entere /16/02 00:00:00

Pleading Page 258 of 26

COMDISCO, INC.

ERNST & YOUNG CORPORATE FINANCE L1.C
DETAIL ()F SERYI(CES RENDERED RBY PRIMEC'T CODE
FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2001 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2002

PROFESSIONAL DATE PCD HOURS DESCRIFPTION

Leas, Jaclyn D3/1307 5% 12 Developed model of & consolidated cash flow statement for Ventures subsidiary to
reconzila new and old minott plans ax presentsd march 7, 2002,

Leas, Iaclyn 03/13/02 35 2.8 Developed model of a consolidated cash flow statement to tie US Leasing,
Evropean and Ventures subaidiaries into Comdisca Tng to reconcile new and ald
runoft piana ns presented march 7, 2002,

Leas, Jaclyn 03/14/02 55 1.3 Prepnratinm of analysis and praparation f list to the company stating detail
information nesded for consolidased cash Dow statcments for dew pas-ofT plan.

Franen, Luis 03/21/02 55 14 Vpdate af workplan hased on call with the cempany und conversatian with
Citibank.

Franco, Luis 03/26/02 55 1.6 Raview of ¢apital call for Redwpod Ventures. Research ond follow-up with
Skadden, Arps.

Miller, David 03/27/02 b 0.2 Working with L. Franco regarding Ventores capital call motion,

Frangaq, 1.vis 03/32/02 55 2.5 Fllow-up an Bedwaod Ventures Capital call.

Miller, David 03/2R/02 45 0.2 Warking with L. Franco regarding Redwood Ventures nnalysis,

Franca, L.uix 03/28/02 5% 17 Additional follow-up on Redwood Vemures Capilal call including additional calla
with Bkadden, Arpa Arther Andersen and Citibank.

Franco, Luig Q3/29/07 B ] 03 Draft of ¢-mail to Creditors' Committes on Redwood Ventwres Capital Call.

45 Total 3

Desc
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FROFESSIONAL DATE FCD HOURS DESCHRIFTION
Franca, l.uis 03/12/02 58 05 Digcusgion with M, Podowitz regarding review of Comdisco CIS emergence plan,
Franca, 1.y 03/14/02 58 N4 Review of C15 scope review prepared by M. Podowitz,
Leasg, Jaclvi 03/14/02 58 23 Analyesd and developed reconuiliation for $G& A proposal presented to unsecored
creditora March 7, 2002
Miller, David 03/15/02 1} 0.1 Rovicw ol initial mema regarding ussessment of (715 shured services plan.
58 Total 16

Desc
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PROFESSIONAL LATE a i) HOURS DESCRIFTION
Franco, Luis n3/26/02 A0 1.3 Revigw of recently received presentation o the Creditors' Committes on March
1%9th.

60 Total 1.3

Desc
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FROFESSIONAL DATFE D HOURS DESCRIFTION
(Heichenhaus, Btuart D3/07/02 a9 3.5 Nom-working travel time.
(fleichenhaus, Stuart 03/07/02 4a 30 Non-working travel time.
Gleichenbans, Stuart 03/1%/02 49 k) Noun-working travel 1nc.
(ileichenhms, Bmart 03/1%/02 &9 15 Nrm=working travel time,
Bogge, Kimberly 03/24/02 69 4.0 Travel titne te MY to attend UCC and Debior meeting.
Gleichenhaus, Stuart 03/24/02 69 30 Non-working travel time.
Kalfen, Donald 03/24/02 ] 4.0 Travel time te NYC to attend Creditors' Comimittes conference with Debtor,
Boggs, Kimbearly 03/25/02 69 a0 ‘Travel time from MY 1o (Chicagn.
Kalfen, Dunald 03/35/02 &9 4.0 Trnval time from MY 40 (Chicago.

6% Total 315

Desc
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FROFESSIONAL DATE PCD HOURS DESCRIFTION

Williams, Michael 03/13/02 T3 1.9 Conversavion with D. Miller and M. Falzone regarding potential opportunity for 5-
yenr carry back of Comdisco NOH.5 - send legisiative kistary and statute ko T,
Miller - update other tax team members - Communivatians with Citigroup through
b Miller

Willians, Michacl 03/14/02 3 19 Comnuticationg with D. Millet regacding the tax aspects of the cconoinic stinuluz
package and ite effect on Comdiaco - Preparation for conference call to Comdisco
and goordinate with B. Sherman - wpdate N, Flzene,

Sherman, Richnrd 3/ E4/02 73 (LA Canverantion with M. Pelish regarding the impact on Comdisca's tax attributes atter
the naw tax [aw chanyes.

Sherman, Richnrd n3/t4/02 73 n; Reviewed notes regarding M. Felish's impressiona of the impagt on Comdisgo's tax
attributes.

$herman, Richard 03/15/02 73 1.5 Review discussian notes with M. Willinms.

Shermun, Richard D3/18/02 73 LE Review nates and draft summary of discussion points.

Sherman, Richard 03/18/02 73 0.6 Review paitits with M. Williama.

Shermun, Richard 03/18/02 3 1.6 Ravise and e-muil analysis t 12, Miller.

Miller, David D3/1%02 73 n.2 ‘Telaphome call to M. Williams regarding follow up on impact of sconomie stimulus
pickaye.

Shermun, Richard D3/15/02 73 0.3 Raview 13, Miller's comments reganding delivery of the Comdisco's ax atinbule
[t

Williarms, Michael 03/20/02 kel 10 Obtain al read puctions of Cumndigeo 10-k Bled for i %30/01 year for comments
velated to deferred taxes and pre and post petition taxes.

Willinms, Michnal 03/20/02 73 P3| Inquiry from 12. Miller regnrding timing of receipt af refimd for § year carry buck
und companents of defarred taxes, cushion and pre-peution and post pelitisn
antouits - discuss with Biclh Sherman - analyvsiz and read file notea related to
anvount and paturs of elaim.

Millee, David D3/240/02 3 4 Drafl und sénd s-iniil o Citibank aiwl Laeard rogardiog tax anadysig and refutieds.

Miller, David 03/240/02 3 0.3 Review imetno from M. Williams and sending numerons e-maile with follow up
questians,

Eherman, Richard 03/20/02 T3 1.1 Discusaiome with b. Williams regarding Comdizcos 1ax attribute memo.

Sheninan, Richard 03/20/02 Ex) 2.1 Raview nates and deaft e-mail to D. Milier regarding the timing of the AMT NOL

varry buck clasm, and the I of $105 million.

Desc
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PROFESSTONAL DATE PCD HOURS DESCRIFTION
Miller, David 03/22/02 73 2 Fallow up with M. Willinms and R. Shermnn regnrding tex reinted diligence issues
Sherman, Richard 03/22/02 73 0.6 Discussions with M. Williams relating to maeting with M. Falish.

73 Total 19.%

Desc
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Milter, David 03/04/02 4 02 Telephone call 5. Gleichenhaus regarding discnasion with {'ommittes chair and
work plan.

Crivett, John 3/4/2002 T4 n2 DNiscusgion with 1., France regarding client reguest.

Franca, luis 03/05/02 T4 0.6 Discussion with EXY engagement team on methadelogy for creating projected
brlpnce shest ok of 6230-01.

Franca, Luix 03/11/02 74 0.7 Meecting with engagement term 40 discuss wark plan and to da itermns based on
update with Citibank.

Leag, Jaclyn 31102 74 0.5 Mesting with [.. Franceo to discuss case stutus and develop steategy for work plan.

Miller, David 03/19/02 74 0.3 ‘Talephane vall te 5. Gleichenhaus regarding Conunittee meeting resalts and next
ateps.

Shernnan, Richard 03/22/02 74 0.3 Draft esmail to 1. Mitler regarding opportunity te discuss bankouptey model for
Comdisco with Arthur Anderson parer.

Willinms, Michas] 03/25/02 74 Lo Communication from D. Miller regarding Clitigroup approves planned muesting
regnrding tax aspects of Arthur Anderson reorganization ax inodel - Discusa with
It. Sherrnan - update for N. Falzone - Telephone call to M, Felish to confirm
necting and confirm with Ir. Miller,

Millet, David n3/27/02 74 i1 Telephone call to L. France regarding diligence follow up with Company,

Millet, David n3/27/02 74 18] Update with 5. (ieichenhaos regarding meeting sesutta on KERP.

14 Todal Lx)

Desc
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Miller, David 03411402 76 0.4 Wurking with L. Franco regarding £)2 cash flow analysix.
Franco, Luis 03714502 76 0.5 Review of compleled cash flow congolidation and SG&A comparizon.
75 Tuotul 0y

Grand Total 380.0

Desc



Case 01-24795 D

&l ERNST & YOUNG

CORPORATE FINANCE LIC

Via Overnight Coutier
Invoice # 17124

Norman P. Blake
Robert Lackey
Comdisco, Inc.

6111 North River Road
Rosemont, IL 60018

James R. Daly

Jones, Day, Reavis & Pogue
77 West Wacker Drive
Chicago, IL 60601

Ann Maric Bredin

Jones, Day, Reavis & Fogue
77 West Wacker Drive
Chicago, IL 60601

William J. Barrett

Giardner, Carton & Douglas
321 North Clark Street
Suite 3400

Chicago, IL 60610

David F. Heroy

Michael Yeinikoft

Bell, Boyd & Lloyd, LLC
Three First National Plaza
Suite 3300

70 West Madison Street
Chicago, IL 60602
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August 29, 2002

John Wm. Buler, Jr.

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom
333 West Wacker Drive, Suite 2100
Chicago, IL 60606

Roman L. Sukley

Office of the U.S. Trustee

227 West Monroe Street, Suoite 3350
Chicago, IL 60606

Michael Bassett

Jones, Day, Reavis & Pogue

599 Lexington Avenue, 317 Floor
MNew York, NY 10022

Edward 5. Weisfelner
John P. Bicdermann
T.eslie 11, Scharf

120 West 45™ Street
New York, NY 10036

Re: Comdisco, Ing., et al, — Case No. 01 B 24795, et seq.

Desc
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Elf ERNST & YOUNG

CORPORATE FINANCE LIC

August 29, 2002
Page 2

To Whom It May Concern:

Emst & Young Corporate Finance LLC (“EYCF”) has recently discovered an internal billing
error that resulted in the understatement of the (otal fees requested between December 2001 and March
2002 by $37,987.

The understatement was caused by the removal of EYCF’s voluntary reduction in fees rwice from
the gross hours/fecs generated during the period. The table below presents the corrected total hours and
fees incurred during the period and the bhalance of fees to be billed by EYCF. We have also attached the

corrected statements.

Dec-2001 Jaun-2002 Feb-20412 Mar-2002 Total
Haues Fees Hours Fees Hours Fees 1louts Fees Hours Feos
Adjusied Fee Total 120.1 % 51,065 HE.6 $ 82,755 1220 £47329 330.7 $142 289 7814 323,438
Initial Fec Total 101.1 44, 587 176.2 066 100.9 30,674 297.6 131,124 6738 285451
Understulement of Fee: 190 % 6478 324 $1268% 21,1 5 76335 332 % 11,163 1057 § 37 947

EYCF is not requesting payment on the balance of the fees due for the December 2001 through March
2002 period at this time. Unless an objection is raised, EYCF intends to inchude the adjusted amount duc

in its final fee application, to be submitted by October 14, 2002,

Please contact me at 404-817-5917 if you have any questions.

Very truly yours,

David Miller
Managing Director

Enclosure

CHO222157083.1



