Docket #: 1028

EXHIBIT D

FINAL APPLICATION PERIOD MBLY TIME DETAIL

Date	Hours	Proj	Description
Buckfire - Ker	35.5		
12/19/2002	1.0	2	Team update re: first day filing
12/31/2002	0.5	2	Case update
01/06/2003	1.0	2	Team update
01/10/2003	1.0	3	Discussion re: creditor presentation
01/12/2003	2.0	3	Review of creditor presentation draft
01/13/2003	0.5	2	Team update
01/13/2003	2.5	3	Review and editing of committee presentation
01/15/2003 01/15/2003	0.5	2	Conference call
01/16/2003	1.5 0.5	3 2	Review of Committee Presentation
01/16/2003	0.5 0.5	2	Review of creditors meeting Team update
01/20/2003	1.0	2	Team update
01/23/2003	1.0	ī	Discussions internally re. deposition and subpoena
01/24/2003	1.0	2	Review of Chanin meetings in Chicago
01/27/2003	0.5	1	Review Debevoise write up to Akin discovery
01/28/2003	2.0	i	Meeting with M. Wiles re: discovery
01/31/2003	1.0	2	Team update re: retention
02/11/2003	1.0	2	Team update
02/19/2003	0.5	2	Team update
02/28/2003	0.5	2	Team update
03/03/2003	1.0	2	Team update
03/07/2003	0.5	2	Team update re: bank/creditor meeting
03/12/2003	1.0	2	Team update following Bank/Creditor meeting
03/14/2003	1.0	2	Discussion regarding MBL retention and fees
03/19/2003	0.5	2	Call with J Perry regarding fees
03/20/2003	0.5	2	Team update re: mbl fees
03/24/2003	1.0	2	Team update re: case status
03/31/2003	1.0	2	Team update
04/02/2003	0.5	2	Team update
04/08/2003	1.0	2	Team update
05/01/2003 05/08/2003	0.5	2 2	Team update on case status
05/14/2003	1.0 0.5	2	Team update on case status Team discussion re: MBLY fees
05/22/2003	0.5 0.5	2	Case update
06/04/2003	1.0	2	Case status re: litigation, discovery, etc.
06/14/2003	2.0	2	Team update re: depositions
06/16/2003	1.5	2	Various calls and internal discussions
06/18/2003	0.5	2	Pre-confirmation hearing meeting
Fazal - Qazl	225.5	_	
12/19/2002	1.5	2	Conference call with management and lawyers
12/19/2002	1.0	2	Calls with Management
12/19/2002	1.0	2	Calls with bondholders
12/19/2002	1.0	2	Team update re: first day filing
12/22/2002	2.5	1	Review court documents (Disc/POR)
12/24/2002	1.0	4	Review of projections for disclosure statement
12/31/2002	0.5	2	Case update
01/06/2003	1.0	2	Various conversations with management
01/06/2003	1.0	2	Team update
01/07/2003	1.0	2	Various conversations with KE, Laura, Bruce, Company
01/10/2003 01/12/2003	1.0	3	Discussion re: creditor presentation
01/13/2003	2.0	3 2	Review of creditor presentation draft Team update
01/13/2003	0.5 2.5	3	Review and editing of committee presentation
01/13/2003	2.0	2	Conf call regarding KERP and committee presentation
01/15/2003	0.5	2	Conference call
01/15/2003	5.0	3	Drafting and review of committee presentations
01/16/2003	6.5	2	Creditors committee meeting
01/16/2003	0.5	2	Review of creditors meeting
01/16/2003	0.5	2	Chanin due diligence review
01/16/2003	0.5	2	Team update
01/17/2003	1.0	2	Discussions with Laura, Kathy, Jim
01/19/2003	0.5	2	Discussions with Jim
01/20/2003	1.0	2	Team update
01/23/2003	1.0	1	Discussions internally re. deposition and subpoena
01/24/2003	1.5	1	Discussion with Debevoise re. Subpoena
01/24/2003	0.5	1	Gathering materials for subpoena

Date	Hours	Proj	Description
01/24/2003	1.0	1	Review utility settlements
01/24/2003	0.5	2	Discussions with Kathy, Colin, and Tim
01/24/2003	1.0	2	Review of Chanin meetings in Chicago
01/26/2003	1.0	2	call with Special Committee (tim, colin) and Pachulski (laura)
01/26/2003	1.0	2	Discussions and e-mails with Jay and Kathy
01/27/2003	0.5	1	Discussion on subpoena
01/27/2003	0.5	1	Review Debevoise write up to Akin discovery
01/30/2003	1.0	2	Conf call with Company and lawyers
01/31/2003	4.5	1	Deposition preparation with M. Wiles of Debevoise
01/31/2003	1.0	2	Team update re: retention
02/02/2003	2.0	1	Deposition preparation with M. Wiles of Debevoise
02/04/2003	2.0	1	Preparation for retention hearing
02/05/2003	2.0	5	Travel to and from Philadelphia for court hearing
02/05/2003	3.5	1	Court hearing
02/07/2003	0.5	2	Call with J. Perry
02/11/2003	1.0	2	Team update
02/14/2003 02/17/2003	2.0	2	Board of Directors call
02/17/2003	1.0	4	Review financial documents
02/19/2003	1.0	2	Calls with Jay/Kathy/Jim
02/19/2003	1.0 0.5	2 2	Calls with Jay/Jim Team update
02/20/2003	1.0	2	Kerp hearing issues
02/21/2003	1.0	2	Calls with Jay and Kathy
02/21/2003	1.0	2	Discussion with Debevoise re. Committee appeal
02/24/2003	1.0	2	Conference call with Jay, Kathy, Laura
02/24/2003	1.0	2	Calls with Jay and Kathy
02/25/2003	0.5	3	Review various documents (court filings)
02/25/2003	0.5	4	Review financial documents
02/26/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with Company and counsel
02/27/2003	1.0	2	Call with J Sinder
02/28/2003	1.0	1	Review of fee application
02/28/2003	0.5	2	Team update
03/03/2003	1.0	1	Review of fee application
03/03/2003	1.0	2	Team update
03/04/2003	0.5	2	Various calls with Jay, Kathy, etc.
03/05/2003	0.5	2	Various calls with Jay, Kathy
03/06/2003	1.5	2	Conference call with Company and Pachulski
03/07/2003	1.0	3	Team meeting regarding work requirements on revised business plan and preparation of Board presentation
03/07/2003	1.0	2	Calls with Company
03/07/2003	0.5	2	Team update re: bank/creditor meeting
03/09/2003	4.0	3	Review and editing of Board presentation
03/10/2003	2.0	2	Board Call
03/10/2003	0.5	2	Calls with Jay
03/10/2003	0.5	2	Call with Rick/K&E
03/10/2003	2.0	2	Call with Jay, MDP, Debra
03/10/2003	2.5	2	Board and follow up conference calls regarding updated business plan, process and arrangement for unsecured creditors
03/10/2003	1.0	3	Review Board presentation
03/11/2003	1.0	2	Various call with management
03/12/2003	3.0	2	Bank Group meeting at Akin Gump with FTI, lenders
03/12/2003	1.0	2	Team update following Bank/Creditor meeting
03/12/2003	1.5	2	Breakfast meeting management, lawyers
03/12/2003	4.0	2	Meeting with management, unsec committee
03/14/2003	1.0	2	Discussion regarding MBL retention and fees
03/17/2003	1.0	2	Calls with management
03/18/2003	2.5	4	Various financial modelling regarding recoveries
03/18/2003	4.5	1	Review and editing of Disc Statement and POR
03/19/2003	1.0	2	Calls with J Sinder
03/19/2003	3.0	1	Review and editing of Disclosure statement
03/20/2003	0.5	2	Various conversations regarding status
03/20/2003	0.5	2	Team update re: mbl fees
03/21/2003	2.5	1	Review of disclosure statement
03/21/2003 03/22/2003	0.5	2	Various discussions with management
03/24/2003	0.5	4	Discussion regarding revised working capital assumptions in projections and overall process
3312412003	1.0	2 2	Team update re: case status Various discussions with J. Perry and J. Sinder; group update on case situation
03/25/2003	1.0		

Date	Hours	Proj	Description
03/26/2003	1.0	2	Call with Company, K&E, Pachulski, and MDP regarding status
03/26/2003	1.5	4	Calls and discussions regarding warrant valuation
03/28/2003	0.5	2	Calls with board members and Jay
03/31/2003	1.0	2	Internal discussion re, next steps and financial analysis
03/31/2003	0.5	2	Call with management
03/31/2003	1.0	2	Team update
04/01/2003			
04/02/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with banks, management
04/02/2003	1.0	2	conf call regarding mgmt equity plan
	0.5	2	Team update
04/03/2003	0.5	2	Discussion regarding US Trustee Objection to D/S
04/07/2003	1.0	2	Various phone calls
04/08/2003	1.0	4	Review of various financial analyses
04/08/2003	1.0	2	Team update
04/09/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with management and lawyers
04/09/2003	1.0	2	Various inlemal meetings/discussions re disclosure hearing
04/10/2003	0.5	2	Various calls with management
04/11/2003	1.0	1	Interim Fee App
04/11/2003	1.5	2	Team call re: D/S hearing
04/13/2003	2.0	2	Conference call with Focal, K&E, Pachulski to review disclosure statement items
04/14/2003	1.5	2	Conference call with Focal and counsel to review amended language and analysis to be sent to Objectors
04/15/2003	0.5	2	Review of case status and progress
04/16/2003	1.0	2	Various phone calls with management and MDP
04/17/2003	1.0	2	Conference call with Focal and counsel to discuss objectors responses to ameded disclosure and discuss next steps
04/18/2003	0.5	2	Update of case status
04/22/2003	1.5	2	Various phone calls with management
04/23/2003	1.0	2	Review of various financial analyses
04/29/2003	0.5	2	Phone conversation with Jay Sinder at Focal
04/30/2003	2.0	2	Participate in conference call with Board of Directors
05/01/2003	1.0	4	Review proposed senior credit facility financial covenants. Discussion with Fazal, Sinder and Glogoff
05/01/2003	0.5	2	Team update on case status
05/02/2003	1.0	4	Call with Company to discuss revised bank facility covenants
05/06/2003	1.5	4	Call with Company management to discuss covenants; call with FTI and bank group to discuss covenants
05/07/2003	1.5	2	Review of various documents
05/08/2003	1.0	1	Review GE Disclosure request. Call with Jay Sinder.
05/08/2003	1.0	2	Team update on case status
05/09/2003	1.0	2	Calls with management
05/11/2003	0.5	2	Conference call with Jay Sinder to review discovery requests and strategy
05/12/2003			Conference calls with Company and counsel to discuss discovery requests. Discussions with internal
	1.5	2	counsel on strategy
05/13/2003	1.0	2	Various internal discussions on discovery and calls with Jay Sinder, counsel
05/14/2003	1.5	2	Conference call on discovery with counsel and the Company
05/14/2003	1.5	2	Conference call with Mike Wiles at Debevoise
05/14/2003	1.0	1	Various internal discussions on disclosure statement and discovery issues. Calls with Jay Sinder
05/14/2003	0.5	2	Team discussion re: MBLY fees
05/15/2003	1.0	1	Review of various internal documents for discovery process
05/16/2003	0.5	2	Conference call with Company, advisors on discovery requests
05/19/2003	1.0	1	Call with PSZYJW to discuss unsecured creditor recoveries. Preparation of analysis to review changes
05/21/2003	1.5	2	Review of various documents
05/22/2003	1.0	2	Call with J. Sinder and D. O'Shea on case update and covenants. Review of revised covenant package
05/22/2003	0.5	2	Case update
05/23/2003	0.5	2	Call with J. Sinder and D. O'Shea to review revised covenants
Q5/27/2003	1.0	1	Case update and review of action steps. Review of presentation summarizing changes based on NTFC preliminary agreement
05/29/2003	1.0	2	Calls with management
06/02/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with Jay Sinder on case strategy
06/03/2003	5.0	2	Participate in bank group meetings with Company and counsel
06/04/2003	1.0	4	Calls with Sinder, analysis of credit agreement and covenants
06/04/2003	1.0	2	Case status re: litigation, discovery, etc.
06/05/2003	1.0	2	Various calls
	0.5	2	Various calls
06/06/2003	T.U		
	1.0	2	Conference call with Company and counsel regarding cash balances and BellSouth responses
06/06/2003 06/10/2003 06/11/2003	1.0 1.0	2	Conference call with Company and counsel regarding cash balances and BellSouth responses Calls with management
	1.0 1.0 1.0	2 2 2	Conference call with Company and counsel regarding cash balances and BellSouth responses Calls with management Conf call with Focal team

Date	Hours	Proj	Description
06/14/2003	2.0	2	Team update re: depositions
06/15/2003	1.0	2	Conf call with Focal, Pachulski
06/15/2003	1.0	2	Call with Kathy
06/16/2003	1.5	2	Various calls and internal discussions
06/16/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with FTI and Jay Sinder
06/17/2003	2.5	1	Drafting of confirmation affidavit
06/18/2003	3.0	4	Preparation for confirmation
06/18/2003 06/18/2003	1.0	2	Board call
06/19/2003	0.5	2	Pre-confirmation hearing meeting
06/19/2003	2.5	5	Travel to and from Philadelphia Confirmation hearing
06/25/2003	8.0 5.0	1 3	
06/28/2003	5.0 3.0	3	Work on strategic options presentation Work on strategic options presentation
06/30/2003	0.5	4	Review emergence cash forecast with Sprung
Golub - Jared		7	Neview emergence cash forecast with optiming
12/19/2002	1.5	2	Conference call with management and lawyers
12/19/2002	1.0	2	Calls with bondholders
12/19/2002	1.0	2	Team update re: first day filing
12/21/2002	0.5	3	Bondholder contact log
12/21/2002	0.5	1	Review of Disclosure Statement
12/21/2002	0.5	4	Liquidation analysis and projections
12/22/2002	1.0	1	Review/editing of Plan/DS
12/24/2002	1.0	4	Review of projections for disclosure statement
12/30/2002	1.0	2	Review of case status
12/30/2002	0.5	1	Review bankruptcy court motions on rejecting executory contracts.
12/31/2002	0.5	2	Case update
12/31/2002	0.5	2	Call with bondholder re: committee formation
12/31/2002	1.0	2	Calls with company and local counsel
12/31/2002	1.0	4	Review of financial analysis materials
12/31/2002	0.5	2	Call with J Sinder re: Unsecured Committee
01/07/2003	0.5	4	Review comparable company analysis, discuss restructuring transaction fees
01/09/2003 01/10/2003	0.5	4	Call with D O'Shea to discuss model
01/10/2003	1.0 1.0	3 3	Discussion re: creditor presentation Drafting of creditor presentation
01/10/2003	0.5	4	Call with D O'Shea regarding model
01/10/2003	1.5	3	Drafting of committee presentation
01/11/2003	3.0	3	Drafting of committee presentation
01/12/2003	4.5	3	Drafting of committee presentation
01/13/2003	2.5	3	Drafting of creditor presentation
01/13/2003	0.5	2	Team update
01/13/2003	2.5	3	Review and editing of committee presentation
01/13/2003	2.0	2	Conf call regarding KERP and committee presentation
01/14/2003	3.5	3	Drafting and review of creditor presentations
01/14/2003	1.0	4	Calls with D O'shea regarding creditor presentation
01/15/2003	0.5	2	Conference call
01/15/2003	5.0	3	Drafting and review of committee presentations
01/16/2003	6.5	2	Creditors committee meeting
01/16/2003	0.5	2	Review of creditors meeting
01/16/2003 01/16/2003	0.5	4	Call with Rich Parisi
01/16/2003	0.5	2	Chanin due diligence review
01/17/2003	0.5	2	Team update Various calls with D O'shea
01/17/2003	1.5 1.5	2 2	Various calls with Chanin
01/19/2003	2.0	3	Preparation of due diligence materials
01/20/2003	0.5	2	Call with D O'shea
01/20/2003	2.0	3	Preparation of due diligence materials
01/20/2003	1.0	2	Team update
01/21/2003	2.0	2	Various calls with Chanin
01/21/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with D O'shea
01/21/2003	0.5	2	Conf call with company to discuss PR
01/22/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with chanin
01/23/2003	3.0	5	Travel to Chicago
01/23/2003	10.0	2	Meetings with Chanin in Chicago
01/24/2003	3.0	5	Travel to NYC
01/24/2003	1.0	2	Review of Chanin meetings in Chicago
01/26/2003	3.0	1	Preparation of documents for supoena
01/27/2003	0.5	1	Discussion on subpoena

Date	Hours	Proj	Description
01/27/2003	2.0	1	Preparation of fee comps
01/28/2003	2.0	1	Meeting with M. Wiles re: discovery
01/28/2003	2.5	1	Preparation of documents for subpoena request
01/29/2003	3.0	1	Preparation of documents for subpoena
01/30/2003	1.0	2	Conf call with Company and lawyers
01/31/2003	1.0	1	Subpoena documents
01/31/2003	4.5	1	Deposition preparation with M. Wiles of Debevoise
01/31/2003	1.0	2	Team update re: retention
02/02/2003	2.0	1	Deposition preparation with M. Wiles of Debevoise
02/04/2003	2.0	1	Preparation for retention hearing
02/05/2003	2.0	5	Travel to and from Philadelphia for court hearing
02/05/2003	3.5	1	Court hearing
02/07/2003	0.5	2	Call with J. Perry
02/10/2003	2.0	1	Preparation of fee application
02/11/2003	1.0	2	Team update
02/14/2003	2.0	2	Board of Directors call
02/19/2003	0.5	4	Review of weekly cash forecast
02/19/2003	0.5	2	Team update
02/20/2003	1.0	2	Kerp hearing issues
02/26/2003 02/27/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with Company and counsel
	1.0	2	Call with J Sinder
02/28/2003 02/28/2003	1.0	1	Review of fee application
	0.5	2	Team update
03/03/2003 03/03/2003	0.5	2	Call with D O'Shea regarding model
03/03/2003	1.0	1	Review of fee application
03/05/2003	1.0	2	Team update
03/07/2003	1.5	1	Fee application Team meeting regarding work requirements on revised business plan and preparation of Board
00/01/2000	1.0	3	presentation
03/07/2003	0.5	2	Team update re: bank/creditor meeting
03/08/2003	6.5	3	Preparation of presentation materials for Board presentation
03/08/2003	1.0	4	Update of valuation
03/08/2003	2.0	4	Update of financial model
03/09/2003	7.5	3	Review and editing of Board presentation
03/10/2003	1.0	3	Review Board presentation
03/11/2003	5.0	4	Various financial analyses regarding new plan
03/12/2003	3.0	2	Bank Group meeting at Akin Gump with FTI, lenders
03/12/2003	1.0	2	Team update following Bank/Creditor meeting
03/14/2003 03/15/2003	1.0	2	Discussion regarding MBL retention and fees
03/17/2003	1.5	3	Update board presentation Fee application
03/17/2003	1.0 2.0	1	Drafting of presentation
03/17/2003	0.5	3 1	Fee application
03/17/2003	4.5	1	Discovery request
03/18/2003	4.5 2.5	4	Various financial modelling regarding recoveries
03/18/2003	4.5	1	Review and editing of Disc Statement and POR
03/18/2003	5.0	i	Discovery request
03/19/2003	1.0	2	Calls with J Sinder
03/19/2003	1.5	4	Financial analyses for Disc Statement
03/19/2003	3.0	1	Review and editing of Disclosure statement
03/20/2003	1.0	2	Various conversations with B Godshall
03/20/2003	1.5	4	Update of financial model
03/20/2003	2.5	1	Editing and reviewing Disclosure Statement and POR
03/20/2003	0.5	2	Various conversations regarding status
03/20/2003	0.5	2	Team update re: mbl fees
03/21/2003	2.5	1	Review of disclosure statement
03/22/2003	1.0	1	Review and editing Disclsoure statement
03/22/2003	1.0	4	Financial modelling - comparison of current and revised plan
03/24/2003	2.0	4	Discussions with Mike Kelly at Ernst & Young regarding bankruptcy accounting, updating of projections
03/24/2003	1.5	А	to reflect changes Various modelling for working capital changes
03/24/2003	1.5	4	
03/25/2003	1.0	2 4	Team update re: case status Conference calls with Chanin regarding revised disclosure statement, projections and valuation
	2.0	4	Financial modelling of revised projections for disclosure statement
03/25/2003	£.U	-	i maneter modeling or revised projections for disclosure statement
03/25/2003 03/25/2003		2	Various discussions with I Perm and I Sinder; group update on sees situation
03/25/2003 03/25/2003 03/26/2003	1.0 1.0	2 2	Various discussions with J. Perry and J. Sinder; group update on case situation Call with Company, K&E, Pachulski, and MDP regarding status

Date	Hours	Proj	Description
03/26/2003	1.5	1	Final review and editing of POR/DS
03/27/2003	0.5	3	Editing of press release
03/28/2003	1.5	3	Call with Company, Investors regarding business plan
03/31/2003	2.5	3	Business plan call with investors, company
03/31/2003	1.0	2	Internal discussion re. next steps and financial analysis
03/31/2003	1.0	2	Team update
04/01/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with banks, management
04/02/2003	1.0	2	conf call regarding mgmt equity plan
04/02/2003	0.5	2	Team update
04/03/2003	0.5	2	Discussion regarding US Trustee Objection to D/S
04/03/2003	1.0	ī	Preparation of Interim Fee App
04/08/2003	1.0	ż	Team update
04/09/2003	1.0	2	Various internal meetings/discussions re disclosure hearing
04/11/2003	1.0	ī	Interim Fee App
04/11/2003	1.5	ż	Team call re: D/S hearing
04/11/2003	1.5	4	Recovery comparison analysis
04/13/2003	2.0	2	Conference call with Focal, K&E, Pachulski to review disclosure statement items
04/17/2003	2.0	1	Preparation of liquidation analysis in presentation format
04/18/2003			Conf call with advisors and company to discuss D/S
04/18/2003	1.0 0.5	2	Update of case status
04/21/2003		2	·
04/2 1/2003	0.5	2	Conference call with Focal and counsel to review revised disclosure statement and comments to
04/21/2003	0.5		objections and liquidation analysis
	0.5	4	Review additional Plan vs. Liquidation subsidiary level analysis
04/21/2003	0.5	1	Editing fee application
04/22/2003	2.0	4	Liquidation anlaysis
04/23/2003	1.0	2	Conference call with Focal, counsel regarding objections to Disclosure Statement
04/23/2003	2.0	4	Liquidation analysis
04/23/2003	1.0	2	Review of various financial analyses
04/24/2003	1.5	4	Liquidation analysis
04/25/2003	2.5	4	Liquidation analysis
04/28/2003	1.0	1	review of disclosure statement
04/29/2003	1.0	1	review of disclosure statement
05/01/2003	1.0	4	Review proposed senior credit facility financial covenants. Discussion with Fazal, Sinder and Glogoff
05/01/2003	0.5	2	Team update on case status
05/02/2003	1.0	4	Call with Company to discuss revised bank facility covenants
05/05/2003	1.0	4	Review suggested bank covenants and research of comparable CLEC covenant packages
05/06/2003	1.0	4	Review of other CLEC covenant packages (i.e. US LEC)
05/06/2003	1.5	4	Call with Company management to discuss covenants; call with FTI and bank group to discuss
			covenants
05/06/2003	1.0	4	Review of financial covenants of comparable telecom transactions
05/08/2003	1.0	2	Team update on case status
05/12/2003	4.0	4	Preparation of expert valuation report
05/12/2003	1.5	2	Conference calls with Company and counsel to discuss discovery requests. Discussions with internal
			counsel on strategy
05/12/2003	1.0	1	Compilation of documents for discovery. Discussion with technical staff on aggregation of emails and
			files
05/13/2003	2.0	1	Preparation of discovery materials. Internal discussions with technical team
05/13/2003	4.0	4	Preparation of expert reports on valuation and liquidation
05/13/2003	1.0	2	Various internal discussions on discovery and calls with Jay Sinder, counsel
05/14/2003	1.5	2	Conference call on discovery with counsel and the Company
05/14/2003	2.0	1	Preparation of discovery materials. Internal discussions with technical team
05/14/2003	1.5	2	Conference call with Mike Wiles at Debevoise
05/14/2003	5.0	4	Preparation of expert reports on valuation and liquidation
05/14/2003	0.5	2	Team discussion re: MBLY fees
05/15/2003	3.0	4	Review and update of expert valuation reports
05/15/2003	4.0	1	Preparation of discovery requests
05/15/2003	0.5	4	Various calls with Debra O'Shea at Focal
05/16/2003	2.0	4	Preparation of valuation report
05/16/2003	2.0 1.5	1	Preparation of discovery request
05/16/2003	1.5 0.5		Conference call with Company, advisors on discovery requests
		2	Conversations with Sinder and Debra O'Shea at the Company
	0.5 3.0	2	
05/16/2003	2.11	1	Preparation of discovery requests, meet with K&E paralegal, various calls with counsel and the
	5.0		
05/16/2003 05/16/2003		4	Company Propers discovery information, call with lared Calub
05/16/2003 05/16/2003 05/17/2003	3.0	1	Prepare discovery information - call with Jared Golub
05/16/2003 05/16/2003		1 1 1	

	Hours		Description
05/19/2003	3.0	1	Prepare discovery information. Meeting with K&E paralegal
05/19/2003	1.0	4	Update expert reports - call with Debevoise & Plimpton
05/19/2003	1.0	1	Call with PSZYJW to discuss unsecured creditor recoveries. Preparation of analysis to review changes
05/20/2003	2.0	1	Fee application
05/20/2003	1.0	2	Discussions with J Sinder and Pachulski regarding valuation report and editing report
05/20/2003	2.0	1	Preparation of discovery materials, several calls/correspondence with PSZYJW
05/20/2003	1.0	1	Preparation of expert reports. Calls with Jared Golub and the Company
05/21/2003	4.0	4	Finalization of expert reports. Preparation of signature pages
05/22/2003	1.0	2	Call with J. Sinder and D. O'Shea on case update and covenants. Review of revised covenant package
05/22/2003	0.5	2	Case update
05/23/2003	1.0	4	Review of revised covenant package and alternatives suggested by the Company
05/23/2003	0.5	2	Call with J. Sinder and D. O'Shea to review revised covenants
05/27/2003	1.0	4	Update of valuation and recovery analysis
05/27/2003	1.0	1	Case update and review of action steps. Review of presentation summarizing changes based on NTFC preliminary agreement
05/27/2003	1.0	1	Review of presentation based on preliminary NTFC agreement. Discussions with Golub.
05/27/2003	2.0	2	Conference call to review bank agreement with Company and counsel
05/29/2003	1.0	4	Covenant analysis
06/02/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with Jay Sinder on case strategy
06/02/2003	0.5	2	Review of draft presentation materials for Bank Group meeting
06/04/2003	2.5	4	Various financial analyses and discussions regarding model
06/04/2003	4.0	4	Calls with Company and FTI to discuss covenants. Analysis of covenants and cushions
06/04/2003	1.0	4	Calls with Sinder, analysis of credit agreement and covenants
06/04/2003	1.0	2	Case status re: litigation, discovery, etc.
06/09/2003	2.0	4	Review of expert report by Bell South and analyze cash sources and uses as of the Effective Date
06/10/2003	1.0	2	Conference call with Company and counsel regarding cash balances and BellSouth responses
06/11/2003	4.0	4	Preparation of revised sources and uses, emergence CF forecasts, multiple calls with Company and counsel
06/13/2003	3.5	4	Review of financial projections
06/14/2003	1.0	2	Conf call with Focal team
06/14/2003	1.0	4	Review revised model
06/14/2003	2.0	2	Team update re: depositions
06/15/2003	1.0	2	Conf call with Focal, Pachulski
06/16/2003	1.5	2	Various calls and internal discussions
06/16/2003	0.5	1	Calls with Counsel on preparation of affidavit for confirmation hearing
06/16/2003	1.0	4	Review revised model and cash forecasts. Send information on emergence of forecasts to FTI
06/16/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with FTI and Jay Sinder
06/17/2003	4.5	4	Review of various financial models and projections
06/17/2003	2.5	1	Drafting of confirmation affidavit
06/18/2003	3.0	4	Preparation for confirmation
06/18/2003	4.5	4	Review of financial projections
06/18/2003	1.0	2	Board call
06/18/2003	0.5	2	Pre-confirmation hearing meeting
06/19/2003	2.5	5	Travel to and from Philadelphia
06/19/2003	8.0	1	Confirmation hearing
06/20/2003	2.5	3	strategic options presentation
06/23/2003	4.0	3	strategic options presentation
06/24/2003	5.0	3	Strategic options presentation
06/25/2003	5.0	3	Work on strategic options presentation
06/26/2003	5.0	3	Work on strategic options presentation
06/28/2003	3.0	3	Work on strategic options presentation
06/29/2003	2.0	3	Work on strategic options presentation
06/30/2003	2.0	4	Review emergence cash forecasts; calls with Sinder, O'Shea and Butler
u - Harold	37.5		
01/21/2003	2.0	1	Telephone conversation with M.Wiles; correspondence with US Trustee concerning potential objections to MBL retention, conferences with MBL professionals concerning standard of review of success fees.
01/22/2003	5.0	1	Telephone conversation with M Wiles concerning MBL retention; survey retention orders in other bankruptcy cases; conferences with other MBL professionals concerning the standard of review for MBL transaction fees.
01/27/2003	0.5	1	Discussion on subpoena
01/28/2003	2.0	i	Meeting with M. Wiles re; discovery
01/28/2003	2.0	1	attention to creditor's committee subpeona; preparation for retention hearing; conference with MBL employees re: same; conf. with M. Wiles of D&P.
01/31/2003	4.5	1	Deposition preparation with M. Wiles of Debevoise
02/02/2003	2.0	i	Deposition preparation with M. Wiles of Debevoise
02/03/2003	6.0	i	Review response to committee objections, prepare revised draft retention order addressing US trustee
		•	

Date	Hours	Ргој	Description
02/04/2003	2.0	1	Preparation for retention hearing
02/05/2003	2.0	5	Travel to and from Philadelphia for court hearing
02/05/2003	3.5	1	Court hearing
05/14/2003	2.0	1	Preparation of discovery materials. Internal discussions with technical team
05/14/2003	1.5	2	Conference call with Mike Wiles at Debevoise
06/17/2003	2.5	1	Drafting of confirmation affidavit
Sprung -	450.0		·
12/19/2002	1.0	2	Team update re: first day filing
12/20/2002	1.0	4	Review Disclosure Statement and significant creditor termsheet
12/24/2002	1.0	4	Review revised projections and liquidation analysis for disclosure statement
12/30/2002	1.0	2	Review of case status
12/30/2002	0.5	1	Review bankruptcy court motions on rejecting executory contracts.
12/30/2002	0.5	4	Review of revised termsheet/correspondence with NTFC
12/31/2002	0.5	2	Case update
12/31/2002	0.5	2	Call with bondholder re: committee formation
12/31/2002	1.0	2	Calls with company and local counsel
12/31/2002	1.0	4	Review of financial analysis materials
12/31/2002	0.5	2	Call with J Sinder re: Unsecured Committee
01/02/2003	2.5	3	Develop presentation outline for Creditor Committee formation meeting. Conversations with Jay Sinder
01/02/2003	2.0	1	Review draft Plan of Reorganization - call with B. Grohsgal
01/03/2003	1.0	2	Call w/K. Perone regarding creditor committee formation meeting; calls w/J. Sinder regarding creditor
01/03/2003	2 5	4	committee meeting, KERP. Analysis sent to FTI
0110312003	2.5	1	Review and comment on Disclosure Statement draft - conversations with B. Grohsgal and Laura Davis Jones
01/04/2003	2.0	1	Review of Disclosure Statement
01/05/2003	1.5	4	Review of disclosure statement and projections - conversations with B. Grohsgal of Pachulski
01/06/2003	1.0	4	Conversations with Debra O'Shea on revised debt balances, restructuring fees - resend analysis
	1.0	_	update
01/06/2003	1.0	2	Team update
01/07/2003	3.5	2	Detailed review of disclosure statement - several iterations. Discussions with J. Sinder, R. Eubanks
			and B. Grohsgal
01/07/2003	0.5	4	Review comparable company analysis, discuss restructuring transaction fees
01/10/2003	1.0	3	Discussion re: creditor presentation
01/13/2003	0.5	2	Team update
01/13/2003	2.5	3	Review and editing of committee presentation
01/13/2003	2.0	2	Conf call regarding KERP and committee presentation
01/14/2003	3.5	3	Drafting and review of creditor presentations
01/14/2003	1.0	4	Calls with D O'shea regarding creditor presentation
01/14/2003	0.5	2	Call with K. Perone regarding creditor call and creditor committee presentation
01/15/2003	0.5	2	Conference call
01/15/2003	5.0	3	Drafting and review of committee presentations
01/16/2003	6.5	2	Creditors committee meeting
01/16/2003 01/16/2003	0.5	2	Review of creditors meeting
01/16/2003	0.5	2	Chanin due diligence review
01/17/2003	0.5 1.5	2 2	Team update Various calls with D O'shea
01/17/2003	1.5	2	Various calls with Chanin
01/20/2003	1.0	2	Team update
01/21/2003	2.0	2	Various calls with Chanin
01/21/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with D O'shea
01/21/2003	0.5	2	Conf call with company to discuss PR
01/22/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with chanin
01/22/2003	1.5	4	Cash Collateral call with Company, Pachulski, Banks, Skadden, FTI
01/24/2003	1.5	1	Discussion with Debevoise re. Subpoena
01/24/2003	1.0	2	Review of Chanin meetings in Chicago
01/26/2003	1.0	2	call with Special Committee (tim, colin) and Pachulski (laura)
01/28/2003	2.0	1	Meeting with M. Wiles re: discovery
01/28/2003	1.0	2	Board of Directors Conference Call
01/28/2003	2.0	2	Conference call with Debra O'Shea - review of Chanin due diligence list and materials to be compiled
01/29/2003	6.0	5	Travel to and from Chicago for Chanin due diligence meetings at Focal
01/29/2003	9.0	2	Chanin due diligence meetings at Focal
01/30/2003	1.0	2	Conf call with Company and lawyers
01/30/2003	1.0	1	Comparable transaction investment banker fee analysis preparation
01/31/2003	4.5	1	Deposition preparation with M. Wiles of Debevoise
01/31/2003 02/02/2003	1.0	2	Team update re: retention
02/02/2003	2.0	1	Deposition preparation with M. Wiles of Debevoise Preparation for retention hearing
CHOMEGOO	2.0	1	reparation to retention hearing

Date	Hours	Proj	Description
02/05/2003	2.0	5	Travel to and from Philadelphia for court hearing
02/05/2003	3.5	1	Court hearing
02/07/2003	0.5	2	Call with J. Perry
02/10/2003	1.0	2	Discussion with D. O'Shea on CTA due-diligence, updates to business model
02/11/2003	1.0	2	Team update
02/19/2003	0.5	2	Team update
02/20/2003	1.0	2	Kerp hearing issues
02/26/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with Company and counsel
02/27/2003	0.5	4	Discussion with D. O'Shea on revised forecast
02/27/2003	1.0	2	Call with J Sinder
02/28/2003	1.0	1	Review of fee application
02/28/2003	0.5	2	Team update
03/03/2003	1.0	1	Review of fee application
03/03/2003	1.0	2	Team update
03/04/2003	1.0	2	Discussion with Mike Mecham, VP Corp. Dev., XO Comm. regarding case status. Sent POR & Disc. Statement
03/06/2003	1.5	2	Conference call with Company and Pachulski
03/06/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with D. O'Shea regarding revised business plan
03/07/2003	1.0	3	Team meeting regarding work requirements on revised business plan and preparation of Board presentation
03/07/2003	0.5	2	Call with D. O'Shea regarding revised business operating forecast
03/07/2003	0.5	2	Team update re: bank/creditor meeting
03/08/2003	6.0	2	Review and analysis of revised business operating forecast. Call with Debra O'Shea. Preparation of presentation materials for Board presentation
03/09/2003	4.0	3	Review and editing of Board presentation
03/09/2003	4.0	3	Review and mark-up changes for Board presentation
03/10/2003	2.0	2	Board Call
03/10/2003	0.5	2	Call with Rick/K&E
03/10/2003	2.0	2	Call with Jay, MDP, Debra
03/10/2003	2.5	2	Board and follow up conference calls regarding updated business plan, process and arrangement for unsecured creditors
03/10/2003	1.0	3	Review Board presentation
03/11/2003	1.0	3	Review and modify Board presentation. Calls with MDP regarding treatment of warrants
03/11/2003	2.0	2	Review of updated operating model and necessary changes; calls with D. O'Shea. Preparation of model to share with FTI
03/12/2003	3.0	2	Bank Group meeting at Akin Gump with FTI, lenders
03/12/2003	1.0	2	Team update following Bank/Creditor meeting
03/14/2003	1.0	2	Discussion regarding MBL retention and fees
03/16/2003	1.0	2	Send revised full financial model to MDP and outline assumed expenses upon emergence
03/17/2003	1.0	4	Several calls with Jay Sinder regarding asset write-downs, liquidation analysis, number of share assumptions and other plan of reorganization process issues
03/17/2003	1.0	4	Discussion with D. O'Shea and G. Custar regarding year end balance sheet asset adjustments and changes to projections to incorporate. Follow-up discussions with Golub
03/17/2003	0.5	3	Review draft presentation on plan of reorganization and business plan overview
03/17/2003	0.5	4	Review and revised liquidation analysis
03/17/2003	0.5	1	Review first MBL fee application following suggested changes from counsel
03/18/2003	2.5	4	Various financial modelling regarding recoveries
03/18/2003	4.5	1	Review and editing of Disc Statement and POR
03/19/2003	1.0	2	Calls with J Sinder
03/19/2003	1.5	4	Financial analyses for Disc Statement
03/19/2003	3.0	1	Review and editing of Disclosure statement
03/20/2003	1.0	2	Various conversations with B Godshall
03/20/2003	2.5	1	Editing and reviewing Disclosure Statement and POR
03/20/2003	0.5	2	Team update re: mbl fees
03/21/2003 03/21/2003	2.5	1	Review of disclosure statement Review of working copital accumptions with DIOShop; call with M. Clareff of ET.
03/21/2003	1.0	3	Review of working capital assumptions with D'OShea; call with M. Glogoff of FTI
03/21/2003	1.0	1 1	Review of disclosure statement; call with M. Gibson at Kirkland & Ellis Review and editing Disclsoure statement
03/22/2003	1.0 1.0	4	Updating of disclosure statement valuation section. Discussion with K&E and Golub
03/22/2003	0.5	4	Discussion regarding revised working capital assumptions in projections and overall process
03/22/2003	0.5	3	Discussion regarding working capital assumptions, revised bank amortization schedule and process
03/24/2003	2.0	4	update Discussions with Mike Kelly at Ernst & Young regarding bankruptcy accounting, updating of projections to reflect changes
03/24/2003	1.0	3	to reflect changes Discussions with Jay Sinder and Debra O'Shea regarding working capital assumptions and proposed changes to projections. Review of analysis prepared by Company and discussion of MBL analysis
03/24/2003	1.0	1	Review of revised Plan and Disclosure Statement. Discussion with Bruce Grohsgal

Date	Hours	Proj	Description
03/24/2003	1.0	2	Team update re: case status
03/25/2003	1.0	4	Conference calls with Chanin regarding revised disclosure statement, projections and valuation
03/25/2003	0.5	3	Various calls with Jay Sinder on updated projections and working capital assumptions
03/25/2003	0.5	3	Various calls with Debra O'Shea regarding revised projections and working capital assumptions
03/25/2003	2.0	4	Financial modelling of revised projections for disclosure statement
03/25/2003	1.0	2	Various discussions with J. Perry and J. Sinder; group update on case situation
03/26/2003	1.0	2	Call with Company, K&E, Pachulski, and MDP regarding status
03/26/2003	1.5	4	Calls and discussions regarding warrant valuation
03/26/2003	1.5	1	Final review and editing of POR/DS
03/27/2003	0.5	3	Editing of press release
03/27/2003	0.5	2	Calls with Debra O'Shea - update on process
03/28/2003	0.5 1.5	3	Call with Company, Investors regarding business plan
03/31/2003	1.0	2	Internal discussion re. next steps and financial analysis
03/31/2003	1.0	2	Team update
04/02/2003	0.5	2	Team update
04/03/2003	0.5	2	
04/03/2003		1	Discussion regarding US Trustee Objection to D/S Callo with B. Grahagal and J. Sindar regarding US Trustee objections to disclosure eleternation to provide the control of
	1.0	-	Calls with B. Grohsgal and J. Sinder regarding US Trustee objections to disclosure statement, internal discussions with Fazal, Golub regarding resolution
04/04/2003	0.5	4	Conversation regarding amended Plan with Business Development managers at XO Communications
04/07/2003	0.5	1	Call with Bruce Grohsgal to review response to US Trustee's objection to Disclosure Statement
04/07/2003	1.0	2	Various phone calls
04/08/2003	1.0	2	Team update
04/09/2003	2.0	1	Review amended disclosure statement, several conversations with counsel at Pachulski
04/09/2003	1.0	4	Discussions with Valuation Research on asset valuation analysis; follow up conversations with Pachulski
04/09/2003	1.5	4	Update of MBL plan of reorganization and valuation overview analysis. Discussions with Fazal and Golub.
04/09/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with management and lawyers
04/09/2003	1.0	2	Various internal meetings/discussions re disclosure hearing
04/10/2003	0.5	2	Discussion with Jay Sinder on NTFC capital claims and amended analysis for liquidation analysis in disclosure statement per US Trustee objection
04/10/2003	1.0	1	Preparation of amended disclosure statement language for liquidation analysis section - discussions with Glenn Custar and Tom Kane at Focal
04/10/2003	2.5	4	Revision of liquidation analysis with Glenn Custar of Focal. Conversations with Focal and Pachulski
04/11/2003	1.5	ż	Team call re: D/S hearing
04/11/2003	4.0	5	Travel to and from Philadelphia for bankruptcy court hearing
04/11/2003	5.0	2	Attend bankruptcy court hearing and subsequent conference call with debtors and their advisors
04/12/2003	2.0	4	regarding amendments to disclosure statement Prepare liquidation analysis by subsidiary. Conference call with Sinder and Kane at Focal
04/13/2003	1.0	4	Prepare and send liquidation and recovery comparison analysis. Several phone converations with
			Tom Kane at Focal
04/13/2003	2.0	2	Conference call with Focal, K&E, Pachulski to review disclosure statement items
04/14/2003	1.5	2	Conference call with Focal and counsel to review amended language and analysis to be sent to Objectors
04/14/2003	2.5	4	Review and preparation of subsidiary liquidation analysis. Several calls with Sinder and Kane at Focal
04/15/2003	2.0	4	Review and finalized subsidiary liquidation analysis and distribute to counsel. Calls with Sinder and Kane regarding changes
04/15/2003	1.0	2	Conference call with Focal and counsel on amended language and analysis sent to objectors
04/15/2003	0.5	2	Review of case status and progress
04/16/2003	1.0	2	Mark-up of changes to liquidation analysis section of disclosure statement
04/16/2003	1.0	4	Revised liquidation analysis per discussions with Jay Sinder at Focal
04/17/2003	1.0	2	Conference call with Focal and counsel to discuss objectors responses to ameded disclosure and discuss next steps
04/17/2003	0.5	4	Preparation of revised subsidiary liquidation analysis for insertion into disclosure statement; discussions with Jared Golub
04/18/2003	1.0	2	Conf call with advisors and company to discuss D/S
04/21/2003	0.5	1	Review March 2003 Second MBL Fee Application
04/21/2003	2.0	i	Review revised Plan of Reorganization and Disclosure Statement and provide comments to counsel
04/21/2003	0.5	2	Conference call with Focal and counsel to review revised disclosure statement and comments to objections and liquidation analysis
04/21/2003	0.5	4	Review additional Plan vs. Liquidation subsidiary level analysis
04/22/2003	1.0	4	Review of comparative subsidiary liquidation analysis, call with Matt Berns at Focal, distribution to
04/23/2003	0.5	4	Company and counsel
	0.5	1	Review second fee application
04/23/2003	1.0	2	Conference call with Focal, counsel regarding objections to Disclosure Statement
04/23/2003 04/24/2003	1.0	2	Review of various financial analyses
	4.0	1	Review and mark-up of disclosure statement additions. Additional subsidiary liquidation analysis on

			Description
04/25/2003	4.0	5	Travel to and from bankruptcy court hearing in Deleware
04/25/2003	3.0	1	Attend bankruptcy court hearing in Deleware
04/25/2003	0.5	2	Review next steps and send correspondence to counsel and Company.
04/26/2003 04/28/2003	0.5	2	Review cash allocation by subsidiary and send email correspondence to Company
04/29/2003	1.0 2.5	2 4	Phone conversations with Company and Jared Golub at MBL on revised liquidation analysis
04/13/2000	2.5	4	Prepare revised liquidation analysis and mark-up disclosure statement for changes. Correspondence with Company counsel
04/29/2003	0.5	2	Phone conversation with Jay Sinder at Focal
04/30/2003	1.0	2	Review disclosure statement changes and phone conversation with counsel
04/30/2003	2.0	2	Participate in conference call with Board of Directors
05/01/2003	1.0	4	Review proposed senior credit facility financial covenants. Discussion with Fazal, Sinder and Glogoff
05/01/2003	0.5	2	Team update on case status
05/02/2003	1.0	4	Call with Company to discuss revised bank facility covenants
05/02/2003	1.0	4	Call with FTI after review of revised covenants. Follow up call with Jay Sinder
05/05/2003	1.0	4	Review suggested bank covenants and research of comparable CLEC covenant packages
05/06/2003	1.0	4	Review of other CLEC covenant packages (i.e. US LEC)
05/06/2003	1.5	4	Call with Company management to discuss covenants; call with FTI and bank group to discuss
			covenants
05/06/2003	1.0	4	Review of financial covenants of comparable telecom transactions
05/08/2003	1.0	1	Review GE Disclosure request. Call with Jay Sinder.
05/08/2003	1.0	2	Team update on case status
05/09/2003	1.0	2	Review of 10Q draft. Calls with Company
05/11/2003	0.5	2	Conference call with Jay Sinder to review discovery requests and strategy
05/12/2003	4.0	4	Preparation of expert valuation report
05/12/2003	1.5	2	Conference calls with Company and counsel to discuss discovery requests. Discussions with internal
		_	counsel on strategy
05/12/2003	1.0	1	Compilation of documents for discovery. Discussion with technical staff on aggregation of emails and
05(42)2002			files
05/13/2003	2.0	1	Preparation of discovery materials. Internal discussions with technical team
05/13/2003 05/13/2003	4.0	4	Preparation of expert reports on valuation and liquidation
05/14/2003	1.0	2	Various internal discussions on discovery and calls with Jay Sinder, counsel
05/14/2003	1.5	2	Conference call on discovery with counsel and the Company
05/14/2003	2.0	1	Preparation of discovery materials. Internal discussions with technical team
05/14/2003	1.5	2	Conference call with Mike Wiles at Debevoise
05/14/2003	5.0	4 1	Preparation of expert reports on valuation and liquidation Various internal discussions on disclosure statement and discovery issues. Calls with Jay Sinder
05/14/2003	1.0 0.5	2	Team discussion re: MBLY fees
05/15/2003	3.0	4	Review and update of expert valuation reports
05/15/2003	3.0 4.0	1	Preparation of discovery requests
05/15/2003	0.5	4	Various calls with Debra O'Shea at Focal
05/16/2003	0.5	2	Conference call with Company, advisors on discovery requests
05/16/2003	0.5	2	Conversations with Sinder and Debra O'Shea at the Company
05/16/2003	3.0	1	Preparation of discovery requests, meet with K&E paralegal, various calls with counsel and the
	5.0	•	Company
05/17/2003	3.0	1	Prepare discovery information - call with Jared Golub
05/18/2003	3.0	i	Review discovery information - calls and emails with Jared Golub and PSZYJW
05/19/2003	3.0	i	Prepare discovery information. Meeting with K&E paralegal
05/19/2003	1.0	4	Update expert reports - call with Debevoise & Plimpton
05/19/2003	1.0	i	Call with PSZYJW to discuss unsecured creditor recoveries. Preparation of analysis to review changes
05/20/2003	2.0	1	Preparation of discovery materials, several calls/correspondence with PSZYJW
05/20/2003	1.0	1	Preparation of expert reports. Calls with Jared Golub and the Company
05/21/2003	4.0	4	Finalization of expert reports. Preparation of signature pages
05/22/2003	1.0	2	Call with J. Sinder and D. O'Shea on case update and covenants. Review of revised covenant package
05/22/2003	0.5	2	Case update
05/23/2003	1.0	4	Review of revised covenant package and alternatives suggested by the Company
05/23/2003	0.5	2	Call with J. Sinder and D. O'Shea to review revised covenants
05/27/2003	1.0	1	Case update and review of action steps. Review of presentation summarizing changes based on
			NTFC preliminary agreement
05/27/2003	1.0	1	Review of presentation based on preliminary NTFC agreement. Discussions with Golub.
05/27/2003	2.0	4	Review of bank credit agreement
05/27/2003	2.0	2	Conference call to review bank agreement with Company and counsel
06/02/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with Jay Sinder on case strategy
06/02/2003	0.5	2	Review of draft presentation materials for Bank Group meeting
06/03/2003	5.0	2	Participate in bank group meetings with Company and counsel
06/03/2003	1.0	4	Calls with Debra O'Shea and review of pro-forma analysis for SBC agreement
06/04/2003	4.0	4	Calls with Company and FTI to discuss covenants. Analysis of covenants and cushions

Date 	Hours	Proj	Description
06/04/2003	1.0	4	Calls with Debra O'Shea. Analysis of projections related to SBC agreement
06/04/2003	1.0	2	Case status re: litigation, discovery, etc.
06/09/2003	2.0	4	Review of expert report by Bell South and analyze cash sources and uses as of the Effective Date
06/09/2003	2.0	1	Calls with sinder and o'shea regarding plan status, bell south, deposition schedules and requested information
06/10/2003	1.0	2	Conference call with Company and counsel regarding cash balances and BellSouth responses
06/10/2003	5.0	4	Work with Company (Debra O'Shea) and develop analysis on projected cash balances through confirmation and variance of performance versus Plan
06/11/2003	4.0	4	Preparation of revised sources and uses, emergence CF forecasts, multiple calls with Company and counsel
06/12/2003	4.0	5	Travel to Atlanta
06/12/2003	4.0	1	Deposition preparation for Bell South feasibility expert
06/13/2003	8.0	1	Deposition of Bell South expert
06/13/2003	6.0	5	Travel from Atlanta to New York
06/14/2003	1.0	2	Conf call with Focal team
06/14/2003	1.0	4	Review revised model
06/14/2003	2.0	2	Team update re: depositions
06/15/2003	1.0	2	Conf call with Focal, Pachulski
06/16/2003	1.5	2	Various calls and internal discussions
06/16/2003	0.5	1	Calls with Counsel on preparation of affidavit for confirmation hearing
06/16/2003	1.0	4	Review revised model and cash forecasts. Send information on emergence cf forecasts to FTI
06/16/2003	1.0	2	Various calls with FTI and Jay Sinder
06/17/2003	4.5	4	Review of various financial models and projections
06/17/2003	2.5	1	Drafting of confirmation affidavit
06/18/2003	3.0	4	Preparation for confirmation
06/18/2003	4.5	4	Review of financial projections
06/18/2003	1.0	2	Board call
06/18/2003	0.5	2	Pre-confirmation hearing meeting
06/19/2003	2.5	5	Travel to and from Philadelphia
06/19/2003	8.0	1	Confirmation hearing
06/23/2003	4.0	3	strategic options presentation
06/24/2003	5.0	3	Strategic options presentation
06/25/2003	5.0	3	Work on strategic options presentation
06/26/2003	5.0	3	Work on strategic options presentation
06/28/2003	3.0	3	Work on strategic options presentation
06/29/2003	2.0	3	Work on strategic options presentation
06/30/2003	2.0	4	Review emergence cash forecasts; calls with Sinder, O'Shea and Butler
07/01/2003	0.5 1,156.0	1	Conversation with Jay Sinder regarding effective date timing and open items